
ITEM NO. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
542039-0060

PN
562039-0060

PN
542039-0060

PN PN
FECAMT

PN PN
00653-040-05-

PN
00654-040-05-

PN
00653-040-

PN
542039-0060KT

PN
562039-

PN
542039-

PN
4BUSAM00CY3

PN
4BUSAM00CY

PN
4BUSAM00CY3

$24.80 $11.75 $24.80 NO BID $10.12 NO BID 24.66$           $14.26 $24.66 $25.63 $14.34 $25.63 $27.73 $15.51 $27.73

2. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
141026-0134

PN
161026-0134

PN
141026-0134B

PN
FHB26BB

PN
FEC26BB

PN
FHB26BBB

PN
00121594-

PN
00122298-

PN
00121594B-

PN
141026-0134KT

PN
161026-

PN
141026-

PN
4BUSBB900726

PN
4BUSBB90072

PN
4BUSBB900726

$29.75 $14.00 $29.75 $24.78 $11.76 $28.25 $18.92 $14.26 $18.92 $29.93 $16.37 $29.93 $18.01 $10.27 $18.01
PN
141030-0134

PN
161030-0134

PN
141030-0134B

PN
FHB30BB

PN
FEC30BB

PN
FHB30BBB

PN
00121745-

PN
00122308-

PN
00121745B-

PN
141030-0134KT

PN
161030-

PN
141030-

PN
4BUSBB900730

PN
4BUSBB90073

PN
4BUSBB900730

$29.75 $14.00 $29.75 $24.78 $11.76 $28.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.93 $16.37 $29.93 $24.09 $12.72 $24.09
PN
141039-0134

PN
161039-0134

PN
141039-0134

PN
FHBBB

PN
FECBB

PN
FHBBBB

PN
00122011-

PN
00122430-

PN
00122011B-

PN
141039-0134KT

PN
161039-

PN
141039-

PN
4BUSBB900739

PN
4BUSBB90073

PN
4BUSBB900739

$26.00 $12.30 $26.00 $21.87 $10.56 $25.37 $24.66 $14.26 $24.66 $26.68 $14.83 $26.68 $26.24 $14.86 $26.24

3. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
171026-0134

PN
161026-0134

PN
171026-0134B

PN
NFHB26BB

PN
FEC26BB

PN
NFHB26BBB

PN
00587-015-05-

PN
00122298-

PN PN
171026-0134KT

PN
161026-

PN
171026-

PN
4BUSBB081526

PN
4BUSBB08152

PN
4BUSBB081526

$33.20 $14.00 $33.20 $27.43 $11.76 $30.93 $28.49 FL $14.26 $28.49 $32.89 $16.37 $32.89 $23.14 $12.72 $23.14
PN
171030-0134

PN
161030-0134

PN
171030-0134B

PN
NFHB30BB

PN
FEC30BB

PN
NFHB30BBB

PN
10010307-

PN
00122308-

PN
10010307B-

PN
171030-0134KT

PN
161030-

PN
172030-

PN
4BUSBB081530

PN
4BUSBB08153

PN
4BUSBB081530

$33.20 $14.00 $33.20 $27.43 $11.76 $30.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.89 $16.37 $32.89 $32.74 $15.08 $32.74
PN
171039-0134

PN
161039-0134

PN
171039-0134B

PN
NFHBBB

PN
FECBB

PN
NFHBBBB

PN
10010376-

PN
00122430-

PN
10010376B-

PN
171039-0134KT

PN
161039-

PN
172039-

PN
4BUSBB081539

PN
4BUSBB08153

PN
4BUSBB081539

$29.00 $12.30 $29.00 $24.18 $10.56 $27.68 $28.49 $14.26 $28.49 $29.26 $14.83 $29.26 $34.88 $17.23 $34.88

4. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
172026-0134

PN
161026-0134

PN
172026-0134B

PN
NFHB26BB

PN
FEC26BB

PN
NFHB26BBB

PN
00587-015-05-
DSK

PN
00122298-
DSK

PN
00587-015-
05B DSK

PN
172026-
0134PTKT

PN
161026-
0134KT

PN
172026-
0134BKT

PN
4BUSBB161726
B

PN
4BUSBB16172
6S

PN
4BUSBB161726
C

$33.20 $14.00 $33.20 $27.43 $11.76 $30.93 $28.49 $14.26 $28.49 $32.89 $16.37 $32.89 $23.14 $12.72 $23.14
PN
172030-0134

PN
161030-0134

PN
172030-0134B

PN
NFHB30BB

PN
FEC30BB

PN
NFHB30BBB

PN
10010307-

PN
00122308-

PN
10010307B-

PN
172030-

PN
161030-

PN
172020-

PN
4BUSBB161730

PN
4BUSBB16173

PN
4BUSBB161730

$33.20 $14.00 $33.20 $27.43 $11.76 $30.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.89 $16.37 $32.89 $32.74 $15.08 $32.74

Matthews Bus Alliance
Attn: Lori Matthews / Brad Hull

4802 W Colonial Drive
Orlando, FL  32808

Phone: (800) 330‐1175
Email: parts@mattewsbusesflorida.com
Email: bhull@matthewsbusesflorida.com

Easy Way Safety Services, Inc.
Attn: Thomas Sackett / Kathy Anneken

10939B Reed Hartman Highway
Cincinnati, OH  45242

Phone: (513) 891‐5660
Email: tsackett@ewss.org
Email: Kanneken@ewss.org

Florida Transportation Systems, Inc.
Attn: Doug Revelle / Jeff Slack

7703 Industrial Lane
Tampa, FL  33637

Phone: (813) 980‐0174
Email: drevelle@fts4buses.com
Email: Jeff.Slack@fts4buses.com

Thirty inch (30")3.b

Thirty-nine inch (39")3.c

Twenty-six inch (26")

Thirty inch (30")

BLUE BIRD BODY (All sizes 2016 through 2017 models)                  

4.a

4.b

The School District of Lee County
Department of Procurement Services

2855 Colonial Blvd.
Fort Myers, Florida 33966

Chalk's Truck Parts
Attn: Richard Davis / Carol Parnell

838 McCarty
Houston, TX  77029

2.c

Twenty-six inch (26")3.a

AMTRAN BODY                                                  (All sizes 2000 
through current models) 39"back bottom, crash barrier        1.

Twenty-six inch (26")2.a

Thirty inch (30")2.b

BLUE BIRD BODY (All sizes 2008 through 2015 models)                  

BLUE BIRD BODY (All sizes 1990 through 2007 models)                  

ITB No. B197371LN

School Bus Seat Covers

Opening Date: Friday, January 10, 2020                           

PN=Part No.

Phone: (800) 231‐5061
Email: Rdavis@Chalks.com
Email: Cparnell@Chalks.com

DESCRIPTION

Thirty-nine inch (39")

Prison Rehabilitative Industries and
Diversified Enterprises, Inc.
d/b/a PRIDE Enterprises

Attn: John R. McCleese / John Lukasek
2323 Morrison Road
Brandon, FL  33511

Phone: (813) 890‐2133
Email: bids@pride‐enterprises.org
Email: Jlukasek@pride‐enterprises.org



PN
172039-0134

PN
161039-0134

PN
172039-0134B

PN
NFHBBB

PN
FECBB

PN
NFHBBBB

PN
10010376-

PN
00122430-

PN
10010376B-

PN
172039-0134-

PN
161039-

PN
172039-

PN
4BUSBB161739

PN
4BUSBB16173

PN
4BUSBB161739

$29.00 $12.30 $29.00 $24.18 $10.56 $27.68 $28.49 $14.26 $28.49 $29.26 $14.83 $29.26 $34.88 $17.23 $34.88

5. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
172026-0134

PN
161026-0134

PN
172026-0134B

PN
NFHB26BB

PN
FEC26BB

PN
NFHB26BBB

PN
00587-015-05-

PN
00122298-

PN
00587-015-

PN
172026-0134-

PN
161026-

PN
172026-

PN
4BUSBB181826

PN
4BUSBB18182

PN
4BUSBB181826

$33.20 $14.00 $33.20 $27.43 $11.76 $30.93 $28.49 $14.26 $28.49 $32.89 $16.37 $32.89 $23.14 $12.72 $23.14
PN
172030-0134

PN
161030-0134

PN
172030-0134B

PN
NFHB30BB

PN
FEC30BB

PN
NFHB30BBB

PN
10010307-

PN
00122308-

PN
10010307B-

PN
172030-0134-

PN
161030-

PN
172030-

PN
4BUSBB181830

PN
4BUSBB18183

PN
4BUSBB181830

$33.20 $14.00 $33.20 $27.43 $11.76 $30.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.89 $16.37 $32.89 $32.74 $15.08 $32.74
PN
172039-0134

PN
161039-0134

PN
172039-0134B

PN
NFHBBB

PN
FECBB

PN
NFHBBBB

PN
10010376-

PN
00122430-

PN
10010376B-

PN
172039-0134-

PN
161039-

PN
172039-

PN
4BUSBB181839

PN
4BUSBB18183

PN
4BUSBB181839

$29.00 $12.30 $29.00 $24.18 $10.56 $27.68 $28.49 $14.26 $28.49 $29.26 $14.83 $29.26 $34.88 $17.23 $34.88

6. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
172026-0134

PN
161026-0134

PN
172026-0134B

PN
NFHB26BB

PN
FEC26BB

PN
NFHB26BBB

PN
00587-015-05-

PN
00122298-

PN
00587-015-

PN
172026-0134-

PN
161026-

PN
172026-

PN
4BUSBB192026

PN
4BUSBB19202

PN
4BUSBB192026

$33.20 $14.00 $33.20 $27.43 $11.76 $30.93 $28.49 $14.26 $28.49 $32.89 $16.37 $32.89 $23.14 $12.72 $23.14
PN
172030-0134

PN
161030-0134

PN
172030-0134B

PN
NFHB30BB

PN
FEC30BB

PN
NFHB30BBB

PN
10010307-

PN
00122308-

PN
10010307B-

PN
172030-0134-

PN
161030-

PN
172030-

PN
4BUSBB192030

PN
4BUSBB19203

PN
4BUSBB192030

$33.20 $14.00 $33.20 $27.43 $11.76 $30.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.89 $16.37 $32.89 $32.74 $15.08 $32.74
PN
172039-0134

PN
161039-0134

PN
172039-0134B

PN
NFHBBB

PN
FECBB

PN
NFHBBBB

PN
10010376-

PN
00122430-

PN
10010376B-

PN
172039-0134-

PN
161039-

PN
172039-

PN
4BUSBB192039

PN
4BUSBB19203

PN
4BUSBB192039

$29.00 $12.30 $29.60 $24.18 $10.56 $27.68 $28.49 $14.26 $28.49 $29.26 $14.83 $29.26 $34.88 $17.23 $34.88

7. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
241028-0060

PN
261028-0060

PN
241028-0060B

PN
FHB28CAR

PN
FEC28CAR

PN
FHB28CARB

PN
01175-040-05-

PN
01169-040-05-

PN
01175-040-05-

PN
241028-0060KT

PN
261028-

PN
241028-

PN
4BUSCC900028

PN
4BUSCC9000

PN
4BUSCC900028

$28.38 $13.40 $28.38 $23.70 $11.35 $27.20 $26.84 $15.42 $26.84 $28.73 $15.79 $28.73 $18.66 $10.86 $18.66
PN
241030-0060

PN
261030-0060

PN
241030-0060B

PN
FHB30CAR

PN
FEC30CAR

PN
FHB30CARB

PN
01172-040-05-

PN
01170-040-05-

PN
01172-040-05b-

PN
241030-0060KT

PN
241030-

PN
261030-

PN
4BUSCC900030

PN
4BUSCC9000

PN
4BUSCC900030

$28.38 $13.40 $28.38 $23.70 $11.35 $27.20 $26.84 $15.42 $26.84 $28.73 $15.79 $28.73 $24.68 $13.37 $24.68
PN
241039-0060

PN
261039-0060

PN
241039-0060B

PN
FHBCAR

PN
FECCAR

PN
FHBCARB

PN
01173-040-05-

PN
01009-040-05-

PN
01173-040-

PN
241039-0060KT

PN
261039-

PN
241039-

PN
4BUSCC900039

PN
4BUSCC9000

PN
4BUSCC900039

$28.38 $13.40 $28.38 $21.13 $10.12 $24.63 $24.41 $14.26 $24.41 $28.73 $14.34 $28.73 $26.82 $15.51 $26.82

8. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
443026-0069

PN
462026-0069

PN
443026-0069B

PN
FHB26THO3

PN
FEC26THO

PN
FHB26THO3B

PN
00974-066-05-

PN
01164-066-05-

PN
00974-066-

PN
443026-0069KT

PN
461026-

PN
443026-

PN
4BUSTH920726

PN
4BUSTH92072

PN
4BUSTH920726

$28.38 $13.40 $28.38 $23.70 $11.35 $27.20 $26.84 $15.42 $26.84 $28.73 $15.79 $28.73 $18.01 $10.27 $18.01
PN
443030-0069

PN
462030-00069

PN
443030-0069

PN
FHB30THO3

PN
FEC30THO

PN
FHB30THO3B

PN
00698-066-05-

PN
01665-066-05-

PN
00698-066-

PN
443030-0069KT

PN
461030-

PN
443030-

PN
4BUSTH920730

PN
4BUSTH92073

PN
4BUSTH920730

$28.38 $13.40 $28.38 $23.70 $11.35 $27.20 $26.84 $15.42 $26.84 $28.73 $15.79 $28.73 24.09 FL $12.72 $24.09
PN
443034-0069

PN
462034-0069

PN
443034-0069

PN
FHB34THO3

PN
FEC34THO

PN
FHB34THO3B

PN
01184-066-05-

PN
01179-066-05-

PN
01164-066-

PN
443034-0069KT

PN
461034-

PN
443034-

PN
4BUSTH920734

PN
4BUSTH92073

PN
4BUSTH920734

$28.38 $13.40 $28.38 $23.70 $11.35 $27.20 $26.84 $15.42 $26.84 $28.73 $15.79 $28.73 $25.00 $13.69 $25.00
PN
443036-0069

PN
462036-0069

PN
443036-0069B

PN
FHB36THO3

PN
FEC36THO

PN
FHB36THO3B

PN
00738-066-05-

PN
01178-066-05-

PN
00738-066-

PN
443036-0069KT

PN
461036-

PN
443036-0069KT

PN
4BUSTH920736

PN
4BUSTH92073

PN
4BUSTH920736

$28.38 $13.40 $28.38 $23.70 $11.35 $27.20 $26.84 $15.42 $26.84 $28.73 $15.79 $28.73 $25.58 $14.28 $25.58
PN
443039-0069

PN
462039-0069

PN
443039-0069B

PN
FHBTHO3

PN
FECTHO

PN
FHBTHO3B

PN
00650-066-05-

PN
00924-066-05-

PN
00650-066-

PN
443039-0069KT

PN
461039-

PN
443039-

PN
4BUSTH920739

PN
4BUSTH92073

PN
4BUSTH920739

8.c

8.b Thirty inch (30")

Thirty-six inch (36")8.d

Thirty-nine inch (39")8.e

Thirty inch (30")

Thirty-four inch (34")

7.a Twenty-eight inch (28")

7.b

BLUE BIRD BODY (All sizes 2019-2020 models)                  

6.a Twenty-six inch (26")

6.b Thirty inch (30")

5.a Twenty-six inch (26")

5.b Thirty inch (30")

4.c Thirty-nine inch (39")

BLUE BIRD BODY (All sizes 2018 models)                  

Thirty-nine inch (39")7.c

Twenty-six inch (26")8.a

CARPENTER / CROWN (All sizes 1990 through 2000 models)        

THOMAS BODY  (All sizes 1992 through 2007 models)           

5.c Thirty-nine inch (39")

6.c Thirty-nine inch (39")



$24.81 $11.74 $24.81 $21.13 $10.12 $24.63 $24.41 $13.68 $24.41 $25.63 $14.34 $25.63 $31.52 $16.58 $31.52
PN
443045-0069

PN
462045-0069

PN
443045-0069B

PN
FHB45THO3

PN
FEC45THO

PN
FHB45THO3B

PN
00701-066-05-

PN
01180-066-05-

PN
00701-066-

PN
443045-0069KT

PN
461045-

PN
443045-

PN
4BUSTH920745

PN
4BUSTH92074

PN
4BUSTH920745

$30.10 $13.68 $30.10 $24.99 $11.56 $29.49 $26.84 $15.42 $26.84 $30.20 $16.02 $30.20 $34.30 $19.41 $34.30

9. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
444026-0069

PN
462026-0069

PN
444026-0069B

PN
FHB26THO3

PN
FEC26THO

PN
NFHB26THO3

PN
00956-066-05-

PN
01164-066-05-

PN
00956-066-

PN
471026-0069KT

PN
462026-

PN
471026-

PN
4BUSTH080926

PN
4BUSTH08092

PN
4BUSTH080926

$28.38 $13.40 $28.38 $23.70 $11.35 $27.20 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 $23.14 $12.72 $23.14
PN
444030-0069

PN
462030-0069

PN
444030-0069B

PN
FHB30THO3

PN
FEC30THO

PN
FHB30THO3B

PN
00792-066-05-

PN
01165-066-05-

PN
00792-066-

PN
471030-0069KT

PN
462030-

PN
471030-

PN
4BUSTH080930

PN
4BUSTH08093

PN
4BUSTH080930

$28.38 $13.40 $28.38 $23.70 $11.35 $27.20 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 $25.59 $13.37 $25.59
PN
444034-0069

PN
462034-0069

PN
444034-0069B

PN
FHB34THO3

PN
FEC34THO

PN
FHB34THO3B

PN
00182-066-05-

PN
01179-066-05-

PN
00182-066-

PN
471034-0069KT

PN
462034-

PN
471034-

PN
4BUSTH080934

PN
4BUSTH08093

PN
4BUSTH080934

$28.38 $13.40 $28.38 $23.70 $11.35 $27.20 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 $26.50 $14.28 $26.50
PN
444036-0069

PN
462036-0069

PN
444036-0069B

PN
FHB36THO3

PN
FEC36THO

PN
FHB36THO3B

PN
00794-066-05-

PN
01178-066-05-

PN
00794-066-

PN
471036-0069KT

PN
462036-

PN
471036-

PN
4BUSTH080936

PN
4BUSTH08093

PN
4BUSTH080936

$28.38 $13.40 $28.38 $23.70 $11.35 $27.20 $26.84 $15.42 $26.84 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 $27.15 $14.86 $27.15
PN
444039-0069

PN
462039-0069

PN
444039-0069B

PN
FHBTHO3

PN
FECTHO

PN
FHBTHO3B

PN
00795-066-05-

PN
00924-066-05-

PN
00795-066-

PN
471039-0069KT

PN
462039-

PN
471039-

PN
4BUSTH080939

PN
4BUSTH08093

PN
4BUSTH080939

$24.80 $11.74 $24.80 $21.13 $10.12 $24.63 $24.66 $13.68 24.66 FL $28.08 $14.34 $28.08 $33.02 $17.23 $33.02
PN
444045-0069

PN
462045-0669

PN
444045-0069B

PN
FHB45THO3

PN
FEC45THO

PN
FHB45THO3B

PN
00796-066-05-

PN
01180-066-05-

PN
00796-066-

PN
471045-0069KT

PN
462045-

PN
471045-

PN
4BUSTH080945

PN
4BUSTH08094

PN
4BUSTH080945

$30.10 $13.68 $30.10 $24.99 $11.56 $29.49 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $32.77 $16.02 $32.77 $35.86 $20.00 $35.86

10. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
472026-0069

PN
462026-0069

PN
472026-0069B

PN
NFHB26THO1

PN
FEC26THO

PN
NFHB26THO1

PN
00960-066-05-

PN
01164-066-05-

PN
00960-066-

PN
472026-0069KT

PN
462026-

PN
472026-

PN
4BUSTH101526

PN
4BUSTH10152

PN
4BUSTH101526

$31.65 $13.40 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 $23.14 $12.72 $23.14
PN
472030-0069

PN
462030-0069

PN
472030-0069B

PN
NFHB30THO1

PN
FEC30THO

PN
NFHB30THO1

PN
0822-066-05-

PN
01165-066-05-

PN
0822-066-05B-

PN
472030-0069KT

PN
462030-

PN
472030-

PN
4BUSTH101530

PN
4BUSTH10153

PN
4BUSTH101530

$31.65 $13.40 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 $25.59 $13.37 $25.59
PN
472034-0069

PN
462034-0069

PN
472034-0069B

PN
NFHB34THO1

PN
FEC34THO

PN
NFHB34THO1

PN
01183-066-05-

PN
01179-066-05-

PN
01183-066-

PN
472034-0069KT

PN
462034-

PN
472034-

PN
4BUSTH101534

PN
4BUSTH10153

PN
4BUSTH101534

$31.65 $13.40 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 $26.50 FL $14.28 $26.50
PN
472036-0069

PN
462036-0069

PN
472036-0069B

PN
NFHB36THO1

PN
FEC36THO

PN
NFHB36THO1

PN
00824-066-05-

PN
01178-066-05-

PN
00824-066-

PN
472036-0069KT

PN
462036-

PN
472036-

PN
4BUSTH101536

PN
4BUSTH10153

PN
4BUSTH101536

$31.65 $13.40 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 $27.15 FL $14.86 $27.15
PN
472039-0069

PN
462039-0069

PN
472039-0069B

PN
NFHBTHO10

PN
FECTHO

PN
NFHBTHO10B

PN
00825-066-05-

PN
00924-066-05-

PN
00825-066-

PN
472039-0069KT

PN
462039-

PN
472039-

PN
4BUSTH101539

PN
4BUSTH10153

PN
4BUSTH101539

$27.64 $11.74 $27.64 $23.12 $10.12 $26.62 $26.16 $13.68 $26.16 $28.08 $14.34 $28.08 $33.02 $17.23 $33.02
PN
472045-0069

PN
462039-0069

PN
472045-0069B

PN
NFHB45THO1

PN
FEC45THO

PN
NFHB45THO1

PN
00826-066-05-

PN
01180-066-05-

PN
00826-066-

PN
472045-0069KT

PN
462045-

PN
472045-

PN
4BUSTH101545

PN
4BUSTH10154

PN
4BUSTH101545

$33.07 $13.70 $33.07 $27.33 $11.56 $31.83 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $32.77 $16.02 $32.77 $35.86 $20.00 $35.86

11. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
473026-0069

PN
463026-0069

PN
473026-0069B

PN
NFHB26THO1

PN
FEC26THO

PN
NFHB26THO1

PN
00960-066-05-

PN
01164-066-05-

PN
00960-066-

PN
473026-0069KT

PN
463026-

PN
473026-

PN
4BUSTH151626

PN
4BUSTH15162

PN
4BUSTH151626

$31.65 $13.40 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 $23.15 $12.72 $23.15
PN
473030-0069

PN
463030-0069

PN
473030-0069B

PN
NFHB30THO1

PN
FEC30THO

PN
NFHB30THO1

PN
00822-066-05-

PN
01165-066-05-

PN
00822-066-

PN
473030-0069KT

PN
463030-

PN
473030-

PN
4BUSTH151630

PN
4BUSTH15163

PN
4BUSTH151630

$31.65 $13.40 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 $25.59 $13.37 $25.59

Thirty nine inch (39 )8.e

8.f

THOMAS BODY    (All sizes 2008 through 2009)                 

9.a Twenty-six inch (26")

Thirty-four inch (34")9.c

9.d

9.b Thirty inch (30")

9.e Thirty-nine inch (39")

Forty-five inch (45")9.f

Forty-five inch (45")

Thirty-six inch (36")

10.a Twenty-six inch (26")

10.c Thirty-four inch (34")

10.d Thirty-six inch (36")

10.b Thirty inch (30")

THOMAS BODY   (All sizes 2010 through 2015)                 

10.e Thirty-nine inch (39")

Forty-five inch (45")10.f

THOMAS BODY  (All sizes 2015 through 2016)                  

11.a Twenty-six inch (26")

11.b Thirty inch (30")



PN
473034-0069

PN
463034-0069

PN
473034-0069

PN
NFHB34THO1

PN
FEC34THO

PN
NFHB34THO1

PN
00183-066-05-

PN
01179-066-05-

PN
00183-066-

PN
473034-0069KT

PN
463034-

PN
473034-

PN
4BUSTH151634

PN
4BUSTH15163

PN
4BUSTH151634

$31.65 $13.40 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 26.50 FL $14.28 $26.50
PN
473036-0069

PN
463036-0069

PN
473036-0069B

PN
NFHB36THO1

PN
FEC36THO

PN
NFHB36THO1

PN
00824-066-05-

PN
01178-066-05-

PN
00824-066-

PN
473036-0069KT

PN
46036-0069KT

PN
473036-

PN
4BUSTH151636

PN
4BUSTH15163

PN
4BUSTH151636

$31.65 $13.40 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 27.15 FL $14.86 $27.15
PN
473039-0069

PN
463036-0069

PN
473039-0069B

PN
NFHBTHO15

PN
FECTHO

PN
NFHBTHO15B

PN
00825-066-05-

PN
00924-066-05-

PN
00825-066-

PN
473039-0069KT

PN
463039-

PN
473039-

PN
4BUSTH151639

PN
4BUSTH15163

PN
4BUSTH151639

$27.63 $11.74 $27.63 $23.12 $10.12 $26.62 $26.16 $13.68 $26.16 $28.08 $14.34 $28.08 $33.02 $17.23 $33.02
PN
473045-0069

PN
463045-0069

PN
473045-0069B

PN
NFHB45THO1

PN
FEC45THO

PN
NFHB45THO1

PN
00826-066-05-

PN
01180-066-05-

PN
00826-066-

PN
473045-0069KT

PN
463045-

PN
473045-

PN
4BUSTH151645

PN
4BUSTH15164

PN
4BUSTH151645

$33.06 $13.68 $33.06 $27.33 $11.56 $31.83 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $32.77 $16.02 $32.77 $35.86 $20.00 $35.86

12 EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
473026-0069

PN
463026-0069

PN
473026-0069B

PN
NFHB26THO1

PN
FEC26THO

PN
NFHB26THO1

PN
00960-066-05-

PN
01164-066-05-

PN
00960-066-

PN
473026-0069KT

PN
463026-

PN
473026-

PN
4BUSTH17CY2

PN
4BUSTH17CY

PN
4BUSTH17CY2

$31.65 $13.40 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 $23.15 $12.72 $23.15
PN
473030-0069

PN
463030-0069

PN
473030-0069B

PN
NFHB30THO1

PN
FEC30THO

PN
NFHB30THO1

PN
00822-066-05-

PN
01165-066-05-

PN
0822-066-05B-

PN
473030-0069KT

PN
463030-

PN
473030-

PN
4BUSTH17CY3

PN
4BUSTH17CY

PN
4BUSTH17CY3

$31.65 $13.40 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $16.02 $31.55 $25.59 $13.37 $25.59
PN
473034-0069

PN
463034-0069

PN
473034-0069B

PN
NFHB34THO1

PN
FEC34THO

PN
NFHB34THO1

PN
00183-066-05-

PN
01179-066-05-

PN
00183-066-

PN
473034-0069KT

PN
463034-

PN
473034-

PN
4BUSTH17CY3

PN
4BUSTH17CY

PN
4BUSTH17CY3

$31.65 $13.40 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 26.50 (FL) $14.28 $26.50
PN
473036-0069

PN
463034-0069

PN
473036-0069B

PN
NFHB36THO1

PN
FEC36THO

PN
NFHB36THO1

PN
00824-066-05-

PN
01178-066-05-

PN
00824-066-

PN
473036-0069KT

PN
463036-

PN
473036-

PN
4BUSTH17CY3

PN
4BUSTH17CY

PN
4BUSTH17CY3

$31.65 $13.40 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $31.55 27.15 FL $14.86 $27.15
PN
473039-0069

PN
4630396-0069

PN
473039-0069B

PN
NFHBTHO15

PN
FECTHO

PN
NFHBTHO15B

PN
00825-066-05-

PN
00924-066-05-

PN
00825-066-

PN
473039-0069KT

PN
463039-

PN
473039-

PN
4BUSTH17CY3

PN
4BUSTH17CY

PN
4BUSTH17CY3

$27.64 $11.74 $27.64 $23.12 $10.12 $26.62 $26.16 $13.68 $26.16 FL $28.08 $14.34 $28.08 $33.02 $17.23 $33.02
PN
473045-0069

PN
463045-0069

PN
473045-0069B

PN
NFHB45THO1

PN
FEC45THO

PN
NFHB45THO1

PN
00826-066-05-

PN
01180-066-05-

PN
00826-066-

PN
473045-0069KT

PN
463045-

PN
473045-0069KT

PN
4BUSTH17CY4

PN
4BUSTH17CY

PN
4BUSTH17CY4

$33.06 $13.68 $33.06 $27.33 $11.56 $31.83 FL $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $32.77 $16.02 $32.77 $35.86 $20.00 $35.86

13. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
542030-

PN
562030-0060

PN
542030-

PN
FHB30AMT3S

PN
FEC30AMT

PN
FHB30AMT3B

PN
00867-040-

PN
00882-040-05-

PN
00867-040-

PN
542030-

PN
562030-

PN
542030-0060KT

PN
4BUSIC970730

PN
4BUSIC97073

PN
4BUSIC970730

$28.38 $13.42 $28.38 $27.20 $11.35 $27.20 $26.84 $15.42 $26.84 $32.84 $15.67 $28.73 $22.01 $14.28 $22.01
PN
542030-0060

PN
562030-0060

PN
542030-0060

PN
FHB30AMT3 

PN
FEC30AMT

PN
FHB30AMT3B 

PN
00867-040-05-

PN
00882-040-05-

PN
00867-040-

PN
542030-0060KT

PN
562030-

PN
542030-0060KT

PN
4BUSIC970730

PN
4BUSIC97073

PN
4BUSIC970730

$28.38 $13.42 $28.38 $23.70 $11.35 $27.20 $26.84 $15.42 $26.84 $28.73 $15.79 $28.73 $20.52 $12.72 $20.52
PN
542039-0060

PN
562039-0060

PN
542039-0060

PN
FHBAMT3

PN
FECAMT

PN
FHBAMT3B

PN
00653-040-05-

PN
00654-040-05-

PN
00653-040-

PN
542039-0060KT

PN
562039-

PN
542039-0060KT

PN
4BUSIC970739

PN
4BUSIC97073

PN
4BUSIC970739

$24.80 $11.74 $24.80 $21.13 $10.12 $24.63 $24.41 $14.26 $24.41 $25.63 $14.34 $25.63 $31.53 $16.58 $31.53
PN
542045-

PN
562045-0060

PN
542045-

PN
FHB45AMT3S

PN
FEC45AMT

PN
FHB45AMT3B

PN
00869-040-

PN
00884-040-05-

PN
00869-040-

PN
542045-0060KT

PN
462045-

PN
542045-0060KT

PN.
4BUSIC970745

PN
4BUSIC97074

PN
4BUSIC970745

$34.86 $13.68 $34.86 $29.49 $11.56 $29.49 $26.84 $15.42 $26.84 $34.32 $16.02 $30.20 $35.86 $20.91 $35.86
PN
542045-0060

PN
562045-0060

PN
542045-0060

PN
FHB45AMT3 

PN
FEC45AMT

PN
FHB45AMT3B 

PN
00869-040-

PN
00884-040-05-

PN
00869-040-

PN
542045-0060KT

PN
562045-

PN
542045-0060KT

PN
4BUSIC970745

PN
4BUSIC97074

PN
4BUSIC970745

$30.10 $13.68 $30.10 $24.99 $11.56 $29.49 $26.84 $15.42 $26.84 $30.20 $16.02 $30.20 $34.30 $19.41 $34.30

14. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
570030-

PN
562030-0060

PN
570030-

PN
NFHBV30AMT

PN
FEC30AMT

PN
NFHBV30AMT

PN
00861-040-

PN
00882-040-05-

PN
00861-040-

PN
570030- 562030- 542030-0060KT

PN
4BUSIC08CY30

PN
4BUSIC08CY3

PN
4BUSIC08CY30

Thirty-six inch (36")

12.e Thirty-nine inch (39")

12.f Forty-five inch (45")

13.b Thirty inch (30") w/o seat belt cut outs

13.c Thirty-nine inch (39")

13.d Forty-five inch (45")with seat belt cut outs

Forty-five inch (45")w/o seat belt cut outs13.e

14.a

11.d Thirty-six inch (36")

11.e Thirty-nine inch (39")

13.a

IC INTERNATIONAL BODY  (All sizes 1997 through 2007 models)

11.f Forty-five inch (45")

THOMAS BODY    (All sizes 2017 through current models)        

12.a Twenty-six inch (26")

12.b Thirty inch (30")

12.c Thirty-four inch (34")

12.d

Thirty inch (30") with seat belt cut outs

11.c Thirty-four inch (34")

IC INTERNATIONAL BODY (All sizes 2008 through current 
models)

Thirty inch (30") with seat belt cut outs



$31.65 $13.42 $31.65 $29.72 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $28.73 $23.57 $14.86 $23.57
PN
570030-0060

PN
562030-0060

PN
570030-0060

PN
NFHBV30AMT

PN
FEC30AMT

PN
NFHBV30AMT

PN
00861-040-05-

PN
00882-040-05-

PN
00861-040-

PN
570030-0060KT

PN
562030-

PN
542030-0060KT

PN
4BUSIC08CY30

PN
4BUSIC08CY3

PN
4BUSIC08CY30

$31.65 $13.42 $31.65 $26.22 $11.35 $29.72 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $31.55 $15.79 $28.73 $22.01 $13.37 $22.01
PN
570039-0060

PN
562039-0060

PN
570039-0060

PN
NFHBVAMT10

PN
FECAMT

PN
NFHBVAMT10

PN
01161-040-05-

PN
00654-040-05-

PN
01161-040-

PN
573639-0060KT

PN
562039-

PN
542039-0060KT

PN
4BUSIC08CY39

PN
4BUSIC08CY3

PN
4BUSIC08CY39

$27.63 $13.42 $27.63 $23.12 $10.12 $26.62 $26.16 $14.26 $26.16 $33.96 $14.34 $25.63 $33.02 $17.23 $33.02
PN
570045-

PN
562045-0060

PN
570045-0060

PN
NFHBV45AMT

PN
FEC45AMT

PN
NFHBV45AMT

PN
01176-040-

PN
00884-040-05-

PN
01176-040-

PN
570045-

PN
562045-

PN
542045-0060KT

PN
4BUSIC08CY45

PN
4BUSIC08CY4

PN
4BUSIC08CY45

$37.84 $13.68 $37.84 $31.83 $11.56 $31.83 $28.49 $15.42 $28.49 $36.89 $16.02 $30.20 $37.35 $21.56 $37.35
PN
570045-0060

PN
562045-0060

PN
570045-0060

PN
NFHBV45AMT

PN
FEC45AMT

PN
NFHBV45AMT

PN
01176-040-05-

PN
00884-040-05-

PN
01176-040-

PN
570045-0060KT

PN
562045-

PN
542045-0060KT

PN
4BUSIC08CY45

PN
4BUSIC08CY4

PN
4BUSIC08CY45

$33.10 $13.68 $33.10 $27.33 $11.56 $31.83 28.49 FL $15.42 $28.49 $30.20 $16.02 $30.20 $35.86 $20.00 $35.86

15. EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PN
4BUSUNXXXX2

PN
4BUSUNXXXX

PN
4BUSUNXXXX2

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.14 $12.72 $23.14

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PN
4BUSUNXXXX3

PN
4BUSUNXXXX

PN
4BUSUNXXXX3

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.59 $13.37 $25.59

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PN
4BUSUNXXXX3

PN
4BUSUNXXXX

PN
4BUSUNXXXX3

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.50 $14.28 $26.50

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PN
4BUSUNXXXX3

PN
4BUSUNXXXX

PN
4BUSUNXXXX3

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.15 $14.86 $27.15

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PN
4BUSUNXXXX3

PN
4BUSUNXXXX

PN
4BUSUNXXXX3

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.02 $17.23 $33.02

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PN
4BUSUNXXXX4

PN
4BUSUNXXXX

PN
4BUSUNXXXX4

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.86 $20.00 $35.86

16. Cost + 10%  COST + 20% COST + 20% COST + 20%

Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

YES YES

YesYes

Yes Yes
Yes Yes
Yes Yes
Yes Yes
No Yes

Forty-five inch (45")

15.c

15.d

15.e

15.f

15.b Thirty inch (30")

Thirty-four inch (34")

Thirty-six inch (36")

Thirty-nine inch (39")

No
Yes

BOL - Balance of Line

14.e Forty-five inch (45")w/o seat belt cut outs

14.b

14.c

Thirty inch (30") w/o seat belt cut outs

Thirty-nine inch (39")

14.d Forty-five inch (45")with seat belt cut outs

y ( )

YES

Yes
Yes
Yes

Letter confirming material being bid meets the requirements of  Federal Motor Vehicle 
Safety Standards 302 & 222

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

No Yes

UNIVERSAL 

15.a Twenty-six inch (26")

I UNDERSTAND AND HAVE THE ABILITY TO ACCEPT CREDIT CARDS FOR 
PAYMENT AS SPECIFIED ON PAGE 15-SECTION 8. (YES OR NO) YES

Attachment I - Emergency/Storm Related Catastrophe Agreement
Attachment J - Statement of Principal Place of Business 

YES

Yes

Required Submittal Checklist
Attachment A - Bid Response Form
Attachment B - Reference Form
Attachment C - Insurance Form and Certificate
Attachment D - Addenda Acknowledgement Form
Attachment E - Debarment Form
Attachment F - Drug Free Workplace Certificate
Attachment G - Public Entity Crimes Form
Attachment H - Scrutinized Company Certification

Attachment L - Sealed Bid Mailing Label

One original and 2 copies

Attachment K - Guarantee/Warranty/Compliance

Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes



Awarded Vendors
Secondary Vendors

14
7
1 Vendor submitted a NO BID
6

APPROVED BY: _________________________________________________________________ DATE: March 10, 2020
Lorie Nein
PROCUREMENT AGENT

ATTN:  SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL. ITB NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER & DESCRIPTION MUST BE ENTERED ON REQUISITION(S).

YesYesYes Yes

Vendors Did Not Respond 

BID TABULATION ONLY.  THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.

IT IS RECOMMENDED THIS ITB BE AWARDED TO EASY WAY SAFETY, INC., FLORIDA TRANSPORTATION SYSTEMS, INC., PRISON REHABILITATIVE INDUSTRIES AND DIVERSIFIED 
ENTERPRISES, INC. d/b/a PRIDE ENTERPRISES  AND RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF FLORIDA, INC. d/b/a RUSH TRUCK CENTER, TAMPA,  HAVING SUBMITTED THE LOWEST OVERALL 
AND BEST RESPONSE MEETING SPECIFICATIONS. 

YesElectronic Copy

Vendors Were Notified of ITB
Vendors Submitted a Responsive Bid



EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
542039-0060

PN
562039-0060

PN
542039-0060

PN
ZB5420390060

PN
ZB562039006

PN
ZB5420390060

$23.91 $11.31 $11.31 $25.05 $11.84 $25.05

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
141026-0134

PN
161026-0134

PN
141026-0134B

PN
ZB1410260134

PN
ZB161026013

PN
ZB1410260134

$28.71 $13.57 $28.71 $29.81 $14.10 $29.81
PN
141030-0134

PN
161030-0134

PN
141030-0134B

PN
ZB1410300134

PN
ZB161030013

PN
ZB1410300134

$28.71 $13.57 $28.71 $29.81 $14.23 $29.81
PN
141039-0134

PN
161039-0134

PN
141039-0134B

PN
ZB1410390134

PN
ZB161039013

PN
ZB1410390134

$25.08 $11.86 $25.08 $26.28 $12.41 $26.04

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
141026-0134

PN
161026-0134

PN
171026-0134B

PN
ZB1410260134

PN
ZB161026013

PN
ZB1710260134

$28.71 $13.57 $32.02 $29.81 $14.10 $33.24
PN
141030-0134

PN
161030-0134

PN
171030-0134B

PN
ZB1410300134

PN
ZB161030013

PN
ZB1710300134

$28.71 $13.57 $32.02 FL $29.81 $14.23 $33.24
PN
141039-0134

PN
161039-0134

PN
171039-0134B

PN
ZB1410390134

PN
ZB161039013

PN
ZB1710390134

25.08 FL $11.86 $25.08 $26.28 $12.41 $29.02

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
172026-0134

PN
161026-0134

PN
172026-0134B

PN
ZB17202601343

PN
ZB161026013
4

PN
ZB1720260134
B

$32.02 $13.75 $32.02 $33.24 $14.10 $33.24
PN
172030-0134

PN
161030-0134

PN
172030-0134B

PN
ZB1720300134

PN
ZB161030013

PN
ZB1720300134

$32.02 $13.75 $32.02 FL $33.24 $14.23 $33.24

Rush Truck Centers of Florida, Inc.
d/b/a Rush Truck Center, Tampa
Attn: David Rye / William Lee

8111 East Adamo Drive
Tampa, FL  33619

Phone: (813) 664‐1441
Email: leeh@rushenterprises.com

Reliatex, Inc.
Attn: Donald J. Miller
6004 Bonacker Drive
Tampa, FL  33610

Phone: (813) 621‐6021
Email: donmillerjoat@aol.com

Wallace International Trucks, Inc.
Attn: Debra W. Gilkey / Randy Blakesley

2761 Edison Avenue
Fort Myers, FL  33916

Phone: (239) 334‐1000
Email: debra.gwallaceinternational.com
Email: randy‐b@wallaceinternational.com

N
O
 
B
I
D
 



PN
172039-0134

PN
161039-0134

PN
172039-0134B

PN
ZB1720390134

PN
ZB161039013

PN
ZB1720390134

$27.97 $11.86 $27.97 FL $29.30 $12.41 $29.02

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
172026-0134

PN
161026-0134

PN
172026-0134B

PN
ZB17202601343

PN
ZB161026013

PN
ZB1720260134

$32.02 $13.57 $32.02 $33.24 $14.10 $33.24
PN
172030-0134

PN
161030-0134

PN
172030-0134B

PN
ZB1720300134

PN
ZB161030013

PN
ZB1720300134

$32.02 $13.57 $32.02 FL $33.24 $14.23 $33.24
PN
172039-0134

PN
161039-0134

PN
172030-0134B

PN
ZB1720390134

PN
ZB161039013

PN
ZB1720300134

$27.97 $11.86 $27.97 FL $29.30 $12.41 $29.02

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
172026-0134

PN
161026-0134

PN
172026-0134B

PN
ZB1720260134

PN
ZB161026013

PN
ZB1720260134

$32.02 $13.57 $32.02 $33.24 $14.10 $33.24
PN
172030-0134

PN
161030-0134

PN
172030-0134B

PN
ZB1720300134

PN
ZB161030013

PN
ZB1720260134

$32.02 $13.57 $32.02 FL $33.24 $14.23 $33.24
PN
172039-0134

PN
161039-0134

PN
172039-0134B

PN
ZB1720390134

PN
ZB161039013

PN
ZB1720390134

$27.97 $11.86 $27.97 FL $29.30 $12.41 $29.02

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
241028-060

PN
261028-0060

PN
241028-0060B

PN
ZB2410280060

PN
ZB261028006

PN
ZB2410280060

$27.37 $12.95 $27.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PN
241030-0060

PN
241030-0060B

PN
261030-0060

PN
ZB2410300060

PN
ZB261030006

PN
ZB2410300060

$27.37 $12.95 $27.37 $28.42 $13.42 $28.42
PN
241039-0060

PN
261039-0060

PN
241039-0060B

PN
ZB24103900060

PN
ZB261039006

PN
ZB2410390060

$23.91 $11.31 $23.91 $25.05 $11.84 $28.42

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
443026-0069

PN
261039-0060

PN
241039-0060B

PN
ZB4430260069

PN
ZB462026006

PN
ZB4430260069

$27.37 $11.31 $23.91 $28.68 $13.56 $28.42
PN
443030-0069

PN
461030-0069

PN
443030-0069B

PN
ZB4430300069

PN
ZB462030006

PN
ZB4430300069

$27.37 $12.95 $27.37 $28.42 $13.42 $28.42
PN
443034-0069

PN
461034-0069

PN
443034-0069B

PN
ZB4430340069

PN
ZB462034006

PN
ZB4430340069

$27.37 $12.95 $27.37 $28.42 $13.42 $28.42
PN
443036-0069

PN
461036-0069

PN
443036-0069B

PN
ZB4430360069

PN
ZB462036006

PN
ZB4430360069

$27.37 $12.95 $27.37 $28.68 $13.42 $28.42
PN
443039-0069

PN
461039-0069

PN
443039-0069B

PN
ZB4430390069

PN
ZB462039006

PN
ZB4430390069

N
O
 
B
I
D
 



$23.91 $11.31 $23.91 $25.05 $11.84 $27.66
PN
443045-0069

PN
461045-0069

PN
443045-0069B

PN
ZB4430450069

PN
ZB462045006

PN
ZB4430450069

$29.01 $13.18 $29.01 $30.12 $13.70 $30.12

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
444026-0069

PN
462026-0069

PN
444026-0069B

PN
ZB4440260069

PN
ZB462026006

PN
ZB4440260069

$27.37 $12.95 $27.37 FL $28.42 $13.56 $28.42
PN
444030-0069

PN
462030-0069

PN
444030-0069

PN
ZB4440300069

PN
ZB620300006

PN
ZB4440300069

$27.37 $12.95 27.37 FL $28.42 $13.42 $28.42
PN
444034-0069

PN
462034-0069

PN
444034-0069B

PN
ZB4440340069

PN
ZB462034006

PN
ZB4440340069

$27.37 $12.95 27.37 FL $28.42 $13.42 $28.42
PN
444036-0069

PN
462036-0069

PN
444036-0069B

PN
ZB4440360069

PN
ZB462036006

PN
ZB4440360069

$27.37 $12.95 $27.37 $28.42 $13.42 $28.42
PN
444039-0069

PN
462039-0069

PN
444039-0069B

PN
ZB4440390069

PN
ZB462039006

PN
ZB4440390069

$23.91 $11.31 $23.91 $25.05 $11.84 $24.82
PN
444045-0069

PN
462045-0069

PN
444045-0069B

PN
ZB4440450069

PN
ZB462045006

PN
ZB4440450069

$29.01 $13.18 $29.01 $30.12 $13.70 $30.12

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
472026-0069

PN
462026-0069

PN
472026-0069B

PN
ZB4720260069

PN
ZB462026006

PN
ZB4720260069

$30.51 $12.95 $30.51 $31.68 $13.56 $31.68
PN
472030-0069

PN
462030-0069

PN
462030-0069

PN
ZB4720300069

PN
ZB462026006

PN
ZB4720300069

$30.51 $12.95 $30.51 $31.68 $13.42 $31.68
PN
472036-0069

PN
462036-0069

PN
472036-0069B

PN
ZB4720340069

PN
ZB462034006

PN
ZB4720340069

$30.51 $12.95 $30.51 $31.68 $13.42 $31.68
PN
472036-0069

PN
462036-0069

PN
472036-0069B

PN
ZB4720360069

PN
ZB462036006

PN
ZB4720360069

$30.51 $12.95 $30.51 $31.68 $13.42 $31.68
PN
472039-0069

PN
462039-0069

PN
472039-0069B

PN
ZB4720390069

PN
ZB462039006

PN
ZB4720390069

$26.66 $11.31 $26.66 $27.93 $11.84 $27.93
PN
472045-0069

PN
462045-0069

PN
472045-0069B

PN
ZB4720450069

PN
ZB462045006

PN
ZB4720450069

$31.90 $13.18 $31.90 $33.10 $13.70 $33.10

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
472045-0069

PN
462045-0069

PN
472045-0069B

PN
ZB4730260069

PN
ZB463026006

PN
ZB4730260069

$31.90 $13.18 $31.90 $31.68 $13.42 $31.68
PN
473026-0069

PN
463026-0069

PN
473026-0069B

PN
ZB4730300069

PN
ZB463030006

PN
ZB4730300069

$30.51 $12.95 $30.51 $31.68 $13.42 $31.68

N
O
 
B
I
D
 



PN
473034-0069

PN
463034-0069

PN
473034-0069B

PN
ZB4730340069

PN
ZB463034006

PN
ZB4730340069

$30.51 $12.95 $30.51 $31.68 $13.42 $31.68
PN
473045-0069

PN
463045-0069

PN
473045-0069B

PN
ZB4730360069

PN
ZB463036006

PN
ZB4730360069

$31.90 $13.18 $31.90 $31.68 $13.42 $31.68
PN
473039-0069

PN
463039-0069

PN
473039-0069B

PN
ZB4730390069

PN
ZB463039006

PN
ZB4730390069

$26.66 $11.31 $26.66 $27.93 $11.84 $27.66
PN
473045-0069

PN
463045-0069

PN
473045-0069B

PN
ZB4730450069

PN
ZB463045006

PN
ZB4730450069

$31.90 $13.18 31.90 FL $33.10 $13.70 $33.10

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
473026-0069

PN
463026-0069

PN
473026-0069B

PN
ZB4730260069

PN
ZB463026006

PN
ZB4730260069

$30.51 $12.95 $30.51 $31.68 $13.42 $31.68
PN
473030-0069

PN
463030-0069

PN
473030-0069B

PN
ZB473030069

PN
ZB463030006

PN
ZB4730300069

$30.51 $12.95 $30.51 $31.68 $13.42 $31.68
PN
473034-0069

PN
463034-0069

PN
473034-0069B

PN
ZB4730340069

PN
ZB463034006

PN
ZB4730340069

$30.51 $12.95 $30.51 $31.68 $13.42 $31.68
PN
473036-0069

PN
463036-0069

PN
473036-0069B

PN
ZB4730360069

PN
ZB463036006

PN
ZB4760360069

$30.51 $12.95 $30.51 $31.68 $13.42 $31.68
PN
473039-0069

PN
463039-0069

PN
473039-0069B

PN
ZB4730390069

PN
ZB463039006

PN
ZB4730390069

$26.66 $11.31 $26.66 $27.93 $11.84 $27.66
PN
473045-0069

PN
463045-0069

PN
473045-0069B

PN
ZB4730450069

PN
ZB463045006

PN
ZB4730450069 

$31.90 $13.18 $31.90 $33.10 $13.70 $33.10

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
542030-

PN
562030-0060

PN
542030-0060

PN
ZB5420300060

PN
ZB562030006

PN
ZB5420300060

$31.75 $12.95 $26.66 $33.17 $13.56 $28.68
PN
542030-0060 

PN
562030-0060

PN
542030-0060

PN
ZB5420300060 

PN
ZB562030006

PN
ZB5420300060

$27.37 $12.95 $23.91 $28.68 $13.56 $28.68
PN
542039-0060

PN
562039-0060

PN
542039-0060

PN
ZB540390060

PN
ZB562036006

PN
ZB5420390060 

$23.91 $11.31 $23.91 $25.05 $11.84 $25.05
PN
542045-

PN
562045-0060

PN
542045-0060

PN
ZB5420450060

PN
ZB562045006

PN
ZB5420450060

$33.38 $13.18 $29.01 $34.89 $13.81 $30.12
PN
542045-0060 

PN
562045-0060

PN
542045-0060

PN
ZB5420450060 

PN
ZB562045006

PN
ZB5420450060

$29.01 $13.18 $29.01 $30.12 $13.81 $30.12

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

PN
542030-

PN
562030-0060

PN
542030-0060

PN
ZB5420300060

PN
ZB562030006

PN
ZB5420300060

N
O
 
B
I
D
 



$31.75 $12.95 $27.37 $33.17 $13.56 $28.68
PN
542030-0060

PN
562030-0060

PN
542030-0060

PN
ZB5420300060

PN
ZB562030006

PN
ZB5420300060

27.37 FL $12.95 $27.37 $28.68 $13.56 $28.68
PN
542039-0060

PN
562039-0060

PN
542039-0060

PN
ZB5420390060

PN
ZB562039006

PN
ZB5420390060

23.91 FL $11.31 $23.91 $25.05 $11.84 $25.05
PN
542045-

PN
562045-0060

PN
542045-0060

PN
ZB5420450060

PN
ZB562045006

PN
ZB5420450060

$33.38 $13.18 $29.01 $34.89 $13.81 $30.12
PN
542045-0060

PN
562045-0060

PN
542045-0060

PN
ZB5420450060

PN
ZB562045006

PN
ZB5420450060

$29.01 $13.18 $29.01 $30.12 $13.81 $30.12

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

EACH
BACK

EACH 
BOTTOM

CRASH
BARRIER

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

YES

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

NO
(Not at this time)

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

NO BID

NO BID

N
O
 
B
I
D



Yes Yes


