
# & Title:

Location:
Opening Date:
Term:
Est. Exposure:
Funding:
Vendors Notified:

Submittals:

Description of Item Qty

Inspection Rates     

0-50 Initiating Devices Each 465.00$                * 465.00$                *  

20 9,300.00$             * 9,300.00$             *  

51-100 Initiating Devices Each 665.00$                * 665.00$                *  

9 5,985.00$             * 5,985.00$             *  

101-150 Initiating Devices Each 795.00$                * 795.00$                *  

16 12,720.00$          * 12,720.00$          *

151-200 Initiating Devices Each 1,050.00$             * 1,050.00$             *

11 11,550.00$          * 11,550.00$          *

> 201 Initiating Devices Each 1,650.00$             * 1,650.00$             *

14 23,100.00$          * 23,100.00$          *

Estimated Total of Fire Alarm Inspections: 70 62,655.00$          * 62,655.00$          *

Battery Replacement Rates     

12 vdc - 7AH Each 23.88$                  * 23.88$                  *  

200 4,776.00$             * 4,776.00$             *

12vdc - 12AH Each 43.44$                  * 43.44$                  *

10 434.40$                * 434.40$                *

12vdc - 18AH Each 59.99$                  * 59.99$                  *

10 599.90$                * 599.90$                *

12vdc - 35AH Each 125.54$                * 125.54$                *

10 1,255.40$             * 1,255.40$             *

Estimated Total for Battery Installs: Estimated 7,065.70$             * 7,065.70$             *

Additional Charges/Discounts/Offers

Additional Charges: Service Charge Per Visit No Bid No Bid

Additional Charges: AHJ Report Fees Per Inspection No Bid No Bid

Discount: Notifier Products From MSRP 25% * 25% *

Additional Fire Alarm Monitoring Per Line 25.00$                  * 25.00$                  *

Estimated Total of Fire Alarm Inspections: Estimated 62,655.00$          *

Estimated Total for Battery Installs: Estimated 7,065.70$             *

Additional Expenditures as Necessary Estimated 10,279.30$          *

Total Annual Estimate for all items: Total 80,000.00$          *

Opened By:

Witnessed by:

Date to Board:

TABULATION SHEET

#24-048 Fire Alarm Systems Inspections, Testing & Certification

Districtwide via Safety & Securiity Department
5775 Osceola Trail | Naples, Florida 34109

p: 239.377.0047 | f: 239.377.0074

e: purchasing@collierschools.com 

Visit us online: www.collierschools.com 

Renewal
January 1, 2026 to December 31, 2026
$80,000.00
Capital
n/a Documents Obtained: n/a

n/a
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Integrated Fire & Integrated Fire &
Security Solutions Security Solutions

1970 Dana Dr 1970 Dana Dr

Ft. Myers, FL 33907 Ft. Myers, FL 33907

(239) 415-4374 (239) 415-4374

jupeterson@ifssi.com jupeterson@ifssi.com

2025 2026

November 12, 2025

 

* Recommend approval of purchase, as vendor has agreed to renew at Purchasing Department

the same terms and pricing as the 2025 calendar year. Purchasing Department

Estimated 2026 Expenditures
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