

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

BID ON SCOREBOARD REPLACEMENT AND REPAIR SERVICES, SDMC No. 23-0081-MR

CONTRACT PERIOD: JANUARY 1, 2023 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2025

BOARD APPROVAL ON NOVEMBER 8, 2022

TABULATION OF BIDS ON SCOREBOARD REPLACEMENT AND REPAIR SERVICES, SDMC No. 23-0081-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., Wednesday, October 12, 2022

Bidder's Name	REPAIR IN EXISTING EQUIPMENT					
	1. a. HOURLY RATE, REGULAR TIME		1.b. HOURLY RATE, OVERTIME		1c. HOURLY RATE, HOLIDAY	
	Bid Price	Notes	Bid Price	Notes	Bid Price	Notes
i2 Visual Inc	\$90.00		\$135.00		\$135.00	
Team C Sports OUT OF BUSINESS	\$130.00		\$205.00		\$260.00	

Bidder's Name	INSTALLATION NEW SYSTEM			
	2. a. HOURLY RATE, REGULAR TIME		2.b. HOURLY RATE, OVERTIME	
	Bid Price	Notes	Bid Price	Notes
i2 Visual Inc	\$265.00		\$350.00	
Team C Sports OUT OF BUSINESS	\$225.00		\$350.00	

Bidder's Name	3.a. SINGLE FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT-OES EQUIPMENT		3.b. SINGLE FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT-OES PARTS		3.c. SINGLE FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT-OES ACCESSORIES	
	DISCOUNT	Notes	DISCOUNT	Notes	DISCOUNT	Notes
	i2 Visual Inc	0.00%		0.00%		0.00%
Team C Sports OUT OF BUSINESS	30.00%		16.00%		30.00%	

Bidder's Name	4.a. SINGLE FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT-EQUIPMENT		4.b. SINGLE FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT-PARTS		4.c. SINGLE FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT-ACCESSORIES	
	DISCOUNT	Notes	DISCOUNT	Notes	DISCOUNT	Notes
	i2 Visual Inc	10.00%	Watchfire	10.00%	Watchfire	10.00%
Team C Sports OUT OF BUSINESS	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

Bidder's Name	5.a. SINGLE FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT-EQUIPMENT		5.b. SINGLE FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT-PARTS		5.c. SINGLE FIXED PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT-ACCESSORIES	
	DISCOUNT	Notes	DISCOUNT	Notes	DISCOUNT	Notes
	i2 Visual Inc	10.00%	Nevoc	10.00%	Nevoc	10.00%
Team C Sports OUT OF BUSINESS	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

TABULATION OF BIDS ON SCOREBOARD REPLACEMENT AND REPAIR SERVICES, SDMC No. 23-0081-MR

Bids Due: 3:00 p.m., Wednesday, October 12, 2022

Bidder's Name	6. EQUIPMENT RENTAL, PERCENTAGE MARKUP OF COST, MAXIMUM 10%		7. USE OF SUBCONTRACTOR, PERCENTAGE MARKUP OF COST, MAXIMUM 10%		8. USE OF CONTRACTOR OWNED EQUIPMENT-HOURLY		8. USE OF CONTRACTOR OWNED EQUIPMENT-DAILY	
	Mark up	Notes	Mark up	Notes	Hourly Rate	Notes	Daily Rates	Notes
i2 Visual Inc	10%		10%		\$120.00	(1)	\$1,200.00	(1)
Team C Sports OUT OF BUSINESS	40%		40%		No Bid		No Bid	

Bidder's Name	8. USE OF CONTRACTOR OWNED EQUIPMENT-HOURLY		8. USE OF CONTRACTOR OWNED EQUIPMENT-DAILY		8. USE OF CONTRACTOR OWNED EQUIPMENT-HOURLY		8. USE OF CONTRACTOR OWNED EQUIPMENT-DAILY	
	Hourly Rate	Notes	Daily Rates	Notes	Hourly Rate	Notes	Daily Rates	Notes
i2 Visual Inc	\$225.00	(2)	\$2,200.00	(2)	\$120.00	(3)	\$1,200.00	(3)
Team C Sports OUT OF BUSINESS	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

Notes:

- 1) 47' bucket truck- qty 9
- 2) 65' crane truck- qty 4
- 3) Hydrovac qty 1 or Auger truck qty 1

"Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes."