
i2 Visual, Inc.
1606 Benchmark Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33905
ATTN:  John Hose

Lee Designs, LLC
3300 Palm Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33901
ATTN:  Mike Johnson 

Connor Johnson

Monarch Direct
1264 Market Circle, Unit #6

Pt. Charlotte, FL  33953
ATTN:  Mike Bladorn

Signs Experts, LLC
11790 Metro Parkway, Unit A

Fort Myers, FL  33966
ATTN:  Jonathan Elmaleh

Crown Trophy of Cape Coral
1333 Lafayette Street Sts B & 

C
Cape Coral, FL  33904

ATTN:  Thomas Rachel

Sign On, LLC
1030 SE 12th Ct.

Cape Coral, FL  3399
ATTN:  Gabriel Jacobs

Signs by Tomorrow
12700 Metro Parkway, Ste 3

Fort Myers, FL  33966
ATTN:  Deborah Thomas

SignUp
6360 Corporate Park Circle

Unit 8
Fort Myers, FL  33966

ATTN:  Raiko Martinez Rojas

Us Sign and Mill Corporation
7981 Mainline Parkway
Fort Myers, FL  33912
ATTN:  Ryan Dinkel

Fred's Award World
3512 Palm Beach Boulevard

Fort Myers,  FL  33913
ATTN:  Rose Macho

Colorado Spirit Signs
9336 Windsor Way

Highlands Ranch, CO  80126
ATTN:  Zoe Manutes

Phone:  239-687-3223 Phone:  239-278-4245 Phone:  941-627-0014 Phone:  239-288-5777 Phone:   239-540-9905 Phone:  239-800-9454 Phone:  239-567-7446 Phone:  239-846-5893 Phone:  239-936-9154 Phone:  239-332-0363 Phone:  517-749-3119
Fax:  Fax:  239-278-3912 Fax: Fax: Fax:         239-540-9902 Fax: Fax: Fax: Fax: Fax:  

Email: sales@i2visual.com
Email:  mike@leedesignsllc.com; 
conner@leedesignsllc.com

Email:  
mike@monarchdirect.com

Email:  info@signsexperts.com
Email:  
sales@capecoraltrophy.com

Email:  frenchie@capeled.com
Email:  
fortmyers@signsbytomorrow.com

Email:  info@signupcreative.com Email:  ryan@ussignandmill.com Email:  rose.freds@outlook.com Email:  cospiritsigns@gmail.com

ITEM
NO.

DESCRIPTION UOM UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1. Photopolymer: Must be ADA Compliant $ per Sq in 1.5 2.00$                                                        2.22$                                                        1.70$                                                        N/A -$                                                          -$                                                                    1.30$                                                        1.47$                                                        
2. Sandblasted: Must be ADA Compliant $ per Sq in 2.5 3.00$                                                        2.55$                                                        -$                                                          N/A -$                                                          -$                                                                    1.70$                                                        1.45$                                                        
3. Fused & Embedded: Must be ADA Compliant $ per Sq in 1 2.00$                                                        2.88$                                                        -$                                                          1.20$                                                        -$                                                          -$                                                                    1.35$                                                        1.28$                                                        
4. Acrylic Informational $ per Sq in 0.75 2.00$                                                        0.60$                                                        1.60$                                                        0.90$                                                        -$                                                          -$                                                                    0.90$                                                        0.98$                                                        
5. Hourly rate for labor $ Per Hour 75 105.00$                                                   125.00$                                                   90.00$                                                      90.00$                                                      -$                                                          125.00$                                                             8.00$                                                        235.00$                                                   

6. STOP, 24” Engineer Grade:  Each 59 107.30$                                                   62.00$                                                      58.50$                                                      72.50$                                                      -$                                                          58.00$                                                               85.00$                                                      59.06$                                                      
7. STOP, 30” Engineer Grade:  Each 90 179.80$                                                   97.00$                                                      91.50$                                                      97.50$                                                      -$                                                          90.00$                                                               120.00$                                                   80.73$                                                      
8. BUSES ONLY, 18” X 24”:  Each 85 85.26$                                                      68.00$                                                      37.00$                                                      125.00$                                                   -$                                                          75.00$                                                               75.00$                                                      93.30$                                                      
9. Do Not Enter 30” Engineer Grade:  Each 115 89.76$                                                      142.00$                                                   91.50$                                                      150.00$                                                   -$                                                          128.00$                                                             95.00$                                                      99.46$                                                      

10. Yield, 36” Engineer Grade: Each 150 138.66$                                                   156.00$                                                   109.50$                                                   125.00$                                                   -$                                                          100.00$                                                             110.00$                                                   109.04$                                                   
11. No Left Turn, 18” x 24: Each 85 85.26$                                                      85.00$                                                      37.00$                                                      125.00$                                                   -$                                                          84.00$                                                               75.00$                                                      66.72$                                                      
12. No Parking 12” x 18”:  Each 25 55.13$                                                      60.00$                                                      34.50$                                                      60.00$                                                      -$                                                          34.00$                                                               65.00$                                                      35.03$                                                      
13. Handicapped Parking 12” x 18” Eng. Gr. Each 30 43.50$                                                      60.00$                                                      34.50$                                                      50.00$                                                      -$                                                          32.00$                                                               65.00$                                                      35.03$                                                      
14. Speed Limit Sign 24” x 30” Eng. Gr. Each 90 77.00$                                                      114.00$                                                   111.00$                                                   75.00$                                                      -$                                                          102.00$                                                             105.00$                                                   116.77$                                                   
15. One Way 18” x 24” Eng. Gr.   Each 85 85.26$                                                      68.00$                                                      66.75$                                                      75.00$                                                      -$                                                          61.00$                                                               75.00$                                                      66.72$                                                      
16. Children Crossing, 30” x 30” Engineer Grade Each 115 174.00$                                                   97.00$                                                      155.00$                                                   250.00$                                                   -$                                                          160.00$                                                             120.00$                                                   134.27$                                                   
17. Children Crosswalk, 24” Engineer Grade Each 55 221.85$                                                   114.00$                                                   97.50$                                                      225.00$                                                   -$                                                          100.00$                                                             95.00$                                                      101.32$                                                   
18. Loading & Unloading Zone 12” x 18” Each 25 42.00$                                                      60.00$                                                      34.50$                                                      67.50$                                                      -$                                                          38.00$                                                               65.00$                                                      35.03$                                                      
19. No Parking Fire Lane 12”x18” Engineer Grade Each 25 52.20$                                                      60.00$                                                      34.50$                                                      67.50$                                                      -$                                                          40.00$                                                               65.00$                                                      35.03$                                                      
20. No Parking Loading 12”x18” Engineer Grade Each 25 52.20$                                                      60.00$                                                      34.50$                                                      67.50$                                                      -$                                                          40.00$                                                               65.00$                                                      35.03$                                                      
21. Hot Dipped Gal. Posts U-Channel, 10” Each 60 88.65$                                                      95.00$                                                      89.00$                                                      85.00$                                                      -$                                                          58.00$                                                               45.00$                                                      94.51$                                                      
22. Hot Dipped Gal. Posts U-Channel, 12” Each 72 106.38$                                                   113.00$                                                   105.00$                                                   100.00$                                                   -$                                                          -$                                                                    60.00$                                                      109.94$                                                   
23. Pressure Treated Posts 4”x 4” x 10’ Each 18 24.35$                                                      43.00$                                                      22.50$                                                      40.00$                                                      -$                                                          35.00$                                                               55.00$                                                      23.44$                                                      
24. Pressure Treated Posts 4”x 4” x 12’ Each 25 29.26$                                                      53.00$                                                      46.90$                                                      50.00$                                                      -$                                                          40.00$                                                               63.00$                                                      28.16$                                                      
25. One Time Art Work Fee $ per Hour 75 65.00$                                                      75.00$                                                      45.00$                                                      90.00$                                                      -$                                                          65.00$                                                               60.00$                                                      185.00$                                                   
26. Hourly Rate for Installation $ per Hour 120 175.00$                                                   125.00$                                                   100.00$                                                   N/A -$                                                          125.00$                                                             62.00$                                                      180.00$                                                   
27. Warranty for Product Years 5 years 5 Years 5 Years 1 year
28 Warranty for Installation Years 5 years 5 Years 1 year

29. Elevator, 8” x 8” Plastic Each 60 30.00$                                                      70.00$                                                      5.00$                                                        40.00$                                                      -$                                                          81.00$                                                               40.00$                                                      119.84$                                     
30. Emergency Exit Keep Clear, 5”x9” Vinyl Each 15 20.00$                                                      24.00$                                                      15.00$                                                      20.00$                                                      -$                                                          10.00$                                                               32.00$                                                      14.72$                                                      
31. Exit Only, 12”x18” Vinyl Each 15 30.00$                                                      30.00$                                                      -$                                                          35.00$                                                      -$                                                          21.00$                                                               35.00$                                                      70.68$                                                      
32. Fish Numbers,1.5”x 4” Plastic Engraved Each 12 20.00$                                                      21.00$                                                      5.00$                                                        10.00$                                                      -$                                                          -$                                                                    8,020.00$                                                10.50$                                                      
33. Flammable/Hazardous Storage, 4”x6” Vinyl Each 18 15.00$                                                      24.00$                                                      -$                                                          20.00$                                                      -$                                                          10.00$                                                               23.00$                                                      7.85$                                                        
34. Portable Numbers, 6”x 9” Plastic Engraved Each 35 45.00$                                                      50.00$                                                      -$                                                          35.00$                                                      -$                                                          67.50$                                                               28.00$                                                      105.73$                                                   
35. Unisex Restrooms, 8” x 8” Plastic Each 60 30.00$                                                      70.00$                                                      -$                                                          40.00$                                                      -$                                                          85.00$                                                               32.00$                                                      119.84$                                                   
36. Teacher of the Year, 12”x 18” Plastic Engraved Each 95 90.00$                                                      90.00$                                                      -$                                                          120.00$                                                   -$                                                          39.50$                                                               55.00$                                                      403.92$                                                   
37. Entry into this HVAC Room, 6”x 8” Each 45 25.00$                                                      60.00$                                                      -$                                                          25.00$                                                      -$                                                          60.00$                                                               28.00$                                                      94.16$                                                      
38. Occupancy by More, 4”X6” Each 24 35.00$                                                      36.00$                                                      -$                                                          25.00$                                                      -$                                                          30.00$                                                               22.00$                                                      44.88$                                                      
39. Suspicion to Search, 12”X18” Each 110 90.00$                                                      90.00$                                                      -$                                                          40.00$                                                      -$                                                          270.00$                                                             40.00$                                                      70.63$                                                      
40. One Time Art Work Fee $ per Hour 75 65.00$                                                      758.00$                                                   -$                                                          90.00$                                                      -$                                                          65.00$                                                               55.00$                                                      185.00$                                                   
41. Hourly Rate for Installation $ per Hour 120 175.00$                                                   125.00$                                                   -$                                                          N/A -$                                                          125.00$                                                             68.00$                                                      180.00$                                                   
42. Warranty for Product Years Lifetime 1 year
43. Warranty for Installation Years 5 years 1 year

44. Supply and deliver only $ per Sq Ft 145.00$                                                   40.00$                                                      75.00$                                                      45.30 assuming sign will be 1" thic N/A -$                                                          185.00$                                                             65.00$                                                      180.00$                                                   
45. Supply, Deliver and Install $ per Sq Ft 195.00$                                                   60.00$                                                      95.00$                                                      need more information N/A -$                                                          225.00$                                                             42.00$                                                      180.00$                                                   
46. Warranty for Product Years 5 years could last 10+ years 1 year
47. Warranty for Installation Years 5 years need more information 1 year

48. Supply and deliver only $ per Sq Ft 145.00$                                                   45.00$                                                      75.00$                                                      -$                                                          N/A -$                                                          N/A Cedar not recommended 68.00$                                                      185.00$                                                   
49. Supply, Deliver and Install $ per Sq Ft 195.00$                                                   65.00$                                                      95.00$                                                      -$                                                          N/A -$                                                          N/A Cedar not recommended 45.00$                                                      245.00$                                                   
50. Warranty for Product Years 5 years 1 year
51. Warranty for Installation Years 5 years 1 year

52. Hourly Rate $ per Hour 75.00$                                                      175.00$                                                   $125.00/Ground - $175.00/Arial N/A 125.00$                                                             68.00$                                                      235.00$                                                   
53. Warranty for Product Years 5 years 1 year Per Agreement 2 years 2 years 1 year 1 year
54. Warranty for Installation Years 5 yeas 2 years Per Agreement N/A 2 years 1 year 1 year

55. Hourly Rate for Installation $ per Hour 150.00$                                                   175.00$                                                   175.00$                                                   -$                                                          N/A 105.00$                                                   N/A  75.00$                                                      295.00$                                                   
56. Hourly Labor Rate for Repairs $ per Hour 150.00$                                                   175.00$                                                   175.00$                                                   -$                                                          N/A 110.00$                                                   N/A 85.00$                                                      235.00$                                                   
57. Price per foot to run electric (boring) $ per Foot 45.00$                                                      120.00$                                                   by others "Cost Plus" Cost $40-80 -$                                                          N/A $5-$14 -$                                                                    27.00$                                                      sub + 0%
58. Price per foot to run electric (underground) $ per Foot 35.00$                                                      60.00$                                                      25.00$                                                      -$                                                          N/A $5-$10 -$                                                                    23.00$                                                      Sub + 0%
59. Warranty for Product Years 5 years 5 years 5 Years N/A 5 Standard/7 Upgrade 1 year 5 years
60. Warranty for Installation Years 5 years 1 year 5 Years N/A 5 Standard/7 Upgrade 1 year 1 year
61. No Yes Yes/Non-proprietary Available No yes

62. Hourly Rate for Installation $ per Hour 150.00$                                                   175.00$                                                   175.00$                                                   -$                                                          N/A 95.00$                                                      N/A 78.00$                                                      295.00$                                                   
63. Hourly Labor Rate for Repairs $ per Hour 150.00$                                                   175.00$                                                   175.00$                                                   -$                                                          N/A 110.00$                                                   N/A 78.00$                                                      235.00$                                                   
64. Price per foot to run electric (boring) $ per Foot 45.00$                                                      120.00$                                                   by others "Cost Plus" Cost $40-80 -$                                                          N/A $5-$14 -$                                                                    27.00$                                                      sub + 0%
65. Price per foot to run electric (underground) $ per Foot 35.00$                                                      60.00$                                                      25.00$                                                      -$                                                          N/A $5-$10 -$                                                                    23.00$                                                      sub + 0%
66. Warranty for Product Years 5 years 1 year 5 Years N/A 1 year 1 year
67. Warranty for Installation Years 5 years 1 year 5 Years N/A 1 year 1 year
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Yes Yes Yes
Yes

+3% additional for CC Fees Yes
Yes

3% Processing Fee Yes Yes Yes
10 Monday - Friday 7-28 Days Monday - Friday Varies Depends on products Monday - Friday project specific
10 Monday - Friday 14-35 Days Monday - Friday Varies Depends on products Monday - Friday project specific

77 VENDORS WERE NOTIFIED
9 VENDORS SUBMITTED A RESPONSIVE PROPOSAL
1 VENDORS SUBMITTED A NO-BID
1 VENDORS DID NOT RESPOND

APPROVED BY: Lauri Adams DATE:  10.22.25
PROCUREMENT AGENT

ITN NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER AND DESCRIPTION MUST BE ON REQUISITION. TABULATION ONLY. THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
 DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

SIGNS - PRODUCTS, INSTALLATION & REPAIR
ITN NO. N257508LA 

Sign Products
Supply and Deliver

STANDARD D.O.T. SIGNS; ALUMINUM, ANODIZED, REFLECTIVE, W/BORDER

ADA AND INFORMATIONAL SIGNAGE

Illuminated Marquee Signs

I understand  and have the ability to accept credit cards for  payment as 
specified on page 10 – Section 44.c. (YES OR NO)

Proprietary Software? (YES OR NO)

Digital Signs

HDU - HIGH DENSITY URETHANE SIGNS

SANDBLASTED CEDAR WOOD SIGNS

OTHER 

Alternative Products

Cost of Materials (Parts/Supplies)

Rental Equipment

Subcontractor Rate (Cost Plus)

AWARDED VENDOR

It is recommended that this ITN be awarded to i2 Visual, Inc.; Lee Designs, LLC; Monarch Direct, and Signs Experts, LLC; being the highest ranked, best value firm(s) based on the 
evaluation committee ranking and negotiated pricing.
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NON RESPONSIVE

NON RESPONSIVE

 N
O

 B
ID

 

NON RESPONSIVE

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
DELIVERY OF PRODUCT ONLY/DAYS:
FURNISH AND INSTALL PRODUCT/DAYS:



 Fixed Fee Amount for Materials for Billing Period 
$                              - $99.00 $                      -

$100.00 $499.00 $15.00 
$500.00 $999.00 $40.00 

$1,000.00 $1,499.00 $65.00 
$1,500.00 $2,499.00 $100.00 
$2,000.00 $4,999.00 $185.00 
$5,000.00 $8,999.00 $380.00 
$9,000.00 $14,999.00 $675.00 

$15,000.00 $24,999.00 $1,100.00 
$25,000.00 $44,999.00 $2,000.00 
$45,000.00 $74,000.00 $3,000.00 
$75,000.00 $124,000.00 $5,000.00 

$125,000.00 $149,000.00 $6,500.00 
$150,000.00 $199,000.00 $8,700.00 
$200,000.00 $249,000.00 $10,100.00 
$250,000.00 $299,999.00 $11,000.00 
$300,000.00 $349,999.00 $13,000.00 
$350,000.00 $399,999.00 $15,000.00 
$400,000.00 $449,999.00 $17,000.00 
$450,000.00 $499,999.00 $19,000.00 
$500,000.00 $549,999.00 $21,000.00 
$550,000.00 $599,999.00 $23,000.00 
$600,000.00 $649,999.00 $25,000.00 
$650,000.00 $699,999.00 $27,000.00 
$700,000.00 $749,999.00 $29,000.00 
$750,000.00 $799,999.00 $31,000.00 
$800,000.00 $849,999.00 $33,000.00 
$850,000.00 $899,999.00 $35,000.00 
$900,000.00 $949,999.00 $37,000.00 
$950,000.00 $999,999.00 $39,000.00 

RENTAL EQUIPMENT
The cost of materials shall be based on the Contractor’s wholesale price from the supply house, plus the correlated fixed fee. Invoices
must include an aggregate cost for all materials, including the sum of wholesale price from the supply house, plus the correlated fixed
fee identified above for the aggregate amount. The District reserves the right, at its sole discretion, to furnish equipment and materials
for any and all jobs or work performed pursuant to this contract.

SUB-CONTRACTED LABOR RATES
Sub-Contracted labor rates are to be billed at either a rate not to exceed the contractor labor rates, or at a fixed rate to be negotiated at 
the time of work.

TABLE 1: FIXED FEE RATE SCHEDULE
Range of Cost of Materials for Billing Period

ALTERNATE PRODUCTS

If alternate products, other than those listed in the specifications, are required, the cost to the District of the alternate products shall be
based on the Contractor’s wholesale price from the supply house, and shall include a negotiated fixed fee. The District reserves the
right, at its sole discretion, to furnish equipment and materials for any and all jobs or work performed pursuant to this contract. Invoices
must include an aggregate cost for all alternate manufacturer products, including the wholesale price from the supply house, plus the
correlated fixed fee identified above for the aggregate amount.

COST OF MATERIALS

The cost of materials shall be based on the Contractor’s wholesale price from the supply house, plus the correlated fixed fee. Invoices
must include an aggregate cost for all materials, including the sum of wholesale price from the supply house, plus the correlated fixed
fee identified above for the aggregate amount. The District reserves the right, at its sole discretion, to furnish equipment and materials
for any and all jobs or work performed pursuant to this contract.



Bladorn Investments, Inc., d/b/a Monarch Direct 80.00

Signs Experts, LLC 78.80

i2 Visual, Inc. 78.33

Lee Designs, LLC 74.50

Sign On, LLC 63.78

US Sign and Mill, Inc. 48.18

SignUp 33.75

Thomas United, Inc. d/b/a Signs By Tomorrow 32.35

JR Purch  Inc., d/b/a Crown Trophy of Cape Coral 23.23

77 VENDOR(S) WERE NOTIFIED OF ITN
9 VENDOR(S) SUBMITTED RESPONSE

68 VENDOR(S) DID NOT RESPOND

APPROVED BY: Lauri Adams, Procurement Agent
Department of Procurement Services
Date: October 23, 2025

ITN No. N257508LA
Signs - Products, Installation & Repair
Scoring of Written Proposals
October 1, 2025      
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