
Item No. UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT UNIT PRICE

1 LS $287.50 LS $364.00 LS $600  per LS $450.00

2 LF $281.75 LF $328.00 LF see letter of transmittal LF $414.00

3 EA $914.25 EA $983.00 EA $715.00 EA $1,242.00

4 EA $1,066.05 EA $1,179.00 EA $790.00 EA $1,490.00

5 EA $1,219.00 EA $1,311.00 EA $870.00 EA $1,656.00

6 EA $356.50 EA $509.00 EA $615.00 EA $643.00

7 EA $356.50 EA $744.00 EA $690.00 EA $940.00

8 EA $655.50 EA $929.00 EA $740.00 EA $1,242.00

9 EA $914.25 EA $1,174.00 EA $1,015.00 EA $1,483.00

10 EA $818.80 EA $1,368.00 EA $936.00 EA $1,286.00

11 EA $563.50 EA $648.00 EA $590.00 EA $818.00

12 EA $845.25 EA $1,229.00 EA $850.00 EA $1,553.00

13 EA $1,380.00 EA $2,321.00 EA $1,650.00 EA $2,933.00

14 EA $1,725.00 EA $3,017.00 EA $1,850.00 EA $3,813.00

15 EA $1,610.00 EA $2,503.00 EA $1,850.00 EA $3,163.00

16 EA $1,955.00 EA $3,274.00 EA $2,050.00 EA $3,630.00

17 EA $1,293.75 EA $1,475.00 EA $660.00 EA $1,863.00

18 EA $1,508.80 EA $1,769.00 EA $800.00 EA $2,236.00

Base Drawer (3 drawers) 24" x 24" x 24" 

File Drawer (3 drawers) 30" x 24" x 24"

Wall Cabinets >< 21.1" - 36"  x  >< 36.1" - 42" x 12"

Tall Pantry  30" x >< 84" - 96" x 24"

Cubbies < 36" x < 24" x < 24"

Montgomery W. Winslow, Inc.
ATTN: Montgomery Winslow/Jake 

Hutto
11300 Deal Rd.

North Fort Myers, FL  33917

PHONE: 239-707-9755

EMAIL: mwwinslowinc@aol.com
EMAIL: jakehutto12@gmail.com

PROPOSED RATES

Base Cabinet  >< 42.1" -  48" X 32.5" x 24"

Base Drawer (1 drawer + 2 doors) >36" x 32.5" x 24" 

PHONE: 239-693-8939

EMAIL: bg@blbfl.com 
EMAIL: bp@blbfl.com 

Big League Builders, Inc.
ATTN: Bo Greenwell/Baylie Pohle

16301 Palm Beach Blvd., Unit 1
Alva, FL  33920

PHONE: 239-204-9322

The School District of  Lee County, Florida
 Department of Procurement Services

2855 Colonial Blvd.,
 Fort Myers, Florida  33966

Tall Pantry  24" x >< 84" - 96" x 24"

Casework Services
ITN No. N257475DB

DESCRIPTION

Shop Drawings (LS)

OPENING DATE: TUESDAY, JULY 29, 2025 AT 2:00 PM
EFFECTIVE DATE: SEPTEMBER 10, 2025

Cabinets (LF) (Line Bore) Include minimum 2 shelves per box

Base Cabinet  < 36" x 32.5" x 24"

Base Cabinet  >< 36.1" -  42" x 32.5" x 24"

Base Drawers >< 15.1" x 21" x 32.5" x 24"

Integrity Builders of SWFL
ATTN: Kelly Barnes/Jake Hutto

3820 Colonial Blvd., #200
Fort Myers, FL  33966

EMAIL: jake@integritybuilders.org

Cubbies >< 36.1" - 42" x < 24" x <24"

Tall Pantry 30" x >< 84" - 96" x 30"

Wall Cabinets  < 21" x < 36" x 12"

Tall Pantry 24" x >< 84" - 96"  x 30"

Base Drawers  < 15" x 32.5" x 24"

BEST AND FINAL OFFER BEST AND FINAL OFFER

Ward and Waters, Inc.
ATTN: Curtis Waters/Jeri Strout

5001 Luckett Road, #3-4
Fort Myers, FL  33905

PHONE: 239-689-8635

EMAIL: curt@wardandwaters.com
EMAIL: accounting@wardandwaters.com

BEST AND FINAL OFFER



Montgomery W. Winslow, Inc.
ATTN: Montgomery Winslow/Jake 

Hutto
11300 Deal Rd.

North Fort Myers, FL  33917

PHONE: 239-707-9755

EMAIL: mwwinslowinc@aol.com
EMAIL: jakehutto12@gmail.com

 

PHONE: 239-693-8939

EMAIL: bg@blbfl.com 
EMAIL: bp@blbfl.com 

Big League Builders, Inc.
ATTN: Bo Greenwell/Baylie Pohle

16301 Palm Beach Blvd., Unit 1
Alva, FL  33920

PHONE: 239-204-9322

The School District of  Lee County, Florida
 Department of Procurement Services

2855 Colonial Blvd.,
 Fort Myers, Florida  33966

Casework Services
ITN No. N257475DB

OPENING DATE: TUESDAY, JULY 29, 2025 AT 2:00 PM
EFFECTIVE DATE: SEPTEMBER 10, 2025

Integrity Builders of SWFL
ATTN: Kelly Barnes/Jake Hutto

3820 Colonial Blvd., #200
Fort Myers, FL  33966

EMAIL: jake@integritybuilders.org

      

Ward and Waters, Inc.
ATTN: Curtis Waters/Jeri Strout

5001 Luckett Road, #3-4
Fort Myers, FL  33905

PHONE: 239-689-8635

EMAIL: curt@wardandwaters.com
EMAIL: accounting@wardandwaters.com

   

19 EA $1,135.05 EA $951.00 EA $915 per W/spec sink EA $966.00 no sink

20 EA $1,316.75 EA $1,043.00 EA $990 per W/spec sink EA $1,138.00 no sink

21 EA $168.00 EA $150.00 EA $400.00 EA NO BID

22 EA $181.00 EA $150.00 EA $500.00 EA NO BID

23 LF $431.25 LF $494.00 LF see letter of transmittal LF $627.00

24 SF $40.25 SF $23.50 SF $30.00 SF $21.00

25 SF $34.50 SF $13.60 SF $20.00 SF $11.50

26 LF $5.75 LF $2.75 LF $2.50 per ft LF NO BID

27 LF $64.40 LF $13.00 LF $15.00 LF $11.50

28 LF $97.75 LF $219.00 LF $50.00 LF $276.00

29 LF $126.50 LF $237.00 LF $70.00 LF $299.00

30 LF $92.00 LF $437.00 LF $225.00 LF $552.00

31 EA $17.25 EA $9.50 EA included with cabinet EA $8.00

32 EA $109.25 EA $13.00 EA $75.00 EA $11.50

33 EA $1,897.50 EA $1,092.00 EA bid per each EA $1,380.00

COST COST COST COST

34 HR $175.00 HR $165.00 HR $115/$175 HR $175.00

35 HR $247.00 HR $165.00 HR $65/$100 HR $175.00

36 HR $180.75 HR $165.00 HR $115/175 HR NO BID

Sink Base  < 30" x 32.5" x 24" Includes Sink

Faucet (See Specifications)

Bookcases

Back Splash

ADDITIONAL SERVICES

Gas: Remove ONLY / Cap

Sink Base >36.0" x 32.5" x 24" Includes Sink

Countertops (Stand alone) Includes mounting brackets

Countertops (Starboard material) See Specifications

Bubbler (See Specifications)

Countertops (cabinet application)

Doors

Cove Base (4" Height)

Extra Shelves

Hardware Includes Installation (See specifications)

Other (Steps, Trophy cases, etc…)

Plumber: Remove / Relocate / Install

Cabinet door Locks (Includes installation)

Electrician: Remove / Relocate / Install
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37 HR $105.00 HR $100.00 HR $65/$100 HR $80.00

38
HR $92.00 HR $100.00 HR $65/$100 HR $65.00

100 VENDORS WERE NOTIFIED

4 VENDORS SUBMITTED A RESPONSIVE PROPOSAL

3
VENDORS SUBMITTED A NO-BID

93
VENDORS DID NOT RESPOND

08.13.25
APPROVED BY: Deborah Gemelli Date

PROCUREMENT AGENT

ITN NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER AND DESCRIPTION MUST BE ON REQUISITION. TABULATION ONLY. THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER

It is recommended that this ITN be awarded to Big League Builders, Inc., Integrity Builders of SWFL, and Ward and Waters, Inc., being the highest ranked, best value firm(s) based 
on the evaluation committee ranking and negotiated pricing.

All Dimensions are labelled as WxHxD (inches)

Price Per EA includes; manufacture, Installations, & / or labor

Price Per LF includes; manufacture, Installations, & / or labor

Price Per SF includes; manufacture, Installations, & / or labor

Handyman: Remove / Relocate / Repair / Install Non-specialized 
items

Disposal of Existing Casework (Labor)

NOTES

AWARDED VENDOR



 Fixed Fee Amount for Materials for Billing 
Period 

$                              - $99.00 $                      -
$100.00 $499.00 $15.00 
$500.00 $999.00 $40.00 

$1,000.00 $1,499.00 $65.00 
$1,500.00 $2,499.00 $100.00 
$2,000.00 $4,999.00 $185.00 
$5,000.00 $8,999.00 $380.00 
$9,000.00 $14,999.00 $675.00 

$15,000.00 $24,999.00 $1,100.00 
$25,000.00 $44,999.00 $2,000.00 
$45,000.00 $74,000.00 $3,000.00 
$75,000.00 $124,000.00 $5,000.00 

$125,000.00 $149,000.00 $6,500.00 
$150,000.00 $199,000.00 $8,700.00 
$200,000.00 $249,000.00 $10,100.00 
$250,000.00 $299,999.00 $11,000.00 
$300,000.00 $349,999.00 $13,000.00 
$350,000.00 $399,999.00 $15,000.00 
$400,000.00 $449,999.00 $17,000.00 
$450,000.00 $499,999.00 $19,000.00 
$500,000.00 $549,999.00 $21,000.00 
$550,000.00 $599,999.00 $23,000.00 
$600,000.00 $649,999.00 $25,000.00 
$650,000.00 $699,999.00 $27,000.00 
$700,000.00 $749,999.00 $29,000.00 
$750,000.00 $799,999.00 $31,000.00 
$800,000.00 $849,999.00 $33,000.00 
$850,000.00 $899,999.00 $35,000.00 
$900,000.00 $949,999.00 $37,000.00 
$950,000.00 $999,999.00 $39,000.00 

TABLE 1: FIXED FEE RATE SCHEDULE

Range of Cost of Materials for Billing Period

ALTERNATE PRODUCTS
If alternate products, other than those listed in the specifications, are required, the cost to the District of the alternate
products shall be based on the Contractor’s wholesale price from the supply house, and shall include a negotiated fixed fee.
The District reserves the right, at its sole discretion, to furnish equipment and materials for any and all jobs or work
performed pursuant to this contract. Invoices must include an aggregate cost for all alternate manufacturer products,
including the wholesale price from the supply house, plus the correlated fixed fee identified above for the aggregate
amount.

COST OF MATERIALS



RENTAL EQUIPMENT
The cost of materials shall be based on the Contractor’s wholesale price from the supply house, plus the correlated fixed
fee. Invoices must include an aggregate cost for all materials, including the sum of wholesale price from the supply house,
plus the correlated fixed fee identified above for the aggregate amount. The District reserves the right, at its sole discretion,
to furnish equipment and materials for any and all jobs or work performed pursuant to this contract.

SUB-CONTRACTED LABOR RATES
Sub-Contracted labor rates are to be billed at either a rate not to exceed the contractor labor rates, or at a fixed rate to be 
negotiated at the time of work.

The cost of materials shall be based on the Contractor’s wholesale price from the supply house, plus the correlated fixed
fee. Invoices must include an aggregate cost for all materials, including the sum of wholesale price from the supply house,
plus the correlated fixed fee identified above for the aggregate amount. The District reserves the right, at its sole discretion,
to furnish equipment and materials for any and all jobs or work performed pursuant to this contract.


	Bid Tab
	Table 1-Fixed Fee Rate Schedule

