

<p>The School District of Lee County Department of Procurement Services 2855 Colonial Blvd. Fort Myers, Florida 33966 Award - July 27, 2021 through July 26, 2022 Renewed through July 26, 2025</p> <p>CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO)</p> <p>BID NO. B207396JC ~ WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS ~ OPENING DATE: THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM REVISED: October 14, 2024</p>	<p>Agni Enterprises, LLC d/b/a Head to Heels Safety Supplies Attn: Subbarayan R. Pochi 7950 NW 155th Street, Suite 103 Miami Lakes, FL 33016</p>			<p>All Florida Paper Attn: Mario Vale 9150 NW 105th Way Miami, FL 33178</p>			<p>Imperial Dade Attn: Vickie Scaglione 9601 NW 112th Avenue Miami, FL 33178</p>			<p>Pyramid School Products Attn: Kenneth D. Miller 6510 North 54th Street Tampa, FL 33610</p>			<p>Tranzonic d/b/a CCP Industries, Inc. Attn: Pete Chojnacki/Laura Dalton 26301 Curtis Wright Parkway, #200 Richmond Heights, OH 44143</p>		
	Phone:	(305) 712-6653	Phone:	(305) 815-5366	Phone:	(305) 805-2600	Phone:	(800) 792-2644	Phone:	(216) 243-6844					
	Fax:	(888) 592-3667	Fax:	(305) 884-8424	Fax:	(305) 883-9363	Fax:	(813) 621-7688	Fax:	(900) 445-8366					
	Email:	cservice@headtoheels.net	Email:	mvale@allfloridapaper.com	Email:	vscaglione@imperialdade.com miamibids@imperialdade.com	Email:	biddept@pyramidsp.com	Email:	pehojnacki@ccpind.com ldalton@ccpind.com					

ITEM NO.	SDLC Part No.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATE D ANNUAL QTY	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DELIVERED PRICE	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DELIVERED PRICE	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DELIVERED PRICE	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DELIVERED PRICE	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DELIVERED PRICE
1.	CW-69001	Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart Black, Plastic, Rectangular, 14 1/2" x 10 1/2" x 15" high, Continental #2818BLK, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	600	No Bid			NTINENTAL 2818B	12	\$3.13	Rubbermaid 295600BLA	12	\$6.88	RUBBERMAID 2956BK **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM ORDER IS \$4000.00, COMBINED RUBBERMAID ITEMS**	12	\$5.99			
2.	CW-69002	Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart Beige, Plastic, Rectangular, 14 1/2" x 10 1/2" x 15" high, Continental #2818BE, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	120	No Bid				No Bid		Rubbermaid 295600BE	12	\$6.88	RUBBERMAID 2956B MINIMUM ORDER IS \$4000.00, COMBINED RUBBERMAID ITEMS**	12	\$5.99			
3.	CW-69003	Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart Gray, Plastic, Rectangular, 14 1/2" x 10 1/2" x 15" high, Continental 2818GY, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	120	No Bid				No Bid		Rubbermaid 295600GR	12	\$6.88	RUBBERMAID 2956G **CONTINENTAL MINIMUM ORDER IS \$4000.00, COMBINED RUBBERMAID ITEMS**	12	\$5.99			
4.	CW-73700	Scouring Pad, Green, 6" x 9", 10/Package, Continental 23107, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	1000	No Bid			ABCO SC-N200	60	\$0.26 \$18.49/CAS	Victoria Bay VB74MSS	20	\$0.52	ACS #5096 **FULL CASES ONLY**	60 EA/Cs	\$0.32 \$19.20/CAS			
5.	CW-74650	Gloves, Nitrile, SMALL, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 14" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	144	Ansell 012-37-155-7	12Dz/Cs	\$2.35/Ea \$338.09/Cs		No Bid			No Bid		IMPACT #8217SMALL *ITEM PRICED PER PAIR* **FULL CASES ONLY**	12 PAIR	\$2.49			
6.	CW-74651	Gloves, Nitrile, MEDIUM, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 14" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	576	SafetyZone GNGF-M-15C	12Dz/Cs	\$1.71 each \$246.74		No Bid			No Bid		IMPACT #8217MEDIUM *ITEM PRICED PER PAIR* **FULL CASES ONLY**	12 PAIR	\$2.49			
7.	CW-74652	Gloves, Nitrile, LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 14" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	576	SafetyZone GNGF-L-15C	12Dz/Cs	\$1.71 each \$246.74		No Bid			No Bid		IMPACT #8217LARGE *ITEM PRICED PER PAIR* **FULL CASES ONLY**	12 PAIR	\$2.49			
8.	CW-74653	Gloves, Nitrile, X-LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 14" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	576	SafetyZone GNGF-XL-15C	12Dz/Cs	\$1.71 each 246.74		No Bid		Safetyzone GNGU-MD-22-18 (No Small)	1pr/pkg, 36pair/cs	6.10pr	IMPACT #8217X-LARGE *ITEM PRICED PER PAIR* **FULL CASES ONLY**	12 PAIR	\$2.49			
9.	CW-74655	Gloves, Nitrile, SMALL Size 7, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 19" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	144	Ansell 012-37-165-7	3Dz/Cs	\$11.978/Ea \$431.21/Cs		No Bid		Safetyzone GNGU-MD-22-18 (No Small)	1pr/pkg, 36pair/cs	\$6.10	IMPACT #8217-SMALL *ITEM PRICED PER PAIR* **FULL CASES ONLY**	12 PAIR	\$2.49 \$29.88 case			
10.	CW-74656	Gloves, Nitrile, MEDIUM Size 8, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 19" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	144	Ansell 012-37-165-8	3Dz/Cs	\$11.978/Ea \$431.21/Cs		No Bid		Safetyzone GNGU-MD-22-18	1pr/pkg, 36pair/cs	\$6.10	IMPACT #8217-MED *ITEM PRICED PER PAIR* **FULL CASES ONLY**	12 PAIR	\$2.49 \$29.88 case			
11.	CW-74657	Gloves, Nitrile, LARGE Size 9, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 19" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	144	Ansell 012-37-165-9	3Dz/Cs	\$11.978/Ea \$431.21/Cs		No Bid		Safetyzone GNGU-LG-22-18	1pr/pkg, 36pair/cs	\$6.10	IMPACT #8217-LARGE *ITEM PRICED PER PAIR* **FULL CASES ONLY**	12 PAIR	\$2.49 \$29.88 case			
12.	CW-74658	Gloves, Nitrile, X LARGE Size 10, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 19" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	144	Ansell 012-37-165-10	3Dz/Cs	\$11.978/Ea \$431.21/Cs		No Bid		Safetyzone GNGU-XL-22-18	1pr/pkg, 36pair/cs	\$6.10	IMPACT #8217-XL *ITEM PRICED PER PAIR* **FULL CASES ONLY**	12 PAIR	\$2.49 \$29.88 case			
13.	CW-74659	Gloves, Nitrile, XX LARGE Size 11, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 19" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED ITEM NOT NEEDED	144	SafetyZone GNGU-2X-22-18	3Dz/Cs	\$8.76 each \$315.46		No Bid			No Bid		No Bid					
14.	CW-77188	Toilet Bowl container, Continental J50600, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	120	No Bid				No Bid		Rubbermaid 631100WHT	24	\$2.36	IMPACT #150 280100 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 72 EA**	12	\$3.00			
14a.	CW-77189	Toilet Bowl Brush, Must Include Container, Continental J50600, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	120	LIBMAN LBN1022CT	4/Ct	\$16.81 each \$67.27		No Bid		Rubbermaid 631000WHT	24	\$1.57	IMPACT #150 280100 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 72 EA**	12	\$0.99			

DECLINED TO RENEW 07.27.23

15.	CW-77190	Bag, Replacement for Janitor Cart, Continental 1884 OR APPROVED EQUAL	60	No Bid			CONTINENTAL 188YW	6	\$14.89	Rubbermaid 1966719	4	\$27.92	RUBBERMAID #188YW **FULL CASES ONLY**	6	\$27.98
16.	CW-77200	Broom, Lobby, Polypropylene Fill, 7.5" X 2" W X 35" H, Tough Polypropylene with Flagged Bristles to Trap Fine Particles, ABCO BR-1021 MC or Rubbermaid 6374, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	360	BOARDWALK BWK951BP	12/Ct	\$73.04	ABCO BR-1021MC	12	\$3.10 Each \$25.91 CS	Abco BR1021MC	12	\$2.99	ABCO #BR1021MC **FULL CASES ONLY**	12	\$8.99
17.	CW-77206	Broom, Push Fine Sweep/Medium Sweep, 24", Anchor Style Block, Carlisle 41871, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	48	No Bid			No Bid			Janico 4024	12	\$9.52	BETTER BRUSH # 100124 **FULL CASES ONLY**	12	\$10.99
18.	CW-77207	Broom, Push, Fine Sweep/Medium Sweep, 36", Anchor Style block, Carlisle 41872, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	48	No Bid			No Bid			Janico 4036	12	\$18.45	BETTER BRUSH # 100136 **FULL CASES ONLY**	12	\$19.99
19.	CW-77209	Broom, Slant, Standard Size, Angled Bristles, 48" Wood Handle Flagged Poly Bristle Tips, Commercial Quality, ABCO, BR-10054, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	480	ABKO BR-10054	6/Pk	5.99each\$35.93	ABCO BR-10054	12	\$5.30 EACH \$63.60 CS	Abco BR10054	12	\$5.58	ABCO #BR28SE **FULL CASES ONLY**	12	\$6.99
20.	CW-77210	Broom, Straight Corn 56", Wood Handle, Carlisle 4135467, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	120	BOARDWALK BWK932YCT	12/Ct	\$11.05 each \$132.65	ABCO BR-10036	6	\$8.34 each \$99.84 CS	Abco BR10036	6	\$21.58	BETTER BRUSH # 432033	12	\$8.99
21.	CW-77211	Broom, Synthetic Corn Broom 57", Wood Handle, Carlisle 41679, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	500	Carlisle 4167903	12/Ct	\$15.95/Ea \$191.40/Cs	No Bid			No Bid			CARLISLE #4167903 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 300 EA**	12	\$10.99
22.	CW-77235	Counter Brush, Pre Line, Self Flagging Bristles, ABCO #00100, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	48	BOARDWALK BWK5308	Ea	\$4.06	ABCO 00100	12	\$2.31 EACH \$27.72 CS	Abco 00100	12	\$2.10	ABCO #00100 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 48**	12	\$2.98
23.	CW-77236	Brush, Bi-Level Scrub Brush 3-angled Brush Design, Carlisle 40423, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	48	RDWALK BWK33	Ea	\$5.81	ABCO-00049	6	\$6.15 EACH \$36.90CS	Abco 00049	6	\$6.59	BETTER BRUSH #230310 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 48**	12	\$7.98
24.	CW-77237	Brush, Iron Handle, Scrub, Carlisle 36289, ABCO 00027, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	120	RUBBERMAID COMMERCIAL PROD. FG648200COBLT	Ea	\$3.21	ABCO 00027	12	\$3.37 EACH \$40.42CS	Abco 00027	12	\$1.00	ABCO #00027 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 120**	12	\$1.69
25.	CW-77238	Brush, Small Grout, Carlisle 365351, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	240	BOARDWALK BWK9008	Ea	\$2.07	ABCO 700020		\$1.61 Each \$19.20 CS	Carlisle 365351	ea	\$1.31	BETTER BRUSH # 310208 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 240**	12	\$0.99
26.	CW-77239	Brush, Pipe, 11", Curved Screw on, Unger Pipeo, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	12	UNGER UNGPIPE	Ea	\$36.04	No Bid			No Bid			UNGER #PIPEO **10 EA/CS... FULL CASES ONLY**	10	\$19.99
27.	CW-77300	Can, Garbage, 20 Gallon, Plastic, Blue Without lid, Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental #2000-1 Huskee, Blue, OR APPROVED EQUAL	60	RUBBERMAID COMMERCIAL PROD. RCP262073BLU	Ea	\$56.06	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
28.	CW-77303	Can, Garbage, 32 Gallon, Plastic, Blue Without lid, Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental #32001BL Huskee, Blue, OR APPROVED EQUAL	180	RUBBERMAID COMMERCIAL PROD RCP263273BE	Ea	\$44.16	CONTINENTAL 32001BL	6	14.88 EA	Rubbermaid 263200BLU	6	\$27.09	RUBBERMAID #FG2632BLUE **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM ORDER IS \$3800.00, COMBINED RUBBERMAID ITEMS**	6	\$24.99
29.	CW-77304	Can, Garbage, 44 Gallon, Plastic, Gray Without lid, Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental #4444GY HUSKEE OR APPROVED EQUAL	48	BOARDWALK BWK44GLWRGR A	Ea	\$35.36	No Bid			Rubbermaid 264360GR	4	\$39.64	RUBBERMAID #FG2643GY **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM ORDER IS \$3800.00, COMBINED RUBBERMAID ITEMS**	4	\$30.99
30.	CW-77305	Can, Garbage, 32 Gallon, Plastic, Gray Without lid, Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental #3200GY Huskee, Gray, OR APPROVED EQUAL	180	BOARDWALK BWK32GLWRGR A	Ea	\$56.38	No Bid			Rubbermaid 263200GR	6	\$27.09	RUBBERMAID #FG2632GY **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM ORDER IS \$3800.00, COMBINED RUBBERMAID ITEMS**	6	\$23.99
31.	CW-77320	Dolly for Garbage Cans to fit round 20 - 55 gallon cans, Rubbermaid 2640, Continental 3255, OR APPROVED EQUAL	120	RUBBERMAID COMMERCIAL PROD. RCP264000BK	Ea	\$69.39	CONTINENTAL 3255-4	4	\$27.00	Rubbermaid 264000BLA	2	\$26.66	RUBBERMAID FG2640 *FITS ALL RUBBERMAID CANS* **MINIMUM ORDER IS 48 EA**	4	\$24.99
32.	CW-77322	Janitor Cart, Continental184BL, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	48	Continental Commercial Product 184GY	Ea	\$221.39	No Bid			Rubbermaid FG617388BLA	1	\$127.87	RUBBERMAID FG6173 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 12 EA**	1	\$130.99

33.	CW-77410	Duster, Telescopic Handle, Lambs Wools Extension 58" with flexible head, SAMPLE REQUIRED	120	LAMBSKIN SPECIALITIES 350FLEX	Ea	\$14.04	No Bid			No Bid			LAMBSKIN SPEC # 360SFLEX **MINIMUM ORDER IS 108 EA**	36	\$7.59
34.	CW-77412	Treated Dust Cloth, 12" x 17", Chic 0413, 40 per bag, 10 bags per case CHIC 0413 OR APPROVED EQUAL	600	BOARDWALK BWKDSMFY	500/Cartron	\$82.99	No Bid			MDI 78404	10/50 104/sk	\$37.78	HOSPECO ANLR6A6FPW 150BAG, 10 BAGS/CS ***MINIMUM ORDER IS 112 CASES**	10/50	\$59.98
35.	CW-77415	Dust Pan, Lobby, 36" Handle, Plastic only, Continental 912, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	360	CONTINENTAL COMMERCIAL 912BK-12	Ea	\$13.10	ABCO DP-00204E	20	92 each\$107.04	Rubbermaid 253100BLA	6	\$9.24	ABCO DP CONTINENTAL #912 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 288 EA**	12	\$8.99
36.	CW-77416	Dust Pan, Counter Duster, Heavy Duty, Rubber, Continental 712, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	120	RUBBERMAID COMMERCIAL PROD 640-2005-CC	Ea	\$6.65	ABCO 00205HDS	12	84 each\$22.05C	Rubbermaid FG200500CHAR	\$12.00	\$2.23	RUBBERMAID #FG2005 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 120**	24	\$1.99
37.	CW-77500	Handle, Wet Mop Invader, Fiberglass handle, Quick Change, ABCO 01206NB, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	240	ABKO 01206-NB	Ea	\$12.04	ABCO 01206-NB	6	\$9.31 each \$51.54 CS	Janico 3201	12	\$8.62	ABCO #01206NB **MINIMUM ORDER IS 240**	12	\$9.99
38.	CW-77501	Handle, Wing Nut Style, ABCO 1203-NB, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	120	ABCO 01203-NBY	Ea	\$7.34	ABCO 01203-NB	6	71 each \$34.26 C	Abco 1203-NB	6	\$6.04	ABCO #01203NB **MINIMUM ORDER IS 120**	12	\$6.89
39.	CW-77505	Handle for Push Broom, Screw in Metal Tip, ABCO 01104, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	120	ABCO 01104	Ea	\$3.64	ABCO 01104	12	\$3.07 each \$36.84 CS	Abco 01104	12	\$3.29	ABCO #01104 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 120**	12	\$3.98
40.	CW-77507	Handle for Push Broom, 60", Wood Anchor Drilled, Carlisle #45270, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	60	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			ABCO #01113 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 60** (CARLISLE #45270 IS DISCONTINUED)	12	\$4.19
41.	CW-77509	Handle for Floor Squeegees, Metal, Unger AL140, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	60	UNGER UNGAL 140	Ea	\$36.48	No Bid			No Bid			UNGER #AL140 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 60**	10	\$20.98
42.	CW-77512	Extension Pole, 30' Ungar Opti-Loc Tele Pole, Ung-Ed900, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	10	UNGER UNGED900	Ea	\$219.99	No Bid			Unger ED900	10	\$126.14	UNGER #ED900 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 20 EA**	10	\$129.98
43.	CW-77514	Handle for Dry Mop, Clip On, Wood, ABCO 0146-NB, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	120	ABCO 01406-NB	Ea	\$8.67	ABCO 01406-NB	12	90 EACH \$63.60	Abco 01406NB	12	\$5.76	ABCO #01406NB **MINIMUM ORDER IS 120**	12	\$5.79
44.	CW-77520	High Duster Handle, Pipe Duster 54" Wooden Handle with Curved Metal Frame, Wilen E317, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	60	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
45.	CW-77521	High Duster Replacement Head, Cotton Mop head Designed to Fit Pipe Duster Handle and Frame, Heavy Weight Materials Can Be Washed for Extended Usage, Wilen E11700, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	120	WILEN E117000	Ea	\$27.79	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
46.	CW-77550	Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic White, for 20 Gallon Garbage Can, 6/Case, Continental #200-WH, OR APPROVED EQUAL	24	No Bid			No Bid			Rubbermaid FG261960WHT	6	\$9.46	CONTINENTAL #2000WH **MINIMUM ORDER IS 24**	6	DISCONTINUED
47.	CW-77551	Lid Only, Recycle Can, Plastic White with hole in center, fits 32 gallon can. Continental 3201-1 OR APPROVED EQUAL	48	No Bid			No Bid			Rubbermaid 1788376**IN BLUE ONLY**	6	\$15.37	CONTINENTAL #3201-1 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 48**	6	DISCONTINUED
48.	CW-77552	Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic, White, fits 32 Gallon Continental Round Garbage Can, Continental 3201, OR APPROVED EQUAL	12	No Bid			CONTINENTAL 3201GY	6	4.90 EA	Rubbermaid FG263100WHT	12	\$9.14	RUBBERMAID #FG263100WHT **MINIMUM ORDER IS 12** WHITE IS DISCONTINUED	6	\$7.99
49.	CW-77553	Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic, Gray, fits 32 Gallon Continental Round Garbage Can, Continental 3201, OR APPROVED EQUAL	60	CONTINENTAL WG239005GY	Ea	\$29.60	No Bid			Rubbermaid FG263100GRAY	12	\$9.14	RUBBERMAID #FG263100GRAY **MINIMUM ORDER IS 60**	6	\$7.99
50.	CW-77554	Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic gray, for 44 Gallon Garbage Can, 6/Case, Continental # 4445, OR APPROVED EQUAL	24	CONTINENTAL WG239005GY	Ea	\$25.03	No Bid			Rubbermaid 264560GRAY	4	\$14.26	RUBBERMAID #FG264560GY **MINIMUM ORDER IS 24**	4	\$10.99
51.	CW-77555	Putty Knife, 1 1/4", Flex Metal Blade with Plastic Handle, TOLCO 280106, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	360	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			TOLCO #280106 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 144 EA**	24	\$1.79
52.	CW-77605	Mop, Bowl, Cotton, 14" Long, 144/Box, Toolco 2801 OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	700	BOARDWALK BWK00160EA	Ea	\$3.43	ABCO 02000	12	6 EACH \$10.32 C	Janico 4100	100	\$0.94	TOLCO #280100 *ACRYLIC**MINIMUM ORDER IS 144 EA**	144	\$0.99
53.	CW-77610	Traffic Cones, 36" Orange Plastic, with reflective strip, JBC #1093947, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	240	BOARDWALK BWK00160EA	Ea	\$72.50	No Bid			No Bid			JBC #1093947 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 288 EA**	288/PALLET	\$30.99
54.	CW-77613	Wet Floor Sign, 37", ABCO WS-001, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	120	ABCO WG708141	Ea	\$38.23	ABCO WS-0001	10	\$6.59 each \$65.90 CS	Abco WS0001	10	\$5.14	ABCO #WS0001 *24** **ABCO MINIMUM ORDER IS \$1300.00, COMBINED ABCO ITEMS**	10	\$6.99
55.	CW-77614	Mop Bucket, Wringer Combo, Yellow, Rubbermaid 7580, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	200	RUBBERMAID WS0001	10 sign/Cs	\$97.09	ABCO T01007	1	\$53.10	Rubbermaid 7580	1	\$73.11	RUBBERMAID #FG7580 **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM ORDER IS \$4000.00, COMBINED RUBBERMAID ITEMS**	1	\$69.88
56.	CW-77626	Wet Mops, Medium, Cotton/Synthetic Blend, Loop ends, 1 1/4" Headband, Dupont Midew Resistant, ABCO 203MCS, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	1600	ABCO FG758088 YEL	Ea	\$103.35	ABCO LM-203MCS	12	\$4.16 each \$49.92 CS	ABCO LM203MCS	12	\$3.97	ABCO #LM203MCS **ABCO MINIMUM ORDER IS \$1500.00, COMBINED ABCO ITEMS**	12	\$4.19
57.	CW-77627	Wet Mops, Large, Cotton/Synthetic Blend, Loop ends, 1 1/4" Headband, Dupont Midew Resistant, ABCO 203LCS, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	500	No Bid			ABCO LM-203LCS	12	06 each\$72.72 C	ABCO LM203LCS	12	\$5.87	ABCO #LM203LCS **ABCO MINIMUM ORDER IS \$1500.00, COMBINED ABCO ITEMS**	12	\$5.99

58.	CW-77628	Dry Mop Head, 24", ABCO DM26524, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	150	ABCO LM-203LCS	Ea	\$13.81	BCO DM-26524B	12	\$5.46 each \$65.52 CS	Abco DM26524B	12	\$5.79	ABCO #DM26524 **ABCO MINIMUM ORDER IS \$1500.00, COMBINED ABCO ITEMS**	\$12.00	\$6.19
59.	CW-77629	Dry Mop Head, 36", ABCO DM26536, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	80	BOARDWALK BWK1124	Ea	\$14.57	ABCO DM-26536B	12	\$7.39 each \$88.68 CS	Abco DM26536B	12	\$7.92	ABCO #DM26536 **ABCO MINIMUM ORDER IS \$1500.00, COMBINED ABCO ITEMS**	12	\$7.29
60.	CW-77630	Dry Mop Head, 48", ABCO DM26548, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	70	BOARDWALK BWK1336	Ea	\$14.30	ABCO DM-26548B	12	\$9.38 each \$112.56 CS	Abco DM26548B	12	\$10.06	ABCO #DM26548 **ABCO MINIMUM ORDER IS \$1500.00, COMBINED ABCO ITEMS**	12	\$9.99
61.	CW-77631	Dry Mop Head, 60", ABCO DM26560, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	30	BOARDWALK BWK1148	Ea	\$24.83	ABCO DM-26560B	6	\$11.37 each \$136.44 CS	Abco DM26560B	6	\$12.32	ABCO #CM26560 **ABCO MINIMUM ORDER IS \$1500.00, COMBINED ABCO ITEMS**	12	\$10.99
62.	CW-77632	Dry Mop Frames for Clip End Handle, 24", ABCO BH24524, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	48	BOARDWALK BWK1424	Ea	\$9.71	ABCO BH-24524WF	12	\$2.86 each \$34.32 CS	Abco BH24524	12	\$2.49	ABCO #BH24524 **ABCO MINIMUM ORDER IS \$1500.00, COMBINED ABCO ITEMS**	12	\$3.99
63.	CW-77633	Dry Mop Frames for Clip End Handle, 36", ABCO BH24536, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	48	BWK1436	Ea	\$12.13	ABCO BH-24536WF	12	\$4.06 each \$48.72 CS	Abco BH24536	12	\$3.17	ABCO #BH24536 **ABCO MINIMUM ORDER IS \$1500.00, COMBINED ABCO ITEMS**	12	\$4.99
64.	CW-77634	Dry Mop Frames for Clip End Handle, 48", ABCO BH24548, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	48	BOARDWALK BWK1436	Ea	\$6.06	ABCO BH-24548WF	12	\$4.88 each \$58.56 CS	Abco BH24548	12	\$4.19	ABCO #BH24548 **ABCO MINIMUM ORDER IS \$1500.00, COMBINED ABCO ITEMS**	12	\$5.99
65.	CW-77635	Dry Mop Frames for Clip End Handle, 60", ABCO BH24560, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	48	BOARDWALK BWK1460	Ea	\$18.28	ABCO BH-24560WF	6	\$7.77 each \$46.62 CS	Abco BH24560	6	\$5.76	ABCO # BH24560**ABCO MINIMUM ORDER IS \$1500.00, COMBINED ABCO ITEMS**	12	\$8.99
66.	CW-77637	Finish System, Microfiber 18" Mop, Rubbermaid Q800, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	70	RCPO800WHI	Ea	\$220.60			No Bid	Rubbermaid Q800	6	\$11.73	RUBBERMAID #Q800 **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM ORDER IS \$4000.00, COMBINED RUBBERMAID ITEMS**	6	\$12.99
67.	CW-77638	Finish System, Microfiber 18" Quick Connect Frame, Rubbermaid Q560, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	24	RUBBERMAID COMMERCIAL RCPO800WHI	6/Bx	\$19.19 EACH \$115.13			No Bid	Rubbermaid Q560	6	\$13.64	RUBBERMAID #Q560 **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM ORDER IS \$4000.00, COMBINED RUBBERMAID ITEMS**	6	\$18.99
68.	CW-77639	Finish System, Microfiber, Rubbermaid Q050, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	12	RUBBERMAID COMMERCIAL PROD. RCPO560	Ea	\$550.75			No Bid	Rubbermaid Q050	1	\$154.47	RUBBERMAID #Q050 **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM ORDER IS \$4000.00, COMBINED RUBBERMAID ITEMS**	6	\$169.98
69.	CW-77641	Finish System, Microfiber, Bucket, Rubbermaid Q930, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	12	RCPO930	Ea	\$254.41			No Bid	Rubbermaid Q930	1	\$78.66	RUBBERMAID #Q930 **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM ORDER IS \$4000.00, COMBINED RUBBERMAID ITEMS**	1	\$99.95
70.	CW-77642	Finished System, Microfiber Rubbermaid Mop Handle, 58" w/quick connect, #Q750, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	12	RUBBERMAID COMMERCIAL PROD RCPO930	Ea	\$132.28			No Bid	Rubbermaid Q750	6	\$7.56	RUBBERMAID #Q750 **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM ORDER IS \$4000.00, COMBINED RUBBERMAID ITEMS**	6	\$8.98
71.	CW-77643	Utility Pad Holder, Screw In with Built in Gripper Teeth and Swivel Head, TOLCO 280137, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	100	TOLCO TOC280137	Ea	\$109.53			No Bid				TOLCO #280157 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 100**	50	\$5.98
72.	CW-77644	Utility Pad, 4 1/2" X 10" Black, 5/PK, Continental 20969, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	48						No Bid	3M 8550B	10	\$3.28	CONTINENTAL #20969 *ITEM PRICED PER EACH...COST WOULD BE \$3.45 PER PACK OF 5* **MINIMUM ORDER IS 40 EA**	20	\$0.23 \$4.59 pack
73.	CW-77645	Cloth Head for Utility Pad Holder, 4"x10", Impact 2005, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	48						No Bid				IMPACT #2005 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 24 EA**	12	\$16.99
74.	CW-77720	Three Gallon Pail with spout, Continental 8114, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	120	IMPACT 2005	12/Pk	\$17.66 each \$211.93			No Bid	Abco T090302	12	\$6.44	RUBBERMAID #FG2614 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 60 EA**	12	\$8.99
75.	CW-77778	Rags, Blue, Approximately 14" x 17", 10 LB Box, RFT DT-HUCK, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	200						No Bid				HOSPECO #540-10 *ITEM PRICED PER 10# BOX* **MINIMUM ORDER IS 50 BOXES**	1	\$37.98
76.	CW-77779	Rags, Terry Cloth, Approximately 14" x 17", RFI DT-BAR MOP, 10LB, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	600						No Bid	Hospeco 534-10	10	\$22.84	HOSPECO #534-10 *ITEM PRICED PER 10# BOX* **MINIMUM ORDER IS 100 BOXES**	1	\$31.99
77.	CW-77850	Light Duty Scrubbing Sponge, 3 7/16" x 6 1/16", Gilt 20951, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	600						No Bid	Victoria Bay VB74MSS	20	\$0.52	HYDRA #70CHDW **MINIMUM ORDER IS 400 EA**	40	\$0.89
78.	CW-77851	Spray Bottles, 1 Quart, Continental #932, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	1000	BOARDWALK BWK00032	20/Ct	\$1.98 EA \$39.61 CS			No Bid	Janico 1132	100	\$0.62	IMPACT #5032WG	96	\$0.85
79.	CW-77852	Trigger Sprayers, Continental #922 HL, ONLY OR APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE REQUIRED	1400	BOARDWALK BWK03010	3/Pk	\$2.08 EACH \$6.25			No Bid	Janico 1003BW	200	\$0.62	IMPACT #4902 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 1000 EA**	250	\$0.89
80.	CW-77860	Window Squeegee, 12", ABCO BH-15006, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	120	ABCO BH-15006	Ea	\$4.83	ABCO BH-15006	1	\$2.00 CS	Abco BH15006	ea	\$1.99	5006 **MINIMUM ORDER IS	12	\$2.99
81.	CW-77861	Floor Squeegee, Foam Rubber, Universal Handle, 18" Unger MW450, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES	48	IMPACT PRODUCTS, LLCIMP6228	Ea	\$32.92			No Bid	Unger MW450	ea	\$9.26	UNGAR MW450 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 48**	12	\$8.99

82.	CW-77864	Floor Squeegee, Foam Rubber, Universal Handle, 30", Unger HM750, Carlisle 40083, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	48	UNGER UNGHM750	Ea	\$21.59	ABCO BH-14003	1	\$7.27 CS	Rubbermaid 9C2900BLA	10	\$17.71	UNGER #HM750 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 20 EA**	10	\$22.99
83.	CW-77866	Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 20" Red, Daily Wash Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED	30	BOARDWALK BWK4020RED	5/Cs	\$4.25 each \$21.05	ACS51-20	5	\$11.92	Victoria Bay VB20RBF	5	\$2.27	ACS #51-20 *ITEM PRICED PER EACH...COST WOULD BE \$12.15/CASE OF 5* **MINIMUM ORDER IS 30 EA**	5	\$2.69 \$13.45
84.	CW-77868	Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 20" Blue, Shower Scrub Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED	30	BOARDWALK BWK4020BLU	5/Cs	\$3.69 each \$18.44	ACS 53-20	5	\$11.92	Victoria Bay VB20BCF	5	\$2.27	ACS #53-20 *ITEM PRICED PER EACH...COST WOULD BE \$12.15/CASE OF 5* **MINIMUM ORDER IS 30**	5	\$2.69 \$13.45
85.	CW-77873	Pad, Burnishing, 20" Hevy Hogs Hair, SAMPLE REQUIRED	50	BOARDWAL BWK4020NHE	5/Cs	\$4.30 each \$21.53	No Bid			Victoria Bay VB20NTB	5	\$2.27	ACS #35-20 *ITEM PRICED PER EACH...COST WOULD BE \$12.15/CASE OF 5* **MINIMUM ORDER IS 50**	5	\$2.69 \$13.45
86.	CW-77874	Pumice Scouring Stick 6", US Pumice, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	240	U.S. PUMICE UPM12	12/Bx	\$3.62 each \$43.53	No Bid			Pumie UPM12	12	\$2.03	US PUMICE #UPM12 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 240**	12	\$2.89
87.	CW-77880	Goggles, Safety, Clear, Chemical Splash, Impact Resistant, Anti fog, Scratch Resistant, Elastic Strap, Condor 1VT70, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	320	MCR SAFETY CRW2230R	Ea	\$4.42	No Bid			3M 7100191924	10	\$17.98	IMPACT #7320 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 144 EA**	12	\$3.99
88.	CW-77890	Tape, Caution, Yellow 3" x 1000', IMACT 7328, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED	100	EMPIRE LEVEL EML771001	RI	\$14.10	No Bid			Profast CT	ea	9.56 rl	CORDOVA #T15101 **MINIMUM ORDER IS 60 ROLLS**	12	\$3.99
89.	CW-77891	Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 12" Red, Daily Wash Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED	60	BOARDWALK BWK4012RED	5/Ct	\$2.58 each \$12.93	No Bid			Victoria Bay VB12RBFP	5	\$1.04	ACS #51-12 *ITEM PRICED PER EACH...COST WOULD BE \$7.00/CASE OF 5* **MINIMUM ORDER IS 60**	5	\$6.89
90.	CW-77892	Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 12" Blue, Shower Scrub Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED	24	3M 61500044708	5/Ct	\$8.86 EACH \$33.42	No Bid			No Bid			ACS #53-12 *ITEM PRICED PER EACH...COST WOULD BE \$7.00/CASE OF 5* **MINIMUM ORDER IS 20 EA**	5	\$1.62
91.	CW-77893	Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 13" Blue, Shower Scrub Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED	12	BOARDWALK BWK4013BLU	5/Ct	\$2.14 EACH \$14.34	No Bid			No Bid			ACS #53-13 *ITEM PRICED PER EACH...COST WOULD BE \$7.35/CASE OF 5* **MINIMUM ORDER IS 10 EA**	5	\$1.79
92.	CW-77894	Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 13" Red, Daily Wash Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED	24	BOARDWALK BWK4013RED	5/Ct	\$2.14 EACH \$14.34	No Bid			Victoria Bay VB13RBFP	5	\$1.17	ACS #51-13 *ITEM PRICED PER EACH...COST WOULD BE \$7.35/CASE OF 5* **MINIMUM ORDER IS 20 EA**	5	\$1.79
93.	CW-77863	Floor Squeegee, 18", Unger MW450, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED		UNGER UNGMW450	Ea	\$7.25	ABCO BH-14001	1	\$4.77 CS	Unger MW450	ea	9.26ea	UNGER #MW450	10	\$8.99
94.	ARO	Arrival Time in Days	0 Days		15		21-30			10-14 A.R.O.					
95.	BOL	Percentage discount off balance of line:	0%		%		32%			15% (CONTACT KENNY MILLER FOR QUOTES AT (800) 792-2644 EXT 225 OR BY E-MAIL AT BIDDEPT@PYRAMIDSP.COM)					