
Item No. UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT UNIT PRICE UNIT UNIT PRICE

1 Per sq. ft. $38.00 - $62.00 Per sq. ft. $49.00 Per sq. ft. $39.58

2 Each $299.00
36x72

Each $279.00 Each $360.00

3 Each
$2,141 - $3,211

8x7, 9x7, 10x7, 16x7 Each $438.00 Each NO BID

4 Each
$618.00 - $953.00

4x6, 5x6, 5x7, 6x6, 6x7, 8x7 Each $438.00 Each $1,135.00

5 Per sq. ft. NO BID Per sq. ft. $4.00 Per sq. ft. $20.40

6 Per sq. ft.
$220.00 - $769.00

3x6 to 8x6 Per sq. ft. $4.00 Per sq. ft. NO BID

7 Each $110.99 Each $95.00 Each $80.00

8 Each
$42.00 - $96.00
16x4 or 12x12 Each $95.00 Each $65.00

9 Lump Sum $290.00 Lump Sum $330.00 Lump Sum $150.00

10 Per sq. ft. NO BID Per sq. ft. NO BID Per sq. ft. NO BID

11 Per sq. ft. NO BID Per sq. ft. NO BID Per sq. ft. NO BID

12 Per sq. ft. NO BID Per sq. ft. NO BID Per sq. ft. NO BID

13 Per mile NO BID Per mile NO BID Per mile NO BID

14 Per mile NONE Per mile $500.00 Per mile NO BID

15 NO BID NO BID NO BID

08.13.25
APPROVED BY: Deborah Gemelli Date

PROCUREMENT AGENT

CONTRACT NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER AND DESCRIPTION MUST BE ON REQUISITION. TABULATION ONLY. THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER

It is recommended that this Contract be awarded to Amazon Sheds & Gazebos, Inc., Suncrest Sheds, Inc., and Superior Sheds, Inc.

Gable Vent

Shipping Container (new)

Shipping Container - Delivery Fee

Delivery Fee

NOTES

AWARDED VENDOR

Ramp - Drive Up

Pre-wired Basic Electric (light, switch, and one (1) 110 outlet)

PHONE: 239-498-5558

EMAIL: Fili@amazonsheds.com
EMAIL: Juancarbayas@amazonsheds.com

Amazon Sheds and Gazebos, Inc.
ATTN: Filiberto Rodriguez/Juan Bayas

1300 Jean St.
Fort Myers, FL 33967

PHONE: 863-675-8600

The School District of  Lee County, Florida
 Department of Procurement Services

2855 Colonial Blvd.,
 Fort Myers, Florida  33966

Shipping Container - Delivery Fee

Storage Sheds, Containers, Shelters, Etc.
Contract No. C257494DB 

DESCRIPTION

Non-electrical Basic Shed with one (1) Walk-thru Door

EFFECTIVE DATE: JUNE 4, 2025

Additional Walk-thru Door

Garage Door

Roll-up Door

Ridge Vent

Suncrest Sheds, Inc.
ATTN: Brian Quinn

1451 Commerce Dr.
LaBelle, FL 33935

EMAIL: Lindap.scs@gmail.com

Shipping Container (used)

Attach Additional Price (List if applicable)

Ramp - Walk Up

RATES RATES

Superior Sheds, Inc.
ATTN: Hector Llamas/Patti Jones

13850 Palm Beach Blvd.
Fort Myers, FL 33905

PHONE: 239-693-0717

EMAIL: aperallon@superiorsheds.com
EMAIL: pjones@superiorsheds.com

RATES



Range of Materials Cost  Fixed Fee Amount for Materials for
for Billing Period Billing Period 
 $0.00 - $100.00  $                                    -   

 $100.00 - $500.00 $15.00 
 $500.00 - $1,000.00 $40.00 

 $1,000.00 - $1,500.00 $65.00 
 $1,500.00 - $2,500.00 $100.00 
 $,2,500.00 - $5,000.00 $200.00 
 $5,000.00 - $9,000.00 $375.00 

 $9,000.00 - $15,000.00 $675.00 
 $15,000.00 - $25,000.00 $1,100.00 
 $25,000.00 - $45,000.00 $1,950.00 
 $45,000.00 - $75,000.00 $3,100.00 

 $75,000.00 - $125,000.00 $5,300.00 
 $125,000.00 - $150,000.00 $6,500.00 
 $150,000.00 - $200,000.00 $8,700.00 
 $200,000.00 - $250,000.00 $10,200.00 

The cost of rental equipment will be reimbursed at the correlated fixed fee identified in Table 1: Fixed Fee
Rate Schedule (above). Invoices must include an aggregate cost for all rental equipment, including the cost
from the supplier, plus the negotiated fixed rate. All credits for rentals are to be returned to the District.

SUB-CONTRACTED LABOR RATES
Sub-Contracted labor rates are to be billed at either a rate not to exceed the contractor labor rates., or at a 
fixed rate to be negotiated at the time of work.

TABLE 1 – FIXED FEE RATE SCHEDULE

Alternative Products, Cost of Materials, Rental Equipment and Sub-Contracted Labor Rates

TABLE 1: FIXED FEE RATE SCHEDULE

ALTERNATE PRODUCTS

If alternate products, other than those listed in the specifications, are required, the cost to the District of the
alternate products shall be based on the Contractor’s wholesale price from the supply house, and shall
include a negotiated fixed fee. The District reserves the right, at its sole discretion, to furnish equipment and
materials for any and all jobs or work performed pursuant to this contract. Invoices must include an aggregate
cost for all alternate manufacturer products, including the wholesale price from the supply house, plus the
correlated fixed fee identified (above) for the aggregate amount.

COST OF MATERIALS

The cost of materials shall be based on the Contractor’s wholesale price from the supply house, plus the
correlated fixed fee. Invoices must include an aggregate cost for all materials, including the sum of wholesale
price from the supply house, plus the correlated fixed fee identified in Table 1: Fixed Fee Rate Schedule
(above) for the aggregate amount. The District reserves the right, at its sole discretion, to furnish equipment
and materials for any and all jobs or work performed pursuant to this contract.

RENTAL EQUIPMENT
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