
SECONDARY AWARDED VENDORS

Contact Name: Contact Name: Contact Name: Contact Name:

Phone: Phone: Phone: Phone:

Email: Email: Email: Email:

Line Item
DWO Item 

Number
Product Name & Number QTY Per Case/Package Unit Price Product Name & Number QTY Per Case/Package Unit Price Product Name & Number QTY Per Case/Package Unit Price Product Name & Number QTY Per Case/Package Unit Price

1. CW-77900

2. CW-77901 BWK6180
500 Sheets/Roll, 96 

Rolls/Carton
82.30$                Probrands 191810 96 rolls per case  $                  29.28 Victoria Bay VBTTST4305 96/500 31.29$                Resolute Tissue 276 as per 

sample
96 30.39$                

3. CW-77903 BWK6101 12/Carton 59.53$                Probrands 30003 12 ROLLS PER CASE  $                  21.22 South Fla Tissue 200001 12/2000 26.80$                Resolute Tissue 901 as per 
sample

12 24.33$                

4. CW-77904 BWK6100B 12 Rolls/Carton 52.72$                PROBRANDS 192312 12 ROLLS PER CASE 19.72$                  Victoria Bay VBJT2100 12/1000 23.94$                Resolute Tissue 800 as per 
sample

12  $               19.22 

5. CW-77905 GEN1507 6 Rolls/Carton 50.05$                PROBRANDS 192200 6 ROLLS/CASE 22.05$                  South Fla Tissue JRT20002 6/2000 25.81$                Resolute Tissue 062 as per 
sample

6  $               21.55 

6. CW-77909 GEN1508
250 Towels/Pack, 16 

Packs/Carton
41.64$                PROBRANDS 191370 4000/CASE 19.14$                  Cascades H115 4000 19.94$                Santoray 4083 as per 

sample
4000  $               17.61 

7. CW-77910 GEN1508
250 Towels/Pack, 16 

Packs/Carton
39.40$                PROBRANDS 191320 16X250 PER CASE 18.84$                  Victoria Bay VBMF91K 4000 15.99$                Santoray 0430 as per 

sample
16/250  $               15.10 

8. CW-77911 GEN1825 6 Rolls/Carton 45.83$                Probrands 191500 6 rolls per case 21.67$                  Victoria Bay VBRT800K 6/800 17.99$                Santoray 80800 as per 
sample

6  $               17.70 

9. CW-77913 GEN1797 85/Roll, 30 Rolls/Carton 45.88$                tork hb1995a 30 ROLLS OF 84 SHEETS 27.72$                  Victoria Bay VBKT385 30/85  $               18.20 
Resolute Tissue 585 as per 

sample
30 21.86$                

10. CW-77994 KCP 34790 126/bx, 10 bx/cs 15.88$                Kimberly Clarke 34790 10/126 66.29$                Berk Wiper MW-60P-1 as 
per sample

10/126  $                 5.96 

11. CW-86666 PROBRANDS 191170 2 PLY 
FLAT BOX

30 BX/1CS 15.88$                  Victoria Bay VB Facial 30 BX/1CS  $               13.22 Santoray 4211C 30 BX/1CS 15.00$                

7-14 Business D 7 Days 10 Days 7 Days

0% 45% 38% 40%

DISCONTINUED DISCONTINUED DISCONTINUED

United Sales USA Corp.
8640 NW 39th Ct.

Coral Springs, FL 33065

Deborah Lappen

ARO (Arrival Time & Days After Receipt of Order): ARO (Arrival Time & Days After Receipt of Order): 

(305) 805-2600

vscaglione@imperialdade.com

Dade Paper & Bag, LLC 
d/b/a Imperial Dade
11641 W 40th Ave.
Hialeah, FL 33018

Vickie Scaglione

Wipers, Paper, 9.75” X 16.75” Nylon Reinforced, White, 126 per Dispenser Box, 
Kimberly-Clark #34790, OR APPROVED EQUAL

No Bid

No Bid

BOL (Balance of Line Percentage Discount): 

(949) 289-8813

bids@unitedsalesusa.com

Tissue, Facial, 100 per box, 30 boxes per case, Marcal #02930, Atlas #10, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Toilet Tissue, Standard White, 4.0" x 3.75", 500 sheets per roll, 2-Ply, Quilted, 96 
Rolls per Case, SCA TM6120S, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Rolls, 11” Perforated Sheets, PLEASE INCLUDE COMPLETE PRODUCT 
SPECS INCLUDING LENGTH OF ROLL AND CASE QUANTITY, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Jr. Jumbo Roll, 12 Rolls per Case, White, 2-Ply, 1000’ x 3.6”, 3.3” 
Core, SCA TJ0922A, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Jumbo Roll, 6 Rolls per Case, White, 2-Ply 2000’ x 3.6”, 3.3" Core SCA 
TJ1222A, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Single Fold, 9.1“ X 10.3”, Natural, 4000 per case, SK1850A, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Multi fold, UNO BIDleached, 250 sheets per Package, 16 Packages 
per Case, MUST BE PALLETIZED, Cascades, SCA MK530E, OR APPROVED EQUAL

BOL (Balance of Line Percentage Discount): BOL (Balance of Line Percentage Discount): 

DISCONTINUED

Agni Enterprises, LLC
d/b/a Head to Heels Safety Supplies

9021 SW 94th St., Unit 510
Maimi, FL 33176

Subbarayan R Pochi

(305) 712-6653

cservice@headtoheels.net

ARO (Arrival Time & Days After Receipt of Order): 

AWARDED VENDORS
PRIMARY AWARDED VENDORS

ARO (Arrival Time & Days After Receipt of Order): 

BOL (Balance of Line Percentage Discount): 

All Florida Paper, LLC
9150 NW 105th Way

Medley, FL 33178

Mario Vale & Angelica Gamboa

(305)755-4820

mvale@allfloridapaper.com
aagamboa@allfloridapaper.com

Description

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
 DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Paper Products for District Warehouse (DWO)

ITB No. B247489DO

OPENING DATE:
 September 17, 2024 @ 2:00 PM

REVISED: November 19, 2025

Towels, Paper, Rolls, 7.5 “ X 800’, 1.8 Core, Packed six (6) per case, Natural, SCA 
RK800E, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Standard, White Rolls, 4.4” X 3.8”, roll diameter minimum 4.4”, 1-
Ply, 96 Rolls per Case, MUST BE PALLETIZED, SCA-TJ1636S, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Jr. Jumbo Roll, 12 Rolls per Case, White, 1-Ply, 2000’ x 3.6”, 3.3” 
Core, SCA TJ0912A, OR APPROVED EQUAL

mailto:cservice@headtoheels.net
mailto:mvale@allfloridapaper.com;%20aagamboa@allfloridapaper.com
mailto:vscaglione@imperialdade.com
mailto:bids@unitedsalesusa.com
mailto:vscaglione@imperialdade.com
mailto:bids@unitedsalesusa.com
mailto:cservice@headtoheels.net
mailto:mvale@allfloridapaper.com;%20aagamboa@allfloridapaper.com
mailto:mvale@allfloridapaper.com;%20aagamboa@allfloridapaper.com
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10.07.24
APPROVED BY: Derek Ochoa DATE:

PRIMARY AWARDED VENDORS

SECONDARY AWARDED VENDORS

VENDORS SUBMITTED A RESPONSIVE BID
VENDORS SUBMITTED A NO - BID
VENDORS DID NOT RESPOND

VENDORS WERE NOTIFIED

It is recommended that this ITB be awarded to Agni Enterprises, LLC d/b/a Head to Heels Safety Supplies; 
All Florida Paper, LLC; Dade Paper & Bag, LLC d/b/a Imperial Dade; and United Sales USA Corp.; having 
submitted the lowest overall and best response meeting specifications.



Contact Name: Contact Name: Contact Name:
Phone: Phone: Phone:
Email: Email: Email:

Line Item DWO Item Number Product Name & Number QTY Per Case/Package Unit Price Product Name & Number QTY Per Case/Package Unit Price Product Name & Number QTY Per Case/Package

1. CW-77900 TM1616S TORK UNIVERSAL BATH
TISSUE 2-PLY WHITE

96/500 46.75$             Resolute #115 96 56.00$             MARCAL
NP-96100033U

96 RL/CS; 30 CS/PL

2. CW-77901 TM6130S ADVANCE BATH TISSUE
2-PLY 4.0X3.75 WHITE

48/CS 37.00$             Resolute #235 96 57.00$             MARCAL
0601849

80 RL/CS; 25 CS/PL

3. CW-77903 Boardwalk BWK6101 12/CS 39.99$             Nittany #NP-5203L 12 39.00$             MARCAL
0601848

12 RL/CS

4. CW-77904 Boardwalk BWk6102B 6/CS 26.99$             Resolute #700 12 29.25$             MARCAL
0601847

12 RL/CS; 48CS/PL

5. CW-77905
TORK TM6130S ADVANCE BATH 

TISSUE
2-PLY 4.0X3.75 WHITE

48/CS 44.95$             Nittany #NP-62000P-12 6 38.00$             MARCAL
NP-62000P-12

6 RL/CS; 54 CS/PL

6. CW-77909 ARRAY BASIC UNBL 16/250 26.99$             Central Poly #600N 4008 25.00$             MARCAL
P600N12334MARPRO

4008/CS; 54 CS/PL

7. CW-77910 MK530A TORK UNIVERSAL MULTIFLD 
TOWEL NATURAL

16/250 27.99$             Central Poly #200N 4000 24.95$             MARCAL
0601842

4000/CS; 63 CS/PL

8. CW-77911 RK800E TORK ADVANCE ROLL 
TOWEL7.85X800 NATURAL

6/Cs 36.99$             Marcal #P728N 6 28.77$             MARCAL
0601840

6 RL/CS; 55 CS/PL

9. CW-77913

HB9201 TORK ADVANCED 
HOUSEHOLD ROLL TOWEL 2-PLY  Roll 

length: 67.5 ft
Roll width:11 in; Roll diameter:5.2 in

Number of sheets:120; Sheet 
legth:6.8 in

30/120 49.99$             Resolute #585 30 29.00$             MARCAL
0616097

30 RL/CS; 24 CS/PL

10. CW-77994

PRISTINE® CLEAN WIPES
[CC6] WHITE SPUNLACE

COMPLETE PERFORMANCE
9"X17"

10 POP-UP BX/126, 
1,260/BUNDLE

91.75$             KIMBERLY CLARK
34790

126 wipes/box; 10 boxes/CS

10 Days 21 Days
1% 0%

Nelson Fermin Andrew Serhofer

Allure Hospitality Suppliers, Inc.
8351 NW 64th St.
Miami, FL 33166

Central Poly-Bag Corp.
2400 Bedle Pl.

Linden, NJ 07036NON AWARDED VENDORS
William Drazkowski

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winona, MN 55987

ITB No. B247489DO cs@allure-hospitality bids@centralpoly.com
Paper Products for District Warehouse (DWO) (305) 885-2484 (908) 862-7570 (507) 453-8548

ARO (Arrival Time & Days After Receipt of Order): 

narfp@fastenal.com

Description

Toilet Tissue, Standard, White Rolls, 4.4” X 3.8”, roll diameter minimum 4.4”, 1-Ply, 96 
Rolls per Case, MUST BE PALLETIZED, SCA-TJ1636S, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Standard White, 4.0" x 3.75", 500 sheets per roll, 2-Ply, Quilted, 96 Rolls per 
Case, SCA TM6120S, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Jr. Jumbo Roll, 12 Rolls per Case, White, 1-Ply, 2000’ x 3.6”, 3.3” Core, SCA 
TJ0912A, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Jr. Jumbo Roll, 12 Rolls per Case, White, 2-Ply, 1000’ x 3.6”, 3.3” Core, SCA 
TJ0922A, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Jumbo Roll, 6 Rolls per Case, White, 2-Ply 2000’ x 3.6”, 3.3" Core SCA 
TJ1222A, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Single Fold, 9.1“ X 10.3”, Natural, 4000 per case, SK1850A, OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Multi fold, UNO BIDleached, 250 sheets per Package, 16 Packages per 
Case, MUST BE PALLETIZED, Cascades, SCA MK530E, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Rolls, 7.5 “ X 800’, 1.8 Core, Packed six (6) per case, Natural, SCA RK800E, 
OR APPROVED EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Rolls, 11” Perforated Sheets, PLEASE INCLUDE COMPLETE PRODUCT SPECS 
INCLUDING LENGTH OF ROLL AND CASE QUANTITY, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Wipers, Paper, 9.75” X 16.75” Nylon Reinforced, White, 126 per Dispenser Box, Kimberly-
Clark #34790, OR APPROVED EQUAL

No Bid

BOL (Balance of Line Percentage Discount): BOL (Balance of Line Percentage Discount): BOL (Balance of Line Percentage Discount): 
ARO (Arrival Time & Days After Receipt of Order): ARO (Arrival Time & Days After Receipt of Order): 

mailto:cs@allure-hospitality
mailto:bids@centralpoly.com
mailto:cs@allure-hospitality
mailto:bids@centralpoly.com
mailto:narfp@fastenal.com


Line Item DWO Item Number

1. CW-77900

2. CW-77901

3. CW-77903

4. CW-77904

5. CW-77905

6. CW-77909

7. CW-77910

8. CW-77911

9. CW-77913

10. CW-77994

NON AWARDED VENDORS

ITB No. B247489DO
Paper Products for District Warehouse (DWO)

Description

Toilet Tissue, Standard, White Rolls, 4.4” X 3.8”, roll diameter minimum 4.4”, 1-Ply, 96 
Rolls per Case, MUST BE PALLETIZED, SCA-TJ1636S, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Standard White, 4.0" x 3.75", 500 sheets per roll, 2-Ply, Quilted, 96 Rolls per 
Case, SCA TM6120S, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Jr. Jumbo Roll, 12 Rolls per Case, White, 1-Ply, 2000’ x 3.6”, 3.3” Core, SCA 
TJ0912A, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Jr. Jumbo Roll, 12 Rolls per Case, White, 2-Ply, 1000’ x 3.6”, 3.3” Core, SCA 
TJ0922A, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Jumbo Roll, 6 Rolls per Case, White, 2-Ply 2000’ x 3.6”, 3.3" Core SCA 
TJ1222A, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Single Fold, 9.1“ X 10.3”, Natural, 4000 per case, SK1850A, OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Multi fold, UNO BIDleached, 250 sheets per Package, 16 Packages per 
Case, MUST BE PALLETIZED, Cascades, SCA MK530E, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Rolls, 7.5 “ X 800’, 1.8 Core, Packed six (6) per case, Natural, SCA RK800E, 
OR APPROVED EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Rolls, 11” Perforated Sheets, PLEASE INCLUDE COMPLETE PRODUCT SPECS 
INCLUDING LENGTH OF ROLL AND CASE QUANTITY, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Wipers, Paper, 9.75” X 16.75” Nylon Reinforced, White, 126 per Dispenser Box, Kimberly-
Clark #34790, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Contact Name: Contact Name:
Phone: Phone:
Email: Email:

Unit Price Product Name & Number QTY Per Case/Package Unit Price Product Name & Number QTY Per Case/Package Unit Price

55.74$              Excel Converting TOILET TISSUE 4.2X3.5 1PLY Item 
# ECI1000-1PLY

96 Rolls/case 54.36$             
Cascades PRO Select Standard Bath Tissue, 1-Ply, 

White, 1000 sheets, 96 rolls/pack, Septic Tank Safe, 
Recycled - B152

96 Rolls/Case 51.27$                     

46.77$              309116312 Renown Single Roll 2-Ply 4 in. x 3.75 in. 
Toilet Paper (500 Sheets Per Roll, 96 Rolls Per Case)

96 rolls/case 53.79$             
Cascades PRO Select Standard Bath Tissue, 2-Ply, 

White, 500 sheets, 96 rolls/pack, Septic Tank Safe, 
Recycled - B040

96 Rolls/Case  $                    38.64 

41.80$              328548232 RENOWN Eco 1-Ply Jumbo Roll Bath 
Tissue Jrt 2000 Feet Per Roll Case Of 12

12 rolls/case 44.80$             
Cascades PRO Select Jumbo Roll Bath Tissue, 1-Ply, 

White, 2000', 12 rolls/pack, Septic Tank Safe, Recycled - 
B212

12 Rolls/Case  $                    31.49 

31.64$              328548231 RENOWN 12 rolls/case 35.34$             
Cascades PRO Select Jumbo Roll Bath Tissue, 2-Ply, 

White, 1000', 12 rolls/pack, Septic Tank Safe, Certified, 
Recycled - B140

12 Rolls/Case  $                    24.41 

38.84$              328812222 Jrt Bath Tissue Jumbo Septic Safe 2-Ply 
White 12" Dia Case Of 6

6 rolls/case 37.80$             

24.66$              REN06003-WB Renown Natural Multifold Paper 
Towels (250 Sheets Per Pack 16 Packs Per Case)

250/pack 16 pack/case 27.12$             Cascades PRO Select Single fold Hand Towel, 1-Ply, 
Natural, 250 sheets, 16 packs, recycled - H115

16 packs/case ** $17.45

22.07$              REN06002-WB Renown White Multifold Paper 
Towels (250 Sheets per Pack 16 Packs per Case)

250/pack 16 pack/case 33.03$             Cascades PRO Select Multifold Hand Towel, 1-Ply, 
White, 250 sheets, 16 packs/pack, Recycled - H170

16 packs/case 19.19$                     

24.12$              REN06004-WB Renown Natural Hardwound Paper 
Towels (800 ft. Per Roll, 6 Rolls Per Case)

6 rolls/case 34.13$             Cascades PRO Select Roll Paper Towel, 1-Ply, Natural, 
800 feet, 6 rolls/pack, Recycled, Certified - H085

6 rolls/case 19.26$                     

28.29$              328548213 RENOWN Eco Perforated Kitchen Paper 
Towel Case Of 30

30 rolls/case 33.59$             
Cascades PRO Select Kitchen Roll Towel, 2-Ply, White, 

85 sheets, 30 rolls/pack, Certified, Recycled, 
Compostable - K085

30 rolls/case 24.07$                     

80.15$              KCC34790 WypAll GeneralClean X60 Multi-Task 
Cleaning Cloths, Pop-Up Box (118 Count)

118/box 10 box/case 86.47$             Cascades PRO Tuff-Job Interfold Wipers, 1-Ply, White, 
126 sheets, 10 boxes /pack - W610

10 boxes/Case 62.50$                     

48-72 Hours 3-5 Days 14 Days or Less
30% 5-15% Call for Quote

 Paul Miquel Eric Peabody & Julia Mendez

HD Supply Facilities Maintenance, LTD.
9000 Southside Blvd., Bldg 100

Jacksonville, FL 32256

ODP Busiess Solutions, LLC
600 North Military Trl.
Boca Raton, FL 33496

 
  

  

(941) 456-8133 (561) 438-4800 

ARO (Arrival Time & Days After Receipt of Order): 

Paul.Miquel@hdsupply.com eric.peabody@odpbusiness.com

BOL (Balance of Line Percentage Discount): 

No Bid

ARO (Arrival Time & Days After Receipt of Order): 
BOL (Balance of Line Percentage Discount): 

mailto:narfp@fastenal.com
mailto:Paul.Miquel@hdsupply.com
mailto:eric.peabody@odpbusiness.com;%20julia.mendez@odpbusiness.com
mailto:Paul.Miquel@hdsupply.com
mailto:eric.peabody@odpbusiness.com;%20julia.mendez@odpbusiness.com


Line Item DWO Item Number

1. CW-77900

2. CW-77901

3. CW-77903

4. CW-77904

5. CW-77905

6. CW-77909

7. CW-77910

8. CW-77911

9. CW-77913

10. CW-77994

NON AWARDED VENDORS

ITB No. B247489DO
Paper Products for District Warehouse (DWO)

Description

Toilet Tissue, Standard, White Rolls, 4.4” X 3.8”, roll diameter minimum 4.4”, 1-Ply, 96 
Rolls per Case, MUST BE PALLETIZED, SCA-TJ1636S, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Standard White, 4.0" x 3.75", 500 sheets per roll, 2-Ply, Quilted, 96 Rolls per 
Case, SCA TM6120S, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Jr. Jumbo Roll, 12 Rolls per Case, White, 1-Ply, 2000’ x 3.6”, 3.3” Core, SCA 
TJ0912A, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Jr. Jumbo Roll, 12 Rolls per Case, White, 2-Ply, 1000’ x 3.6”, 3.3” Core, SCA 
TJ0922A, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Toilet Tissue, Jumbo Roll, 6 Rolls per Case, White, 2-Ply 2000’ x 3.6”, 3.3" Core SCA 
TJ1222A, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Single Fold, 9.1“ X 10.3”, Natural, 4000 per case, SK1850A, OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Multi fold, UNO BIDleached, 250 sheets per Package, 16 Packages per 
Case, MUST BE PALLETIZED, Cascades, SCA MK530E, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Rolls, 7.5 “ X 800’, 1.8 Core, Packed six (6) per case, Natural, SCA RK800E, 
OR APPROVED EQUAL

Towels, Paper, Rolls, 11” Perforated Sheets, PLEASE INCLUDE COMPLETE PRODUCT SPECS 
INCLUDING LENGTH OF ROLL AND CASE QUANTITY, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Wipers, Paper, 9.75” X 16.75” Nylon Reinforced, White, 126 per Dispenser Box, Kimberly-
Clark #34790, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Contact Name:
Phone:
Email:

Product Name & Number QTY Per Case/Package Unit Price

Kenneth D. Miller

Pyramid Paper Company
d/b/a Pyramid School Products

biddept@pyramidsp.com
(800) 792-2644
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