
SECONDARY AWARDED VENDORS

Contact Name: Contact Name: Contact Name: Contact Name:

Phone: Phone: Phone: Phone:

Email: Email: Email: Email:

Line Item
DWO Item 

Number
Product Name & Number QTY Per Case/Package Unit Price Product Name & Number

QTY Per 
Case/Package

Unit Price Product Name & Number
QTY Per 

Case/Package
Unit Price Product Name & Number

QTY Per 
Case/Package

Unit Price

1. CW-69001
Boardwalk - 

BWK28QTWBBLA
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED

12/Case $ 7.54 
abco bs-78

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

12 $ 46.57 ABCO BS7B 12/CS $ 3.90 Continental #2818BK 12/CS $ 7.75 

2. CW-69002

Rubbermaid® 
Commercial - 
RCP295600BG

NO SAMPLE PROVIDED

12/Case $ 9.66 
abco bs-7g

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

12 $ 46.57 Rubbermaid 
295600BE

12/CS $6.12 Continental #2818BE 12/CS $ 7.75 

3. CW-69003

Rubbermaid® 
Commercial - 
RCP295600GY

NO SAMPLE PROVIDED 

12/Case $ 9.51 
janico 1025gy 
SAMPLE NOT 

PROVIDED
10 $ 6.93 ABCO BS7G 12/CS $ 3.96 Continental #2818GY 12/CS $ 7.75 

4. CW-73700 Boardwalk - BWK196 
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED 20/Carton $ 1.38 

acs s096
SAMPLE NOT 

PROVIDED
60 $ 15.87 VICTORIA BAY 

VB96MSP 20/CS $0.21 ABCO #SC-N2000 72/CS $ 0.45 

5. CW-74652 ANSELL - 37-155 12/CS $ 4.11 
hospeco 990800-lg 

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

12 $ 14.24 Fastenal #0600280 12/CS $2.88

6. CW-74653 ANSELL - 37-155 12/CS $ 3.99 
hospeco 990800-xlg 

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

12 $ 14.24 Fastenal #0600281 12/CS $2.88

7. CW-77190

8. CW-77200 ABCO - BR1021MC 12/CS $27.62/EA
$331.44/CS

acs b414             
SAMPLE NOT 

PROVIDED
12 $ 39.92 Abco BR1021MC 12/CS $2.82/EA

$33.84/CS ABCO #BR1021-MC 12/CS $4.32/EA
$51.84/CS

9. CW-77209 ABCO  - BR10054 12/CS $29.42/EA
$353.04/CS

acs b410a           
SAMPLE NOT 

PROVIDED
12 $ 48.89 ABCO BR10054 12/CS $5.31/EA

$63.72/CS ABCO #BR-10054 12/CS $7.77/EA
$93.24/CS

10. CW-77211 Carlisle - 4167903 12/CS $47.70/EA OR CS?
acs b412             

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

12 $ 72.08 CFS 41679 12 $9.67 Carlisle #4167903 12 $ 15.65 

11. CW-77238 Boardwalk - BWK9008 24/CS $ .92/EA
$22.18/CS abco 700020-24 24/CS $ .65/EA

$15.68/CS ABCO 700020 24/CS $ .67/EA
$16.08/CS Carlisle #365351 24/CS $3.02/EA

$72.48/CS

12. CW-77303
Lavex - 475RB32BLREC 

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

Each $ 67.70 
aco bs32g           

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

6 $ 132.30 CFS 8403214 6/CS $19.42 Continental #32001BL 6/CS $ 30.20 

13. CW-77304 Continental - 4444GY 4/CS $35.49/EA
$141.94/CS

abco bs 44g        
SAMPLE NOT 

PROVIDED
4 $ 110.43 CFS 84104423 4/CS $28.17/EA

$112.68/CS
Continental 
#4444GY 4/CS $42.17/EA

$168.68/CS

Dade Paper & Bag, LLC
d/b/a Imperial Dade
11641 W. 40th Ave
Hialeah, FL 33018

vscaglione@imperialdade.com

(305) 805-2600

Vickie Scaglione

No Bid

No Bid

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winona, MN 55987

William Drazkowski

(507) 453-8723

narfp@fastenal.com
cfornes@fastenal.com

Discontinued Discontinued

Broom, Slant, Standard Size, Angled Bristles, 48” Wood Handle 
Flagged Poly Bristle Tips, Commercial Quality, ABCO, BR-10054, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

Scouring Pad, Green, 6” x 9”, 10/Package, Continental 23107, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

Gloves, Nitrile, LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 14” USDA 
Approved, reusable, Ansell OR APPROVED EQUAL

Gloves, Nitrile, X-LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 14” USDA 
Approved, reusable, Ansell OR APPROVED EQUAL

Bag, Replacement for Janitor Cart, Continental 1884 OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

All Florida Paper, Inc.
9150 NW 105th Wy.

Medley, FL 33178

Mario Vale

(305) 755-4820

mvale@allfloridapaper.com
aagamboa@allfloridapaper.com

Agni Enterprises, LLC 
d/b/a Head to Heels Safety Supplies

9021 SW 94th St., Unit 510
Miami, FL 33176

Malancha Sarkar & Subbarayan Rochi

(305) 712-6653

cservice@headtoheels.net

Discontinued Discontinued

AWARDED VENDORS
PRIMARY AWARDED VENDORS

Description

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
 DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Custodial Tools for District Warehouse (DWO)

ITB No. B257499DO
OPENING DATE:

February 26, 2025 @ 2:00 PM
REVISED: 08/04/25

Broom, Lobby, Polypropylene Fill, 7.5” X 2” W X 35” H, Tough 
Polypropylene with Flagged Bristles to Trap Fine Particles, ABCO 
BR-1021 MC or Rubbermaid 6374, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart Black, Plastic, Rectangular, 14 
⅜” x 10 ¼” x 15” high, Continental #2818BLK, OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart  Gray, Plastic, Rectangular, 14 
⅜” x 10 ¼” x 15” high, Continental 2818GY, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Brush, Small Grout, Carlisle 365351, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Can, Garbage, 32 Gallon, Plastic, Blue Without lid, Minimum 10% 
Recycled Plastic, Continental #32001BL Huskee, Blue, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

Can, Garbage, 44 Gallon, Plastic, Gray Without lid, Minimum 10% 
Recycled Plastic, Continental  4444GY HUSKEE OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

Broom, Synthetic Corn Broom 57”, Wood Handle, Carlisle 41679, 
ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES

Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart Beige, Plastic, Rectangular, 14 
⅜” x 10 ¼” x 15” high, Continental #2818BE, OR APPROVED EQUAL

mailto:cservice@headtoheels.net
mailto:vscaglione@imperialdade.com
mailto:vscaglione@imperialdade.com
mailto:vscaglione@imperialdade.com
mailto:vscaglione@imperialdade.com
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mailto:cservice@headtoheels.net


14. CW-77320
Lavex - 274TCDOLLY 

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

Each $ 51.86 ABCO BS-DOLLY 6/CS $19.27/EA
$115.62/CS Continental #3255-8 1 $17.55/EA

$105.30/CS

15. CW-77322

16. CW-77412
DustWorks - M-N6507H               

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

400 Sheets $ 0.29 
hospeco n-dsmqpy 

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

400 $ 26.69 MDI 78404 500 $36.94 Chicopee #CHIC0413 
12"x17"               400 $0.49/EA

$196.00/CS

17. CW-77415
Lavex - 697LDP12OP 

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

Each $ 43.74 abco dp-00204eh 12/CS $6.09/EA
$73.10/CS Abco DP00204EH 12/CS $6.16/EA

$73.92/CS ABCO #DP-00204-EH 12/CS $15.21/EA
$182.52/CS

18. CW-77500 Lavex - 697QFBH60YL 
SAMPLE NOT RECIEVED Each $ 36.86 abco 01206-nb 6/CS $9.11/EA

$54.67/CS Abco 1206NB 6/CS $9.21/EA
$55.26/CS ABCO #01206-NB 6/CS $12.41/EA

$74.46/CS

19. CW-77501 ABCO - 1203NB 6/CS $31.72/EA
$190.32/CS abco 1203-nb 6/CS $5.59/EA

$33.54/CS ABCO 1203NB 6/CS $5.69/EA
$34.14/CS ABCO #01203-NB 6/CS $8.63/EA

$51.78/CS

20. CW-77505 Abco  - HDL01104 12/CS $27.98/EA
$335.76/CS abco 01104 12/CS $3.01/EA

$36.11/CS ABCO 01104 12/CS $3.08/EA
$36.96/CS ABCO #01104 12/CS $4.48/EA

$53.76/CS

21. CW-77509 Unger - UNGAL140 10/CS $28.90
acs b1260            

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

12 $ 44.64 UNGER AL140 10/CS $ 42.36 Unger #AL140 10/CS $ 33.59 

22. CW-77514 Abco - ABH01406NBFE 12/CS $42.38/EA
$508.56/CS abco 0146-nb 12/CS $5.26/EA

$63.07/CS ABCO 01406NB 12/CS $5.36/EA
$64.32/CS ABCO #0146-NB 12/CS $8.96/EA

$107.52/CS

23. CW-77551 CFS 34103503 6/CS $21.83
Rubbermaid #1788376                 

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

6 $ 30.07 

24. CW-77553

Advantage Supplies - 
475ADV32GYLD 

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

Each $ 33.74 
abco 32-t              

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

6 $ 31.54 CFS 84103323 6/CS $5.39/EA
$32.34/CS Continental #3201GY 6/CS $11.19/EA

$67.47/CS

25. CW-77554

Advantage Supplies - 
475ADV44GYLD 

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

Each $ 36.24 
abco 44-t              

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

4 $ 27.47 CFS 84104523 4/CS $7.04/EA
$28.16/CS Continental #4445GY 4/CS $18.36/EA

$73.44/CS

26. CW-77555

27. CW-77605 Boardwalk - BWK00160 25/Carton $2.02/EA OR CS? ABCO 02000 12/CS $0.63/EA
$7.56/CS ABCO #02000 12/CS $1.53/EA

$18.36/CS

No Bid

No Bid

Discontinued

Discontinued Discontinued

No Bid

Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued

Discontinued

Handle, Wet Mop Invader, Fiberglass handle, Quick Change, ABCO 
01206NB, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Handle, Wing Nut Style, ABCO 1203-NB, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Handle for Push Broom, Screw in Metal Tip, ABCO 01104,  ONLY, 
NO SUBSTITUTES

Handle for Floor Squeegees, Metal, 
Unger AL140, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Handle for Dry Mop, Clip On, Wood, ABCO 0146-NB, ONLY, NO 
SUBSTITUTES

Janitor Cart, Continental184BL, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Dolly for Garbage Cans to fit round 20 - 55 gallon cans, 
Rubbermaid 2640, Continental 3255, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Treated Dust Cloth, 12” x 17”, Chic 0413, 40 per bag, 10 bags per 
case CHIC 0413 OR APPROVED EQUAL

Dust Pan, Lobby, 36” Handle, Plastic only, Continental 912,  OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

Lid Only, Recycle Can, Plastic White with hole in center, fits 32 
gallon can.  Continental 3201-1 OR APPROVED EQUAL

Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic, Gray, fits 32 Gallon Continental 
Round Garbage Can, Continental 3201, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic gray, for 44 Gallon Garbage Can, 
6/Case, Continental # 4445, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Putty Knife, 1 ¼”, Flex Metal Blade with Plastic Handle, TOLCO 
280106, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Mop, Bowl, Cotton, 14” Long, 144/Box, Toolco 2801 OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

No Bid

Discontinued



28. CW-77610
Cortina - 03-500-06 

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

Each $ 46.54 Cortina #03-500-06 1 $40.77

29. CW-77613 ABCO  - WS0001 10/CS $32.58/EA
$325.80/CS abco ws-001 10/CS $4.71/EA

$47.08/CS ABCO WS0001 10/CS $4.79/EA
$47.90/CS ABCO #WS-001 10/CS $8.07/EA

$80.70/CS

30. CW-77614

31. CW-77626 abco 203mcs 12/CS $3.75/EA
$45.02/CS ABCO LM203MCS 12/CS $3.79/EA

$45.48/CS ABCO #LM-203MCS 12/CS $8.66/EA
$103.92/CS

32. CW-77627 abco 203lcs 12/CS $5.52/EA
$66.25/CS ABCO LM203LCS 12/CS $5.58/EA

$66.96/CS ABCO #LM-203LCS 12/CS $12.59/EA
$151.08/CS

33. CW-77628 Boardwalk - BWK1124 
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED 12/Case $ 15.40 abco dm26524 12/CS $5.35/EA

$64.17/CS ABCO DM26524 12/CS $5.47/EA
$65.64/CS ABCO #DM-26524B 12/CS $11.19/EA

$134.28/CS

34. CW-77629 Lavex  - 2715X36BLNBL
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED Each $ 34.19 abco 26536 12/CS $7.22/EA

$86.68/CS ABCO DM26536 12/CS $7.38/EA
$88.56/CS ABCO #DM-26536B 12/CS $13.87/EA

$166.44/CS

35. CW-77631 abco dm26560 6/CS $67.50/CS ABCO DM26560 6/CS $11.54/EA
$69.24/CS

ABCO #DM-26560B
SAMPLE NOT 

PROVIDED
12/CS $16.09/CS

36. CW-77632 Boardwalk - BWK1424 12/CS $7.18/EA
$86.16/CS abco eh24524wf 12/CS $2.28/EA

$27.37/CS ABCO BH24524 12/CS $2.35/EA
$28.20/CS ABCO #BH-24524WF 12/CS $3.72/EA

$44.64/CS

37. CW-77638

38. CW-77642

39. CW-77643 ocedar 93105               
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED

10 $ 4.00 Tolco #280137 10/CS $8.88

40. CW-77644 acs 672                          
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED

20 $ 13.17 Tolco #280142 100/CS $1.63

41. CW-77645 Hospeco/Impact 2005 12/CS $8.08 Impact #2005IP 12/CS $ 17.36 

42. CW-77720 Lavex  - 274PL14QGY 
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED Each $ 40.99 abco t090302               

NO SAMPLE PROVIDED
12 $ 71.48 ABCO T090302 12/CS $6.08 ABCO #T090302 12/CS $ 9.90 

43. CW-77778
Global Industrial - 

670230                             
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED

Each $ 118.74 RFI #DT-HUCK 1 $55.25

44. CW-77779
APPROVED VENDOR - 

13Y371                                   
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED

Each $ 83.93 hospeco 534-10        
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED

65 $ 21.85 

HOSPECO 534-10 / 
OPTIONAL *175cs min 

order / 10 Buisness 
Days*

1
$26.03/CS

Min. Order: 
$20.71/CS

RFI #DT-BAR MOP 1 $ 28.50 

45. CW-77850 Boardwalk - BWK16320                     
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED  20/Carton $ 2.02 acs 63-614                    

NO SAMPLE PROVIDED
20 $ 12.89 Victoria Bay VB74MSS 20/CS

$0.57/EA
$11.54/CS

$23.08/2CS
ABCO #SC-C2004 40/CS $0.97/EA

$38.80/CS

No Bid

NO BID

No Bid

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Discontinued

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Discontinued

No Bid

Discontinued

Wet Floor Sign, 37”, ABCO WS-001, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Mop Bucket, Wringer Combo, Yellow, Rubbermaid 7580, ONLY, 
NO SUBSTITUTES

Wet Mops, Medium, Cotton/Synthetic Blend, Loop ends, 1 1/4” 
Headband, Dupont Mildew Resistant, ABCO 203MCS, ONLY, NO 
SUBSTITUTES

Wet Mops, Large, Cotton/Synthetic Blend, Loop ends, 1 1/4” 
Headband, Dupont Mildew Resistant, ABCO 203LCS, ONLY, NO 
SUBSTITUTES

Rags, Blue, Approximately 14” x 17”, 10 LB Box, RFT DT-HUCK, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

Rags, Terry Cloth, Approximately 14” x 17”, RFI DT-BAR MOP, 
10LB, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Light Duty Scrubbing Sponge, 3 7/16: x 6 1/19”, Glit 20951, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

Finished System, Microfiber Rubbermaid Mop Handle, 58” 
w/quick connect, #Q750, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES

Utility Pad Holder, Screw In with Built in Gripper Teeth and Swivel 
Head, TOLCO 280137, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES

Utility Pad, 4 ½ “ X 10” Black, 5/PK, Continental 20969, ONLY, NO 
SUBSTITUTES

Cloth Head for Utility Pad Holder, 4”x10”, Impact 2005, ONLY, NO 
SUBSTITUTES

Three Gallon Pail with spout, Continental 8114, OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

Dry Mop Head, 24”, ABCO DM26524, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Dry Mop Head, 36”, ABCO DM26536, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Dry Mop Head, 60”, ABCO DM26560,  OR APPROVED EQUAL

Dry Mop Frames for Clip End Handle, 24”, ABCO BH24524, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

Finish System, Microfiber 18” Quick Connect Frame, Rubbermaid 
Q560, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES

Traffic Cones, 36” Orange Plastic, with reflective strip, JBC 
#1093947,  OR APPROVED EQUAL

Discontinued

Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued

Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued Discontinued



46. CW-77851 Boardwalk - BWK00032 24/Carton $ 1.85 ocedar 93161-84       
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED

84 $ 54.60 JANICO 1132 100 $0.67 Janico #1132 100 $ 1.35 

47. CW-77852 Boardwalk - BWK09229                    
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED 24/Carton $ 1.63 ocedar93141              

NO SAMPLE PROVIDED
200 $ 96.00 JANICO 1003RW 200 $0.67 Janico #1003BW 200 $ 0.83 

48. CW-77860 Lavex - 697LAV12SNSQ            
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED Each $ 32.49 abco bh-15006 12/CS $1.83/EA

$21.96/CS ABCO BH15006 12/CS $1.88/EA
$22.56/CS ABCO #BH-15006 12/CS $2.90/EA

$34.80/CS

49. CW-77861 Unger - UNGMW450 
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED 10/Case $ 10.67 ocedar  96816-s          

NO SAMPLE PROVIDED
10 $ 30.20 UNGER MW450 10/CS $17.63 Unger #MW450 10/CS $ 12.69 

50. CW-77866 Boardwalk - 
BWK4020RED 5/CS $ 8.28 acs 51-20 5/CS $ 12.51 Victoria Bay 

VB20RBFP 5/CS $2.28 ACS Industries #51-20 5/CS $5.05

51. CW-77868 Boardwalk - 
BWK4020BLU 5/CS $ 8.28 acs-53-20 5/CS $ 12.51 Victoria Bay VB20BCP 5/CS $2.28 ACS Industries #55-20 5/CS $5.05

52. CW-77874 Pumie - UPM12 12/CS $ 3.92 PUMIE UPM12 12/CS $2.09 Pumie #UPM12 12/CS $ 3.16 

53. CW-77890 Cordova - T20101             
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED 12/Case $ 7.08 Hospeco/Impact 7328 8/CS $2.13/EA

$17.04/CS Fastenal #63160 8/CS $9.99/EA
$79.92/CS

54. CW-77863 Unger - UNGMW450 10/Case $ 10.67 janico 4818                  
NO SAMPLE PROVIDED

3 $ 10.28 Abco BH14001 1 $4.22

ABCO #BH-14001 
(Duplicate Ungar part 
referenced. See CW-

77861)

1 $ 9.12 

7-14 Business 
Days 15 Days 10 Days 1-2 Days

0% 45% 25% 30%BOL (Balance of Line Percentage 
Discount): 

ARO (Arrival Time & Days After 
Receipt of Order): 

BOL (Balance of Line 
Percentage Discount): 

ARO (Arrival Time & Days After 
Receipt of Order): 

ARO (Arrival Time & Days After 
Receipt of Order): 

BOL (Balance of Line 
Percentage Discount): 

BOL (Balance of Line Percentage 
Discount): 

ARO (Arrival Time & Days After 
Receipt of Order): 

No Bid

No Bid

Tape, Caution, Yellow 3” x 1000’, IMACT 7328, OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

Floor  Squeegee, 18”, Unger MW450, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Window Squeegee, 12”, ABCO BH-15006, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Floor Squeegee, Foam Rubber, Universal Handle, 18”, Ungar 
MW450, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES

Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 20” Red, Daily Wash Pads

Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 20” Blue, Shower Scrub Pads

Pumice Scouring Stick 6”, US Pumice, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Spray Bottles, 1 Quart, Continental #932, OR APPROVED EQUAL

Trigger Sprayers, Continental #922 HL, ONLY OR APPROVED 
EQUAL SAMPLE REQUIRED



35
6
0

29

03.27.25
APPROVED BY: Derek Ochoa DATE:

It is recommended that this ITB be awarded to Agni Enterprises, LLC d/b/a Head to Heels Safety Supplies; 
All Florida Paper, LLC; Dade Paper & Bag, LLC d/b/a Imperial Dade; and Fastenal Company, having 
submitted the lowest overall and best response meeting specifications.

VENDORS WERE NOTIFIED
VENDORS SUBMITTED A RESPONSIVE BID
VENDORS SUBMITTED A NO - BID

PRIMARY AWARDED VENDORS

SECONDARY AWARDED VENDORS

VENDORS DID NOT RESPOND



Contact Name: Contact Name:
Phone: Phone:

Email: Email:

Line 
Item

DWO Item 
Number

Product Name & 
Number

QTY Per 
Case/Package

Unit Price Product Name & Number QTY Per 
Case/Package

Unit Price

1. CW-69001

Rubbermaid 
#295600BLA
SAMPLE NOT 
APPROVED

1 $ 9.68 

2. CW-69002

Rubbermaid 
#295600BE

SAMPLE NOT 
APPROVED

12 $ 9.68 

3. CW-69003

Rubbermaid 
#295600BR

SAMPLE NOT 
APPROVED

12 $ 9.68 

4. CW-73700 ACS Industries 
#S096 20/CS $0.54

7. CW-77190 ABCO # JC-BAGJC 4/CS $ 77.63 Rubbermaid #1966719 4/CS $ 67.56 

10. CW-77211 Rubbermaid 
#FG253600BLA 12 $10.51

15. CW-77322 Rubbermaid 
#FG617388BLA

1 $ 191.10 

16. CW-77412

Boardwalk #BWK-
DSMFPY 18"x24" 

(larger) 50 bags of 
10 per case             

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

500 0.35

24. CW-77553

Rubbermaid 
#FG263100GY            
SAMPLE NOT 

RECIEVED

6 $ 16.27 

25. CW-77554

Rubbbermaid 
#FG264560GY    
SAMPLE NOT 

RECIEVED

4 $ 24.47 

26. CW-77555 Warner #180 10 $1.75 Fastenal #0222960 1 $2.79

27. CW-77605 Tolco #280100 100 $ 1.53 

30. CW-77614 ABCO #T01009SPW 1 $84.00/CS

43. CW-77778
Hospeco #539-10 

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

1 $ 50.05 

44. CW-77779
Hospeco #534-10      

SAMPLE NOT 
PROVIDED

1 $ 37.96 

45. CW-77850

AbilityOne #7920-
01-463-2977                      
NO SAMPLE 

RECEIVED

1 $ 1.02 Fastenal #610101-131450
NO SAMPLE RECEIVED

1 $ 1.03 

46. CW-77851 Fastenal #610101-
131450 1 $1.75

47. CW-77852 Fastenal #610099-
131450 1 $ 0.99 

49. CW-77861
ABCO #BH-14001 -

SAMPLE NOT 
RECEIVED

1 $ 8.97 

53. CW-77890
Impact #7328     
SAMPLE NOT 

PROVIDED
8 $ 15.18 Cordova #T15101 12 $ 7.35 

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winona, MN 55987

William Drazkowski
(507) 453-8723
narfp@fastenal.com
cfornes@fastenal.com

Description

NON AWARDED ADDITIONAL 
RESPONSES

Fastenal Company
2001 Theurer Blvd.
Winona, MN 55987

William Drazkowski

Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart Black, Plastic, 
Rectangular, 14 ⅜” x 10 ¼” x 15” high, Continental 
#2818BLK, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart Beige, Plastic, 
Rectangular, 14 ⅜” x 10 ¼” x 15” high, Continental 
#2818BE, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

Custodial Tools for District Warehouse (DWO) (507) 453-8723

ITB No. B257499DO
narfp@fastenal.com
cfornes@fastenal.com

Bag, Replacement for Janitor Cart, Continental 
1884 OR APPROVED EQUAL

Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart  Gray, Plastic, 
Rectangular, 14 ⅜” x 10 ¼” x 15” high, Continental 
2818GY, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Scouring Pad, Green, 6” x 9”, 10/Package, 
Continental 23107, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

Broom, Synthetic Corn Broom 57”, Wood Handle, 
Carlisle 41679, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES

Janitor Cart, Continental184BL, OR APPROVED 
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Treated Dust Cloth, 12” x 17”, Chic 0413, 40 per 
bag, 10 bags per case CHIC 0413 OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic gray, for 44 Gallon 
Garbage Can, 6/Case, Continental # 4445, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

Putty Knife, 1 ¼”, Flex Metal Blade with Plastic 
Handle, TOLCO 280106, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED

Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic, Gray, fits 32 Gallon 
Continental Round Garbage Can, Continental 3201, 
OR APPROVED EQUAL

Mop Bucket, Wringer Combo, Yellow, Rubbermaid 
7580, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES

Mop, Bowl, Cotton, 14” Long, 144/Box, Toolco 
2801 OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Light Duty Scrubbing Sponge, 3 7/16: x 6 1/19”, Glit 
20951, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Spray Bottles, 1 Quart, Continental #932, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Rags, Blue, Approximately 14” x 17”, 10 LB Box, 
RFT DT-HUCK, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

Rags, Terry Cloth, Approximately 14” x 17”, RFI DT-
BAR MOP, 10LB, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

Tape, Caution, Yellow 3” x 1000’, IMACT 7328, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Floor Squeegee, Foam Rubber, Universal Handle, 
18”, Ungar MW450, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES

Trigger Sprayers, Continental #922 HL, ONLY OR 
APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE REQUIRED

mailto:vscaglione@imperialdade.com
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Contact Name: Contact Name:
Phone: Phone:

Email: Email:

Line Item
DWO Item 

Number
Product Name & 

Number
QTY Per 

Case/Package
Unit Price

Product Name & 
Number

QTY Per 
Case/Package

Unit Price

1. CW-69001

RUBBERMAID 
#FG2956BLK 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

12/CASE $ 6.09 

2. CW-69002

RUBBERMAID 
#FG2956BEIGE 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

12/CASE $ 6.09 

3. CW-69003

RUBBERMAID 
#FG2956GRAY 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

12/CASE $ 6.09 

4. CW-73700

ACS #SO96 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER CASE)
*MIN ORDER*

10/PKG, 6 
PKG/CASE $ 19.98 

5. CW-74652

HOSPECO 
#990800-LG 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER PACKAGE)
*MIN ORDER*

12/PKG $ 23.76 UPC NPF-15L Dozen $ 18.00 

6. CW-74653

HOSPECO 
#990800-XL 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER PACKAGE)
*MIN ORDER*

12/PKG $ 23.76 UPC NPF-15LXL Dozen $ 18.00 

7. CW-77190

RUBBERMAID 
#1966719 (ITEM 

PRICED PER 
EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

4/CASE $ 32.96 

8. CW-77200

ABCO 
#BR1021MC 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER EACH) 

*MIN ORDER*

12/CASE $ 2.86 

9. CW-77209

ABCO #BR10054 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

12/CASE $ 5.24 

10. CW-77211

CARLISLE 
#4167903 (ITEM 

PRICED PER 
EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

12/CASE $ 10.79 

11. CW-77238

ABCO #700020-
24 (ITEM 

PRICED PER 
EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

24/CASE $ 1.09 

12. CW-77303

RUBBERMAID 
#FG263273BLUE 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

6/CASE $ 25.16 

13. CW-77304

RUBBERMAID 
#FG264360GRAY 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

4/CASE $ 36.49 

Custodial Tools for District Warehouse (DWO) (800) 621-6446 ext. 225 (888) 808-5120
ITB No. B257499DO biddept@pyramidsp.com customercare@unipakcorp.net

NON AWARDED VENDORS
Pyramid School Products

6510 North 54th St.
Tampa, FL 33610-1908

Unipak Corp.
PO Box 332

West Long Branch, NJ 07764

Kenneth D. Miller Brian Marcus

Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart  Gray, Plastic, 
Rectangular, 14 ⅜” x 10 ¼” x 15” high, Continental 
2818GY, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

No Bid

Scouring Pad, Green, 6” x 9”, 10/Package, 
Continental 23107, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

No Bid

Description

Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart Black, Plastic, 
Rectangular, 14 ⅜” x 10 ¼” x 15” high, Continental 
#2818BLK, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

No Bid

Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart Beige, Plastic, 
Rectangular, 14 ⅜” x 10 ¼” x 15” high, Continental 
#2818BE, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

No Bid

Broom, Slant, Standard Size, Angled Bristles, 48” 
Wood Handle Flagged Poly Bristle Tips, Commercial 
Quality, ABCO, BR-10054, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED

No Bid

Broom, Synthetic Corn Broom 57”, Wood Handle, 
Carlisle 41679, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid

Bag, Replacement for Janitor Cart, Continental 
1884 OR APPROVED EQUAL No Bid

Broom, Lobby, Polypropylene Fill, 7.5” X 2” W X 35” 
H, Tough Polypropylene with Flagged Bristles to 
Trap Fine Particles, ABCO BR-1021 MC or 
Rubbermaid 6374, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

No Bid

Gloves, Nitrile, LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 14” 
USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell OR APPROVED 
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Gloves, Nitrile, X-LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, 
14” USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Can, Garbage, 44 Gallon, Plastic, Gray Without lid, 
Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental  
4444GY HUSKEE OR APPROVED EQUAL

No Bid

Brush, Small Grout, Carlisle 365351, OR APPROVED 
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid

Can, Garbage, 32 Gallon, Plastic, Blue Without lid, 
Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental 
#32001BL Huskee, Blue, OR APPROVED EQUAL

No Bid

mailto:biddept@pyramidsp.com
mailto:customercare@unipakcorp.net
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mailto:customercare@unipakcorp.net


14. CW-77320

RUBBERMAID 
#FG2640 (ITEM 
PRICED PER 

EACH)
*MIN ORDER* 

2/CASE $ 30.09 

15. CW-77322

RUBBERMAID 
#FG617388 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

1/CASE $ 131.92 

16. CW-77412

HOSPECO #N-
DSMQPY (ITEM 

PRICED PER 
CASE)

*MIN ORDER*

40/PKG, 10 
PKG/CASE $ 27.99 

17. CW-77415

ABCO 
#DP00204EH 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

12 
EA/CASE $ 6.39 

18. CW-77500

ABCO #01206NB 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

6 EA/CASE $ 9.38 

19. CW-77501

ABCO #01203NB 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

6 EA/CASE $ 5.79 

20. CW-77505

ABCO #01104 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

12 
EA/CASE $ 3.10 

21. CW-77509

UNGER #AL140 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

10 
EA/CASE $ 19.99 

22. CW-77514

ABCO #01406NB 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

12 
EA/CASE $ 5.31 

23. CW-77551

RUBBERMAID 
#1788376 (ITEM 

PRICED PER 
EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

6/CASE $ 13.89 

24. CW-77553

RUBBERMAID 
#FG2631GY 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

6/CASE $ 8.31 

25. CW-77554

RUBBERMAID 
#FG2645GY 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

4/CASE $ 13.49 

26. CW-77555

TOLCO #280106 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

12/CASE $ 1.83 

27. CW-77605

ABCO #02000 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

12/CASE $ 0.79 

28. CW-77610

JBC #1093947 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

1/CASE $ 27.89 

29. CW-77613

ABCO #WS0001 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

10/PKG  $ 5.79 

Janitor Cart, Continental184BL, OR APPROVED 
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid

Treated Dust Cloth, 12” x 17”, Chic 0413, 40 per 
bag, 10 bags per case CHIC 0413 OR APPROVED 
EQUAL

No Bid

Dolly for Garbage Cans to fit round 20 - 55 gallon 
cans, Rubbermaid 2640, Continental 3255, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

No Bid

Handle for Floor Squeegees, Metal, 
Unger AL140, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

No Bid

Handle for Dry Mop, Clip On, Wood, ABCO 0146-
NB, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid

Handle, Wing Nut Style, ABCO 1203-NB, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid

Handle for Push Broom, Screw in Metal Tip, ABCO 
01104,  ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid

Dust Pan, Lobby, 36” Handle, Plastic only, 
Continental 912,  OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

No Bid

Handle, Wet Mop Invader, Fiberglass handle, Quick 
Change, ABCO 01206NB, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED

No Bid

Mop, Bowl, Cotton, 14” Long, 144/Box, Toolco 
2801 OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid

Traffic Cones, 36” Orange Plastic, with reflective 
strip, JBC #1093947,  OR APPROVED EQUAL, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED

No Bid

Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic gray, for 44 Gallon 
Garbage Can, 6/Case, Continental # 4445, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

No Bid

Putty Knife, 1 ¼”, Flex Metal Blade with Plastic 
Handle, TOLCO 280106, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED

No Bid

Lid Only, Recycle Can, Plastic White with hole in 
center, fits 32 gallon can.  Continental 3201-1 OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

No Bid

Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic, Gray, fits 32 Gallon 
Continental Round Garbage Can, Continental 3201, 
OR APPROVED EQUAL

No Bid

Wet Floor Sign, 37”, ABCO WS-001, OR APPROVED 
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid



30. CW-77614

RUBBERMAID 
#FG7580 (ITEM 
PRICED PER 

EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

1/CASE $ 103.49 

31. CW-77626

ABCO 
#LM203MCS 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

12 
EA/CASE $ 3.99 

32. CW-77627

ABCO 
#LM203LCS 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

12 
EA/CASE $ 5.69 

33. CW-77628

ABCO 
#DM26524B 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

12 
EA/CASE $ 5.79 

34. CW-77629

ABCO 
#DM26536B 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

12 
EA/CASE $ 7.49 

35. CW-77631

ABCO 
#DM26560B 

(ITEM PRICED 
PER EACH)

*MIN ORDER*

12 
EA/CASE $ 11.59 

36. CW-77632

ABCO 
#BH24524WF 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

12/CASE $ 2.59 

37. CW-77638

RUBBERMAID 
#Q560 (ITEM 
PRICED PER 

EACH) 
*MIN ORDER*

6/CASE $ 19.12 

38. CW-77642

RUBBERMAID 
#Q750 (ITEM 
PRICED PER 

EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

6/CASE $ 7.89 

39. CW-77643

TOLCO #280137 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

10/CASE $ 6.39 

40. CW-77644

ACS #672 (ITEM 
PRICED PER 
PACKAGE) 

**CONTINENTAL 
WAS 

PURCHASED BY 
ACS**

*MIN ORDER*

5/PKG, 4 
PKG/CASE $ 4.54 

41. CW-77645

IMPACT #2005 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

12 
EA/CASE $ 16.99 

42. CW-77720

ABCO #T090302 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

12/CASE $ 7.98 

43. CW-77778

HOSPECO #539-
10 (ITEM 

PRICED PER 
BOX) 

*MIN ORDER*

10#/BOX $ 38.99 

44. CW-77779

HOSPECO #534-
10 (ITEM 

PRICED PER 
BOX)

*MIN ORDER*

10#/BOX $ 31.75 

Dry Mop Head, 24”, ABCO DM26524, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid

Dry Mop Head, 36”, ABCO DM26536, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid

Wet Mops, Medium, Cotton/Synthetic Blend, Loop 
ends, 1 1/4” Headband, Dupont Mildew Resistant, 
ABCO 203MCS, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES

No Bid

Wet Mops, Large, Cotton/Synthetic Blend, Loop 
ends, 1 1/4” Headband, Dupont Mildew Resistant, 
ABCO 203LCS, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES

No Bid

Mop Bucket, Wringer Combo, Yellow, Rubbermaid 
7580, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid

Utility Pad Holder, Screw In with Built in Gripper 
Teeth and Swivel Head, TOLCO 280137, ONLY, NO 
SUBSTITUTES

No Bid

Utility Pad, 4 ½ “ X 10” Black, 5/PK, Continental 
20969, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid

Finish System, Microfiber 18” Quick Connect 
Frame, Rubbermaid Q560, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid

Finished System, Microfiber Rubbermaid Mop 
Handle, 58” w/quick connect, #Q750, ONLY, NO 
SUBSTITUTES

No Bid

Dry Mop Head, 60”, ABCO DM26560,  OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid

Dry Mop Frames for Clip End Handle, 24”, ABCO 
BH24524, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

No Bid

Rags, Blue, Approximately 14” x 17”, 10 LB Box, RFT 
DT-HUCK, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

No Bid

Rags, Terry Cloth, Approximately 14” x 17”, RFI DT-
BAR MOP, 10LB, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

No Bid

Cloth Head for Utility Pad Holder, 4”x10”, Impact 
2005, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid

Three Gallon Pail with spout, Continental 8114, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid



45. CW-77850

ACS #SC400 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER CASE)
*MIN ORDER*

40 
EA/CASE $ 35.60 

46. CW-77851

IMPACT 
#5032WG (ITEM 
PRICED PER EA)

*MIN ORDER*

96 
EA/CASE $ 0.85 

47. CW-77852

IMPACT #4902 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EA)
*MIN ORDER*

96 
EA/CASE $ 0.89 

48. CW-77860

ABCO #BH15006 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EA)
*MIN ORDER*

12 
EA/CASE $ 3.34 

49. CW-77861

UNGER #MW450 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

10 
EA/CASE $ 9.29 

50. CW-77866

ACS #51-20 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER CASE)
*MIN ORDER*

5 EA/CASE $ 13.43 

51. CW-77868

ACS #53-20 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER CASE)
*MIN ORDER*

5/CASE $ 13.43 

52. CW-77874

US PUMICE 
#UPM12 (ITEM 
PRICED PER 
PACKAGE)

*MIN ORDER*

12/PKG, 6 
PKG/CASE $ 34.56 

53. CW-77890

CORDOVA 
#T15101 (ITEM 
PRICED PER 

ROLL)
*MIN ORDER*

12 
ROLLS/PA

CKAGE
$ 6.49 

54. CW-77863

UNGER #MW450 
(ITEM PRICED 

PER EACH)
*MIN ORDER*

10 
EA/CASE $ 9.29 

14-21 Days 1-10 Days
10% 21%

Light Duty Scrubbing Sponge, 3 7/16: x 6 1/19”, Glit 
20951, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid

Spray Bottles, 1 Quart, Continental #932, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid

Floor Squeegee, Foam Rubber, Universal Handle, 
18”, Ungar MW450, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES No Bid

Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 20” Red, Daily Wash Pads, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED

Trigger Sprayers, Continental #922 HL, ONLY OR 
APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid

Window Squeegee, 12”, ABCO BH-15006, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Floor  Squeegee, 18”, Unger MW450, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

ARO (Arrival Time & Days 
BOL (Balance of Line 

ARO (Arrival Time & Days 
BOL (Balance of Line 

No Bid

Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 20” Blue, Shower Scrub 
Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Pumice Scouring Stick 6”, US Pumice, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Tape, Caution, Yellow 3” x 1000’, IMACT 7328, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

No Bid

No Bid
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