


THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES 2855 COLONIAL BOULEVARD FORT MYERS, FL 33966 CONCRETE FINISHING & BLOCK WORK ITN NO. N187324LN OPENING DATE: February 6, 2018 at 2:00 pm REVISED DATE: May 17, 2023		American Management Resources Corporation (AMRC) Attn: Jack Snider III / Lauren Papero 5230 Clayton Court Fort Myers, FL 33907 Phone: (239) 936-8266 Email: sniderjm@amrc-environmental.com lauren@amrc-environmental.com		Bateman Contracting, LLP Attn: Lisa Bateman / Leo Bateman 3260 Cargo Street Fort Myers, FL 33916 Phone: (239) 482-4826 Email: lisabateman@bateman-contracting.com leonardbateman@aol.com		Neubert Construction Services, Inc. Attn: Tyler Neubert / Skip Doyle 4301 Veronica Shoemaker Boulevard Suite B Fort Myers, FL 33916 Phone: (239) 332-8800 Email: tyler@neubertconstruction.com skip@neubertconstruction.com		Pavement Maintenance, LLC Attn: Joseph Ward / Marco Gomez 1640 Benchmark Avenue Fort Myers, FL 33905 Phone: (239) 334-6760 Email: estimating@pmioffortmyers.com Jward@pmioffortmyers.com		SCP Enterprises, Inc. Attn: Kurt R. Smutney / Jason Smutney 2702 Hanson Street Fort Myers, FL 33901 Phone: (239) 303-0750 Email: Build@SCPenterprises.comcastbiz.net	
		Item No.	Item	Negotiated Price		Price		Price		Negotiated Price	
CONCRETE		<500 sq. ft.	≥500 sq. ft.	<500 sq. ft.	≥500 sq. ft.	<500 sq. ft.	≥500 sq. ft.	<500 sq. ft.	≥500 sq. ft.	<500 sq. ft.	≥500 sq. ft.
1	4" THICK – Price Per Square Foot With Reinforcement (steel or wire mesh 6x6 10 ga. wire)	\$11.75	\$11.50	\$8.00	\$6.50	\$8.45	\$7.35	\$6.10	\$3.75	\$5.95	\$3.95
2	4" THICK – Price Per Square Foot Without Reinforcement	\$11.00	\$11.50	\$7.00	\$6.00	\$8.45	\$7.35	\$6.10	\$3.75	\$5.75	\$3.95
3	4" THICK – Price Per Square Foot With Fiber Reinforcement	\$11.75	\$11.50	\$8.00	\$6.50	\$8.45	\$7.35	\$6.10	\$3.75	\$5.90	\$3.70
4	6" THICK – Price Per Square Foot With Reinforcement (steel or wire mesh 6x6 10 ga. wire)	\$15.50	\$14.50	\$10.00	\$9.00	\$9.70	\$8.60	\$7.40	\$4.25	\$6.75	\$3.85
5	6" THICK – Price Per Square Foot Without Reinforcement	\$15.00	\$14.00	\$10.00	\$9.00	\$9.70	\$8.60	\$7.40	\$4.25	\$6.45	\$4.95
6	6" THICK – Price Per Square Foot With Fiber Reinforcement	\$15.50	\$14.50	\$10.00	\$9.00	\$9.70	\$8.60	\$7.40	\$4.25	\$6.65	\$4.65
7	8" THICK – Price Per Square Foot With Reinforcement (steel or wire mesh 6x6 10 ga. wire)	\$16.75	\$16.00	\$12.00	\$11.00	\$11.65	\$10.35	\$7.50	\$6.25	\$7.75	\$4.85
8	8" THICK – Price Per Square Foot Without Reinforcement	\$15.50	\$15.15	\$11.50	\$10.50	\$11.65	\$10.35	\$7.50	\$6.25	\$7.35	\$5.95
9	8" THICK – Price Per Square Foot With Fiber Reinforcement	\$16.75	\$16.00	\$12.00	\$11.00	\$11.65	\$10.35	\$7.50	\$6.25	\$7.60	\$5.55
10	Clean Fill, if required- Cost Per Cubic Yard	\$21.00	\$19.00	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$30.00	\$30.00	\$17.00	\$15.00	\$34.95	\$5.80
11	8" x 8" Curb – Cost Per Lineal Foot	\$20.00	\$19.00	\$40.00	\$30.00	\$32.50	\$27.50	\$8.90	\$8.25	\$11.95	\$19.95
12	16" x 8" Curb – Cost Per Lineal Foot	\$23.00	\$20.50	\$30.00	\$35.00	\$32.50	\$27.50	\$9.95	\$8.70	\$19.95	\$9.95
CONCRETE FOOTING/REINFORCING		Price		Price		Price		Price		Price	
13	8" Block - Price Per Block	\$14.25		\$10.00		\$7.55		NO BID		\$4.42	
14	8" thick x 16" Wide Footer, Including #5 Re-bar To Code, Price Per Lineal Foot	\$27.25		\$50.00		\$24.50		NO BID		\$22.95	
15	#5 Rebar Vertical Reinforcing at 6' o.c. with concrete filled cell per 8' lin. length	\$28.50		\$60.00		\$45.00		NO BID		\$23.95	
BLOCK WORK		Price		Price		Price		Price		Price	
16	8" Block - Price Per Lineal Foot	\$13.00		\$12.00		\$5.75		NO BID		\$5.15	
17	8" x 8" Lintel - Price Per Lineal Foot	\$27.25		\$40.00		\$33.50		NO BID		\$9.70	
18	Stucco Work (5/8" min.) - Price per Surface Square Foot	\$24.00		\$20.00		\$18.45		NO BID		\$4.75	
BRICK WORK		Price		Price		Price		Price		Price	
19	Price Per Lineal Foot	\$18.50		\$10.00		\$25.00		NO BID		\$6.45	

61 Vendors informed
 5 Vendors returned a proposal
 56 Vendors did not respond

 =Awarded Vendor

It is recommended this ITN be awarded to **American Management Resources Corporation (AMRC)**, **Pavement Maintenance, LLC (PMI)**, and **SCP Enterprises, Inc.** being the highest ranked, best value firms based on the evaluation committee rankings and negotiated pricing.

APPROVED BY: 
 Lorie Nein, Procurement Agent
 Department of Procurement Services

ATTENTION SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL: ITN NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER AND DESCRIPTION MUST BE ON REQUESTION. TABULATION ONLY. THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.