
ITEM
NO. A - New Alternator & Starters Warranty Period Warranty Period Warranty Period Warranty Period Warranty Period

1. Manufacturer/ Brand Delco-Remy 
Alternator 40SI              

(*) National 
Fleet 
Pricing

3 Years / Unlimited Mileage 
School Bus Only

DELCO 
STARTER 
29MT 12V

20% 1 YEAR

2. Manufacturer/ Brand
NAPA 
Premium 
Starters

50% 3 years Delco-Remy 
Alternator 28SI               

(*) National 
Fleet 
Pricing

2 Years / Unlimited Mileage 
School Bus Only

LEECE/NE
VILLE 
ALTERNA

40% 1 year

3. Manufacturer/ Brand
NAPA 
Premium 
Alternators

50% 3 years Delco-Remy 
Starter Motors

(*) National 
Fleet 
Pricing

2 Years / Unlimited Mileage 
School Bus Only

4. Manufacturer/ Brand

5. Manufacturer/ Brand
Mitsubishi 
Diamound Gard 
Starters only

(A)(*) 
National 
Fleet 

3 Years / Unlimited Mileage 
No-Fault / Re-Clock 
Warranty

6. Manufacturer/ Brand Please Read 
Notes: (A), (*) 

(A)(*) 
National 
Fleet 

All OEM International Parts 
Warranties 1 Year / 
Unlimited Mileage

7. Labor Rate for Installation
Installed At 
Rechtien 
Dealership $129.00

8. Labor Warranty Period

9. Manufacturer/ Brand
NAPA 
Silentguard 
Brake Pads

OEM Meritor 
Reman Brake 
Shoe Kits

10. Manufacturer/ Brand

NAPA Fleet 
Brake Pads

International 
FleetRite Reman 
Shoe Kits

11. Manufacturer/ Brand
Meritor 
Platinumshield III 
Coating has a 

12. RIVET PLATING FOR RELINING (TYPE): Genuine OEM 
Meritor 

13. Labor Rate for Installation
Installed At 
Rechtien 
Dealership 

14. Parts Warranty Period

15. Labor Warranty Period

16. Manufacturer/ Brand
Wix NAPA Filters

OEM Fleetguard 
Filter 

CUMMINS 
FILTERS 

17. Manufacturer/ Brand
Auto Extra

International, 
Hino Filters

18. Manufacturer/ Brand
ATP

19.
Parts Warranty Period

20.
International Bus

IC, Navistar and 
Fleetrite  OEM 
Parts WIPERS

21.
Thomas Built

This is cost plus 
markup

IC, Navistar and 
Fleetrite  OEM 
Parts WIPERS

Parts Discount off MSRP

Parts Discount off MSRP Parts Discount off MSRP Parts Discount off MSRP

Parts Discount off MSRP Parts Discount off MSRP Parts Discount off MSRP Parts Discount off MSRP

Parts Discount off MSRP Parts Discount off MSRP Parts Discount off MSRP Parts Discount off MSRP

No Bid

NEGOTIATED RATES NEGOTIATED RATES NEGOTIATED RATES

50.00%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

For the Service Life Recommended by OE 
Manufacturer

No Bid

75.00%

Parts Discount off MSRP

No Bid

LD: -75.05% & HD: -78.05%

-50.00%

-40.00%

Please see the attached Warranty List for 
details

Parts Discount off MSRP

C - Automotive & Equipment Filters 
Catalog Discount

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
 DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Florida Transportation Systems, Inc.
6041 Orient Rd

Tampa, FL 33610

Vehicle Service and Parts Phone: (813) 980-0174
ITN  NO. N227424DO Fax: (813) 985-7874

No Bid

OPENING DATE:
 October 26, 2022 @ 2:00 PM Email: drevelle@fts4buses.com jeff.slack@fts4buses.com

No Bid

B - Relined Brake Parts

No Bid

No Bid

Parts Discount off MSRP

NEGOTIATED RATES

Parts Discount off MSRP

Parts Discount off MSRP

D - OEM Bus Parts & Accessories
Catalog Discount

25.00%

IEH Auto Parts, LLC d/b/a Auto Plus 
Auto Parts
901 N Lenola Rd

Moorestown, NJ 08057

Phone: (855) 214-9055

J&K Auto Parts, Inc. d/b/a NAPA Auto 
Parts

1820 Boyscout Dr
Fort Myers, FL 33907

Phone:   (239) 936-4000
Fax:       (239) 939-5675Fax: (800) 723-1377

No Bid

Email: fleetparts@autoplusap.com

No Bid

50.00%

Fleet Pads - 90 days

Email:    jmurdza@cox.net

Limited Lifetime

Parts Discount off MSRP

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

1-Year / Unlimited Mileage From Rechtien International 
Dealer Invoice Date

(**) 60% Off Navistar Major Fleet Pricing

(*) National Fleet Pricing

All OEM International / Feetrite Warranties 1-Year / 
Unlimited Mileage Date of Invoice

(*) National Fleet Pricing   

(*) National Fleet Pricing   

No Bid

Parts Discount off MSRP

Fax: (239) 334-8712

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc.
2761 Edison Ave

Fort Myers, FL 33916                                       

Phone: (239) 334-1000

Southeast Power Systems, Inc.
5900 Country Lakes Dr
Fort Myers, FL 33905

Phone:   239-694-4197
Fax:  239-790-1401

All OEM International / Feetrite Warranties 1-Year / 
Unlimited Mileage Date of Invoice

Email: ccurrlin@rechtien.com,  acanton@rechtien.com, 
rarnieri@rechtien.com , rblakesley@rechtien.com

Per Hour $150.00

1-Year / Unlimited Mileage From Rechtien International 
Dealer Invoice Date

(*) National Fleet Pricing 15% up to 55%  

(*) National Fleet Pricing   

3 -Year / 300,000 mile warranty against 
Rust-Jacking

Reference Meritor Specification Sheet 
Provided

Per Hour $150.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Email:  ctipton@se-power.com and sfeliciano@se-
power.com

Per Hour

6 months

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NEGOTIATED RATES

No Bid

25.00%

1 YEAR OR MANUFACTURES WARRANTY 
WHICHEVE COMES FIRST

35.00%

35.00%

Parts Discount off MSRP

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



22.
Bluebird

IC, Navistar and 
Fleetrite  OEM 
Parts WIPERS

23.
Parts Warranty Period

Unit Price 
Delivered

Installation 
Charge 
Vendor 
Location

District Location 
Hourly Rate

Unit Price 
Delivered

Installation 
Charge 
Vendor 
Location

District Location 
Hourly Rate

Unit Price 
Delivered

Installation 
Charge 
Vendor 
Location

District 
Location Hourly 

Rate

Unit Price 
Delivered

Installation 
Charge 
Vendor 
Location

District Location Hourly 
Rate

Unit Price 
Delivered

Installation 
Charge 
Vendor 
Location

District Location 
Hourly Rate

24. ALLISON Model AT 545 - Remanufactured 
only, NO SUBSTITUTION

25. ALLISON Model 1000 - Remanufactured 
only, NO SUBSTITUTION

26. ALLISON Model 2000 - Remanufactured 
only, NO SUBSTITUTION

27. ALLISON Model 2500 PTS - 
Remanufactured only, NO SUBSTITUTION

28. ALLISON Model 3000 PTS - 
Remanufactured only, NO SUBSTITUTION

29. Balance of Line Discount off MSRP

30. Labor Rate for Diagnostics $129.00 Per Hour $129.00

31. Parts Warranty Period (minimum 2 years)

32. Labor Warranty Period (minimum 2 years)

33. Rebuilt Engine Parts

OR BETTER - 
Please see the 
attached Lee 
County Schools 
Pricing

(*) National Fleet Pricing

34. Mounts, Suspension & Steering Parts
Cost Plus, 
Dorman, 

Automann

OR BETTER - 
Please see the 
attached Lee 
County Schools 
Pricing

(*) National Fleet Pricing

35. Emission & EGR Controls, Carburetor, Fuel 
Injection & Exhaust Parts

Off Bostech 
Jobber

OR BETTER - 
Please see the 
attached Lee 
County Schools 
Pricing

(*) National Fleet Pricing

36. Batteries CHAMPION & 
EXIDE (*) National Fleet Pricing

37. Belts and Hoses
Cost Plus, 
Dorman, 

Automann
GATES RUBBER (*) National Fleet Pricing

38. Cooling and Heating Parts
Cost Plus, 
Dorman, 

Automann
FOUR SEASONS (*) National Fleet Pricing

39. Drive Train and Chassis Parts
Cost Plus, 
Dorman, 

Automann

MOOG & 
PRECISION (*) National Fleet Pricing

40. Rebuilt Electrical Parts WILSON (*) National Fleet Pricing

41. New Electrical Parts
Cost Plus, 
Dorman, 

Automann

OR BETTER - AC 
DELCO & 
MOTORCRAFT; 
Please see the 
attached Lee 
County Schools 

(*) National Fleet Pricing

Parts Discount off MSRP

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

25%

21%

25%

25%

25%

1 year

E - Transmissions - Remanufactured

No Bid

No Bid

F - Fleet Vehicle Parts and After Market Parts
Catalog Discount

10.00%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

-56%

AC DELCO DEALER -0%
MOTORCRAFT DEALER 

-7.25%
25%

-65%

-68%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

45%

45%

45%

-69%

-50%

Parts Discount off MSRP

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

48%

60%

43%

43%

50%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

50%

Parts Discount off MSRP

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

International / Fleetrite OEM & 
All Makes Parts 

International / Fleetrite OEM & 
All Makes Parts 

International / Fleetrite OEM & 
All Makes Parts 

50%

50%

50%

International / Fleetrite OEM & 
All Makes Parts 

All OEM International / Feetrite Warranties 1-Year / 
Unlimited Mileage Date of Invoice

No Bid

No Bid

International / Fleetrite OEM & 
All Makes Parts 

International / Fleetrite OEM & 
All Makes Parts 

International / Fleetrite OEM & 
All Makes Parts 

International / Fleetrite OEM & 
All Makes Parts 

International / Fleetrite OEM & 
All Makes Parts 

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Parts Discount off MSRP

(*) National Fleet Pricing   

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

25%

35.00%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Parts Discount off MSRP

20%

25%

20%

20%

25%

20%

25%

20%



42. A/C Repair Parts MCC FOUR SEASONS (*) National Fleet Pricing

43. Balance of Line Discount off MSRP

OR BETTER - 
Please see the 
attached Lee 
County Schools 
Pricing

(*) National Fleet Pricing

44. Parts Warranty Period

Hourly Rate at 
Vendor Location

O/T Hourly 
Rate at 
Vendor 

Location

District Location 
Hourly Rate

Hourly Rate 
at Vendor 
Location

O/T Hourly 
Rate at 
Vendor 

Location

District Location 
Hourly Rate

Hourly Rate at 
Vendor 

Location

O/T Hourly 
Rate at 
Vendor 

Location

District Location 
Hourly Rate

Hourly Rate at 
Vendor Location

O/T Hourly 
Rate at 
Vendor 

Location

District Location Hourly Rate
Hourly Rate 
at Vendor 
Location

O/T Hourly 
Rate at 
Vendor 

Location

District Location 
Hourly Rate

45.
International Bus

$150.00 $175 $150 $150.00 $165 $175 $129.00 $129

46.
Thomas Built

$150.00 $175 $150 $150.00 $165 $175 $129.00 $129

47.
Bluebird

$150.00 $175 $150 $150.00 $165 $175 $129.00 $129

48.
Light and Medium Duty Auto

$150.00 $165 $175 $129.00 $129

49.
Light and Medium Duty Truck

$150.00 $165 $175 $129.00 $129

50.
Heavy Duty Truck

$150.00 $165 $175 $129.00 $129

51. Bus Inspection/  DOE Certification $150.00 $175 $150 $525.00 NA NA $129.00 $129

52. Parts Warranty Period (minimum 1 year)

53.
Labor Warranty Period (minimum 1 year)

(A) Please See Extended Warranty Informatio(*) Please See Navistar Pricing File
AWARDED VENDOR (**) Please See Fleetguard Pricing Information File

85 VENDORS WERE NOTIFIED
5 VENDORS SUBMITTED A RESPONSIVE PROPOSAL
5 VENDORS SUBMITTED A NO - BID

80 VENDORS DID NOT RESPOND

11.09.22
APPROVED BY: Derek Ochoa DATE:

It is recommended that this ITN be awarded to Florida Transportation Systems, Inc., IEH Auto Parts, LLC d/b/a Auto Plus Auto Parts, J&K 
Auto Parts, Inc. d/b/a NAPA Auto Parts, Rechtien International Trucks, Inc., and Southeast Power Systems of Fort Myers, Inc. being the 
highest ranked, best value firm(s) based on the evaluation committee ranking and negotiated pricing.

G - Repair Service of Light Duty, Medium Duty and 
Buses & Parts

No Bid

No Bid

-50%

-40%

Please see the attached Auto Plus Warranty 
Info for details

1 year

1 Year

25%

25%

1 Year from date of install

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

International / Fleetrite OEM & 
All Makes Parts 

International / Fleetrite OEM & 
All Makes Parts 

Per Manufacturer's stated warranty

No Bid

No Bid

All OEM International / Feetrite Warranties 1-Year / Unlimited 
Mileage Date of Invoice

1-Year / Unlimited Mileage From Rechtien International Dealer 
Invoice Date

All OEM International / Feetrite Warranties 1Year / 
Unlimited Mileage Date of Invoice

50%

45%

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

6 MONTHS OR MANUFACTURE WARRANTY 
WHICHEVER COMES FIRST

1 YEAR OR MANUFACTURES WARRANTY

1 YEAR OR MANUFACTURES WARRANTY

20%

22%



November 2, 2022

Rechtien International Trucks, Inc. 80.75

J&K Auto Parts, Inc. d/b/a NAPA Auto 
Parts 80.75

Florida Transportation Systems, Inc. 80.75

IEH Auto Parts, LLC d/b/a Auto Plus Auto 
Parts 78.25

Southeast Power Systems of Fort Myers, 
Inc. 76.13

85 VENDOR(S) WERE NOTIFIED OF ITN
5 VENDOR(S) SUBMITTED RESPONSE

80 VENDOR(S) DID NOT RESPOND

APPROVED BY:

Tracey Adams CLGPO, Director of Procurement
Department of Procurement Services
Date: October 21, 2022

Vehicle Parts and Services
Scoring of Written Proposals

ITN No. N227424DO
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