ITN No. N227422MG

Golf Cart Purchase, Repairs and Services

Scoring of Written Proposals
October 18, 2022

Affordable Carts Holdings, LLC 84.27
Coastal Carts 79.53

B&W Golf Cars, Inc. 72.27

Wesco Turf, Inc. 68.60

Gator Golf Cars & Utility Vehicles, LLC 55.70

19 VENDOR(S) WERE NOTIFIED OF ITN
5 VENDOR(S) SUBMITTED RESPONSE
1 VENDOR(S) Submitted A NO BID
13 VENDOR(S) DID NOT RESPOND
APPROVED BY:

menjw

Tracey Adams CLGPO, Director of Procurement

Nenartment nf Praciireameant Senvicec

Date: November 23, 2022




THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Affordable Carts Holdings, LLC
17521 N Tamiami Trail,
North Fort Myers, FL 33903

OPENING DATE: TUESDAY, October 11, 2022

Contact: Joe Crouch (Manager)

BOARD APPROVED: TUESDAY, January 10, 2023

Phone Number: 239-731-9500

AWARDED: January 10, 2023 through January 9, 2026

Email Address: joe@affordablecarts.com

RENEWAL OPTIONS: Three (3) additional one-year periods

Best and Final Offer

CATEGORY 1: PURCHASE OF NEW, USED AND RECONDITIONED GOLF CARTS, SPECIALTY VEHICLES AND UTILITY VEHICLES

ITEM DESCRIPTION uom GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
NEW USED | RECON NEW useD | RecoN | New | usep | REcon
1-1 EZGO RXV Elite Discount 5% 15% 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
1-2 EZGO RXV Discount 5% 15% 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
1-3 EZGO Valor Discount 5% 15% 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
1-4 EZGO TXT Discount No Bid 15% 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
1-5 Club Car Onward Discount 10% 15% 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
1-6 Club Car Tempo Discount 5% 15% 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
1-7 Club Car XRT Discount 5% 15% 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
1-8 Yamaha Drive Discount No Bid 15% 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
1-9 Cushman Hauler Discount 5% 15% 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
1-10 |Cushman Shuttle Discount No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 15% 10% No Bid | No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 2: PARTS, ACCESSORIES AND WARRANTIES
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
2-1 |Service Parts Discount 22% 22% No Bid
2-2  |Accessories Discount 15% 15% No Bid
23 Loaner Vehicle Amount
(Daily Rate) $25.00 $25.00 No Bid
Additional Warranty for parts and
labor over and above one year: _
2-4 R Description
New Equipment
(Months/Years) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Additional Warranty for parts
25 labor ove.r and above one year: Amount
Used Equipment
(Months/Years) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Additional Warranty for parts and
labor over and above one year:
2-6 . Amount
Recon Equipment
(Months/Years) No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-7 Y/N
Minimum Order Required No No No Bid
CATEGORY 3: REPAIRS AND SERIVCES
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
Minimum Service Call
31 Amount $75.00 $75.00 No Bid
3-2 Pickup/Delivery Fee Amount $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
3-3 |Additional Rate 1/2 Hour Amount $47.50 $47.50 No Bid
3-4 |Additional Rate 1/4 Hour Amount $23.75 $23.75 No Bid
3-5 |Authorized for Warranty Work Y/N Yes Yes No Bid
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom
4-1 Licensing Information Description Lee County Busines License
4-2 Certification Information Description We are certified authorized dealers of EZGO, Cusk 1, Club Car, XRT
4-3  |Insured Y/N Yes
4-4 One Year Warranty/Guarantee Y/N Yes
4-5 Extended Warranty Offered Y/N No
46 Manufacture (Blue B‘ook) Y/N No
for New & Used Equipment
4-7  |Published Catalog Date Parts and Accessories
Shipping included on purchases of parts,
48 accessories and equipment YIN Vs
4-9  [Service Call Response Time Description 3 days
Additional Items as may be required:
4-10 |Percentage markup over Proposer cost Description Note that One Year Warranty Applies to Parts and Accessories

(Not to exceed 5%)




THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

B&W Golf Cars, Inc.
5467 Yahl Street,
Naples, FL 34109

OPENING DATE: TUESDAY, October 11, 2022

Contact: Steve Parker (Present and Owner)

BOARD APPROVED: TUESDAY, January 10, 2023

Phone Number: 239-707-7898

AWARDED: January 10, 2023 through January 9, 2026

Email Address: steve@bwgolfcars.com

RENEWAL OPTIONS: Three (3) additional one-year periods

Best and Final Offer

CATEGORY 1: PURCHASE OF NEW, USED AND RECONDITIONED GOLF CARTS, SPECIALTY VEHICLES AND UTILITY VEHICLES

TEM MANUFACTURER uom GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
NEW [ useD | REcON | NEw | useD | RECON | NEw [ useD | RECON
1-1  [Pilotcar EV | PC-2 w/Econo Box & Short Top Discount No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid [ No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid
1-2 Pilotcar EV | PC-2+2 w/ Full Long Top Discount 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid [ No Bid No Bid No Bid [ No Bid No Bid
1-3  [Pilotcar EV | PC-4+2 w/ Full Long Top Discount 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid [ No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
1-4 Pilotcar EV | PC-H w/ Full Long Top Discount No Bid [ No Bid No Bid 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid [ No Bid No Bid
1-5 [E-Z-GO | 2P w/ Utility Box Discount No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid [ No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% 10%
1-6 [E-Z-GO | 4P Discount No Bid 10% 10% No Bid [ No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
1-7 __ [Club Car | 2P w/ Utility Box Discount No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid [ No Bid No Bid No Bid 10% 10%
1-8 [Club Car | 4P Discount No Bid 10% 10% No Bid [ No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 2: PARTS, ACCESSORIES AND WARRANTIES
ITEM DESCRIPTION UoM GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
2-1 Service Parts Discount 20% 20% 20%
2-2  [Accessories Discount 20% 20% 20%
23 Loaner Vehicle Amount
(Daily Rate) 15.95 (15 Day Minimum) 17.5 (15 Day Minii ) 19.85 (15 Day Mini )
Additional Warranty for parts and labor over and
2-4 above one year: Description
New Equipment Pilotcar Vehicle, Motor, and | Pilotcar Vehicle, Motor, and | Pilotcar Vehicle, Motor, and
(Months/Years) ESC (48 months/4 years) | ESC (48 months/4 years) | ESC (48 months/4 years)
Additional Warranty for parts labor over and above
one year:
z5 Used Equipment Amount
(Months/Years) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Additional Warranty for parts and labor over and
26 above one.year: Amount
Recon Equipment
(Months/Years) No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-7 Minimum Order Required Y/N No No No
CATEGORY 3: REPAIRS AND SERIVCES
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
Minimum Service Call
Amount . . q
3-1 Regional $60-$125 Regional $60-$125 Regional $60-$125
3-2 Pickup/Delivery Fee Amount Varies $75-$150 Varies $75-$150 Varies $75-$150
Additional Rate Amount First 30 minutes ($105) After | First 30 minutes ($105) After | First 30 minutes ($105) After
3-3  |1/2 Hour initial 30 min at half|initial 30 min minimum, at half|initial 30 min at half|
Additional Rate First 30 minutes ($105) After | First 30 minutes ($105) After | First 30 minutes ($105) After
Amount q G q .
3-4 1/4 Hour initial 30 min minimum, at initial 30 min at initial 30 min Im, at
3-5 |Authorized for Warranty Work Y/N Yes Yes Yes
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
ITEM DESCRIPTION Uuom
4-1  |Licensing Information Description No Bid
4-2  |Certification Information Description No Bid
4-3  |Insured Y/N Yes
4-4  |One Year Warranty/Guarantee Y/N Yes
4-5 |Extended Warranty Offered Y/N Yes
Manufacture (Blue Book)
46 for New & Used Equipment YN Yes
4-7  [Published Catalog Date Yes, 2022 Catalog
Shipping included on purchases of parts,
4-8 accessories and equipment Y/N Yes
4-9  |Service Call Response Time Description 24-48 Hours
Additional Items as may be required:
4-10 |Percentage markup over Proposer cost Description 5% markup on special order items and overseas freight

(Not to exceed 5%)




Coastal Carts
16611 S Tamiami Trail,
Fort Myers, FL 33908
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966
OPENING DATE: TUESDAY, October 11, 2022 Contact: Jerry McTear (General Manager)
BOARD APPROVED: TUESDAY, January 10, 2023 Phone Number: 239-936-5676
AWARDED: January 10, 2023 through January 9, 2026 Email Address: jerry@coastalcartsfl.com
RENEWAL OPTIONS: Three (3) additional one-year periods Best and Final Offer
CATEGORY 1: PURCHASE OF NEW, USED AND RECONDITIONED GOLF CARTS, SPECIALTY VEHICLES AND UTILITY VEHICLES
ITEM MANUFACTURER oM GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
NEW USED RECON NEW USED RECON NEW USED RECON
1-1 |Yamaha Discount 12% 15% 15% 12% 15% 15% 12% 15% 15%
1-2 Icon Discount 12% 15% 15% 12% 15% 15% 12% 15% 15%
CATEGORY 2: PARTS, ACCESSORIES AND WARRANTIES
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
2-1  |Service Parts Discount 25% 25% 25%
2-2  |Accessories Discount 25% 25% 25%
23 Loaner Vehicle Amount
(Daily Rate) $30.00 No Bid $35.00
Additional Warranty for parts and labor
24 |OVer and.above one year: Description
New Equipment
(Months/Years) One Year One Year One Year
Additional Warranty for parts labor over
2.5 and abov? one year: Amount
Used Equipment
(Months/Years) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.6 Additional Warranty for parts and labor Amount
over and above one year:
Recon Equipment
(Months/Years) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2-7  |Minimum Order Required Y/N No No No
CATEGORY 3: REPAIRS AND SERIVCES
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
Minimum Service Call Amount
3-1 $80.00 $80.00 $0.00
3-2 Pickup/Delivery Fee Amount $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Additional Rate Amount
3-3 1/2 Hour $42.50 $42.50 $42.50
Additional Rate Amount
3-4 1/4 Hour $22.50 $22.50 $22.50
3-5 |Authorized for Warranty Work Y/N No Bid No Bid No Bid
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom
4-1 |Licensing Information Description FL State Motor Vehicle Dealer VF/1123339/1
4-2  [Certification Information Description All mechanics certified by Yamaha
4-3  |Insured Y/N Yes
44 One Year Warranty/ Y/N Yes
Guarantee
4-5 Extended Warranty Offered Y/N No
Manufacture (Blue Book)
4-6 No
for New & Used Equipment YN
4-7  |Published Catalog Date No
Shipping included on purchases of parts,
4-8 |accessories and equipment Y/N No
4-9 |Service Call Response Time Description Within 24 Hours
Additional Items as may be required:
4-10 |Percentage markup over Proposer cost Description 0
(Not to exceed 5%)




THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Gator Golf Cars & Utility Vehicles, LLC

14519 Global Parkway,
Fort Myers, FL 33913

OPENING DATE: TUESDAY, October 11, 2022

Contact: David Parker (President)

BOARD APPROVED: TUESDAY, January 10, 2023

Phone Number: 239-334-4000

AWARDED: January 10, 2023 through January 9, 2026

Email Address: dave@gatorgolfcars.com

RENEWAL OPTIONS: Three (3) additional one-year periods

Best and Final Offer

CATEGORY 1: PURCHASE OF NEW, USED AND RECONDITIONED GOLF CARTS, SPECIALTY VEHICLES AND UTILITY VEHICLES

TEM MANUFACTURER uom GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
NEW USED RECON NEW USED RECON NEW USED RECON
$6,598.88 EV | Varies By | Varies By
2023 Club Car C 11 100 Di: t 159 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 ub Car Carryal iscount 15% o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi o Bi $7,130.05 Gas Year Year
TR Varies By | Varies B
2023 Club Car Carryall 300 Discount 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,784.00 Gas Year Y Year Y
1-2
SEELEY Varies By | Varies B
2023 Club Car Carryall 500 Discount 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,928.80 Gas Year Y Year Y
1-3
11,176.00 EV | Varies By | Varies B
2023 Club Car Carryall 700 Discount 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid :11,386.40 p a;'::r v a"{'::r v
1-4
" . . . . . . Varies By | Varies By
2023 Club Car Carryall 1500 2WD Discount 15% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,802.65 Gas Year Year
1-5
SRS Varies By | Varies B
2023 Club Car Carryall 1500 4WD Discount 15% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13,859.25 Year Y Year Y
1-6 Diesel
SR Varies Per | Varies Per
2023 Club Car Transporter Discount 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid $11,754.40 Year Year No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.7 Gasoline
PEZAOEY Varies Per | Varies Per
2023 Club Car Transporter XL Discount 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid $19,242.40 Year Year No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-8 Gasoline
AL Ry Varies Per | Varies Per
2023 Club Car Villager 6 Passenger Discount 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,983.20 Year Year No Bid No Bid No Bid
1-9 Gasoline
CE IRy Varies Per | Varies Per
2023 Club Car Villager 8 Passenger Discount 20% No Bid No Bid No Bid $11,936.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
. Year Year
1-10
$21,387.60
Lead Acid Varies Per | Varries Per
2023 Club Car Current LSV W/ Flat Bed  |Discount 10% No Bid No Bid No Bid $3z,290.lss ;ear Vlear No Bid NoBid | NoBid
1-11 Lithium
$9,570.40 EV . Varies Per . . . . . .
i 9
112 2023 Club Car Tempo 2 + 2 Discount 20% $9,622.40 Gas Varies Per Year Year No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2023 Club Car Tempo 2 + 2 Lithium Discount 20% $11,671.20 | Varies Pervear | V2MieS Per No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | No Bid
1-13  [Battery Year
2023 Club Car Villager 2+ 2 LSV (Street |, 0 130 $10,713.18 | Varies Pervear | V2MieS Per No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | No Bid
1-14 [Legal Vehicle) Year
OMNIA contract T See attatched
Pricing based on . vehicles are OMNIA
- . Effective date ) ) Renewal . . . . .
Additional Information OMNIA contract 02/18/22 subject to price Effective contract for No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
EV2671-01 Increases from 02/19/2023 additional
1-15 3.5%-5% information
CATEGORY 2: PARTS, ACCESSORIES AND WARRANTIES
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
2-1 [Service Parts Discount 20% 20% 20%
2-2  |Accessories Discount 15% (See Omnia Contract) 15% (See Omnia Contract) 15% (See Omnia Contract)
L "
23 (s:i’l':;:f:)'c'e Amount Vehicle Specific/Check Availability Vehicle Specific/Check Availability | Vehicle Specific/Check Availability
Additional Warranty for parts and labor
24 over and'above one year: Description No Bid No Bid No Bid
New Equipment
( hs/Years)
Additional Warranty for parts labor over
2.5 |2andabove one year: Amount No Bid No Bid No Bid
Used Equipment
(Months/Years)
Additional Warranty for parts and labor
26 over and aPove one year: Amount No Bid No Bid No Bid
Recon Equipment
( hs/Years)
2-7  |Minimum Order Required Y/N No No No




CATEGORY 3: REPAIRS AND SERIVCES

ITEM DESCRIPTION uom GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
3-1 Amount $95.00 $95.00 $95.00
3-2 Pickup/Delivery Fee Amount $125.00 $125.00 $125.00
3-3 1/2 Hour Amount $62.50 $62.50 $62.50
3-4 1/4 Hour Amount $31.25 $31.25 $31.25
3-5 Authorized for Warranty Work Y/N Yes Yes Yes

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

ITEM DESCRIPTION uom
4-1  |Licensing Information Description Authorized New Club Car Utility/Personal Vehicle Dealer
4-2 Certification Information Description Club Car Factory Certified Technicians
4-3  |Insured Y/N Yes
4-4  |One Year Warranty/Guarantee Y/N No
4-5 led Warranty Offered Y/N No

Manufacture (Blue Book)
4-6 No
for New & Used YN
Published Catalog
4-7 Yes
Omnia Contract #EV2671-01 Date 2/15/22
Shipping included on purchases of parts,
4-8 |accessories and equipment Y/N No
4-9  |Service Call Response Time Description Response Time: 24hrs  Repair Time: TBD
Additional Items as may be required:
4-10 (Percentage markup over Proposer cost Description No Bid

(Not to exceed 5%)




It is recommended that this ITN be awarded to Affordable Carts Holdings, LLC, B&W Golf Cars, Inc., Coastal Carts, Gator Golf Cars & Utility Vehicles, LLC and
Wesco Turf, Inc., being the highest ranked, best value firm(s) based on the evaluation committee ranking and negotiated pricing.

WA@'/ et

APPROVED BY: Melissa Gross DATE: 11/23/2022

Wesco Turf, Inc.
2101 Canta Court,
Sarasota, FL 34232
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966
OPENING DATE: TUESDAY, October 11, 2022 Contact: Chris Fordney
BOARD APPROVED: TUESDAY, January 10, 2023 Phone Number: 941-650-1257
AWARDED: January 10, 2023 through January 9, 2026 Email Address: chris.fordney@wescoturf.com
RENEWAL OPTIONS: Three (3) additional one-year periods Best and Final Offer
CATEGORY 1: PURCHASE OF NEW, USED AND RECONDITIONED GOLF CARTS, SPECIALTY VEHICLES AND UTILITY VEHICLES
\TEM MANUFACTURER UoM GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
NEW USED RECON NEW USED RECON NEW USED RECON
1-1 Toro Workman GTX, MDX, HD series Discount No Bid | No Bid No Bid 22% 0% 0% 22% 0% 0%
1-2  [Toro Workman UTX Discount No Bid | No Bid No Bid 7% 0% 0% 7% 0% 0%
1-3  [Club Car Discount No Bid | No Bid No Bid No Bid 0% 0% No Bid 0% 0%
CATEGORY 2: PARTS, ACCESSORIES AND WARRANTIES
ITEM DESCRIPTION Uom GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
2-1  |Service Parts Discount No Bid 0% 0%
2-2  |Accessories Discount No Bid 0% 0%
Loaner Vehicle
2-!
3 |(paily Rate) Amount No Bid No Bid No Bid
Additional Warranty for parts and labor over and
2-4 above on.e year: Description
New Equipment
(Months/Years) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Additional Warranty for parts labor over and above
2-5 one year:. Amount
Used Equipment
(Months/Years) No Bid No Bid No Bid
Additional Warranty for parts and labor over and
26 above one'year: Amount
Recon Equipment
(Months/Years) No Bid No Bid No Bid
2-7 _ |Mini Order Required Y/N No Bid No No
CATEGORY 3: REPAIRS AND SERIVCES
ITEM DESCRIPTION Uom GOLF CARTS SPECIALTY VEHICLES UTILITY VEHICLES
3q | Minimum Service Cal Amount No Bid $129.00 $129.00
3-2  |Pickup/Delivery Fee Amount No Bid $45.00 $45.00
Additional Rate Amount
3-3  |1/2 Hour No Bid $65.00 $65.00
Additional Rate Amount
34 1/4 Hour No Bid $32.50 $32.50
3-5 Authorized for Warranty Work Y/N No Bid Yes Yes
ADDITIONAL INFORMATION
ITEM DESCRIPTION uom
4-1 |Licensing Information Description No Bid
42 |Certification Information Description Toro Certification
4-3  |Insured Y/N Yes
4-4  |One Year Warranty/Guarantee Y/N No
4-5 Extended Warranty Offered Y/N No
26 Manufacture (Blue B.ouk) /N No
for New & Used Equipment
4-7  |Published Catalog Date No Bid
Shipping included on purchases of parts, accessories
4-8 |and equipment Y/N No
4-9 |[Service Call Response Time Description 72 Hours
Additional Items as may be required:
4-10 |Percentage markup over Proposer cost Description No Bid
(Not to exceed 5%)
Awarded Vendor
19 Vendors notified of the ITN
5 Vendors Submitted Proposal
13 Vendors Non-Responsive
1 Vendor(s) Returned a No Bid




