
ITEM
NO. DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATEDQ
UANTITY 

PER WEEK

PRODUCT NAME, OUNCES AND 
NUMBER PRICE PER DOZEN PRODUCT NAME, OUNCES AND 

NUMBER PRICE PER DOZEN

1. Nutzo Cone, 4 oz, (Blue Bell #182 or Approved Equal)
Approx. 1 Dozen Per Week 1 DZ.

DeConna 4 oz. 
Nutty Cone -   DEC118

Does Not Meet Specifications
$8.00

LOW FAT CRAZY 
CONE,4OZ,24 PER PACK,

 ITEM #31303
$5.28

2.
Chocolate and Vanilla Cone, 3 oz.,
(Or Approved Equal)
Approx. 2 Dozen Per Week

2 DZ.
DeConna 4 oz. 

Choc. Van. Cone - 
GAR352

$6.50

VANILLA CHOCOLATE 
TWIST CONE,4OZ,24 PER 

PACK, 
ITEM #31307

$5.28

3. Cookie Cone, 4 oz, (Blue Bell # 100 or Approved Equal)
Approx. 2 Dozen Per Week 2 DZ.

DeConna 4 oz. 
L/F Cookie Cone - 

DEC119
$6.50

LOW FAT COOKIE & CREAM 
CONE,40Z,24 PER PACK, 

ITEM #31306
$5.28

4. Mini Sandwich, 24pk, (Blue Bell #439 or Approved Equal)
Approx. 20 Dozen Per Week 20 DZ.

DeConna 2.75 oz.
L/F Mini Ice Cream Sandwich 

DEC039
$4.00

MIGHTY MINI ICE CREAM 
SANDWICH, 2.5OZ,

48 PER PACK, 
ITEM #31352

$3.48

5.

Cool Daze Low Fat Ice Cream Sandwich, 3 oz., low fat 
vanilla ice cream layered between two classic chocolate 
wafers (Blue Bell #128 or Approved Equal)
Approx.  20 Dozen Per Week

20 DZ.
DeConna 4 oz.

L/F Ice Cream Sandwich   
DEC079

$6.00
REDUCED FAT VANILLA ICE 

CREAM SANDWICH, 4OZ, 
24 PER PACK, ITEM #31319

$5.52

6. Reduced fat Cookies 'N Cream sandwich
Approx.  20 Dozen Per Week 20 DZ. NO BID $6.00

REDUCED FAT COOKIE 'N 
CREAM ICE CREAM 

SANDWICH,
4OZ, 24 PER PACK,

 ITEM #31355

$5.52

7.
Blue Ribbon Classics Orange Dream Bar, 3 oz., (Blue Bell 
#218, Or Approved Equal)
Approx. 10 Dozen Per Week 

10 DZ.
Rich's 2.5 oz. 

L/F Orange Cream Bar - 
RCH024

$4.50
ORANGE BLOSSOM BAR,

2.5OZ,36 PER PACK,
ITEM #31154

$3.06

8.
Blue Ribbon Classics Fudge Bar, 3 oz., (Blue Bell #207 or 
Approved Equal)
Approx. 24 Dozen Per Week 

24 DZ.
DeConna 2.5 oz. 

L/F Fudgie Fudge Bar   
DEC031

$4.50
FUDJO BAR,2OZ,

36 PER PACK, 
ITEM #31153

$3.06

9.
Strawberry Shortcake Bar, 3 oz, (Blue Bell #162 or 
Approved Equal) 
Approx. 3 Dozen Per Week

3 DZ.
Rich's 3 oz. 

L/F Strawberry Shortcake Bar - 
RCH030

$6.00
STRAWBERRY SCOOTER, 

2.75OZ, 36 PER PACK,
ITEM #31151

$3.84

10.
Chocholate Éclair Bar, 3 oz, (Blue Bell #186 or Approved 
Equal)
Approx. 1 Dozen Per Week

1 DZ.
Rich's 3 oz. 

L/F Chocolate Shortcake Bar - 
RCH029

$6.00
CHOCOLATE SCOOTER,

2.75OZ,36 PER PACK,
ITEM #31150

$3.84

11.
Rainbow Polar Pole (Push Up), 2.75 oz., (Blue Bell #139 or 
Approved Equal)
Approx. 3 Dozen Per Week

3 DZ.
Rich's 2.75 oz. 

Rainbow Push Up - 
RCH009

$5.50 NO BID NO BID

12.

FrozFruit Chunky Strawberry, 3 oz., fat-free frozen fruit bar 
w/ slices of real strawberry and all-natural flavor
(Blue Bell #199 or Approved Equal)
Approx. 6 Dozen Per Week

6 DZ.
DeConna 4 oz. 

Strawberry Fruit Bar - 
DEC050

$11.00
STRAWBERRY TROPI-KOOL 

FRUIT BAR,4OZ,24 
PER PACK, 

$10.62

13.
Sour Swell, 2.5 oz.,
(Blue Bell #221, or Approved Equal)
Approx. 4 Dozen Per Week

4 DZ. Rich's 2.5 oz. 
Sour Swell RCH019 $4.25 NO BID NO BID

14.
Blue Raspberry Freeze Bar, 2 oz.,(Blue Bell #387 or 
Approved Equal) 
Approx. 3 Dozen Per Week

3 DZ.
DeConna 2.5 oz. 

Typhoon Blue Rasp. 
Lemonade Bar DEC106

$4.25 NO BID NO BID

15.
Cherry Freeze Bar, 2 oz., (Blue Bell #387 or Approved 
Equal)
 Approx. 3 Dozen Per Week

3 DZ.
DeConna 2.5 oz. 

Double Dare Sour Cherry Bar  
DEC107

$4.25 NO BID NO BID

16.
Grape Freeze Bar, 2 oz., (Blue Bell #387 or Approved 
Equal)
 Approx. 3 Dozen Per Week

3 DZ.
DeConna 2.5 oz. 

Typhoon Cotton Candy Bar    
DEC105

$4.25 NO BID NO BID

17. Peach Fruit Bar, 2.5 oz., (Blue Bell #215 or Approved Equal) 
Approx. 3 Dozen Per Week 3 DZ.

DeConna 2.5 oz. 
Orange Stuff Orange Juice Bar  

DEC108
$4.25 NO BID NO BID

18.
Bar, Juice, Cherry Freeze, 100% Fruit Juice, High vitamin C 
(Blue Bell #229 or Approved Equal) Approx. 2 Dozen Per 
Week

2 DZ.
Rosatti 4.4 oz. 

Typhoon Blue Rasp. 
Lemonade Cup DEC102

$5.07
POLAR BLAST FRUIT 

PUNCH BAR,PACK SIZE 36, 
2.25OZ,ITEM #31000

$3.06

19.
Bar, Juice, Grape Freeze 100% Fruit Juice, High vitamin C, 
(Blue Bell #227 or Approved Equal) Approx. 2 Dozen Per 
Week

2 DZ.
Rosatti 4.4 oz. 

Crybaby Sour Cherry Cup   
ROS016

$5.07 NO BID NO BID

20.

Ice Cream Cup, 3 oz., first ingredient as dairy, low-fat and 
sugar not to exceed more than 35% of total calories.  
Flavors - Vanilla, Chocolate, Strawberry (Blue Bell #456)
Approx. 20 Dozen Per Week

20 DZ. DeConna 3 oz. 
Vanilla Cup - DEC451 $4.50 NO BID NO BID

21. Fiesta Sunday Cup, 3 oz, (Blue Bell #112 or Equal) 
Approx. 20 Dozen Per Week 20 DZ. DeConna 3 oz. 

Chocolate Swirl Cup - DEC452 $4.50
NO FAT BIRTHDAY CAKE 

YOGURT PLASTIC CUP, 3OZ, 
48 PER CASE, ITEM #31660

$3.24

DeConna Ice Cream
Attn: Nick DeConna

6300 West Highway 318
Reddick, FL  32686

Hershey Creamery Company
Attn: Jeffrey Harsh / Shawn Ash

301 South Cameron Street
Harrisburg, PA  17101-2815

CUPS

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
 DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

ICE CREAM AND FROZEN SPECIALTY ITEMS
BID NO. B187335DG

OPENING DATE:  Thursday, May 24, 2018 AT 2:00 PM
REVISED: November 22, 2022

CONES & SANDWICHES

BARS

Phone:  (352) 591-1530
Fax:  (352) 591-4418

Email:  nick@deconna.com

Phone:  (717) 238-8134
Fax:  (717) 233-7195

Email:  harshj@hersheyicecream.com
ashs@hersheyicecream.com



22.
Sunday Cherry Cup, 3 oz, (Blue Bell #467 or Approved 
Equal)
Approx. 20 Dozen Per Week

20 DZ.
DeConna 3 oz. 

Strawberry Swirl Cup - 
DEC453

$4.50 NO BID NO BID

23.
Cup, Ice Cream Chocolate, Low Fat, 3 oz cup,  (Blue Bell 
#137 or Approved Equal)
Approx. 20 Dozen Per Week

20 DZ.
DeConna 3 oz. 

Vanilla / Chocolate Cup - 
DEC454

$4.50

LOW FAT CHOCOLATE 
PLASTIC 

DESSERT CUP, 3OZ, 48 PER 
CASE, ITEM #31665

$3.24

24.
Cup, Ice Cream Strawberry, Low Fat, 3 oz cup, contains 
strawberries, (Blue Bell #126 or Approved Equal) Approx. 20 
Dozen Per Week

20 DZ. DeConna 3 oz. 
Strawberry Cup - DEC453 $4.50 NO BID NO BID

25. Cup, Ice Cream Vanilla, Low Fat, 3oz cup,  (Blue Bell #466 
or Approved Equal) Approx. 6 Dozen Per Week 20 DZ. DeConna 3 oz. 

Vanilla Cup - DEC451 $4.50
LOW FAT VANILLA PLASTIC 

DESSERT CUP, 3OZ, 
48 PER CASE, ITEM #31664

$3.24

26. Lowfat Cup, 3 oz, (Blue Bell #168 or Approved Equal)
Approx. 10 Dozen Per Week 10 DZ.

Garber 3 oz. 
Cotton Candy Cup - 

GAR260
$4.50 NO BID NO BID

27.
Cup, Lime Sherbet, 3 oz cup, High vitamin C, (Blue Bell 
#454 or Approved Equal)
Approx. 10 Dozen Per Week

10 DZ. Garber 4 oz. 
Lemon Lime Cup - GAR020 $4.50

LEMON SHERBET FOAM 
CUP, 4OZ, 24 PER CASE,

 ITEM #31480
$3.48

28.
Cup, Orange Sherbet, 3 oz cup, High vitamin C, (Blue Bell 
#455 or Approved Equal)
Approx. 5 Dozen Per Week

5 DZ. Garber 4 oz. 
Orange Cup  GAR009 $4.50

ORANGE SHERBET FOAM 
CUP, 4OZ, 24 PER CASE,

 ITEM #31490
$3.48

29.
Cup, Rainbow Sherbet, 3 oz cup, High vitamin C,  (Blue Bell 
#136 or Approved Equal) 
Approx. 3 Dozen Per Week

3 DZ. Garber 4 oz. 
Raspberry Cup - GAR010 $4.50

RASPBERRY SHERBET FOAM 
CUP, 4OZ, 24 PER CASE,

ITEM #31500
$3.48

30. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE

Garber 3 oz. 
Orange Juice Push Up - 

GAR001
$5.50

REDUCED FAT SALTED 
CARAMEL

BROWNIE CRUNCH BAR, 
2.75OZ, 

36 PER CASE, ITEM #31167

$3.84

31. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE

Garber 3 oz. 
Vanilla Fudge Push Up - 

GAR013
$5.50

JUICE RUSH CHERRY BLUE 
RASPBERRY, 4.4OZ,

 80 PER CASE, ITEM #31700
$3.60

32. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE

Garber 3 oz. 
Cotton Candy Push Up - 

GAR015
$5.50

JUICE RUSH LEMON 
ORANGE, 

4.4OZ, 80 PER CASE, 
ITEM #31701

$3.60

33. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE

Garber 4 oz. Birthday 
Cake Cone - GAR351 $6.50

JUICE RUSH STRAWBERRY 
MANGO, 4.4OZ, 80 PER 

CASE, ITEM #31702
$3.60

34. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE

DeConna 4 oz.
Pineapple Fruit Bar - DEC055 $11.00

TROPI-KOOL FRUIT BAR 
MANGO, 4OZ, 24 PER CASE, 

ITEM #31232
$10.62

35. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE

DeConna 4 oz. 
Mango Fruit Bar - DEC057 $11.00

NO FAT TWISTER CUP SOUR 
APPLE, 3.75OZ, 18 PER CASE, 

ITEM #50255
$6.00

36. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE NO BID NO BID

NO FAT TWISTER CUP 
SOUR BLUE RASPBERRY, 

3.75OZ, 18 PER CASE,
 ITEM #50260

$6.00

37. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE NO BID NO BID

NO FAT TWISTER CUP 
COTTON 

CANDY YOGURT, 3.75OZ, 
18 PER CASE, ITEM #50245

$6.00

38. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE NO BID NO BID

NO FAT TWISTER CUP 
BIRTHDAY CAKE YOGURT,

3.75OZ, 18 PER CASE,
 ITEM #50230

$6.00

39. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE NO BID NO BID

NO FAT RASPBERRY 
YOGURT 

DESSERT CUP FOAM, 
4OZ, 24 PER CASE, 

ITEM #31580

$4.08

40. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE NO BID NO BID

NO FAT VANILLA YOGURT 
DESSERT CUP FOAM, 4OZ, 
24 PER CASE, ITEM #31570

$4.08

41. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE NO BID NO BID

LOW FAT COTTON CANDY 
PLASTIC CUP, 3OZ, 48 PER 

CASE, ITEM #31661
$3.24

42. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE NO BID NO BID

LOW FAT CHOCOLATE 
SUNDAE PLASTIC CUP, 3OZ, 
48 PER CASE, ITEM #31662

$3.24

43. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE NO BID NO BID

LOW FAT STRAWBERRY 
SUNDAE PLASTIC CUP, 3OZ, 
48 PER CASE, ITEM #31663

$3.24

44. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE NO BID NO BID

REDUCED FAT MINTY MINT 
ICE CREAM SANDWICH, 4OZ, 

24 PER CASE, ITEM #31354
$5.52

45. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE NO BID NO BID

REDUCED FAT BROWNIE 
BATTER ICE CREAM 

SANDWICH, 4OZ, 24 PER 
CASE, ITEM #31356

$5.52

ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS



46. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE NO BID NO BID

LOW FAT MINT/CHOCOLATE 
TWIST PLASTIC DESSERT 
PLASTIC CUP (SEASONAL 

MARCH), 3OZ, 48 PER CASE, 
ITEM # 31643

$3.24

47. ALTERNATE OR NEW PRODUCTS. SAMPLES ARE 
REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE DATE NO BID NO BID

CANDY CANE DESSERT 
PLASTIC CUP (SEASONAL 
DECEMBER), 3OZ, 48 PER 

CASE, ITEM #31667

$3.24

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

11 Vendor(s) Were Notified of Bid  = PRIMARY VENDOR
2 Vendor(s) Submitted Bids
0 Vendor(s) Returned a No Bid
9 Vendor(s) Did Not Respond 

IT IS RECOMMENDED THIS BID BE AWARDED TO DECONNA ICE CREAM HAVING SUBMITTED THE  LOWEST OVERALL AND BEST RESPONSE MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.

APPROVED BY: DATE: 5/25/2018
Doug Gupton
PROCUREMENT AGENT

BID TABULATION ONLY.  THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.
ATTN:  SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL. BID NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER & DESCRIPTION MUST BE ENTERED ON REQUISITION(S).
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Electronic copy of the bid
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Yes
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Attachment E - Debarment Form
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Yes

Attachment F - Drug Free Workplace Certificate

Attachment A - Bid Response Form
Yes
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Required Submittal Checklist

Attachment C - Insurance Requirements Form
Yes
Yes

Attachment B - Reference Form
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