

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES 2856 COLONIAL BLVD. FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966			All Florida Paper Attn: Mario Vale 9150 NW 105th Way Miami, FL 33178			Central Poly-Bag Corporation Attn: Andrew Hoffer/Nicole Lawson 2401 Biedle Place Linden, NJ 07036			Cosgrove Enterprises, Inc. Attn: R. Gregory Rogers/Anthony Jenity 14300 NW 77th Court Miami Lakes, FL 33016			Fastenal Company Attn: Terry Owen/Christopher Fornes 2001 Theuner Boulevard Winona, MN 55987			Imperial Bag & Paper Company Attn: Vickie Scaglione/Lisa Barash 5101 E Hanna Avenue Tampa, FL 33610			Office Depot, LLC Attn: Tim LaRue/Jim Pollman 6600 North Military Trail Boca Raton, FL 33496-2434			Pyramid School Products Attn: Kenneth D. Miller 6510 North 54th Street Tampa, FL 33610			Quill, LLC Attn: Karrie Szalkowski/Conni Montrose 100 Scheller Road Lincnshire, IL 60069			ThreeZ Company, LLC Attn: Hanan Furgon 1225 W Beaver Street Jacksonville, FL 32204			Wallace Packaging, LLC Attn: Monica Urquidez 820 E 47th Street Tucson, AZ 85713		
PAPER PRODUCTS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS (DWO) ITB NO. B207382JC OPENING DATE: THURSDAY, October 8, 2020 @ 2:00 PM REVISED FOR 2nd Renewal, November 1st, 2022			Phone: (305) 755-4820 Email: <a href="mailto:mvale@AllFloridaPaper.com">mvale@AllFloridaPaper.com</a>			Phone: Email:			Phone: (904) 509-0787 Email: <a href="mailto:roy12@cosgrove.com">roy12@cosgrove.com</a>			Phone: (507) 454-5374 Email: <a href="mailto:info@fastenal.com">info@fastenal.com</a>			Phone: Email:			Phone: (561) 438-4800 Email: <a href="mailto:tim.la@officedepot.com">tim.la@officedepot.com</a>			Phone: (800) 792-2644 Email: <a href="mailto:biddep@pyramidsp.com">biddep@pyramidsp.com</a>			Phone: Email:			Phone: Email:					
ITEM NO.	S/LC Part No.	DESCRIPTION	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DWO DELIVERY PRICE	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DWO DELIVERY PRICE	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DWO DELIVERY PRICE	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DWO DELIVERY PRICE	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DWO DELIVERY PRICE	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	SAMPLE Y/N	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DWO DELIVERY PRICE	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DWO DELIVERY PRICE	PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER	QTY PER CASE/PKG	DWO DELIVERY PRICE					
1.	CW-7790	Toilet Tissue, Standard, White Rolls, 4.4" X 3.1", roll diameter minimum 4.4", 1-Ply, 96 Rolls per Case. <b>MUST BE PALLETIZED, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED</b> Estimated Quantity 1000.	SCA-TJ1636S	96	\$37.11	Atlas #125	4.4"x3.5", 96/ics	\$38.77	ESSITY T1616S	96	\$41.49	Kimberly-Clark 0601850	80	Discontinued	SOFDEL 41002T 25cs/kskd	D	\$32.68	454327 TOILET PAPER, 1-PLY,ROLL, WH	96800	\$70.96	Boardwalk BWK61768 "Minimum order is 30 cases"	No	1000/Roll, 96 Rolls/CS	\$54.99	NO BID	CTCOMM 95000	D	\$36.23	NO BID			
2.	CW-7791	Toilet Tissue, Standard White, 4.0" x 3.7", 500 sheets per roll, 2-Ply, Quilted, 96 Rolls per Case, SCA T16120S, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED Estimated Quantity 2000	SCA246120S Reinforced jyn18120s	80	\$27.32	Atlas #235	4.4"x3.5", 96/ics	\$37.99	ESSITY TM1616S	96	\$36.54	Von Drehle Corp 0601849	80	Discontinued	SOFDEL 41002T 25cs/kskd	E	\$29.22	TISSUE, BATH, WH, 2-PLY, 96 ROLLS	96	\$49.29	Boardwalk BWK6180B "Minimum order is 35 cases"	No	500/Roll, 96 Rolls/CS	\$39.45	NO BID	ATLAS APM276	C	\$34.48	NO BID			
3.	CW-7792	Toilet Tissue, Jumbo Roll, 6 Rolls per Case, White, 1-Ply 4000' x 3.6", 3.3" Core SCA TJ1212A, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED Estimated Quantity 150	TJ1212A	6	\$24.74				SCA TJ1212A	6	Discontinued	Von Drehle Corp 0601848	12	No samples	NITTANY 64000P12 48cs/kskd	L	\$25.99	529424 TISSUE, BATH, WH, 2-PLY, 96 ROLLS	6	\$74.65	NO BID	NO BID	BOARDWALK BKWK6103	L	\$30.16	NO BID						
4.	CW-7793	Toilet Tissue, Jr. Jumbo Roll, 12 Rolls per Case, White, 1-Ply, 2000' x 3.6", 3.3" Core SCA TJ0912A, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED Estimated Quantity 200	TJ0912A	12	\$25.77	Atlas #710	3.4"x2000", 12/ics	\$38.77	SCA TJ0912A	12	Discontinued	Von Drehle Corp 0601848	12	Discontinued	SOFDEL 410036 6cs/kskd	N	\$22.64	971782 TISSUE, BTH, CSCD, JRT, 3-PLY, 2000	12	\$43.65	NO BID	NO BID	SOFDEL 410036	N	\$29.49	NO BID						
5.	CW-7794	Toilet Tissue, Jr. Jumbo Roll, 12 Rolls per Case, White, 2-Ply, 1000' x 3.6", 3.3" Core SCA TJ0922A, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED Estimated Quantity 800	TJ0922A	1200%	\$22.73	Atlas #700	3.4"x1000", 12/ics	\$38.66	SCA TJ0922A	12	\$18.96	Von Drehle Corp 0601847	12	Discontinued	NITTANY 5212 60cs/kskd	E	\$21.60	411809 TISSUE, BATHROOM, 100%HT, 12CA	12	\$32.19	NO BID	NO BID	SOFDEL 92014	E	\$16.96	NO BID						
6.	CW-7795	Toilet Tissue, Jumbo Roll, 6 Rolls per Case, White, 2-Ply 2000' x 3.6", 3.3" Core SCA TJ1222A, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED Estimated Quantity 600	TJ1222A	6	\$22.73	Atlas #730	3.4"x2000", 6/ics	\$39.77	SCA TJ1222A	6	Discontinued	Von Drehle Corp 0601847	12	No samples	NITTANY 62000P12 48cs/kskd	D	\$21.88	361433 PPR TOILET JMB 2000' ROLL	6	Discontinued	NO BID	NO BID	SOFDEL 166	D	\$25.58	NO BID						
7.	CW-7799	Towels, Paper, Single Fold, 9.1" X 10.3", Natural, 4000 per case, SK1850A, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED Estimated Quantity 400	SK1850A	16	\$13.66	Marcal #P9009A	10.25"x8.6", 400B/ics	\$25.66	TORK SK1850A	400000%	\$22.05	Von Drehle Corp 0601842	16	Discontinued	CASCADE S1115	O	\$14.19	468780 TOWEL, SINGLE-FOLD, 15CA, NATURAL	4000	\$22.34	NO BID	NO BID	TORK SK1850A	O	\$14.67	NO BID						
8.	CW-77910	Towels, Paper, Multi fold, UNO Bid/each, 290 sheets per Package, 16 Packages per Case, MUST BE PALLETIZED, Cascades, SCA MK30E, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED Estimated Quantity 16,000	MK30E	16	\$14.43	Marcal #P2009A	9.25"x9.5", 16/ics	\$25.77	ESSITY MK30A	4000	\$23.76	Von Drehle Corp 0601843	16	Discontinued	NITTANY MFN4000 70cs/kskd	R	\$13.61	468770 TOWELS, M-FOLD, NTRL, 4000CT	4000	22.07	NO BID	NO BID	ESSITY MK30A	R	\$14.80	NO BID						
9.	CW-77911	Towels, Paper, Rolls, 7.5" X 8.0", 1.8 Core, Packed six (6) per case, Natural, SCA RK800E, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED Estimated Quantity 1200	RK800E	6	\$16.75	Marcal #P7289A	7.87"x8.00", 6/ics	\$32.33	SCA RK800E	600%	\$25.96	Von Drehle Corp 0601840	6	Discontinued	NITTANY 6800E 50cs/kskd	E	\$15.58	214719 TOWEL, ROLL, 800', LCA, NATURAL	6	28.05	NO BID	NO BID	ATLAS 72018	E	\$21.34	NO BID						
10.	CW-77913	Towels, Paper, Rolls, 11" Perforated Sheets, PLEASE INCLUDE COMPLETE PRODUCT SPECS INCLUDING LENGTH OF ROLL AND CASE QUANTITY, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED Estimated Quantity 1000	HB1990A	30	\$18.50	Marcal #06350	11"x8", 85 sheets/roll, 30/ics	\$28.85	ATLAS APM585	30 rolls	\$18.57	Von Drehle Corp 0616097	30	Discontinued	RESOLUT E 585	E	\$17.56	694183 TOWEL, PAPER, 2-PLY, 3-PLY, WHITE	30	33.31	NO BID	NO BID	ATLAS APM585	E	\$18.00	NO BID						
11.	CW-77995	Wipers, Paper, 9.75" X 16.75" Nylon Reinforced, White, 126 per Dispenser Box, Kimberly-Clark 34790, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED Estimated Quantity 250	No Bid			KIMBERLY-CLARK 34790	10 boxes	\$63.93 FL Pref	Kimberly-Clark 0616873	1000%	\$62.20			CASCADE S W610	W	\$55.85	398220 WIPER, RD, 8800790 WYPALL, 126BX	126	No Bid	Kimberly Clark 34790 "Minimum order is 250 cases"	No	126/Box, 10 Box/CS	\$58.98	NO BID	KIMBERLY-CLARK 34790	W	\$56.50	NO BID				
12.	ARO	Delivery Time in Days		5 DAYS		Within 30 Days ARO		30 days		Within expected 30 day delivery timeline			30			5-7 Business Days					7-10 Days						30 DAYS					
13.	BOL	Percentage discount off balance of line:		Yes		No		No		Yes at 30% off wholesale			30%			Yes				Yes (20%)				No								
APPROVED EQUAL (Samples Required) Samples must meet or exceed the specifications of the items listed for each line item. EACH SAMPLE Required Submittal Checklist			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Attachment A - ITB Response Form			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Attachment B - Reference Form			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Attachment C - Insurance Requirements Form			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Attachment D - Addenda Acknowledgment Form			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Attachment E - Debarment Form			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Attachment F - Drug Free Workplace Certificate			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Attachment G - Public Entity Crimes Form			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Attachment H - Scrutinized Company Certification			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Attachment I - Emergency/Storm Related Submittals			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Attachment J - Principal Piece of Business Form			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Attachment K - Guarantee/Warranty Form			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Attachment L - ITB Mailing Label			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
Electronic copy of proposal			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			
(T) Original and (U) copy of bid			Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes				Yes			Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes			

PRIMARY VENDOR  
 SECONDARY VENDOR  
 Florida Preference  
 Florida Preference

APPROVED BY: Deborah Gemelli DATE: \_\_\_\_\_

Deborah Gemelli  
 PROCUREMENT AGENT  
 ITB TABULATION ONLY - THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.  
 ATTN: SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL. ITB NUMBER, ITEM  
 NUMBER & DESCRIPTION MUST BE ENTERED ON  
 REQUESTIONS.