THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Agni Enterprises, LLC
dibla Head to Heels Safety Supplies
Attn: Subbarayan R. Pochi
7950 NW 155th Street, Suite 103
Miami Lakes, FL 33016

Al Florida Paper
Aftn: Mario Vale
9150 NW 105th Way
Miami, FL 33178

Imperial Dade

Atin: Vickie Scaglione

960

1 NW 112th Avenue

Miami, FL 33178

Pyramid School Products
Aftn: Kenneth D. Miller
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610

Sam Tell & Son, Inc.
Attn: Marc Tell/Fred Smilow
300 Smith Street
Farmingdale, NY 11735

Tranzonic dibla CCP Industries, Inc.
Attn: Pete Chojhacki/Laura Dalton
26301 Curtiss Wright Parkway, #200
Richmond Heights, OH 44143

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) (305) 712-6653 (305) 815-5366 Phone: (305) 805-2600 Phone: (800)7922644 | phone: (631)501-6700 (216) 2436844
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (888) 5923667 (305) B84-8424 Fax: (305) 583.9363 Fax: (136217688 Fax 6315010709 Fax: (800) 4456366
~ WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS ~ vscaglione@imperialdade.co GovernmentSales@Samtell.co
OPENING DATE: Email: t Email: m Emai dept m Email: peholnacki@ecoind.com..
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM : : o o : dalton@cepind.com
PDATED: January 20, 2022; June 20, 2022
mem| soLc DESCRPTION ESTWATED | PRODUCTNAME | GTYPER | DELVERED |pRODUTNAME| GTYPER | DELVERED |pRODUCTNAME| QTYPER | DELVERED |pRODUGTNAME| OTYPER | DELVERED |propuctwawe| @UYPeR | |p;opuctnawe| GTYPER | DELWERED
NO. | Part No. ANNUALQTY | ANDNUMBER | CASEPKG | ~ PRCE | ANDNUMBER | CASEPKG PRICE | ANDNUMBER | CASEIPKG PRICE | ANDNUMBER | CASEPKG | PRCE | ANDNUMBER | CASEPKG ANDNUMBER | CASEPKG |  PRICE
TVASIE BaSKaT STNOaTa. 26 QUAT BIRCK.FIaSIC | TR
Cw. | Rectanguar, 14 %' 10 % x 15" igh, BOARDWALK . CONTINENTAL Rubbernaid et o8
| gaags_|Comranal 281601, OR APPROVED wo E P 2 B s | oo | comen | 2 s s
EQUAL. SAPLE REQUIRED ot
VWasta Basket, Snaard, 25 QAN BSe
ow. | Plstc, Rectangulr, 14 % x 10 % x 15' igh, et Rubbermis o
2| O |Cominenta 4201685, OR APPROVED EQUAL,| 120 |PRODICTS.LC|  Ea No B e 2 5396 2 5439 NoBid
oo MP7702BE !
VVaSIE BaSKeL, STANGaTa. 25 UAT Gy
ow. | Plstic, Rectangulr, 14 % Contertal . . o
3| go00s | Continrial 2813GY, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 o Sommercial = Nosis 20560068 * %0 ° $439 tosd
SAMPLE REQUIRED ot 28166
ow. | Scouring Pad, Green, 6" x 9", 10/Package, BOARDWALK . 028 o i b Bk
| 73700 | Contineral 23107, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 1000 BwKi%6 b Ascoseneon * 18.491CAS fosd sorncs s fosd
WPLE REQUIRED
N, So
Gloves, i, SMALL, Non Latex 15 il e, 3
cw. |%e . g SatetyZono s213Ea ) 0B ] Rosiston iodum | 144 Pairpor | $1.50 oach
5. | joeso | 14" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, OR 148 Prvisted 1202Cs $307.35 Noid Noid TTEMPRICED | 12PAR szie Weight 15 Mi caso $216.00cs
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED PR 990800-6m
" Niie, Solvert
Gloves, Nirie, MEDIUM, Non Latex 15 mi . #217MEDIUN o <
6 | ety |nie, 14 ved, reusatle, Ansel, s Setenzone | wpwcs | R0 NoBid Nogid “TEMPRICED | 12PAR s218 C | TR || e
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED _ b
i) Nire, So
Gloves, Nitile, LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil i, E217LARGE >
ow. (S Satetyzone . | s ) 08I b Rosistont iodum | 144 Pairpor | $1.50 oach
7| Jagsz | 14" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell OR 576 v 1202(C; $445.26 No Bid. NoBid ITEM PRICED 12 PAR $2.18 et 15 ML case. 22160000
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED PR il
e Niie, Solvert
Gloves, Nitle, X-LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil 3
8. | SW- |nirie, 14" USDA Approved, reusaie, Ansell OR | 76 omezore | vedwes | 005 NoBid Nogid 12PAR 5216 | W || R
T VED EGUAL, SAUPLE REGUIRED s
cw. | Gloves. Nitie, SVALL Size 7, Non Latex 15 mi S0
5. nite, 19" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell 144 s0Cs ooror Nogid Nosid TEMPRICED |  12PAR s247 NoBid
7ass: aNGUS 2218 s
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED PER T
Gloves, Nirie, MEDIUM Size 8, Non Latex 15 .
10. | Sbe | milniie, 19" USDA Approved, reusabe, Ansel, 144 oezone | sowcs Rhss NoBid NoBid TEMPRICED | 12PAR s217 Nosid
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED PER
Gloves, Nitile, LARGE Size &, Non Latox: 15 mil LaRGE
- feyzone 1089 Ea
11, | S | nie, 19" USDA Approved, reusabe, Ansel, 144 SatenZr sorcs | S0 Nogid Nosid TEMPRICED |  12PAR s247 NoBid
74657 oNGUL22-18 s
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED PR
ow. | Gloves, Nie, X LARGE Size 10, Non Latex 15 S0 e
12.| St |minivie, 19" USDA Approved, reusabe, Ansel. 144 osieyzone | apdcs s NoBid NoBid PREopeR | 12PAR s2a7 NoBid
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED AR
Gloves, Nicle, XX LARGE Size 11, Non Latox
| ow 1o - . 1t Safetyzone spacs No i NoBid No Bid NoBid
74659
w. | Tole Bow Bush Mt nodo Conainer, Lo o5 oo s
4. | 77189 | Continental J50600. OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 Lent02zCT e Nos fosd AN " s fosd
SAMPLE REQUIRED R
CONTINENTAL
15| SW- |Bag. Repiacement for Janior Cart, Continental o NoBid CONTINENTAL o S0 Nosid wissvW B st008 NoBid
77190 {1884 OR APPROVED EQUAL 188w FULL CASES
onLy
Bro0m, Lobby, Polypropylene Fil. 75" X2 WX 3600
16, | SW- |35 H, Tough Polypropyiene vith Fia 0 BOARDWALK 1201 800 @ S2UBEACH | Rutpornaid B sa00 sRIONG - s200 rosia
77200 | Bristies to Trap Fine Partices, ABCO BR-1021 BWKos 18P BRAGZING 5259105 | caraoomin FULL GASES
e o
cw. | Broom Push Fine Sweepedium Sweep, 2¢",
47| 4% | Anchor Sty Bock, Cariske 41871, ONLY, NO s NoBid No Bid NoBid 100124 “FULL 2 5999 Noid
SUBSTITUTES GASES ONLY
ow. |Broom Push, Fine Sweepedum Sweep. 36" BETTER BRUSH 4|
18.| g7 | Anchor Styie block, Cariisle 41872, ONLY, NO a8 No Bid. No Bid. ABCOBR10054 12 $3.89 100136 “FULL 12 $16.99 o Bid
SUBSTITUTES GASES ONLY™
Broom, Sant Standard Size, Angled Bristes.
CW- | 48" Wood Hande Fiagged Poly Biste Tips, ABKO o 99000 T = 5353 EACH ot 5508 ot
" | 77200 | Commercial Quaity, ABCO, BR-10054, O 0 BRA00S4 93 | ABCOBRA siza1cs ABCO #6R10054 2
Broom, Straght Cor 56", Wood Hande,
ow- BOARDWALK $11.05 cach 5757 eacn
20. Garisle 4135467, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 12t 800 BR-1003 6 Nogid 2 599 Nogid
BWKo3ZYCT $13265 Sisascs R
77210 | SAMPLE REQUIRED
Broom, Synthetc Corn Broom 57", Wood
ow- Cartso T2t S1450€a ’ NoBid “MINMUM 5 Nosid
21.| 9% |Hande, Cariske 41679, ONLY. NO 500 Sartle. ity NoBid e 2 E
SUBSTITUTES e
ABCO #0100
Gounter Brush, Pre Line, Sef Flagging Bristes, g
22| S |ABCO 00100, OR APPROVED EQUAL, . soMONALK Ea 406 ABCO 00100 2 PLroEAc Noid O 12 s208 Noid
SAMPLE REQUIRED e
BETIER BRUSH
CW- [ Brush, Tie Foam, Carlsle 40423, OF BOARDWALK 5544 EACH #23031
2. 3 « e 5022 ABCO-00045 o NoBid 2 798 NoBid
77236 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED o BWKI310 2678 N
ORDER 1 48"
RUBBERVAD 'ABCO #00027
Brush, ron Hande, Scrub, Carlse 36289,
24.| S |ABCO 00027, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 COMMERCIAL Ea s202 A8CO 00027 12 SR Noid T 2 s1.40 NoBid
SAMPLE REQUIRED BT 15 120
BETIER BRUSH #|
CW- [ Brush, Smal Grout, Carise 365351, OR BOARDWALK 310208
25, » e ABCO 700020 54808 NoBid 2 NoBid
77238 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 0 819008 MU
ORDER 15 240
‘UNGER #PIPEG
26, | W [Brush, ipe, 11", Curved Screw on, Unger 2 NGER & 2278 NoBid NoBid 10 EACS © 1890 NoBid
77239 |Pipeo, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES nePpE FULL CASES
Gan, Garbage, 20 Galon, Pist. Biie Wibout RUBBERIAD #FG2620BLUE
27, | W i, Minimum 10% Recycled Plastc, Contiental w COMMERCIAL . 55006 o s NoBid e 5 e NoBid
77300 [#2000-1 Huskee, Bue, OR APPROVED PROD. =
Eouiat Rep220738LU peniy]
Gan Garbage, 32 Galon, Pist. Bloe Wilhoul RUBBERIAD
26, | SW-  |id, Minimum 10% Recycied Plastic, Contiertal 15 COMMERCIAL & CONTINENTAL s 1488 EA wtborreid 6 siror o s2190 NoBid
77303 |#32001BL Huskee, B, OR APPROVED PROD az0018L. 2632008LU
Eoum Repzs273BE
cw. | Can. Garbage, 44 Galon, Plastic, Gray Without
2. i Minimum 10% Recycled Pastic, Continental a BWKaGLWRGR| €@ NoBid . 2528 B 52599 NoBid
730, 2643606R
4444GY HUSKEE OR APPROVED EQUAL A
Gan_ Garbage, 32 Galon, Piastc. Gray Wil
BOARDWALK
CW- i, Minimum 10% Recycked Plastic, Continenal & Rubbernaid
0. 180 | BWKsGLNRGR 3 Nogid 3 si7o7 6 s2208 NoBid
77305 [#3200GY Huskee, Gray, OR APPROVED b 2632006R
RUBBERVAD
Dol for Garbage Cans to fit round 20 - 55
ow- COMMERCIAL E, CONTINENTAL 2 s Rubbernaid 2 sz . Nosid
at. || gaton cans, Rubbermaid 2640, Contnerial 120 R, sy s Rutbemid B s
3255, OR APPROVED EQUAL RopaapoBK
cow- Contren E: 236,98 1 106.97 2 8
32| 17355 | Janitor Cart, Continental184BL, OR 0  Conmarcial a E No Bl B $106.9 1 s12008 Noid
APPROVED EQUAL, SAVPLE REQUIRED -
cw. | Duster Telescopic Hand, Lambs Wools
33| e |Extension 58" it flexibe head, SAMPLE 120 SPECIALES & $1275 Nogid Noid % 72 Noid
REQUIRED 350FLEX
34, | CW- | Treated Dust Cloth 127 x 17 Chic 0413, 40per] g, BOAROWALK | so0/Carton Noid MDI78a0s | 100104k | 34290case 1050 5090 o bt | 401g tobgcaso
| 77412 b0, 10 bags per case CHIC 0413 OR BWKDSFPY Clote- 158807
APPROVED EQUAL My
. |DustPan, Lobby, 36" Handie, Plasti only. CONTINENTAL S~ sonona 4912
35| O | Creni 013 R APPROVED EGUAL, w | magw | o I . EET I 5750 o
SAMPLE REQUIRED azBici2 ORDERIS
RUBBERVAD e
. |Dust Pan, Counter Duster, Hoavy Duty, Rubber, e #7G2005
36| S |Concrana 715 OR APPROVED EQUAL, | comEmo | e 8o | e o i B siss o
SAMPLE REQUIRED s10300800 ORDER IS
ABCO 4012068
Handie, Wt Mop Invader, Fierglass hande, o
ow. ’ c 8CO 6 $6.73 oach 2 71 MINMUM 500 Nosid
a7. | o4 | Quick Change, ABCO 01206N8, OR 240 ABKO01206:48 == $o7a0ah | recooraosne o 2 E
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED P
- RBCO #0120
CW- | Hande, Wing Nut Sy, ABCO 1203-NB, OR secoorzoney|  Ea #8C0 o 27 each Notid MINNUM 1 59 NoBid
3| 77501 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 2 o1z0588 5256308 ORDER 1S
ABCO #1104
OW- | Hando for Push Broom, Screw in Meta T 5202 0ach
30, A8CO 01104 e ABCO01I04 2 NoBid 2 5399 NoBid
77505 |ABCO 01104, ONLY. NO SUBSTITUTES 120 $24.24C8 ORDER IS
1207
ew. | Hande for Push Broom, 60, Wood Anchor “MINMUM
“ - |ore, & No Bid No B Discontinued-No Bid 2 5399 Nogid
7807 | Garisk #45270, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES
Handiefor Fior Squeegees, Meta, =
a1.| G| CrerALTAO, OR APPROVED EQUAL, © inoeR oA e s Nosia NoBia o 0 ) Nosia
SAMPLE REQUIRED =
=
42| SW- |Extension Pole. 30" Ungar Opti-Loc Tele Pole, " nGER & s10990 NoBid NoBid “MINMUM © 12890 NoBid
77512 | Ung-EdS00, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES UNGEDS0D T
s
"ABCO #01406N8
GW- | Hand for Dry Mop, Clp On, Wood. ABCO E 8cO o 5399 EACH NoBid N
@ 28000140618 2 o i 2 5579 NoBid
77514 [0146-NB, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES = 014068 5479105 ORDERIS
120
s, | W |High Duster Hande, Pipe Duster 54" Wooden w Nosis Nosis NoBid o gie NoBid
77520 | Handi vith Curved MetalFrame, Wien E317,
ONLY NO SUBSTITUTES
High Duster Repiacement Head. Coton Mop
cW- | head Designed to Fit Pipe Dustor Handi and & s Nosis Noid oms Nosid
45| 77521 |Frame, Hoawy Weight aterials Can Be | WIENENTO0 :

Washad for Exteried Lsaoe Wien £11700
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id Only, Gart an, Plastic White, for #2000WH
.| oW e e o 2 NoBid NoBid NoBid MINMUM 0 609
WH. OR APPROVED EQUAL ORDER S
Cw- | Lid Only, Recycle Can, Plastic White ith hole in CONTINENTAL n . o i a0t
47-| 77851 | conter,fits 32 galon can. Continental 3201-1 E WGz240459WH & bzl o Bid Noid o 6 s7.09
OR APPROVED EQUAL ot
ow. |Lid Only, Garbage Can,Plste, Wrie, fis 52 ) CONTINENTAL obi #FGEB3100WHT
46| a5z | Galon ContreralRouna Grtage Can, ” s it ° “oo=n A R : e
R APPROVED EQUAL DER
G- [LidOnly, Gerbage Cen, Plasic, Gray,fs 32 conmeNTAL & s2028 NoBid NoBid RG2E31GY o 15
4. 77553 | Gallon Continental Round Garbage Can, LJ WG240461WH “MINIMUM
‘OR APPROVED EQUAL ORDERI5 60
Cw. | Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic gray, for 44 CONTINENTAL . ’ - #FG2645606Y
50| 77as4 | Galon Gabage Can, 6 Case Connorial # #o | Vemer | © s s A iy ‘ oo
4445, OR APPROVED EQUAL oy
ToLCo 280105
CW. | Putty Knife, 174 Fex Metal Blade with Pastc o8 o8 roB MM " sus
51| 77855 |Hande, TOLCO 280106, OR APPROVED 0 ORDERIS
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 144 EA
| Mop, Bow, Cotton, 14" Long, 144/B0x, Tookeo seeach SACRYLIC
52| e0s |2601 OR ARPROVED EQUAL SAVFLE 0 fisr=A = o | secoomoo |12 Saancs Nosis MU " soss
REQUIRED ’ ORDERS 144
BT #1053047
5o, | ow. |Trafc Cones, 36" range st win o BOARDWALK - sis s ot oo | soneater | ss0s
| 77610 |refectve stip, JBC #1083047, OR BWKOOT60ER ORDER IS
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 200 e
= 24
4. 735“:-3 Wet Fioor Sign, 37", ABCO WS-001, OR 120 ABCO WGT08141 Ea 53823 | ABCOWS-0001 1 e NoBid - 10 699
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
P I —— 200 RUBSERAD | 10 sgucs so70s | aBcoToio0r 1 757 | rusbormala 7580 . soa.14 1 se058
Rubbermaid 7580, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES
e NapS, FEa, COTONSyHel: Sien.
CW. | Loop ends, 1 114 Headband, Dupont Midew saco . x8c0 96 each
56 | 77626 |Resistant, ABCO 203MCS, ONLY, NO 1600 FG758088 YEL & §10339 Lh203MCS 2 $3563CS | ABCO LM203MCS | 2 sa7 2 419
ey MINMUM ORDER|
Vet NopS, Larg, TToon o
CW. | encs, 1 114 Headband, Dupont Midew ’ e $4190ach  azoaics
57| 77627 |Resistam, ABCO 203LCS, ONLY, N 500 Nosid Lmz03LCs ° sozscs | AecPumeoics| 12 S0 | aecoumm| 12 el
GW. | Dry Mop Head, 24", ABCO DM26524, OR s8c0 $4.14 cach
5 recowmaics|  Ea s1361 2 Noid 2 5019
77628 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 150 DM-265248 $49.78 CS.
50, W |DryMopHead, 36" ABCO DM26536, OR w BOARDWALK & sst 800 @ 55630ach Nosid - 5120
77629 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED BwK1124 ow265%8 567505
60, | CW- |DryMopHead, 48" ABCO DM26548, OR o BOARDWALK . s1a30 s8c0 @ $7.13 each Noid " o7
77630 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED BWK13% oM 265488 $8551C
o1, | W |DryMopHead, 60", ABCO DM26560, OR w BOARDWALK & su80 800 6 5868 0ach rosia - s1090
77631 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED BwK1148 oM265608 $521005
Dry Mop Frames for Clp End Handie, 24",
cw- BOARDWALK £ $222 EACH ABCO " $1.96 each No Bid 3.00
| 7763z 4500 BH2IG2 OR APPROVED EQUAL. “° BWK1260 s06s | smaeszewe 25908 2 §
Dry Mop Frames or Clip End Handie, 36",
cw- BOARDWALK Ea $4.43 ABCO 12 EeTn No Bid 12 $4.99
€| 77633 |ABC0 BH24536. OR APPROVED EQUAL, @ Ern BHS3NE 526505
Dry Mop Frames for Clp End Handie, 48",
ow. BOARDWALK . 5608 s8c0 @ 5328 each Noid 50
O | 7763s |ABCO BHIS4S, OR APPROVED EQUAL, “° BWK1436 BH2ASAENE. 5304105 *2 §
|0y Mop Frames for Cip End Hande, 60, f— Br24550ABC0
65, | 9. | ABGO BH245e0, OR APPROVED EQUAL, @ somowALK B a0 | sec0 s Pase rosia W ORoER| 12 sesm
SAMPLE REQUIRED 'S
o6, | CW: |Finsh Systom, wirotor 18" wop, Rusbermaia | ik - - s U [ . si200
77637 | Q800, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES BWKi460
Fiish System, Mcrofiber 13" Quick Comnect ERMAD 101
67. | St |Frame. Rubbermaid 0560, ONLY, N 2 COMMERCIAL B 813 18 EACH NoBid Rubbermaid 0560 6 51569 6 s16.99
SUBSTITUTES RCPOROOWHI
RUBBERWAD
CW. | Fiish System, Microficer, Rubbermaid Q050, COMMERCIAL
™ & 3105 No Bid wbberme 1 105 6 $169.98
77639 | ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES ” PROD. Rubbermid Q050
RCPOS6
RUBBERIAD
60, | CW- |Finish System, Microfivr, Bucket, Rubbermaid - COMMERCIAL & sares6 NoBid NoBid 9 59095
77641 {230, ONLY,NO SUBSTITUTES PROD.
RePavsD
o |Frsred St virtter Rutparraa o e
70. | O |Hande, 56" wivick comnect, #750,ONLY.NO| 12 HERC & s15228 NoBid Rubberaid Q750 s 897 | “pusaERMAD 6 $98
SUBSTITUTES Renos
RUBBER WAD
CW. | Uity Pad Holder, Screw I wih Buitin Grpper CONMEROIAL o siaen s - o s
1| 77643 |Teethand Swivel Head, TOLCO 280137, ONLY, 100 ROD.
Repazsovw
CW- 1 i io Bic o
72| 77644 |Utiity Pad, 4 %" X 10" Black, 5/PK, Continental b ToC280137 toret s728 NoBid Noid 20 ald 20 pk
20969, ONLY.
1o, | oW |CoHeaa or Uty Pac Hoker, 107 et oo oo oo pacr » S50
77645 |2005, ONLY. NO SUBSTITUTES oRoER 15 24 EA"|
#G2614
ow. 517,66 6ach
- | 77720  |Tivee Galon Pailvith spout, Continenta 8114, 20 IWPACT 2005 e tose Contnertal 8114 ° s N ® soe
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPL OROERS 0
TOSPECO TR
- To-rTEM
15| OW [Rag Bm Agprosinaty 14 x 171018806 g | etscmsriaws|  Es si7s2 Nogig NoBid PRICED PER 104 ' sa7.58
SAVPLE REQUIRED i L
Rags. Tory Cloth, Approximaely 14" x 17" RFI e
cw. |DT-BAR MOP. 10LB, OR APPROVED EQUAL, AN
76| o |savpLe RequiReD a0 No g No Bid Nogid 1 090
MM
TORA #70C
17, | .. |LihtDuty Scrusing Sponge, 3 7116:x5 111, oo oms s . Ao s sors
77850 | Git20951, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE ORDERIS
EQURED 00 A
76| Sea1 | Seay ottes, 1 uar,Contnentar 022, OR 1000 gt I oo oo s 6
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
WPACT w302
ow. BOARDWALK P ’ o5
79| 77852 | Trigger Sprayers, Continental #922 HL, ONLY 1400 BWK03010 I toBid tosid 250 LD
OR APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE REQUIRED
80. | % | WindowSaucegee, 12/, ABCO BH. 15006, OR 120 ABCOBH-15006 Ea ~ABCO BH15006 1 183cs. NoBid 2 5299
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
ew. | Floor Saueegee, Foam Rubber, Universal eAcT
81. 77861 |Handke. 187, Ungar MW450, ONLY. NO 48 PRODUCTS, Ea $2083 No Bid. Mo Bid 12 8.9
SUBSTITUTES LicPez28
Floor Squeegee, Foam Rubber, Universal
82, | S, |Hande, 30", Ungar HMT7S0, Cariske 40083, OR . v € ABCO BH-14003 1 2708 Subermaid 10 s17.43 10 s2159
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
ow. BOARDWALK . o5
83. | 17866 |Padfor Floor Scrubbers, 20" Red, Daily Wash 0 BWK4020RED o Aess1-z0 ° $1058 toid s S22
Pads. SAVPLE REQUIRED EACH...COST
ow- s s st058 NoBid 5 5255
84. | 77868 | Padfor Fioor Scrubbers, 20" Blue, Shower %0 BWK4020BLU Acss20 §
Secrub Pads, SAVPLE REQUIRED
ow. BOARDWAL . ’ o5
85| 77873 |Pad, Burnishing, 20" Hevy Hogs Hair, SAMPLE 50 BWK4020NHE e toBid toid ° S22
QUIRED
86. | 72t |Purice Scourng sk, us purics, oR 0 B sanst b ros 2 sz
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
mpact Resstan, A 105, Seralch FesisanT
CW. | Elastc Srap, Condor 1VT70, OR APPROVED MCR SAFETY . ’ obi
87 | 17880 |EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 320 CRW2230R B s402 toBid tosid 2 LD
88| Taeo [Tape, Cauton, vetowsx 000, mnctraze, | 00 | FEEIEE ) sreez b roe 2 soz8
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPL
ow- BOARDMALK 23 ’ o8 153075
89. | 17891 |Padfor Floor Scrubbers, 12" Red, Daily Wash 60 BWKA012RED st $11.75 No Big NoBid 6 Sos
Pads. SAVPLE REQUIRED
cow. am $008Ea y o
90 | 77892 |Padfor Fioor Scrubbers, 12" Biue, Shower 2 61500044708 e 53038 o Bid Noid & UEIABE
Secrub Pads, SAVPLE REQUIRED
cw- BOARDWALK s261€a ; ot PRICED
91 | 77893 |Padfor Floor Scrubbers, 13" Blue, Shower 2 BWK40138LU st $13.04 NoBid NoBid PER s 169 ealBd5 s
Scrub Pacs, SAVPLE REQUIRED EACH..COST
ow. BOARDWALK ot s261€a o s Nosid o
o2 77894 2 BWK4013RED $13.04 5 169 ea/B.45.
Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 13" Red, Daily Wash
Pads. SAVPLE REQUIRED
Floor Saueogee, 18", Unger MWA50. OR
93, |cw-7786:| APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED UN‘Q‘;\;TSB Ea $10.93 'ABCO BH-14001 1 409cs No Bid UNGER #MW450 10 $8.99
s | ARO Artval Time in Days 0Days 15 2130 10-14 ARO.

SMUVOUOId—S SMUTOUOIH4—-—S SMIUOIA—S= St

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

No Bid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

Noid

NoBid

$19.90 with
of 54 cases,
ottervise
$2295

Raclaimod Huck
owe 10bs per case
taasszszs | 100
70400-10

1417 Economy
Bar Mops 10bs
'536.60-5dzbx

100 per case

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

NoBid

4-5 business days




BOL

Percentage discount off balance of line:

0%

15% (CONTACT KENNY MILLER FOR
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