THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Agni Enterprises, LLC
d/b/a Head to Heels Safety Supplies
Attn: Subbarayan R. Pochi
7950 NW 155th Street, Suite 103
Miami Lakes, FL 33016

All Florida Paper
Attn: Mario Vale
9150 NW 105th Way
Miami, FL 33178

Imperial Dade
Attn: Vickie Scaglione
9601 NW 112th Avenue
Miami, FL 33178

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (305) 712-6653 Phone: (305) 815-5366 Phone: (305) 805-2600
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (888) 592-3667 Fax: (305) 884-8424 Fax: (305) 883-9363
~ WAREHOUSE OPER-ATIONS - Email: cservice@headtoheels.net Email: Mvale@allfloridapaper.com Email: vscaglione@imperialdade.com
OPENING DATE: mail: : mail: : mail: miamibids @imperialdade.com
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM
ITEM SDLC DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED PRODUCT NAME | SAMPLE| QTY PER DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME|SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME | SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED
NO. | Part No. ANNUALQTY | ANDNUMBER | YN |CASEPKG| PRICE ANDNUMBER | YIN |CASE/PKG| PRICE | ANDNUMBER | YIN |CASE/PKG| PRICE
Vvasie Basket, Stanaard, £5 quart Biack,
cw- |Plastic, Rectangular, 14 %" x 10 %" x 15" high, BOARDWALK CONTINENTAL Rubbermaid
1| o001 |Continental #2818BLK, OR APPROVED 600 BWK28QTWBBLA| ¥ Ea $4.58 2818BK 12 $3.13 295600BLA Y 12 $3.96
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
VWVaste Basket, Standard, 28 quart Beige,
cw- |Plastic, Rectangular, 14 %" x 10 %" x 15” high, IMPACT _ Rubbermaid
2. | ca002 |Continental #2818BE, OR APPROVED 120 PRODUCTS, LLC Y Ea $5.42 No Bid e Y 12 $3.96
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED IMP7702BE|
Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart Gray, Continental
CW- |Plastic, Rectangular, 14 %" x 10 %" x 15" high, ontinenta _ Rubbermaid
3- | 69003 |Continental 2818GY, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 o Cgmzf‘gﬂf& Y Ea $10.41 No Bid 295600GR v 2 $3.96
SAMPLE REQUIRED roduc
cw. Scouring Pad, Green, 6” x 9", 10/Package, BOARDWALK 0
4. | ,o70o |Continental 23107, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 1000 AT Y Ea $6.15 ABCO SC-N200 72 18450AS No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED :
Gloves, Nitrile, SMALL, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile,
5. 73:;'0 14" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, OR 144 ez, v | 12pzcs |17 ea No Bid No Bid
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED :
Gloves, Nitriie, MEDIUM, Non Latex 15 mil
CW- nitrile, 14” USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, SafetyZone 1.71 each No Bi No Bid
6- | 74651 |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 576 GNGF-M-15C Y 12D2/Cs 246.74 o Bid o Bi
RENIIREN
Gloves, Nitrile, LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile,
7. 73:‘;'2 14” USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell OR 576 aroreyzone v | 12pzcs | 170 eah No Bid No Bid
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED i
Gloves, Nitrile, X-LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil
CW- nitrile, 14” USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell SafetyZone 1.71 each No Bi No Bid
8 | 74653 |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 576 GNGF-XL-15C Y | 12D2Cs 246.74 o Bid o Bi
RENIIREN
GIoves, Nitriie, SMALL Size 7, Non Latex 15 mit
CW- |nitrile, 19" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, SafetyZone $8.76 each No Bi No Bid
9 | 74655 |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 144 GNGU-S-2218 | ¥ S $315.46 o Bid oBi
RENIIIREN
Gloves, Nitrile, MEDIUM Size 8, Non Latex 15
CW-  |mil nitrile, 19” USDA Approved, reusable, SafetyZone $8.76 each No Bi No Bid
10- | 74656 |Ansell, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 144 GNGU-M-22-18 M SRS $315.46 o Bid 05!
REQIIRED
Gloves, NITe, LARGE SIZe 9, NOn Latex 15 mi|
CW- nitrile, 19” USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, SafetyZone $8.76 each . .
. No Bid No Bid
M- | 74657 |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 144 onouL22-8 | | PFO | Tsaisas o i o
DENILIPREN
Gloves, Nitrile, X LARGE Size 10, Non Latex 15
CW- mil nitrile, 19” USDA Approved, reusable, SafetyZone $8.76 each . "
. No Bid No Bid
12| 74658 |Ansell, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 144 oNGUxL22-18 | T | 3PFO | Tssisas o i o
REQIIIRED ;
Cw- : ; 9 ,Y 7 SafetyZone $8.76 each ) '
13| 74659 |Ansell OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE. 144 GNGU-2x-22-18 | T 3DzICs | s31546 No Bid No Bid
DEANILIPREN ITEMANATANEENEN
Toilet Bowl Brush, Must Include Container,
14, 7‘7"1’; Continental J50600, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 LN v acy | $1981 och No Bid No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED :
CW- |Bag, Replacement for Janitor Cart, Continental No Bid CONTINENTAL No Bid
15| 77190 |1884 OR APPROVED EQUAL 60 o5 188YW 6 Pk o b
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Agni Enterprises, LLC
d/b/a Head to Heels Safety Supplies
Attn: Subbarayan R. Pochi
7950 NW 155th Street, Suite 103
Miami Lakes, FL 33016

All Florida Paper
Attn: Mario Vale
9150 NW 105th Way
Miami, FL 33178

Imperial Dade
Attn: Vickie Scaglione
9601 NW 112th Avenue
Miami, FL 33178

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (305) 712-6653 Phone: (305) 815-5366 Phone: (305) 805-2600
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (888) 592-3667 Fax: (305) 884-8424 Fax: (305) 883-9363
~ WAREHOUSE OPER.ATIONS - Email: cservice@headtoheels.net Email: Mvale@allfloridapaper.com Email: B
OPENING DATE: mail: - mail: : mail: miamibids @imperialdade.com
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM
ITEM| SDLC DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | PRODUCT NAME | SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |[PRODUCT NAME|SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME |SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED
NO. | Part No. ANNUAL QTY | AND NUMBER YIN | CASEIPKG PRICE AND NUMBER YIN |CASE/PKG| PRICE AND NUMBER YIN | CASEIPKG PRICE
Broom, Lobby, Polypropylene Fill, 7.5” X 2" W X
_ |35" H, Tough Polypropylene with Flagged .
16. 7‘;‘,:30 Bristles to Trap Fine Particles, ABCO BR-1021 360 Bgv/\*,ig;": Q;K Y 12/ct $73.04 BR-A18()§?M . 12 $§;569E%CSH Eg?gg&gfﬁ' Y 6 $3.04
MC or Rubbermaid 6374, OR APPROVED .
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
CW- Broom, Push Fine Sweep/Medium Sweep, 24",
17. 77206 Anchor Style Block, Carlisle 41871, ONLY, NO 48 No Bid No Bid No Bid
SUBSTITUTES
CW- Broom, Push, Fine Sweep/Medium Sweep,
18. 77207 36", Anchor Style block, Carlisle 41872, ONLY, 48 No Bid No Bid ABCO BR10054 NTS 12 $3.89
NO SUBSTITUTES
Broom, Slant, Standard Size, Angled Bristles,
CW- |48" Wood Handle Flagged Poly Bristle Tips, ABKO $5.99each g $3.53 EACH No Bid
19| 77200 |Commercial Quality, ABCO, BR-10054, OR 480 BR-10054 Y 6Pk 3503 | ABCOBR-10054 12 $42.41CS o B
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
Broom, Straight Corn 56”, Wood Handle,
20. 7‘;‘2":'0 Carlisle 4135467, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 e Y 12/Ct $1; |99 each | ABCO BR-10036 6 ggzzg No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED ’ :
Broom, Synthetic Corn Broom 577, Wood )
21. 7‘;‘;'1 Handle, Carlisle 41679, ONLY, NO 500 Pl v 12/Ct $g'§§ on No Bid No Bid
SURSTITUTES .
Counter Brush, Pre Line, Self Flagging Bristles,
22. 7‘;‘,:;5 ABCO #00100, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 48 B%‘\\,\TES";’&LK Y Ea $4.06 ABCO 00100 12 $;'27059'2’2:%H No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED :
CW- Brush, Tile Foam, Carlisle 40423, OR BOARDWALK g $5.44 EACH No Bid
B | 77236 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 8 BWK3310 Y Ea $5.81 ABCO-00049 6 $32.67CS o B
" RUBBERMAID
CW- Brush, Iron Handle, Scrub, Carlisle 36289, COMMERGIAL $3.37 EACH !
24. ABCO 00027, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 Y Ea $2.33 ABCO 00027 12 No Bid
77237 PROD. $40.42CS
SAMPLE REQUIRED EGARARIONCORL T
CW-  |Brush, Small Grout, Carlisle 365351, OR BOARDWALK .
, , , ! No Bid
25 | 77238 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 240 BWK9008 Y Ea $2.07 ABCO 700020 5:48CS o8
CW-  |Brush, Pipe, 117, Curved Screw on, Unger UNGER . No Bid
26- | 77239 |Pipeo, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 12 UNGPIPE Y Ea $20.29 No Bid o b
Can, Garbage, 20 Gallon, Plastic, Blue Without RUBBERMAID
CW- |lid, Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental COMMERCIAL . .
y ’ . No B No Bid
27- | 77300 |#2000-1 Huskee, Blue, OR APPROVED 60 PROD. Y Ea $36.11 o Bid o B
EQUAL RCP262073BLU
Can, Garbage, 32 Gallon, Plastic, Blue Without RUBBERMAID
CW- |lid, Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental COMMERCIAL CONTINENTAL Rubbermaid
2 | 77303 |#32001BL Huskee, Blue, OR APPROVED 180 PROD Y Ea vaa.16 32001BL 6 1488EA | 632008LU Y 6 str.o7
EQUAL RCP263273BE
Can, Garbage, 44 Gallon, Plastic, Gray Without .
29. 7‘;‘;’)‘4 lid, Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental 48 BWB&ZEIE_’Q/’V"QE’; Al Y Ea $35.36 No Bid Rz‘gjg%%"’; Y 4 $25.26
4444GY HUSKEE OR APPROVED EQUAL
Can, Garbage, 32 Gallon, Plastic, Gray Without
CW- |lid, Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental BOARDWALK ) Rubbermaid
\ ) . No B 4
30- | 77305 [#3200GY Huskee, Gray, OR APPROVED 180 BWK32GLWRGRA| ' Ea $23.86 o 8id 263200GR Y 6 S
EQLIAI
- RUBBERMAID
Dolly for Garbage Cans to fit round 20 - 55 :
31. 7‘;‘;‘;}) gallon cans, Rubbermaid 2640, Continental 120 Co“ﬁ,“F"{g%C'A'- Y Ea $69.39 CONaTz'gEEZ‘TA'- 4 $17.01 Egggg&'gfﬁ N 2 $23.22
3255, OR APPROVED EQUAL RCPRANNARK
. . Continental .
CW- |Janitor Cart, Continental184BL, OR ) ) Rubbermaid
’ ’ . No B X
32. | 77322 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 8 poommercial | v Ea $22139 o Bid 617388BLK NTS ! $108.97
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Agni Enterprises, LLC
d/b/a Head to Heels Safety Supplies
Attn: Subbarayan R. Pochi
7950 NW 155th Street, Suite 103
Miami Lakes, FL 33016

All Florida Paper
Attn: Mario Vale
9150 NW 105th Way
Miami, FL 33178

Imperial Dade
Attn: Vickie Scaglione
9601 NW 112th Avenue
Miami, FL 33178

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (305) 712-6653 Phone: (305) 815-5366 Phone: (305) 805-2600
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (888) 592-3667 Fax: (305) 884-8424 Fax: (305) 883-9363
- WAREHS;?E?;EEATIONS - Email: cservice@headtoheels.net Email: Mvale@allfloridapaper.com Email: ysca A”"?ne .im er.ialdade‘com
: : . . miamibids@imperialdade.com
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM
ITEM| SDLC DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | PRODUCT NAME |SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME|SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME|SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED
NO. | Part No. ANNUAL QTY AND NUMBER YIN CASE/PKG PRICE AND NUMBER YN CASE/PKG PRICE AND NUMBER YN CASE/PKG PRICE
cwW- Duster, Telescopic Handle, Lambs Wools LAMBSKIN
33. 77410 Extension 58” with flexible head, SAMPLE 120 SPECIALITIES Y Ea $10.14 No Bid No Bid
REQUIRED 350FLEX
cw- |Treated Dust Cloth, 12" x 177, Chic 0413, 40 BOARDWALK ) 10/50
34. 77412 |per bag, 10 bags per case CHIC 0413 OR 600 BWKDSMEPY Y 500/Carton $82.99 No Bid MDI 78404 Y T 34.29/case
APPROVED EQUAL
Dust Pan, Lobby, 36" Handle, Plastic only, CONTINENTAL .
35. 73!:'5 Continental 912, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 360 COMMERCIAL Y Ea $13.10 DP‘_‘?&&E 20 :?0378597?2 ?;;:’:(;“Bif Y 6 $7.74
SAMPLE REQUIRED 912BK-12 :
RUBBERMAID
Dust Pan, Counter Duster, Heavy Duty,
36. 73!:'6 Rubber, Continental 712, OR APPROVED 120 COMP“Q%FE)C'AL Y Ea $6.65 0025;_%3 12 f;z'g‘t)ggcsh No Bid
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED A40.2005.CC :
Handle, Wet Mop Invader, Fiberglass handle,
37. 73‘_:3'0 Quick Change, ABCO 01206NB, OR 240 ABKO 01206NB | Ea $12.04 o 12%2-%3 6 2%3353?%‘ ABCO01206NB | N 12 $7.41
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED :
CW- |Handle, Wing Nut Style, ABCO 1203-NB, OR g ABCO $4.27 each No Bid
38 77501 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 120 ABCO 01203-NBY Y Ea §7.34 01203-NB g $25.63 CS 05!
CW- |Handle for Push Broom, Screw in Metal Tip, " $2.02 each No Bid
39| 77505 |ABCO 01104, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 120 ABCO'01104 v Ea §3.64 ABCO 01104 2| 2248 o B!
cw Handle for Push Broom, 60”, Wood Anchor
40. 7750-7 Drilled, 60 No Bid No Bid Discontinued - No Bid
Carlisle #45270, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES
Handle for Floor Squeegees, Metal,
M. 73‘;‘3; Unger AL140, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 60 UNGEi‘gNGAL Y Ea $21.93 No Bid No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED
CW- |Extension Pole, 30" Ungar Opti-Loc Tele Pole, UNGER o No Bi No Bid
421 77512 Ung-Ed900, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 10 UNGEDS00 Y Ea $125.62 o Bid o Bi
CW-  |Handle for Dry Mop, Clip On, Wood, ABCO g ABCO $3.99 EACH No Bid
43| 77514 |0146-NB, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 120 ABCOOQ1406-NB | ¥ Ea $8.67 01406-NB 2 Vsaz910s o B
cwW- High Duster Handle, Pipe Duster 54” Wooden
44, 77520 Handle with Curved Metal Frame, Wilen E317, 60 No Bid No Bid No Bid
ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES
High Duster Replacement Head, Cotton Mop
CW- head Designed to Fit Pipe Duster Handle and
45. 77521 Frame, Heavy Weight Materials Can Be 120 WILEN E117000 Y Ea $8.89 No Bid No Bid
Washed for Extended Usage, Wilen E11700,
ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES
cw- Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic White, for 20
46. 77550 Gallon Garbage Can, 6/Case, Continental #200- 24 No Bid No Bid No Bid
WH, OR APPROVED EQUAL
CW- |Lid Only, Recycle Can, Plastic White with hole CONTINENTAL . .
41. 77551 |in center, fits 32 gallon can. Continental 3201-1 48 WG240459WH NTS Ea $7.45 No Bid No Bid
OR APPROVED EQUAL
Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic, White, fits 32
Ccw- : ' ’ ’ ) CONTINENTAL "
48. | ,-cs, |Gallon Continental Round Garbage Can, 12 No Bid 3001GY 6 4.90 EA No Bid
Continental 3201, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic, Gray, fits 32
W- . .
49. c Gallon Continental Round Garbage Can, 60 CONTINENTAL NTS Ea $20.26 No Bid No Bid
77553 ) WG240461WH
Continental 3201, OR APPROVED EQUAL
Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic gray, for 44
50. 7“7:W'4 Gallon Garbage Can, 6/Case, Continental # 24 (\\’Nog;?'ggor\ééﬂ‘ NTS Ea $15.71 No Bid No Bid
554 14445, OR APPROVED EQUAL
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Agni Enterprises, LLC
d/b/a Head to Heels Safety Supplies
Attn: Subbarayan R. Pochi
7950 NW 155th Street, Suite 103
Miami Lakes, FL 33016

All Florida Paper
Attn: Mario Vale
9150 NW 105th Way
Miami, FL 33178

Imperial Dade

Attn: Vickie Scaglione
9601 NW 112th Avenue
Miami, FL 33178

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (305) 712-6653 Phone: (305) 815-5366 Phone: (305) 805-2600
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (888) 592-3667 Fax: (305) 884-8424 Fax: (305) 883-9363
~ WAREHOUSE OPER.ATIONS - Email: cservice@headtoheels.net Email: Mvale@allfloridapaper.com Email: vscaglione@imperialdade.com
OPENING DATE: mail: - mail: : mail: miamibids @imperialdade.com
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM
ITEM| SDLC DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | PRODUCT NAME | SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |[PRODUCT NAME|SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME |SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED
NO. | Part No. ANNUAL QTY | AND NUMBER YIN | CASEIPKG PRICE AND NUMBER YIN |CASE/PKG| PRICE AND NUMBER YIN | CASEIPKG PRICE
cW- Putty Knife, 1 4", Flex Metal Blade with Plastic
51. 77555 |Handle, TOLCO 280106, OR APPROVED 360 No Bid No Bid No Bid
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
cw Mop, Bowl, Cotton, 14” Long, 144/Box, Toolco TOOLCO A
52. " 12801 OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 700 Y Ea $2.08 ABCO 02000 12 i No Bid
77605 GNS15PKS $6.26 CS
REQUIRED
cw Traffic Cones, 36” Orange Plastic, with BOARDWALK
53. " |reflective strip, JBC #1093947, OR 240 BVWKOO160EA Y Ea $1.34 No Bid No Bid
77610 | \PPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
s4. | CW- ign, 37" 2 ABCOWGT708141| Y E $3823 | ABCO WS-0001 10 Solrgeach No Bid
. 77613 Wet Floor Sign, 37”, ABCO WS-001, OR 120 a . - $51.74 CS
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
CW- RUBBERMAID ) )
55. 77614 |Mop Bucket, Wringer Combo, Yellow, 200 WS0001 Y 10 sign/Cs $97.09 ABCO T01007 1 $37.57 | Rubbermaid 7580 N 1 $68.14
Rubbermaid 7580, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES
Loop ends, 1 1/4” Headband, 'Dupont Mildew
CW- " ABCO ABCO $2.96 each
56. Resistant, ABCO 203MCS, ONLY, NO 1600 Y Ea $103.35 12 ABCO LM203MCS N 12 $3.17
77626 |5 BSTITUTES FG758088 YEL LM-203MCS $35.63 CS
ends, 1 '1/4” Hgadband, Duf)ont Mildew
57. 7‘;‘:;'7 Resistant, ABCO 203LCS, ONLY, NO 500 No Bid M Staes 12 | %1998 | ascpLmzoacs| N 12 $4.49
SUBSTITUTES :
CW- |Dry Mop Head, 24", ABCO DM26524, OR ’ ABCO $4.14 each No Bi
58. 77628 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 150 ABCOLM-203LCS v Ea $1381 DM-26524B L $49.78 CS o Bid
CW- |Dry Mop Head, 36", ABCO DM26536, OR BOARDWALK ABCO $5.63 each No Bid
9. 77629 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 80 BWK1124 Y Ea $14.57 DM-26536B L2 $67.60 CS oH
CW- |Dry Mop Head, 48", ABCO DM26548, OR BOARDWALK ABCO $7.13 each No Bid
60 | 77630 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED o BWK1336 Y Ea $14.30 DM-265485 2| ses6108 oBi
1. CW- |Dry Mop Head, 60", ABCO DM26560, OR 30 BOARDWALK v Ea $24.83 ABCO 6 $8.68 each No Bid
77631 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED BWK1148 DM-26560B $52.10 CS
Dry Mop Frames for Clip End Handle, 24",
Ccw- BOARDWALK $2.22 EACH ABCO $1.96 each '
62. ABCO BH24524, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 48 Y Ea ¥ 12 No Bid
77632 |SaviPLE REQUIRED BWK1360 $26.69 BH-24524WF $22.53 CS
Dry Mop Frames for Clip End Handle, 36",
63. 73:‘;'3 ABCO BH24536, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 48 B%’c\?ﬂﬁ’g*{ Y Ea $4.43 BH_;“?%;WF 12 gﬁ;g*gg No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED :
Dry Mop Frames for Clip End Handle, 48”,
64. 7‘7::;'4 ABCO BH24548, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 48 B Y Ea $6.06 AW 12 ggifg‘ No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED :
Dry Mop Frames for Clip End Handle, 60”,
65. 7‘7::;'5 ABCO BH24560, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 48 R v Ea $7.36 B 6 il No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED :
CW-  |Finish System, Microfiber 18" Mop, Rubbermaid BOARDWALK No Bid )
66. 77637 |Q800, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 70 BWK1460 Y Ea $9.97 o Bi Rubbermaid Q800 N 6 $12.99
cwW- Finish System, Microfiber 18” Quick Connect RUBBERMAID $19.19 EACH
67. 77638 Frame, Rubbermaid Q560, ONLY, NO 24 COMMERCIAL Y 6/Bx $'115 13 No Bid Rubbermaid Q560 N 6 $15.69
SUBSTITUTES RCPQ800WHI .
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Agni Enterprises, LLC
d/b/a Head to Heels Safety Supplies
Attn: Subbarayan R. Pochi
7950 NW 155th Street, Suite 103
Miami Lakes, FL 33016

All Florida Paper
Attn: Mario Vale
9150 NW 105th Way
Miami, FL 33178

Imperial Dade
Attn: Vickie Scaglione
9601 NW 112th Avenue
Miami, FL 33178

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (305) 712-6653 Phone: (305) 815-5366 Phone: (305) 805-2600
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (888) 592-3667 Fax: (305) 884-8424 Fax: (305) 883-9363
~ WAREHOUSE OPER.ATIONS - Email: cservice@headtoheels.net Email: Mvale@allfloridapaper.com Email: vscaglione@jimperialdade.com
OPENING DATE: mail: : mail: : mail: miamibids @imperialdade.com
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM
ITEM| SDLC DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | PRODUCT NAME |SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME|SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME|SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED
NO. | Part No. ANNUAL QTY AND NUMBER YIN CASE/PKG PRICE AND NUMBER YN CASE/PKG PRICE AND NUMBER YN CASE/PKG PRICE
RUBBERMAID
CW-  |Finish System, Microfiber, Rubbermaid Q050, COMMERCIAL No Bid .
68. 77639 |ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 12 PROD. Y Ea $31.05 o Bi Rubbermaid Q050 N 1 $170.54
RCPQ560
RUBBERMAID
CW- Finish System, Microfiber, Bucket, Rubbermaid COMMERCIAL No Bid No Bid
89| 77641 |Q930, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 12 PROD. NTS Ea #2768 o8 o8
RCPQ050
CW- Finished System, Microfiber Rubbermaid Mop Egl‘\a/I?/IEE'TR’\g/L?_
70. Handle, 58” w/quick connect, #Q750, ONLY, 12 NTS Ea $132.28 No Bid Rubbermaid Q750| NTS 6 $8.97
77642 \NO SUBSTITUTES PROD
RCPQ930
Utility Pad Holder, Screw In with Built in Gripper RUBBER MAID
CW- . COMMERCIAL n n
71. 77643 Teeth and Swivel Head, TOLCO 280137, 100 PROD Y Ea $13.93 No Bid No Bid
ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES RCPOZEOYW
CW- TOLCO . .
72. 48 Y 10/Ct $72.81 No Bid No Bid
77644 | Utility Pad, 4 ¥ “ X 10" Black, 5/PK, Continental TOC280137
20969, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES
CW- |Cloth Head for Utility Pad Holder, 4’x10” " . "
’ i} No Bid No Bid No Bid
73| 77645 |Impact 2005, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 8 o o o
TS SO T AT T S PUTT, S OT TS TIGT O T T
74. CW-  |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 120 IMPACT 2005 v 12/Pk $17.66 each No Bid Continental 8114 N 5 $6.19
77720 |REQUIRED $211.93
CW- . .
75. 77778 Rags, Blue, Approximately 14” x 17”, 10 LB 200 Huskee® 8114WH | NTS Ea $17.92 No Bid No Bid
Box, RFT DT-HUCK, OR APPROVED EQUAL,
SAMPLE REQUIRED
Rags, Terry Cloth, Approximately 14” x 17”, RFI
DT-BAR MOP, 10LB, OR APPROVED EQUAL,
76. 73‘7’\;'9 SAMPLE REQUIRED 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid
cw Light Duty Scrubbing Sponge, 3 7/16: x 6 1/19”,
77. " |Glit 20951, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 600 No Bid No Bid No Bid
77850 | REQUIRED
CW- Spray Bottles, 1 Quart, Continental #932, OR BOARDWALK $.93 EACH No Bid No Bid
8. | 77851 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 1000 BWK16320 Y 20/ct $18.51 0B oBi
CW- [Ty S Continental #922 HL, ONLY BOARDWALK $2.08 EACH . .
79. rigger Sprayers, Continenta ) 1400 Y 3/Pk No Bid No Bid
77852 |OR APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE REQUIRED BWK03010 $6.25
CW- |Window Squeegee, 12", ABCO BH-15006, OR "
. ABCO BH-15006 Y E 4.83 ABCO BH-15006 1 1.63 CS No Bid
80 77860 |[APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 120 a $ o
CW- Floor Squeegee, Foam Rubber, Universal IMPACT
81. 77861 Handle, 18", Ungar MW450, ONLY, NO 48 PRODUCTS, Y Ea $18.20 No Bid No Bid
SUBSTITUTES LLCIMP6228
Floor Squeegee, Foam Rubber, Universal X
82. 7‘;:‘24 Handle, 30", Ungar HM750, Carlisle 40083, OR 48 Uﬁgﬁ;;‘m Y Ea $21.50 | ABCO BH-14003 1 7.27Cs ':ggggggif Y 10 $17.43
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
CW- BOARDWALK $4.25 each "
83. | .78 |Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 20" Red, Daily Wash 30 BWKA4020RED Y 5/Cs $21.05 ACS51-20 5 $10.58 No Bid
Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED
CW- " BOARDWALK $3.69 each .
84. Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 20" Blue, Shower 30 Y 5/Cs ACS 53-20 5 $10.58 No Bid
77868 |scrup Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED BWK4020BLU $18.44
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Agni Enterprises, LLC

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY . All Florida Paper Imperial Dade
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES dibla :tetra]_dst:bﬂ:falsasna;etgoiﬁrplIes Attn: Mario Vale Attn: Vickie Scaglione
2855 COLONIAL BLVD. 7950 NW 155th Sytreet .Suite 103 9150 NW 105th Way 9601 NW 112th Avenue
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966 o : Miami, FL 33178 Miami, FL 33178
Miami Lakes, FL 33016
CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (305) 712-6653 Phone: (305) 815-5366 Phone: (305) 805-2600
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (888) 592-3667 Fax: (305) 884-8424 Fax: (305) 883-9363
~ WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS ~ ) . )
. " . ! . glione@imp: .
OPENING DATE: Email: cservice@headtoheels.net Email: Mvale@allfloridapaper.com Email: vscaglione@imperialdade.com

miamibids@imperialdade.com
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM

ITEM| SDLC DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED PRODUCT NAME | SAMPLE| QTY PER DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME|SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED [PRODUCT NAME | SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED
NO. | Part No. ANNUAL QTY AND NUMBER YIN CASE/PKG PRICE AND NUMBER YN CASE/PKG PRICE AND NUMBER YN CASE/PKG PRICE
CW- . . BOARDWAL $4.30 each . .
" No Bi No Bi
85. 77873 Pad, Burnishing, 20" Hevy Hogs Hair, SAMPLE 50 BWKA020NHE Y 5/Cs $21.53 o Bid o Bid
REQUIRED
6. CW- Pumice Scouring Stick 6”, US Pumice, OR 240 U.S. PUMICE v 12/Bx $2.36 each No Bid No Bid
77874 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED UPM12 $28.3

Googles, Safety, Clear, Chemical Splash,
Impact Resistant, Anti fog, Scratch Resistant,

87. | W-  |Elastic Strap, Condor 1VT70, OR APPROVED 320 MCR SAFETY Y Ea $2.76 No Bid No Bid
77880 |EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED CRW2230R
oy | o oo Tow oz
- |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE EMPRELEVEL | RI 1115 No Bid No Bid
8. | 77890 |REQUIRED 10 EML771001 s
CW- BOARDWALK $1.91 each . .
89. | 891 |Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 12° Red, Daily Wash 60 BWKA4012RED Y 5/Ct 5957 No Bid No Bid

Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED

CW- 3M $3.77 EACH . N
. No B No B
90. | 2295 |Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 12° Blue, Shower 24 61500044708 Y 5ICt 11886 o Bid o Bid

Scrub Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Cw- BOARDWALK $2.14 EACH

91. | 47893 |Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 13" Blue, Shower 12 BWK4013BLU Y 5Ct 510,74 No Bid No Bid

Scrub Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED

cw- ., ) BOARDWALK $2.14 EACH ' !

92. | 2294 |Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 13" Red, Daily Wash 24 BWKA4013RED Y 5/Ct $10.74 No Bid No Bid

Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED

Floor Squeegee, 18", Unger MW450, OR UNGER i
93. |CW-77863 AppROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED UNGMW450 Y Ea R | R 1 4.09Cs No Bid
94. | ARO Arrival Time in Days 0 Days 15 21-30
95. BOL Percentage di t off bal of line: 0% % 32%

APPROVED EQUAL (Samples Required) Samples must meet or exceed
the specifications of the name brand listed for each line item. EACH
SAMPLE SUBMITTED SHALL BE CLEARLY MARKED WITH COMPANY
NAME, BID NUMBER, SDLC PART NUMBER AND THE MANUFACTURES
NAME WITH THEIR PART NUMBER.

Required Submittal Checklist Yes Yes Yes
Attachment A - Proposal Response Form Yes Yes Yes
Attachment B - Reference Form Yes Yes Yes
Attachment C - Insurance Requirements Form Yes Yes Yes
Attachment D - Addenda Acknowledgement Form Yes Yes Yes
Attachment E - Debarment Form Yes Yes Yes
Attachment F - Drug Free Workplace Certificate Yes Yes Yes
Attachment G - Public Entity Crimes Form Yes Yes Yes
Attachment H - Scrutinized Company Certificate Yes Yes Yes
Attachment | - Emergency/Storm Related Catastrophe Agreement Yes Yes Yes
Attachment J - Bidder's Statement of Principal Place of Business Yes Yes Yes
Attachment K - Guarantee/Warranty Yes Yes Yes
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO)

BID NO. B207396JC

~ WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS ~
OPENING DATE:
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM

Agni Enterprises, LLC
d/b/a Head to Heels Safety Supplies
Attn: Subbarayan R. Pochi
7950 NW 155th Street, Suite 103
Miami Lakes, FL 33016

All Florida Paper
Attn: Mario Vale
9150 NW 105th Way
Miami, FL 33178

Attn: Vickie Scaglione

Imperial Dade

9601 NW 112th Avenue
Miami, FL 33178

Phone: (305) 712-6653 Phone: (305) 815-5366 Phone: (305) 805-2600
Fax: (888) 592-3667 Fax: (305) 884-8424 Fax: (305) 883-9363

i ice@ i @ idapap ; vscaglione@imperialdade.com
Email: cservice@headtoheels.net Email: Mvale@allfloridapaper.com Email: vscaglione@imperialdade.com

miamibids@imperialdade.com

ITEM
NO.

Part No.

SDLC DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED
ANNUAL QTY

PRODUCT NAME
AND NUMBER

SAMPLE
YIN

QTY PER
CASE/PKG

DELIVERED
PRICE

PRODUCT NAME
AND NUMBER

SAMPLE
YN

QTY PER
CASE/PKG

DELIVERED
PRICE

PRODUCT NAME
AND NUMBER

SAMPLE
YIN

QTY PER
CASE/PKG

DELIVERED
PRICE
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Pyramid School Products
Attn: Kenneth D. Miller
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610

Sam Tell & Son, Inc.

Attn: Marc Tell/Fred Smilow

300 Smith Street

Farmingdale, NY 11735

Tranzonic d/b/a CCP Industries, Inc.

Attn: Pete Chojhacki/Laura Dalton

26301 Curtiss Wright Parkway, #200

Richmond Heights, OH 44143

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (800) 792-2644 Phone: (631) 501-9700 Phone: (216) 243-6844
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (813-621-7688 Fax: 631-501-9709 Fax: (800) 445-8366
~ WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS ~ Email: biddept ramidsp.com Email: GovernmentSales@Samtell.com Email: pchojnacki@ccpind.com:;
OPENING DATE: mail: - mail: Fsmilow@samtell.com mail: Idalton@ccpind.com
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM
PRODUCT
ITEM| SDLC ESTIMATED SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME| SAMPLE QTY PER DELIVERED SAMPLE | QTY PER
NO. | Part No. DESCRIPTION ANNUAL qTy | PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER YIN |CASE/PKG| PRICE AND NUMBER YN CASE/PKG PRICE Nrfmfs‘gf YIN | CASEIPKG DELIVERED PRICE
Vvasie Basket, Stanaard, £5 quart Biack, COUNTINEN AL 720 OB
cw- |Plastic, Rectangular, 14 %" x 10 %" x 15" high, **CONTINENTAL MINIMUM .
1. 69001 Continental #2818BLK, OR APPROVED 600 ORDER IS $4000.00, COMBINED N 12 $3.79 Impact # 7702-5 1 each $8.62 No Bid
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED CONTINENTAL
VWaste Basket, Standard, Z8 quart Beige, T
cw- |Plastic, Rectangular, 14 %" x 10 %" x 15” high, **CONTINENTAL MINIMUM )
2. | ca002 |Continental #2818BE, OR APPROVED 120 ORDER IS $4000.00, N 12 $3.79 Impact # 7702-15 1 each $8.62 No Bid
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED COMBINED CONTINENTAL
Waste Basket, Standard, 28 quart Gray, **uJN'I'INﬁ&%#'ZMY
CW- |Plastic, Rectangular, 14 %" x 10 %" x 15" high, CONTINENTAL MINIMUM No Bid
3. | 69003 |Continental 2818GY, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 Co,\cﬂ);lla\‘i% Iggrz\tg?sé),(\)ﬁ“ N 12 $3.79 Impact # 7702-3 1 each $8.62 o Bi
SAMPLE REQUIRED Teuse
cw Scouring Pad, Green, 6” x 9”, 10/Package, CONTINENTAL #23107 0.27 57 each
4| 0'0 Continental 23107, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 1000 ~FULL OASES ONLY* N B0EACS 4o tcns #75004160 60/cs $'$3 4e§5c No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED ) :
o - TMPACT #8217SMALL Nitrile, Solvent
Gloves, Nitrile, SMALL, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, M " .
5. 73:‘;'0 14" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, OR 144 ngf"fgﬂffg :SE;S N 12 PAIR $1.89 Impact # 82178 Dozen $2$2257 f)?h Tﬂe:;fn':‘ Y 144622'; 7 21 ffge;/z:
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED ol - : Weiaht 15 Mil. :
Gloves, Nitrile, MEDIUM, Non Latex 15 mil IMPACT #8217MEDIUM Nitrile, Solvent
CW- |nitrile, 14" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, *ITEM PRICED PER $2.21 each Resistent 144 Pair per $1.00 each
6 | 74651 |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 576 PAIR* *FULL CASES N 12PAIR §1.89 | Impact # 8215M Dozen $26.61 Medium v case $143.99/cs
REQALIRED ONLY** Weiaht 15 Mil.
- P— MPACT #8217LARGE Nitrile, Solvent
Gloves, Nitrile, LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil nitrile, " " .
7. 73:‘;'2 14" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell OR 576 pZEEAfFFSEEg :SE; N 12 PAIR $1.89 Impact # 82151 Dozen $2$2216 Zaf" 'ﬁ:&fﬂ‘ Y 144622'; [Pl 21 fa‘);;/fs‘
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED ol - : Weiaht 15 Mil. :
Gloves, Nitrile, X-LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil IMPACT #8217X-LARGE Nitrile, Solvent
CW- |nitrile, 14" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell *ITEM PRICED PER $2.21 each Resistent 144 Pair per $1.00 each
8 | 74653 |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 576 PAIR* “FULL CASES N 12PAIR §1.89 | Impact # 8215XL Dozen $26.61 Medium v case $143.99/cs
REALIREN ONLY** Weiaht 15 Mil.
GIOVes, NITTS, SMALL SIZé 7, Non Latex 15 mil TMPACT #8217-SMALL
CW- |nitrile, 19" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell, *ITEM PRICED PER $1.89 $9.03 No Bid
9 | 74655 |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 144 PAIR* *FULL CASES N | T2PAIR | 65168 case | MPact# 82258 Dozen $108.41 oBi
RENI IREN ONI Y**
Gloves, Nitrie, MEDIUM Size 8, Non Latex 15 IMPACT #8217-MED
CW- | mil nitrile, 19" USDA Approved, reusable. *ITEM PRICED PER $1.89 $9.03 .
) , \ , N D No Bid
10- | 74656 |Ansel, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 144 PAIR* *FULL CASES T2PAIR | 52168 case | 'mPact#8225M ozen $108.41 oBi
RENIIIREN ONLY**
Gloves, NITe, LARGE SIZe 9, NOn Latex 15 mi| TMPACT #8217-LARGE
CW- |nitrile, 19" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell *ITEM PRICED PER $1.89 $9.03 "
, \ , , No Bid
1| 74657 |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 144 PAIR* “FULL CASES N | 12PAR | 62168 case | 'MPact#8225L Dozen $108.41 o B
DENIIDEN ONIY**
Gloves, Nitrile, X LARGE Size 10, Non Latex 15 IMPAGT #8217 XL TTEM
CW- | mil nitrile, 19” USDA Approved, reusable o $1.89 $9.03 "
X ) > s * N D No Bid
12| 74658 |Ansell, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 144 P AR T2PAR | 65168 case | 'mPact#8225XL ozen $108.41
REOLIREN
13. 73:‘;9 i-nitrile, 49> 7 7 144 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ansell, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE
DEANILIPREN ITEMANATANEENEN
CW- Toilet Bowl Brush, Must Include Container, CONTINENTAL #J50600
14. 77189 Continental J50600, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 *MINIMUM ORDER N 12 $2.69 Impact # 333 each $3.55 No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED IS 72 EA**
CW- |Bag, Replacement for Janitor Cart, Continental CONTINENTAL #188YW Continental # "
J d No Bid
15- | 77190 |1884 OR APPROVED EQUAL 60 *FULL CASES ONLY** N 6 $19.98 18BN each $36.00 0 Bi
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Pyramid School Products
Attn: Kenneth D. Miller
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610

Sam Tell & Son, Inc.
Attn: Marc Tell/Fred Smilow
300 Smith Street
Farmingdale, NY 11735

Tranzonic d/b/a CCP Industries, Inc.
Attn: Pete Chojhacki/Laura Dalton
26301 Curtiss Wright Parkway, #200
Richmond Heights, OH 44143

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (800) 792-2644 Phone: (631) 501-9700 Phone: (216) 243-6844
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (813-621-7688 Fax: 631-501-9709 Fax: (800) 445-8366
~ WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS ~ Email: biddept ramidsp.com Email: GovernmentSales@Samtell.com Email: pchojnacki@ccpind.com:;
OPENING DATE: mail: - mail: Fsmilow@samtell.com mail: Idalton@ccpind.com
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM
PRODUCT
ITEM| SDLC ESTIMATED SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME| SAMPLE QTY PER DELIVERED SAMPLE | QTY PER
NO. | Part No. DESCRIPTION ANNUAL QTY PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER YIN |CASEIPKG| PRICE AND NUMBER YIN CASE/PKG PRICE Nrfmfs‘g;n YIN | CASEIPKG DELIVERED PRICE
Broom, Lobby, Polypropylene Fill, 7.5” X 2" W X
CW- 35" H, Tough Polypropylene with Flagged ABCO #BR1021MC $2.57 each
16. Bristles to Trap Fine Particles, ABCO BR-1021 360 **FULL CASES N 12 $2.39 BR-1021MC Dozen $3O izc No Bid
77200 MC-orRubb id 6374, OR APPROVED ONLY** :
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
CW- Broom, Push Fine Sweep/Medium Sweep, 24", BETTER BRUSH # Carlisle #
17. | ,7ope |Anchor Style Block, Carlisle 41871, ONLY, NO 48 100124 **FULL NTS 12 $8.99 58100 NTS each $18.19 No Bid
SUBSTITUTES CASES ONLY**
CW- Broom, Push, Fine Sweep/Medium Sweep, BETTER BRUSH # Carlilse #
18. | 47507 |36" Anchor Style block, Cariisle 41872, ONLY, 48 100136 “FULL NTS 12 $14.98 42315233 NTS each $34.48 No Bid
NO SUBSTITUTES CASES ONLY**
Broom, Slant, Standard Size, Angled Bristles,
CW- |48" Wood Handle Flagged Poly Bristle Tips, g $4.19 each No Bid
19. 77200 |Commercial Quality, ABCO, BR-10054, OR 480 ABCO #BR10054 N 12 $4.89 BR-10054 Dozen $50.36 o Bi
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
Broom, Straight Corn 56”, Wood Handle, X
20. 7‘;‘2":'0 Carlisle 4135467, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 BETTER BRsH# N 12 $5.99 Gartsie # each $21.78 No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED
Cw. | Broom, Synthetic Com Broom 577, Wood CARLISLE #41679
21. 77211 |Handle, Carlisle 41679, ONLY, NO 500 **MINIMUM ORDER IS N 12 $7.92 Carlisle #4167903 each $16.78 No Bid
SURSTITUTES 264 EA™
CW- Counter Brush, Pre Line, Self Flagging Bristles, ABCO #00100 $2.07 each
22. 77235 ABCO #00100, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 48 **MINIMUM ORDER N 12 $1.99 Abco #00100 Dozen '$2459"‘° No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED IS 48** .
- ) BETTER BRUSH )
CW-  |Brush, Tile Foam, Carlisle 40423, OR Carlisle # :
, \ ] o ! ) No Bid
B | 77236 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 8 o N 12 $598 4042303 each $12.18 o B
CW- Brush, Iron Handle, Scrub, Carlisle 36289, ABCO #00027 $1.03 h
24. | ooony |ABCO 00027, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 *MINIMUM ORDER N 12 $1.25 Abco #00027 Dozen & o No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED 1S 120** -
- BETTER BRUSH # "
CW-  |Brush, Small Grout, Carlisle 365351, OR Carlisle # :
g ’ : | No Bid
25 | 77238 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 240 S o N 12 $0.99 36535103 each $1.48 o Bi
: f UNGER #PIPEO
CW-  |Brush, Pipe, 117, Curved Screw on, Unger . g No Bid
26. 77230 |Pipeo. ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 12 s L?Aiﬁl.giﬁn - N 10 $15.99 FMP # 142-1472 each $33.76 o Bi
Can, Garbage, 20 Gallon, Plastic, Blue Without :ggiiﬁgmg
CW- |lid, Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental " Carlisle # No Bid
27- | 77300 [#2000-1 Huskee, Blue, OR APPROVED &0 A ORDER 166380000 N g S1335 | 341020REC1A each §96.64 o B
EQUAL COMBINED RUBBERMAID
Can, Garbage, 32 Gallon, Plastic, Blue Without RUBBERMAID
08 | CW- [id, Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental 5 ‘*RUBEZ?QZJifSﬁEIMUM N . $16.19 Carlisle # woch 54962 No Bid
) 77303 |#32001BL Huskee, Blue, OR APPROVED . 341032REC14 :
ORDER IS $3800.00,
EQUAL COMAINGRRHRRERMAR
CW- Can, Garbage, 44 Gallon, Plastic, Gray Without *RUBBERMAID MINIMUM Carlisle #
29. | 7204 |lidh Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental 48 ORDER IS $3800.00, N 4 $23.75 21104495 each $56.02 No Bid
4444GY HUSKEE OR APPROVED EQUAL COMBINED RUBBERMAID
————ii—
Can, Garbage, 32 Gallon, Plastic, Gray Without RUBBERMAID #FG2632GY
CW- |lid, Minimum 10% Recycled Plastic, Continental **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM Carlisle # No Bid
30- | 77305 |#3200GY Huskee, Gray, OR APPROVED 180 ORDER IS $3800.00, N 6 $16.19 34103223 each $35.9 o B
EOLIAL CONBINED RUBBERMAID
CW- Dolly for Garbage Cans to fit round 20 - 55 CONTINENTAL #3255 *FITS ALL Carlisle #
31. | ;7490 |gallon cans, Rubbermaid 2640, Continental 120 RUBBERMAID CANS* *MINIMUM N 4 $18.89 32;'15133 each $54.16 No Bid
3255, OR APPROVED EQUAL ORDER IS 48 EA**
- - CONTINENTAL #1845L -
CW- |Janitor Cart, Continental184BL, OR Continental # !
, ) - . No Bid
32. | 77322 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 8 MINIMUM ORDER 1S N L S 184BK each $213.49 o
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Pyramid School Products
Attn: Kenneth D. Miller
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610

Sam Tell & Son, Inc.
Attn: Marc Tell/Fred Smilow
300 Smith Street
Farmingdale, NY 11735

Tranzonic d/b/a CCP Industries, Inc.
Attn: Pete Chojhacki/Laura Dalton
26301 Curtiss Wright Parkway, #200
Richmond Heights, OH 44143

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (800) 792-2644 Phone: (631) 501-9700 Phone: (216) 243-6844
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (813-621-7688 Fax: 631-501-9709 Fax: (800) 445-8366
~ WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS ~ Email: biddept ramidsp.com Email: GovernmentSales@Samtell.com Email: pchojnacki@ccpind.com;
OPENING DATE: mail: - mail: Fsmilow@samtell.com mail: Idalton@ccpind.com
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM
PRODUCT
ITEM| SDLC ESTIMATED SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME| SAMPLE QTY PER DELIVERED SAMPLE | QTY PER
NO. | Part No. DESCRIPTION ANNUAL QTY PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER YIN CASE/PKG PRICE AND NUMBER YN CASE/PKG PRICE N'?‘T;BAE’;D YN CASE/PKG DELIVERED PRICE
cwW- Duster, Telescopic Handle, Lambs Wools LAMBSKIN SPEC # Carlisle #
33. 741 Extension 58 with flexible head, SAMPLE 120 360SFLEX **MINIMUM Y 36 $5.98 363312500 each $10.39 No Bid
0 REQUIRED ORDER @ 108 EA*™*
MDI #78404 *50/BAG Fremmum $29 per case with
CW- | reated DUSt Cloth, 127X 177, Chic 0413, 40 10 BAGS/CS Treated 60 case minimum.
34. 77412 |per bag, 10 bags per case CHIC 0413 OR 600 “MINIMUM ORDER IS Y 10/50 $46.98 Chicopee # 8483 300/cs $66.95 Strgltctr:‘Dust Y  ]/bg 10bg/ca: g;:znxi:;ti%%?
ek oths -
APPROVED EQUAL 104 CASES 160007 's or $49 per case
CW- Dust Pan, Lobby, 36" Handle, Plastic only, CONTINENTAL #912 Carlisle #
35. | 47445 |Continental 912, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 360 *MINIMUM ORDER IS N 12 $6.09 36?‘1':;03 each $10.56 No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED 288 EA*
CW- Dust Pan, Counter Duster, Heavy Duty, RUBBERMAID #FG2005
36. 77416 Rubber, Continental 712, OR APPROVED 120 **MINIMUM ORDER IS N 24 $1.79 Impact #700 each $3.10 No Bid
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 120"
CW- Handle, Wet Mop Invader, Fiberglass handle, ABCO #01206NB Abco #
37. 77500 Quick Change, ABCO 01206NB, OR 240 *MINIMUM ORDER IS N 12 $6.59 01206f?-NB 6/cs $76.68 No Bid
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 240"
. ABCO #01203NB
CW- |Handle, Wing Nut Style, ABCO 1203-NB, OR . Abco # $8.11 each No Bid
38- | 77501 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 120 MINIMU ORDER 1S N 12 $4.69 01203-NB les $48.7 o B
. N ABCO #01104
CW- |Handle for Push Broom, Screw in Metal Tip $3.84 EACH .
A ¢ ’ * N 2.2 D No Bid
39| 77505 |ABCO 01104, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 120 MINIMUN DRDER 1S 12 $2.23 Abco#01104 ozen $46.06 =
ABLU #UTTTS
CW- Handle for Push Broom, 60”, Wood Anchor **MINIMUM ORDER IS Carlilse #
40. | ogon |Drilled, 60 60" (CARLISLE N 12 $2.89 422'6330 each $7.32 No Bid
Carlisle #45270, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES #45270 IS
DISCONTINIIED)
CW- Handle for Floor Squeegees, Metal, UNGER #AL140
4. 77509 Unger AL140, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 60 *MINIMUM ORDER IS N 10 $16.99 Unger AL140 each $28.64 No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED 60**
. s . UNGER #ED900
CW- |Extension Pole, 30’ Ungar Opti-Loc Tele Pole, .
. ** N . h 121. No Bid
42 77512 |Ung-Ed900, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 10 MINIMZ%h/églfDER 1S 10 $99.98 Unger ED900 eac $121.38 o Bi
. ABCO #01406NB
CW- |Handle for Dry Mop, Clip On, Wood, ABCO . $7.59 EACH No Bid
43. 77514 |0146-NB, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 120 MINIMle;/IOSiRDER IS N 12 $4.59 Abco #0146-NB Dozen $91.04 0 Bi
cW- High Duster Handle, Pipe Duster 54” Wooden Continental #
44, 77520 Handle with Curved Metal Frame, Wilen E317, 60 No Bid E317000 NTS each $6.19 No Bid
ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES
High Duster Replacement Head, Cotton Mop
CW- head Designed to Fit Pipe Duster Handle and Continental #
45. 77521 Frame, Heavy Weight Materials Can Be 120 No Bid 021':5803 each $3.76 No Bid
Washed for Extended Usage, Wilen E11700,
ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES
cw. |Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic White, for 20 R
46. Gallon Garbage Can, 6/Case, Continental #200- 24 - N 6 $5.99 No Bid No Bid
77550 MINIMUM ORDER IS
WH, OR APPROVED EQUAL 4
o c CONTINENTAL
CW- |Lid Only, Recycle Can, Plastic White with hole #3201-1 Continental # .
47| 77551 |in center, fits 32 gallon can. Continental 3201-1 48 *MINIMUM ORDER IS N 6 9738 3201-1 each $20.18 No Bid
OR APPROVED EQUAL 48*
) - o RUBBERMAID
cw- |Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic, White, fits 32 #FG263100WHT **MINIMUM ORDER Carlisle # !
48. | ,ocs, |Gallon Continental Round Garbage Can, 12 s N 6 $6.49 34103302 each $14.00 No Bid
Continental 3201, OR APPROVED EQUAL 12%*
CW- Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic, Gray, fits 32 RUBBERMAID Carlisle #
49. 77553 Gallon Continental Round Garbage Can, 60 #FG2631GY **MINIMUM N 6 $6.49 34103323 each $13.92 No Bid
Continental 3201, OR APPROVED EQUAL ORDER IS 60**
cw Lid Only, Garbage Can, Plastic gray, for 44 ;ngeizgogg Carlisle #
50. | - 4 Gallon Garbage Can, 6/Case, Continental # 24 T OE RS N 4 $8.99 34zi1r(;25eza each $23.76 No Bid
554 14445, OR APPROVED EQUAL e
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Pyramid School Products
Attn: Kenneth D. Miller
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610

Sam Tell & Son, Inc.
Attn: Marc Tell/Fred Smilow
300 Smith Street
Farmingdale, NY 11735

Tranzonic d/b/a CCP Industries, Inc.
Attn: Pete Chojhacki/Laura Dalton
26301 Curtiss Wright Parkway, #200
Richmond Heights, OH 44143

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (800) 792-2644 Phone: (631) 501-9700 Phone: (216) 243-6844
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (813-621-7688 Fax: 631-501-9709 Fax: (800) 445-8366
~ WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS ~ Email: biddept ramidsp.com Email: GovernmentSales@Samtell.com Email: pchojnacki@ccpind.com;
THURSDAY F:EE':JI:RGY[:‘:TEON @ 2:00 PM mail: - mail: Fsmilow@samtell.com mail: Idalton@ccpind.com
PRODUCT
ITEM| SDLC ESTIMATED SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME| SAMPLE | QTYPER DELIVERED SAMPLE | QTY PER
NO. | Part No. DESCRIPTION ANNUAL qTy | PRODUCTNAMEANDNUMBER | ™"y)\""| cASE/PKG| PRICE | AND NUMBER YIN CASEIPKG PRICE Nrfmfs‘;'f YIN | CASEIPKG DELIVERED PRICE
cw. |PuttyKnife, 1 %, Flex Metal Blade with Plastic TOLCO #280106
51. | ,7ceg |Handle, TOLCO 280106, OR APPROVED 360 ~MINIMUM ORDER IS N 24 $1.29 Tolco # 280106 24/pack $69.65 No Bid
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 144 EA**
cW- Mop, Bowl, Cotton, 14” Long, 144/Box, Toolco TOLCO #280100 Carlisle #
52. 2801 OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 700 *ACRYLIC* **MINIMUM N 144 $0.62 ep3808 each $1.26 No Bid
77605 | REQUIRED ORDER IS 144 EA™
cW- Traffic Cones, 36” Orange Plastic, with JBC #1093947 200/PALLE
53. 7761 reflective strip, JBC #1093947, OR 240 **MINIMUM ORDER IS N T $22.79 S-14710-0 each $31.25 No Bid
610 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 200 EA*
ABCOO #WS0001 24
54. 7‘7:‘::'3 Wet Floor Sign, 37", ABCO WS-001, OR 120 Ig%?gog"'()“(‘)"‘"c%’:'ﬂgm%iR N 10 $569 | Abco #WS-0001 10/cs $6$1351 cach No Bid
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED ABCO [TENS™
RUBBERMAID #FG7580
CW- *RUBBERMAID MINIMUM Rubbermaid # '
55. | 77614 |Mop Bucket, Wringer Combo, Yellow, 200 ORDER IS $3800.00, COMBINED N ! $63.49 FG758088YEL each $100413 No Bid
Rubbermaid 7580, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES RUBBERMAID [TEMS**
Loop ends, 1 1/4” Headband, Dupont Mildew ABCO #LM203MCS "ABCO
CW- P MINIMUM ORDER IS '
56. Resistant, ABCO 203MCS, ONLY, NO 1600 N 12 $2.98 Abco #203MCS Dozen $42.31 No Bid
77626 |SUBSTITUTES $1300.00, COMBINED
cw. ends, 1 4 Hgadband, Duf)ont Mildew **AB/.(\:Ez)EMEINLI:\\AAa?\/IEIbCR’SDER Aboo #
. i No Bi
L0 ggzss‘irébﬁ?zgo 203LCS, ONLY, NO 500 1S $1300.00, COMBINED N 12 $4.14 st Dozen $59.71 o Bid
Aﬁf%sﬁzhﬁﬁco
CW-  |Dry Mop Head, 24”, ABCO DM26524, OR MINIMUM ORDER IS Abco # DM- $4.93 each No Bid
%8 | 77628 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 150 $1300.00, COMBINED N 12 $4.13 265248 Dozen $50.13 oBi
o
T e
CW-  [Dry Mop Head, 36", ABCO DM26536, OR MINIMUM ORDER IS Abco # DM- $6.69 each No Bid
99| 77620 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 8 $1300.00, COMBINED N 12 $5.69 265368 Dozen $80.28 o8
ABCO ITEMS**
ABCO #DM26548 “*ABCO
CW-  [Dry Mop Head, 48", ABCO DM26548, OR MINIMUM ORDER IS Abco # DM- $8.47 each No Bid
60 | 77630 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED o $1300.00, COMBINED N 12 $7.12 265488 Dozen $101.66 o B
ABCO ITEMS**
ABCO ACMZ6560 ~ABCO
1 CW-  |Dry Mop Head, 60", ABCO DM26560, OR % MINIMUM ORDER IS N 12 $8.67 Abco # olcs $6.19 EACH No Bid
| 77631 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED $1300.00, COMBINED i DM26560 $61.88
ARCO |TE] *x
cw. |Pry Mop Frames for Clip End Handle, 24", ABI\/ICIf\I)I:/IBUHI\i“O‘Sg‘I‘DEQ?SC ° Abco # $2.23 each
62 | 77632 gihCAgLiHééstSiF?E%APPROVED EQUAL, 48 $1300.00, COMBINED N 12 $1.91 BH24524WF Dozen $26.76 No Bid
CW- Dry Mop Frames for Clip End Handle, 36", AﬁNLI’I:IMéUME OEREEDEQ?;U $2.86 h
63. | 17633 |ABCO BH24536, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 48 $1300.00. COMBINED N 12 $2.40 Abco # BH24536 Dozen $34532° No Bid
SAMPLE REQUIRED ol e
cw- |PryMop Frames for Clip End Handle, 48", ABIVICIf\l)I:/IBUHI\i“OS“RIB;)ES?SC ° Abco # $3.90 EACH
64. °  |ABCO BH24548, OR APPROVED EQUAL 48 N 12 $3.32 Dozen - No Bid
77634 : ' $1300.00, COMBINED BH24548WF $46.8
SAMPLE REQUIRED TEMS™
- . ABCO # BI24560 " ABCO
65 | SW- |20 brioasen, OR APPROVED EGUAL w MINIMUM ORDER IS Nl ow $4.99 Avco bes | SBSBEACH No Bid
" | 77635 |AMPLE REQUIRED ' $1300.00, COMBINED : BH24560WF $35.30
DA
- - . ) *RUBBERMAID MINIMUM )
CW-  |Finish System, Microfiber 18" Mop, Rubbermaid Rubbermaid # ;
66. . , 70 ORDER IS $3800.00, N 6 $12.19 each $15.88 No Bid
77637 |Q800, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES COMBINED RUBBERMAID FGQBO00OWHO0
KUDDEKMJ #FWO0U
CW- Finish System, Microfiber 18” Quick Connect *RUBBERMAID MINIMUM Rubbermaid #
67. 77638 Frame, Rubbermaid Q560, ONLY, NO 24 ORDER IS $3800.00, N 6 $14.52 FGQ56000YLOD each $25.87 No Bid
SUBSTITUTES COMBINED
BlooCouan Tocs
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Pyramid School Products
Attn: Kenneth D. Miller
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610

Sam Tell & Son, Inc.
Attn: Marc Tell/Fred Smilow
300 Smith Street
Farmingdale, NY 11735

Tranzonic d/b/a CCP Industries, Inc.
Attn: Pete Chojhacki/Laura Dalton
26301 Curtiss Wright Parkway, #200
Richmond Heights, OH 44143

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (800) 792-2644 Phone: (631) 501-9700 Phone: (216) 243-6844
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (813-621-7688 Fax: 631-501-9709 Fax: (800) 445-8366
~ WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS ~ Email: biddept ramidsp.com Email: GovernmentSales@Samtell.com Email: pchojnacki@ccpind.com;
OPENING DATE: mail: - mail: Fsmilow@samtell.com mail: Idalton@ccpind.com
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM
PRODUCT
ITEM| SDLC ESTIMATED SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED [PRODUCT NAME| SAMPLE QTY PER DELIVERED SAMPLE | QTY PER
NO. | Part No. DESCRIPTION ANNUAL qTy | PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER YIN |CASE/PKG| PRICE AND NUMBER YIN CASE/PKG PRICE Nm"nfs‘;'f YIN | CASEIPKG DELIVERED PRICE
TN T———Tr—v=y=ry
RUBBERMAID #Q050
CW-  |Finish System, Microfiber, Rubbermaid Q050, **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM $26.74 each | Rubbermaid # No Bid
68 | 77639 |ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 12 ORDER IS $3800.00, N 6 $16045 | FGQ050000000 each $352.23 05!
v e
CW-  |Finish System, Microfiber, Bucket, Rubbermaid **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM Rubbermaid # :
’ : ’ No Bid
69 | 77641 |Q930, ONLY. NO SUBSTITUTES 12 ORDER IS $3800.00, NTS ! $8475 | FGQ93000BLUE NTS each $17244 o B!
COMBINED RUBBERMAID
RUBBERMAID #Q750
cwW- Finished System, Microfiber Rubbermaid Mop **RUBBERMAID MINIMUM Rubb id #
70. | tesp |Handle, 58" wiquick connect, #Q750, ONLY, 12 ORDER IS $3800.00, NTS 6 $8.29 E G‘&ggg“;'(wo NTS each $11.60 No Bid
NO SUBSTITUTES COMBINED
RIIRRERMAIN ITEMS**
cwW. Utility Pad Holder, Screw In with Built in Gripper TOLCO #280157 $9.18 each
LA 4‘ Teeth and Swivel Head, TOLCO 280137, 100 **MINIMUM ORDER IS N 50 $4.59 Tolco # 280137 10/pack 491 esgc No Bid
643 | ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 100* :
CONTINENTAL #20969
cwW- *ITEM PRICED PER 06
72. N ) 48 EACH...COST WOULD BE N 20 - No Bid No Bid
77644 | Utility Pad, 4 ¥ “ X 10" Black, 5/PK, Continental $3.45 PER PACK OF 5% $3.45 pack
20969, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES *MINIMUM ORDER IS
CW- [Cloth Head for Utility Pad Holder, 4’x10” IMPACT #2005 **MINIMUM ORDER IS ! !
; : I No Bid No Bid
73| 77645 |impact 2005, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 8 24 EA N B REEE o B oBi
T SO T e WIS Ut SOMTTeTar O T, RUEEERVEABEGPETE :
CW-  |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE o Rubbermaid # No Bid
74| 12100 REQUIRED 120 MINIMUNIIEgISDER IS 60 N 12 $5.89 FG261400GRAY each $27.02 o Bi
HOSPECO #540-10 *ITEM Reclaimed $1 9.5:)1: ;\itit:arz iensimum
Cw- ) . . PRICED PER 10# BOX* Blue Huck # Huck Towels 10lbs per ) ’
8- | 77778 |Rags, Blue, Approximately 14” x 17", 10 LB 200 *MINIMUM ORDER IS 50 N { HERES BO7BFXQ8MB 70/es $61.25 141552325 T case otherwise $22.98
Box, RFT DT-HUCK, OR APPROVED EQUAL, BOXES** 70400-10 when s_old_ in 2'sor
SAMPLE REQUIRED 37.99 individually
Rags, Terry Cloth, Approximately 14” x 17”, RFI a7 $18.99 with
DT-BAR MOP, 10LB, OR APPROVED EQUAL, HOSPECO #534-10 *ITEM Eco:omy Minimum order of
CW- |SAMPLE REQUIRED PRICED PER 10# BOX* 10lbs per 56 cases, otherwise,
76. 77779 600 “MINIMUM ORDER IS 100 N 1 $24.98 Sam Tell # 133x Dozen $2.88 Birol:/kl)ops Y case $29.98 per case
BOXES** 536-60-55dsz when sold by 2’s or
$35.99 individually
cw Light Duty Scrubbing Sponge, 3 7/16: x 6 1/19”, HYDRA #70CHDW $2.21 each
LA [ " |Glit 20951, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 600 **MINIMUM ORDER IS N 40 $0.68 3m #427402096 20/cs 4 4933; No Bid
850 |REQUIRED 400 EA™ :
CW-  |Spray Bottles, 1 Quart, Continental #932, OR Conitnental # No Bid
78. | .7e51 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 1000 IMPACT #5032WG N 96 $0.55 93200 each $1.06 0 Bi
Cw- i i JMEACIp002 Continental #
79. Trigger Sprayers, Continental #922 HL, ONLY 1400 “MINIMUM ORDER IS N 250 $0.65 each $0.90 No Bid
77852 |OR APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE REQUIRED 1000 EA™ 902Wws9
- ABCO #BH15006
CW- |Window Squeegee, 12", ABCO BH-15006, OR Abco # ;
X 4 ; * N 2.29 h 1.94 No Bid
80 | 77860 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 120 MINIMUM ORDER IS 12 § BH-15006 ead $
Floor Squeegee, Foam Rubber, Universal - .
81. 73‘3’: 1 |Handie, 18", Ungar MW450, ONLY, NO 48 EELER B%’:;Effgig, RATIMERT (R 12 $4.99 ;éj‘;';;';go each $23.78 No Bid
SUBSTITUTES
CW- Floor Squeegee, Foam Rubber, Universal UNGER #HM750 Carlisle #
82. | ooy |Handle, 30", Ungar HM750, Carlisle 40083, OR 48 **MINIMUM ORDER IS N 10 $18.59 008300 each $31.44 No Bid
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 20 EA**
PER EACH...COST WOULD .
W- . .
8. | C Pad for Floor Scrubbers. 20" Red. Daily Wash 30 BE $12.15/CASE OF 5* N 5 $2.43 Prime Source # 5/cs $3.31 each No Bid
77866 , » bally " 75004453 $16.56
Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED MINIMUM ORDER 1S
ACS #53-2’6 EM PRICED
8a. | CW- |pad for Floor Scrubbers, 20" Blue, Shower 30 P e ocns o N 5 s243 | Prime Source Sfes S oo No Bid
77868 | Scrub Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED e 12 e -
AUNIMUNM ORDERIS,
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Pyramid School Products
Attn: Kenneth D. Miller
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610

Sam Tell & Son, Inc.
Attn: Marc Tell/Fred Smilow
300 Smith Street
Farmingdale, NY 11735

Tranzonic d/b/a CCP Industries, Inc.
Attn: Pete Chojhacki/Laura Dalton
26301 Curtiss Wright Parkway, #200
Richmond Heights, OH 44143

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (800) 792-2644 Phone: (631) 501-9700 Phone: (216) 243-6844
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (813-621-7688 Fax: 631-501-9709 Fax: (800) 445-8366
~ WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS - Email: biddept ramidsp.com Email: GovernmentSales@Samtell.com Email: pchojnacki@ccpind.com:;
OPENING DATE: mail: - mail: Fsmilow@samtell.com mail: Idalton@ccpind.com
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM
PRODUCT
ITEM| SDLC ESTIMATED SAMPLE| QTY PER | DELIVERED |PRODUCT NAME| SAMPLE QTY PER DELIVERED SAMPLE | QTY PER
NO. | Part No. DESCRIPTION ANNUAL QTY PRODUCT NAME AND NUMBER YIN | CASE/PKG PRICE AND NUMBER YIN CASE/PKG PRICE N,?‘T;BAE";D YIN | CASEIPKG DELIVERED PRICE
ACS #35-20 *ITEM PRICED
Cw- o " . PER EACH...COST WOULD Prime Source # $3.31 each .
85. 77873 |Pad, Bumishing, 20" Hevy Hogs Hair, SAMPLE 50 BE $12.15/CASE OF 5% N 5 $2.43 75004475 Slcs $16.56 No Bid
REQUIRED “*MINIMUM ORDER IS 50**
CW- Pumice Scouring Stick 6”, US Pumice, OR US PUMICE #UPM12 **MINIMUM Pumie # No Bid
86. | 77874 |APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 240 ORDER IS 240** N B b2 BO18UR7LPG 2pack $11.18 o b
Googles, Safety, Clear, Chemical Splash,
Impact Resistant, Anti fog, Scratch Resistant, ”
87. | CW- |Elastic Strap, Condor 1VT70, OR APPROVED 320 IMPACT #7320 “MINIMUM ORDERIS| 12 $2.28 FMP # each $5.23 No Bid
77880 |EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED aHIER 142-1100
TaPS, CauUTOTT, TeTOW U A TUUU S TVIRG T TOZ0;
CW- |OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE CORDOVA #T15101 **MINIMUM ' !
88. 77890 |REQUIRED 100 ORIBIEE S 0 FEILLE N 12 $5.28 Impact # 7328 1000'roll $13.71 No Bid
ACS #51-12 *ITEM PRICED
CW- PER EACH...COST WOULD $1.40 each . .
89. | ;7891 |Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 12" Red, Daily Wash 60 BE $7.00/CASE OF 5* N 5 $7.00 case No Bid No Bid
Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED **MINIMUM ORDER IS 60**
ACS #0012 TTEM FRICED
CW- PER EACH...COST WOULD $1.40 each
90. | 2295 |Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 12° Blue, Shower 24 BE $7.00/CASE OF 5* N 5 $7.00 case | FMP #159-1058 each $153 No Bid
Scrub Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED *"MINIMUM ORDER IS :
ACS FOoT o 1T LV FRICED
PER EACH...COST WOULD )
Cw- 1.47 each | Prime S # 1.77 each '
91. | ;7593 |Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 13" Blue, Shower 12 BE $7.35/CASE OF 5* N 5 27.35 sach | Prime Source Blcs $ i e No Bid
Scrub Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED ENRITE CIREER 1
ACS #51-13 *ITEM PRICED
CW- ., i PER EACH...COST WOULD $1.47 each No Bi No Bi
92. | 2294 |Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 13" Red, Daily Wash 24 BE $7.35/CASE OF 5+ N 5 $7.35 case o Bid o Bid
Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED ~MINIMUM ORDER IS
Floor Squeegee, 18", Unger MW450, OR ’
93. |CW-77863( \ppROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED UNGER #MW450 N 10 $7.98 FMP 142-1415 each $15.36 No Bid
94. | ARO Arrival Time in Days 10-14 AR.O. 30 days 4-5 business days
15% (CONTACT KENNY MILLER FOR QUOTES AT (800) 792-
95. BOL Percentage di t off bal of line: 2644 EXT 225 OR BY E-MAIL AT % %
BIDDEPT@PYRAMIDSP.COM)
APPROVED EQUAL (Samples Required) Samples must meet or exceed
the specifications of the name brand listed for each line item. EACH
SAMPLE SUBMITTED SHALL BE CLEARLY MARKED WITH COMPANY
NAME, BID NUMBER, SDLC PART NUMBER AND THE MANUFACTURES
NAME WITH THEIR PART NUMBER.
Required Submittal Checklist Yes Yes Yes
Attachment A - Proposal Response Form Yes Yes Yes
Attachment B - Reference Form Yes Yes Yes
Attachment C - Insurance Requirements Form Yes Yes Yes
Attachment D - Addenda Acknowledgement Form Yes Yes Yes
Attachment E - Debarment Form Yes Yes Yes
Attachment F - Drug Free Workplace Certificate Yes Yes Yes
Attachment G - Public Entity Crimes Form Yes Yes Yes
Attachment H - Scrutinized Company Certificate Yes Yes Yes
Attachment | - Emergency/Storm Related Catastrophe Agreement Yes Yes Yes
Attachment J - Bidder's Statement of Principal Place of Business Yes Yes Yes
Attachment K - Guarantee/Warranty Yes Yes Yes
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY Pyramid School Products Sam Tell & Son, Inc. Tranzonic d/b/a CCP Industries, Inc.

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES Attn: Kenneth D. Miller Attn: Marc Tell/Fred Smilow Attn: Pete Chojhacki/Laura Dalton
2855 COLONIAL BLVD. 6510 North 54th Street 300 Smith Street 26301 Curtiss Wright Parkway, #200
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966 Tampa, FL 33610 Farmingdale, NY 11735 Richmond Heights, OH 44143
CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE (DWO) Phone: (800) 792-2644 Phone: (631) 501-9700 Phone: (216) 243-6844
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (813-621-7688 Fax: 631-501-9709 Fax: (800) 445-8366

~ WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS ~ . biddept ramidsp.com . GovernmentSales@Samtell.com - pchojnacki@ccpind.com;
OPENING DATE: Email: - Email: Fsmilow@samtell.com Email: Idalton@ccpind.com
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM

nnnnnnnnnnnnn ) T 28 Vendor(s) Were Notified of Bid = PRIMARY VENDOR
6 Vendor(s) Submitted Bids : = SECONDARY VENDOR
0 Vendor(s) Returned a No Bid
22 Vendor(s) Did Not Respond * Florida State Preference *k Minimum Order Required

IT IS RECOMMENDED THIS BID BE AWARDED TO AGNI ENTERPRISES, LLC d/b/a HEAD TO HEALS SAFETY SUPPLIES, ALL FLORIDA PAPER, IMPERIAL DADE, PYRAMID SCHOOL
PRODUCTS< SAM TELL & SON, INC. and TRANZONIC d/b/a CCP INDUSTRIES, INC. HAVING SUBMITTED THE LOWEST OVERALL AND BEST RESPONSE MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.

%?Q %
APPROVED BY: - DATE:  July 14, 2021

Lorie Nein
PROCUREMENT AGENT

BID TABULATION ONLY. THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.
ATTN: SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL. BID NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER & DESCRIPTION MUST BE ENTERED ON REQUISITION(S).
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