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1. CW-85302
Bandage, Assorted sizes, 80 – 100 box minimum, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 
100% LATEX FREE

600  DER 997481 Y 7500/cs $819.60       
$1.366/BX

1271272 Dukal 
#1250033

N 24
NTS

$1.03 32033 SH No 80/BX $2.25
ASO Intergra 
Band-Aids 
#1260033

80/box $1.99/bx

2. CW-85304
Bandage, 1” X 3”, Plastic Strip, 100 per box, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% 
LATEX FREE

1800  ASO CBD2019 Y 100/bx, 12 
bx/cs

$2937.60       
$1.632/Bx 1126142 h.s.i N 54

NTS $1.10 32000 SH Yes 100/BX $1.94

3. CW-85305
Bandage, 1" X 3", Flexible Fabric, 100/Box, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% 
LATEX FREE

1200  NUT 1114025 Y 1500/cs $2959.44       
$2.467/bx

Adhesive 
Bandages/#3
45-420-886-

0001

1,000 (10 BX 
of 100)

$39.45
$3.945/BX

1126133 h.s.i. N 54
 NTS

$1.55 32006 SH No 100/BX $2.68

4. CW-85306
Bandage, Extra Large, Flexible Fabric, 2" X 4".  
50/Box, SAMPLE REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS 
MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

480  DER 1565033 Y 10/bx, 12 bx/cs $9205.20         
$19.178

2610116 ASO 
CBD4016

N 12
NTS

$2.97 32120 SH Yes 50/BX $6.22

5. CW-85307
Bandage, Adhesive, Flexible Knuckle, 1 1/2" X 3, 
100/Bx.  SAMPLE REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS 
MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

480  HAR 46140000 Y 100/bx, 24 
bx/cs

$2536.32         
$5.284 1126144 h.s.i. N

36
NTS $2.19 32230 SH No 100/BX $3.41

6. CW-85310
Tape, Athletic, 1 1/2" X 15 YDS, 32/CASE, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% 
LATEX FREE

480  CRA 280750 Y  32/cs $25503.12       
$53.14/CS

 1285850 
Good'N'Cheap 

GNC01 
N 1

NTS
$40.65 28199 SH Yes 32/CS $40.83

7. CW-85313
Gauze Pads, Sterile, 3" X 3", 12-ply, 100/BX, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% 
LATEX FREE

480  DUK 1312-36B Y 1/pk, 3600 pk/cs $1837.52      
$3.829 1003963 h.s.i. N 24

NTS
$4.49 27543 SH No 100/BX $3.14

8. CW-85314
Gauze Sponges, Non Sterile, 3" X 3", 8 Ply, 200/Bag, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 
100% LATEX FREE

480  KEN 441214 Y 200/Bg, 20bg/C $833.328           
$1.737 1006458 h.s.i. N 20

NTS
$2.45 27537 SH No 200/BG $1.40

9. CW-85315
Gauze, Rolled, Non Sterile, 2" X 3.5 Yds, 6/Bag, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 
100% LATEX FREE

480  DUK 402 Y  12 rl/bg, 8 bg/cs $711.72
$1.483

1209183 Dukal 
402 12/bag

N 8               NTS $2.28 27545 SH Yes 12/BG $3.13

10. CW-85316
Gauze, Rolled, Non Sterile, 6" X 4.5 Yds, 12/Bag, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 
100% LATEX FREE

480 KEN 441121 Y  48/cs $3671.28       
$7.65

1202833 Dukal 
406 6/bag

N 8                  
NTS

$3.97 27546 SH
 6"X 4.1" YDS

No 12/BG $4.92

11. CW-85570
Cotton Balls, 2000 per pkg, Abco 053028, OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 
100% LATEX FREE

100  DUK 801 Y  2000/bg, 2 bg/c $931.20
$9.312

1024857 Tidi 
969153

N 2 $11.23 30020 
DYNAREX

No 2000/BG $9.61

12. CW-85571

Probe Cover, Ear Thermometer, 200 box, 
thermoscan PC800,  OR APPROVED EQUAL, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 
100% LATEX FREE

400 KEN 303030 Y  96/ctn, 22 
ctn/cs

$5399.67                
$13.50

Tympanic 
Probe 

Covers/#480-
500-400-0106

5000 $301.02 1005927 
BRAUN

No 200/BX $14.39
Thermoscan 

#PC800 Probe 
Covers

200/box $11.99

13. CW-85574
Safety Pins, Brass/Steel, Assorted. Minimum pack 
size 50.   Please indicate how many pins in 
package.   SAMPLE REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS 
MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

480 TEC 4400 Y 10 gr/bx $24570.00                 
$51.19

90027 
SIMPLICITY

No 90/PKG $2.74

14. CW-85575
Applicator Sticks, 6 inch, Wooden, 1000/BX, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% 
LATEX FREE

240  AMR 55900 Y  1000 pk/bx, 20 
bx/cs

$749.376              
$3.123 1009485 h.s.i. N 1000/BX             

20BX/CS
$3.30 99306 SH No                 

NTS
100/PKG

NTS
$0.77

15. CW-85576
Applicators, Cotton Tipped, 6" Length, 1000/BX, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 
100% LATEX FREE

240 DUK 9006 Y
100/bg, 10 

bg/bx, 
10 bx/cs

$2.10/each               
$20.968/cs  
$5032.20    

1009175 h.s.i. N 1000/BX                    
10BX/CS

$5.71/box      
$57.10/case

90165 Puritan No 100/BX $12.80

16. CW-85577
Tongue Depressors, Sterile, Individually Wrapped, 
Regular, 100/BX  SAMPLE REQUIRED, ALL 
PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

240  SOL 58000 Y 100/bx 10 bx/cs $653.328           
$2.723 1000238 h.s.i. N 100/BX          

10BX/CS
$4.35 90254 SH No 100/BX $2.46

17. CW-85578
Ointment, Bacitracin Zinc Ointment, 4 oz. SAMPLE 
REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% 
LATEX FREE New Product needed. 

240 1264296 
Dynarex 1175

N 72/CS $4.80 ea

18. CW-85579
Lotion, Calamine, 6 oz. (Calamine Only Cannot 
contain topical analgesic) SAMPLE REQUIRED, ALL 
PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

240  CUM 
1000050328

Y 12/cs $446.40               
$1.86

1381188 Major 
014283

N 12/CS $2.15 ea 1034910 
MAJOR

No EACH $3.24

19. CW-85666
Doctor’s Roll, 18” X 125’, 12 rolls per case, Avalon 
613, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 120  ALP 613 Y  12/cs

$2455.92 
$1.71/ea             

$20.466/cs
1009865 h.s.i. N 1 $17.87 21158 

NORTHTECH
No EACH $2.60

20. CW-85668 Doctor’s Roll, 21” X 125’, 12 rolls per case, Avalon 
617,  OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 

120  ALP 617 Y  12/cs $2824.56              
$23.538 1001657 h.s.i. N 1 $20.29 21414 NDC No 12/CS $41.04

21. CW-85910
Gloves, Small, Vinyl,  Non Latex, Disposable, Non 
Powdered,100 per box, SAMPLE REQUIRED
ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

240 GVP9-S-HH Y  100/BX 
10BX/CS

$2952.936              
$12.31/Bx

SAFETY 
ZONE 040565

DWO 
APPROVE

D

100 PER BOX 
1000 PER 

CASE

$86.00               
$8.60/Bx

Med Pride-Sm-
VPFG-E, Mfr: 

Med Pride As per 
sample #21

Y 100/Box $8.90

HOSPECO 
#GLV104F-SMALL 

**MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 200 

BOXES**

N 100/BX, 10 
BX/CASE

$12.99/BOX 21603 HG No 100/BX $12.99 VPF-S Y 100 $135.00                 
$13.50/BX

INTCO Yes 100/box $9.86/BX

22. CW-85911
Gloves, Medium, Vinyl, Non Latex,  Disposable, Non 
Powdered,100 box, SAMPLE REQUIRED
ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

2000 GVP9-M-HH Y  100/BX 
10BX/CS

$24607.8              
$12.31/Bx

SAFETY 
ZONE 040495

DWO 
APPROVE

D

100PER BOX 
1000 PER 

CASE

$86.00               
$8.60/Bx

Med Pride-Med-
VPFG-E, Mfr: 

Med Pride As per 
sample #22

Y 100/Box $8.90

HOSPECO 
#GLV104F-MED 

**MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 200 

BOXES**

N 100/BX, 10 
BX/CASE

$12.99/BOX 21604 HG No 100/BX $12.99 VPF-M Y 100 $135.00                 
$13.50/BX

INTCO Yes 100/box $9.86/BX

23. CW-85912
Gloves, Large, Vinyl,  Non Latex,  Disposable, Non 
Powdered,100 per box, SAMPLE REQUIRED
ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

1500 GVP9-L-HH Y  100/BX 
10BX/CS

$18455.85         
$12.31/Bx

 SAFETY 
ZONE 040500

DWO 
APPROVE

D

100PER BOX 
1000 PER 

CASE

$86.00
$8.60/Bx

Med Pride-Lrg-
VPFG-E, Mfr: 

Med Pride As per 
sample #23

Y 100/Box $8.90

HOSPECO 
#GLV104F-LARGE 

**MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 200 

BOXES**

N 100/BX, 10 
BX/CASE

$12.99/BOX 21605 HG No 100/BX $12.99 VPF--L Y 100 $135.00                 
$13.50/BX

INTCO Yes 100/box $9.86/BX

24. CW-85913
Gloves, X-Large, Vinyl, Non Latex,  Disposable, Non  
Powdered,100 per box, SAMPLE REQUIRED
ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

1000 GVP9-XL-HH Y  100/BX 
10BX/CS

$12303.9       
$12.31/Bx

SAFETY 
ZONE 040505

DWO 
APPROVE

D

100PER BOX 
1000 PER 

CASE

$86.00             
$8.60/Bx

Med Pride-XL-
VPFG-E, Mfr: 

Med Pride  As per 
sample #24

Y 100/Box $8.90

HOSPECO 
#GLV104F-XL 
**MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 200 
BOXES**

N 100/BX, 10 
BX/CASE

$12.99/BOX 21682 HG No 100/BX $12.99 VPF-XL Y 100 $135.00                 
$13.50/BX

INTCO Yes 100/box $9.86/BX

25. CW-85915
Gloves, Small, Nitrile, Non Powdered, Disposable, 
100 per Box, SAMPLE REQUIRED
ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

100 GNPR-S-1BL Y  100/BX 
10BX/CS

$1836.945        
$18.37/Bx

Med Pride/Superb-
Sm-NPFG-E, Mf r: 

Med 
Pride/Ev eready ,  As 

per sample #25

Y 100/Box $34.75 21742 HG No 100/BX $15.99 NPF-S Y 100 $185.00                 
$18.50/BX

AMY Yes 100/box $15.09/BX

26. CW-85916
Gloves, Medium, Nitrile, Non Powdered, 
Disposable, 100 per Box, SAMPLE REQUIRED
ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

240 GNPR-M-1BL Y  100/BX 
10BX/CS

$4408.668            
$18.37/Bx

Med Pride/Superb-
Med-NPFG-E, Mf r: 

Med 
Pride/Ev eready , As 

per sample #26

Y 100/Box $34.75 21743 HG No 100/BX $15.99 NPF-M Y 100 $185.00                  
$18.50/BX

AMY Yes 100/box $15.09/BX

27. CW-85917
Gloves, Large, Nitrile, Non Powdered, Disposable, 
100 per Box, SAMPLE REQUIRED
ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

240 GNPR-L-1BL Y  100/BX 
10BX/CS

$4408.668      
$18.37/Bx

Med Pride/Superb-
Lrg-NPFG-E, Mf r: 

Med 
Pride/Ev eready , As 

per sample #27

Y 100/Box $34.75 21744 HG No 100/BX $15.99 NPF-L Y 100 $185.00                  
$18.50/BX

AMY Yes 100/box $15.09/BX

28. CW-85918
Gloves, X Large, Nitrile, Non Powdered, Disposable, 
100 per Box, SAMPLE REQUIRED
ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% LATEX FREE

240 GNPR-XL-1BL Y  100/BX 
10BX/CS

$4408.668       
$18.37/Bx

Med Pride/Superb-
XL-NPFG-E, Mf r: 

Med Pride/Ev eready  
As per sample #28

Y 100/Box $34.75 21745 HG No 100/BX $15.99 NPF-XL Y 100 $185.00                  
$18.50/BX

AMY Yes 100/box $15.09/BX

29. CW-86666
Tissue, Facial, 100 per box, 30 boxes per case, 
Marcal #02930, Atlas #10,  
 OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

12000 MRC2930 Y
100 

Sheets/Box, 
30 

Boxes/Carton

$9042.00
$.754

PROBRANDS 
191170

30 BOXES 
PER CASE $.50 per box Kleenex/#480

500-400-0404
Y 36 BX of 100 34.2             .95/Bx

1158903 
Georgia Pacific 
47410 30Bx/Ca 

N 1 $25.95
$.865/BX

MARCAL 
#02930 

**MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 70 

CASES**

NOT 
MINIMUM 
ORDER

100/BX, 30 
BX/CASE

$19.99/CS                
$.67/BX

1030645 
KLEENEX

No 30/BX 
PER CS

$31.79                  
$1.06/BX

30. CW-86910
Wiper, Wash Cloth, 15” X 13 ½”, 50 per pkg, 10 pkg 
per case, Moore Medical #57463,  
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 2500 packages

2400 MF50G16X16WH Y 12/Bg, 
12Bg/Cs

$993,484.8    
$9.86/Bag  
$1.1832/Cs

9004279 h.s.i. N 1 $14.51
48033 

DYNAREX 
10"X13"

Yes 500/CS $18.82

31. CW-86912
Wipe – Alcohol, approximately 1” x 1”, 70% isopropyl 
alcohol, sealed in individual packages, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

1200 KEN 5750 Y 200/Bx,
 20Bx/Cs

$3015.60              
$2.513/Bx

Dynarex 1113 N 2,000/case             
NTS

$49.97/case
1126131 h.s.i. 

Med 200/bx 
sterile

N 200/BX                  
20/CS

$1.16/BX
$1.18/BX

49251 SH No 200/BX $1.61

32. CW-86913
Masks, N95 Airborne Disposable Face Masks with 
Ear Loops, 30 box, 3M8000 58968,  OR APPROVED 
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

120 708555 Y 20/box
$21586.5  
$6.00/Box    
$1.1993/Cs

newline 
291280

DWO 
APPROVED 500 per case $77.40/Cs                   

$3.87 each 3M 8200 Y 20/box $55/box
$2.75/each

GERMISEPT 
#G01462 (KN95) 

**10/BX**
N 10/BX, 30 

BX/CS
$5.90/BX

$0.59/each
1020181 
WEVEEL

No 50/BX $104.63
$2.09/each

33. CW-86915
Hand Sanitizer, Waterless, 12oz. Pump, Fragrance 
Free, Purell, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

1800 GOJ369112CT Y 12/Carton
$10,743.15   
$5.97/Ea    
$71.62/Cs

Joby 16.9oz pum Y 24/case $120/case
$5.00 ea

PURELL Foam 
Pump 

Bottle/#485-
950-700-1004

4 Bottles $59.88/CS               
$14.97/each

BAY #03826 
**16.9oz, 70% 
ALCOHOL**

N 20 EA/CS $3.69/EA

DrJs Natural 
Adv anced 

Formula Hand 
Sanitizer - 

DRJHS12OZ

Y 12/case $2.00 1020157 SH No EACH $5.11 Guangdong 
Kemei

No 48/box $2,538.00

34. CW-86916
Hand Sanitizer, 7.5” X 5.375 wipes, 300 wipes per 
container Sani-Hands, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 700 NICP92084CT Y 300/Canister, 

6/CT

$5,986.52  
$8.55/Canister  

$51.31/Cs

GERMISEPT 
#G01482 **300 
WIPES/BAG**

N 300/BAG, 4 
BAGS/CS

$13.99/BAG

35. CW-87000

Tampons, Economic Cardboard Sleeve, Individually 
wrapped, Vending machine compatible, 100/BX,  
Hospeco T100V or approved equal. SAMPLE 
REQUIRED, ALL PRODUCTS MUST BE 100% 
LATEX FREE

240
9904431 
Procter & 
Gamble 

7301002500 
Reg.

N 1 $55.74
HOSPECO #T500 

*500/BX* 
**MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 50 BX**

N 500/BX $55.90/BX* 1003250 
NATURELLE

No 500/CS $108.98

36. CW-87001
Sanitary Napkins, Maxi Pads, Individually packaged.  
Naturelle Plus, 250/Carton, RCM25189973 OR 
APPROVED EQUAL

240

1200433 
Rochester-
Midland  
889820  

Naturelle Maxi 
Pad w/Wings 

#4 

N 1 $65.43

ROCHESTER 
MIDLAND 

#RCM25189973 
**MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 50 
CASES**

N 250/CS $56.50/CASE 22003 
NATURELLE

Yes 250/CS $50.31

37. CW-88001
Diapers, Disposable, 200 Diapers per Case, 8-
14lbs CUTIES SIZE 1 OR APPROVED EQUAL, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED

20  KIM 52238 Y Cs $1,374.4              
$68.72/Cs

21567 CUTIES No 200/CS $33.10

38. CW-88002
Diapers, Disposable, 144 Diapers per case, 16-28 
lbs, CUTIES SIZE 3 OR APPROVED EQUAL, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED

50 21571 CUTIES No 144/CS $33.03

39. CW-88003
Diapers, Disposable, 124 Diapers per case, 22-37 
lbs, CUTIES SIZE 4,  OR APPROVED EQUAL, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED

80 21573 CUTIES No 124/CS $32.43

40. CW-88004
Diapers, Disposable, 92 Diapers per case, For Boys 
and Girls over 35 lbs., CUTIES SIZE 6,  OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

10 21577 CUTIES No 92/CS $33.01

41. CW-88005
Diapers, Disposable, 108 Diapers per case, For 
Boys and Girls 27 + lbs., CUTIES SIZE 5,  OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

100 21575 CUTIES No 108/CS $32.55

42. CW-88006
Diapers, Disposable, 168 Diapers per case, For 
Boys and Girls 12-18 lbs., CUTIES SIZE 2,  OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

20 21569 CUTIES No 168/CS $32.84

43. CW-88009

Pull Ups, Disposables, One (1) Size Fits All Girls or 
Boys, 104 Pull Ups per case, Up to 34 lbs., Wonder 
Pants Med 2T-3T WP7001,
 OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

40 1006530 
HUGGIES

No 92/CS $58.48

44. CW-88010

Pull Ups, Disposable, One (1) Size Fits All Girls or 
Boys, 92 Pull Ups per case, 32-40 lbs. Wonder 
Pants Large 3T-4T WP8001,  OR APPROVED 
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

40 1006531 
HUGGIES

No 80/CS $58.99

45. CW-88012

Pull Ups, Disposable, One (1) Size Fits All Girls or 
Boys, 84 Pull Ups per case, 35+ lbs., Wonder Pants 
X-Large 4T-5T WP9001
 OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED

60 1006534 
HUGGIES

No 68/CS $58.16

46. CW-88013

Pull Ups, Disposable, One (1) Size Fits All Girls or 
Boys,40-70 lbs. DRYTIME OR APPROVED EQUAL, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED 40 1006466 

CUTIES
No 76/CS $60.44

47. CW-88015

Wipes, Alcohol Free, Scent Free, 12-80ct per case 
CUTIES WIPES FRANGRANCE FREE CR303-1  OR 
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 300 F3878PCH80 Y 12 Packages / 

Case

$8728.5  
$2.53/Ea   

$29.10/Cs

1378048  First 
Quality  Products  

CR-16413/3 
Cuties 

Aloe/Vitamin E 
72/Pk Unscented 

864/Ca

NTS 1 $30.96/Cs 
$2.00

DIAMOND WIPES 
#F3878PCH80N 

**MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 50 

CASES**

NTS 12-80ct/CS $21.98/Cs 
$1.83/Ea  

1003422 
CUTIES

No                 
NTS 72/PK $4.27

48. CW-88016
Diaper Genie Refills, 3 pk, 240 refills per pack 
PLAYTEX 80066,  OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED

20 1031726 
PLAYTEX No 3/PK $21.73 Playtex 80066 

as specif ied N
3 packs of 

240/pack as 
spec'd

$27.88

ARO

BOL

96 Vendor(s) Were Notified of Bid  = PRIMARY VENDOR

13 Vendor(s) Submitted a Responsive Bid  = SECONDARY VENDOR

2
Vendor (s) Submitted a Non- Responsive Bid

0
Vendor(s) Returned a No Bid

81
Vendor(s) Did Not Respond 

Fl Pref /Pref Florida Statute 287.084 (1)

APPROVED BY: DATE: 05 24 2021
Edith Stiller 
PROCUREMENT AGENT

BID TABULATION ONLY.  THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.
ATTN:  SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL. BID NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER & DESCRIPTION MUST BE ENTERED ON REQUISITION(S).
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Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

NO BID

7 DAYS ARO

8%

8% CATALOG DISCOUNT. FREE SHIPPING ON ALL ORDERS OVER $50.00. 
PLEASE SEE THE ATTACHED LIST OF EXCLUDED ITEMS FROM THE 

DISCOUNT.

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

4-6 Days

15%

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

jgiesel@schoolnursesupply.com
Stornabene@schoolnursesupply.com

Suncoast Surgical & Medical Supply, LLC
Attn: Ron Dial/Steve Dial

2711 N 58th Street
Tampa, FL  33619

(813) 881-0065

(813) 886-3045

Ron_Dial@suncoastsurgical.com
Steve_Dial@suncoastsurgical.com

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

No

Yes

No

Yes

No

Tranzonic d/b/a CCP Industries
Attn: Pete Chojnacki/Laura Dalton

26301 Curtiss Wright Parkway, Suite 200
Richmond Heights, OH  44143-1454

(216) 243-6844

(800) 445-8366

pchojnacki@ccpind.com
Ldalton@ccpind.com

School Health Corporation
Attn: Sam Medine/Andrew Wlezen

5600 Apollo Avenue
Rolling Meadows, IL  60008

(866) 323-5465

(800) 235-1305 (800) 485-2738

Percentage discount off balance of line:

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Attachment H - Scrutinized Company Certification
Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

50% off current catalog

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

1 day ARO

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

bids@schoolhealth.com

NO BID

NO BID

Yes

Yes

No

Yes

Yes

Yes

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Yes  

Henry Schein Medical
(a division of Henry Schein, Inc.)

Attn: Joanne Viggiano/Travis Meekins
135 Duryea Road

Melville, NY  11747

(800) 851-0400

biddept@henryschein.com
travbis.meekins@henryschein.com

Due to Covid-19 deliveries may be longer than usual.

18% Catalog Discount for items not on bid. See letter & terms of 
sale.

Yes

Yes

Yes

SAMPLE no samples w ill be provided,
  do to Covid-19 w e can not send samples.    our w eb site: 

https://w w w .henryschein.com 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Pyramid School Products
Attn: Kenneth D. Miller
6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, FL  33610-1908

10%

(833) 343-2700

(800) 944-6667

Government.Bids@McKesson.com

(800) 792-2644

(813) 621-7688

biddept@pyramidsp.com

McKesson Medical-Surgical Government Solutions, 
LLC

Attn: Kimberly R. Zabriskie/Amanda Johnson
9954 Mayland Drive, Suite 5176

Henrico, VA  23233-1464

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Arrival Time in Days 7 days 7-10 Days ARO 30

Yes

Attachment B - Reference Form
Attachment C - Insurance Requirements Form
Attachment D - Addenda Acknowledgement Form
Attachment E - Debarment Form

0%

Yes

Yes

Yes

APPROVED EQUAL (Samples Required) Samples must meet or exceed the 
specifications of the name brand listed for each line item. EACH SAMPLE 
SUBMITTED SHALL BE CLEARLY MARKED WITH COMPANY NAME, BID NUMBER, 
SDLC PART NUMBER AND THE MANUFACTURES NAME WITH THEIR PART 
NUMBER.

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

0%

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
 DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

CLINIC SUPPLIES FOR DISTRICT WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS (DWO)
~ WAREHOUSE ~

(305) 712-6653

(888) 592-3667

cservice@headtoheels.net
OPENING DATE:

TUESDAY, JANUARY 19, 2021 @ 2:00 PM
REVISED: September 14, 2021

ITB  NO. B207395JC

Agni Enterprises, LLC
d/b/a Head to Heels Safety Supplies

Attn: Subbarayan R. Pochi
7950 NW 155th Street, Suite 103

Miami Lakes, FL  33016-5819

(845) 782-6800

(845) 781-2450

abraham@interboropackaging.com

Interboro Packaging Corporation
Attn: Blimie Itzkowitz/Abraham Jeremias

114 Bracken Road
Montgomery, NY  12549

All Florida Paper
Attn: Mario Vale/Anglica Gamboa

9150 NW 105th Way
Miami, FL  33178

(305) 755-4820

(305) 884-8424

mvale@allfloridapaper.com

Buyer's Point
Attn: Ben Walker/Kim Mesler

2300 Tall Pines Drive, Suite 110
Largo, FL  33771

(813) 499-4715

ben.walker@buyerspoint.com
mesler.kim@buyerspoint.com

Florida Association of Rehabilitation Facilities 
d/b/a RESPECT of Florida

Attn: Suzanne Sewell/Dayna Lenk
1113 E Tennessee Street, Suite 100

Tallahassee, FL  32308

(850) 942-3555

ssew ell@floridaarf.org
customerservice@respectoff lorida.org

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

YesAttachment I - Emergency/Storm related Catastrophic Agreement
Attachment J - Bidder's Statement of Principal Place of Business

Yes

Yes

Yes

No

Yes

NoYesYes Yes

IT IS RECOMMENDED THIS BID BE AWARDED TO AGNI ENTERPRISES, LLC dba HEAD TO HEELS SAFETY SUPPLIES, ALL FLORIDA PAPER, BUYER'S POINT, HENRY SCHEIN MEDICAL, INTERBORO PACKAGING CORPORATION, 
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS,  QYK BRANDS, LLC., SCHOOL HEALTH CORPORATION, SCHOOL NURSE SUPPLY, INC., SUNCOAST SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLY, INC., AND VIZOCOM ICT, INC. HAVING SUBMITTED THE  LOWEST 
OVERALL AND BEST RESPONSE MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.

(650) 283-8515

balaji@qyk.us
Patrick@qyk.us

N/A%

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Unipak Corporation
Attn: Brian Marcus

PO Box 300027
Brooklyn, NY  11230

(888) 808-5120

(718) 677-9371

customercare@unipakcorp.net
brian@unipakcorp.net

Vizocom ICT, LLC
Attn: George Attar/Sam Jonas
860 Jamacha Road, Suite 104

ElCajon, CA  92019

(619) 350-6980

(619) 599-8184

government@vizocom.us
samj@vizocom.com

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

School Nurse Supply, Inc.
Attn: Jeff Giesel/Stephanie Tornabene

1690 Wright Boulevard
Schaumburg, IL  60193

(800) 485-2737

QYK Brands, LLC
Attn: Balaji Tammabattula/Patrick Mucca

10517 Garden Grove Boulevard
Garden Grove, CA  92843

NO BID

15 DAYS

%

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

3-5 days

%

Yes

Yes

Yes

Within 14 days of order

Yes

YesYes

Required Submittal Checklist
Attachment A - Bid Response Form

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Attachment G - Public Entity Crimes Form

Attachment K - Guarantee

Attachment F - Drug Free Workplace Certificate
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