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1. CW-77781

Liner, Disposable for Sanitary Napkin Receptacle, 6 mic, 
Clear plastic,17" x 18", 40 rolls, 50 bags per, 2000 per 
Case,SAMPLE REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 100

h1716061 Y 2000 $9.95 CALICO 
9930011

Y 2000/CS $11.80 NORAMCO 
921103359

Yes 2000 $15.14
INT-1718-L, As per 

sample #1/CW-77781. 
Mfr: IBS/Capital

Yes 2000 $11.68/Cs

NAPCO #NR171806 
**NAPCO MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 250 
CASES, COMBINED 

NAPCO ITEMS**

Yes 2000/CS $12.89

2. CW-77782

Liner, Disposable for Sanitary Napkin Receptacle, 
Waxed, 9" X 10" X 3 1/4", Gusseted, 250 case, Hospeco 
HS-6141, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 100

HOSPECO
HS-6141

No 250 $18.07
HOSPECO #HS6141 
**MINIMUM ORDER 

IS 50 CASES**
No 250/CS $11.79

3. CW-78830

Liner, Garbage Can, Plastic, PolyPlastic, 1.5 Mil 
Minimum, 23" x 10" x 40",Gusseted, Must Fit Huskee 
44Gallon Can, With/ Twist Ties,Black, 250 per Case, 
SAMPLE REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 1500

3740XH-AAP Y                 
NTS

250 $21.14 L3340250R Y                 
NTS

250 $29.53 CALICO 
9910347

Y                 
NTS

250/CS $21.48 COLONIAL BAG
 LCS23104015B

Y                 
NTS

250 $30.93
INT-231040-Exh, As 
per sample #3/CW-

78830. Mfr: 
IBS/Capital/Glopak

Yes 250
$20.68/Cs
$25.85/Cs
$33.60/Cs

NAPCO #CRM333915 
**NAPCO MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 250 
CASES, COMBINED 

NAPCO ITEMS**

Yes
250/CS                 
Min. too 

High
$13.55 UPC40X Y                 

NTS 250
$23.60
$28.80
$35.00

4. CW-78833

Liner, Compactor Use, 2 Mil Minimum, PolyPlastic, Star 
Sealed, 33” x 40”,Black, 250 per Case, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED,
Estimated Annual Quantity: 6000

3340XXH-AAP Y                 
NTS

250 $24.40 L33402250R Y 250 $38.95 CALICO 
9911025R

Y 250/CS
$26.24
$38.76
$48.14

COLONIAL BAG
LCS33402B

Yes 250 $38.22
INT-3340-Super Exh, 

As per sample #4/CW
78833. Mfr: 

IBS/Capital/Glopak

Yes 250
$25.34/Cs
$31.68/Cs
$41.18/Cs

NAPCO #RM333920 
**NAPCO MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 250 
CASES, COMBINED 

NAPCO ITEMS**

Yes
250/CS                 
Min. too 

High
$17.23 3339XH Yes 250

$26.28
$32.00
$46.00

5. CW-78835

Liner, Recycling Can, ClearPlastic, Heavy Duty, 16 
Micron Minimum,23” x 10” x 39”, 250 per Case, SAMPLE 
REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 600

H334016N Y 250 $13.36 CALICO 
9970130

Y                 
NTS 250/CS $11.24 COLONIAL BAG 

HCR40XC
Yes 250 $15.01

INT-3340-H, As per 
sample #5/CW-78835. 

Mfr: IBS/Capital
Yes 250

$11.14/Cs
$13.93/Cs
$18.11/Cs

NAPCO 
#NCSR334016N 

**NAPCO MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 250 

CASES, COMBINED 
NAPCO ITEMS**

Yes 250/CS $15.23 UPC3916 Yes 250
$12.28
$14.98
$15.90

6. CW-78840

Liner, Waste, Clear Poly Plastic,Medium-Heavy Duty, 24” 
x 24”,1000 per Case, 10 Gallon Size,20 rolls/50 bags per 
roll, black or clear, 6-8 Micron, SAMPLE REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 1400 H242406N Y 1000 $9.32 CALICO 

9970001
Y 20/50/CS $8.94 COLONIAL BAG 

HCR24LC
Yes 1000 $11.64

INT-2424-H, As per 
sample #6/CW-78840. 

Mfr: IBS/Capital
Yes 1000

$8.68/Cs
$10.85/Cs
$14.10/Cs

NAPCO 
#VNR242408N 

**NAPCO MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 250 

CASES, COMBINED 
NAPCO ITEMS**

Yes 1000/CS $13.55 UPC246 Yes 1000
$8.80
$10.74
$11.25

7. CW-78842

Liner, Waste, 13 – 15 Gallons,24” x 33”, 8 Micron, 
Medium-Heavy Duty,black or clear, 20 rolls/50 bags per 
roll ,SAMPLE REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 800

H243308N Y 1000 $17.31 CALICO 
9970089

  Y  20/50/CS 
$11.78
$16.56
$25.64

COLONIAL BAG 
HCR33MC

Yes 1000 $19.54
INT-2433-H, As per 

sample #7/CW-78842. 
Mfr: IBS/Capital

Yes 1000
$11.48/Cs
$14.35/Cs
$18.65/Cs

NAPCO 
#VNR243308N 

**NAPCO MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 250 

CASES, COMBINED 
NAPCO ITEMS**

Yes 1000/CS $18.25 UPC338 Yes 1000
$15.98
$19.50
$19.25

8. CW-78845

Liner, Garbage Can, Plastic, PolyPlastic, 1.5 Mil 
Minimum, 37" x 44", Must Fit Huskee 44 Gallon Can, 
With/Twist Ties, Black, 250 per Case,SAMPLE 
REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 1200

3744XH-AAP
Y                 

NO 
sample

250 $25.76 L3744150R Y 250 $36.42 CALICO 
9911529

Y 250/CS
$26.05
$38.48
$45.34

COLONIAL BAG 
LCS374415B

Yes 250 $37.49
INT-3744-Exh, As per 
sample #8/CW-78845. 

Mfr: 
IBS/Capital/Glopak

Yes 250
$26.24/Cs
$32.80/Cs
$46.64/Cs

NAPCO 
#CUSTOM3744-1.5 
**NAPCO MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 250 
CASES, COMBINED 

NAPCO ITEMS**

No
250/CS                 
Min. too 

High
$16.69 UPC44C15 Yes 250

$13.20
$16.10
$42.50

9. CW-78849

Liner, Waste, 55 Gallon, Drum,Black, 2 mil Minimum, 38" 
X 60", Star Seal, 50 case Flexsol ECO600SXH LDPE, 
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 600

3860XXH-AAP Y 50
8.98

$10.21
$13.13

L3860200R Y 50 $13.63 Flexsol 
ECO600SXH

N 50/CS $9.36 COLONIAL BAG 
LCS38602B

Yes 50 $12.56
INT-3860-Super Exh, 

As per sample #9/CW
78849. Mfr: 

IBS/Capital/Glopak

Y                 
NTS

50 $9.32/Cs

NAPCO 
#CUSTOM38X60-2.0 
**NAPCO MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 250 
CASES, COMBINED 

NAPCO ITEMS**

No 50/CS $18.58 603PL Yes 50
$12.50
$15.25
$17.20

10. CW-78851

Liner, Waste, 45 – 50 Gallons,Plastic, 43” x 48”, 17 
Micron, XHeavy,black, 200 per Case,
SAMPLE REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 400

H434717N Y 200 $17.57 CALICO
9930372

Y 200/CS
$14.78
$20.78
$21.24

COLONIAL BAG 
HCR47XB

Yes 200 $19.85
INT-4348-XH, As per 

sample #10/CW-
78851. Mfr: 
IBS/Capital

Yes 200
$14.84/Cs
$18.55/Cs
$24.11/Cs

NAPCO 
#NCSR434817K 

**NAPCO MINIMUM 
ORDER IS 250 

CASES, COMBINED 
NAPCO ITEMS**

Yes 200/CS $20.25 434817 Yes 200 $17.50
$23.20

11. CW-78855

Liner, Compactor Use, 1.3 Mil Minimum, PolyPlastic, 43" 
X 58" minimum, clear, 65 gallon, 100 per case SAMPLE 
REQUIRED
Estimated Annual Quantity: 100

4358H-AAP Y 100 $17.54 L4350130C Y 100 $17.92 CALICO 
99SP4358HC Y 100/CS $15.72 COLONIAL BAG 

LCS435813C
Yes 100 $23.95

INT-4358-X-Hvy, As 
per sample #11/CW-

78855. Mfr: 
IBS/Capital/Glopak

Y                 
NTS 100 $15.32/Cs

NAPCO 
#CUSTOM4358-1.3 
**NAPCO MINIMUM 

ORDER IS 250 
CASES, COMBINED 

NAPCO ITEMS**

No 100/CS $26.42 UPC4358C13 Yes 100 $20.90
$24.60

12. ARO Arrival Time in Days

13. BOL Percentage discount off balance of line:

69  = PRIMARY VENDOR Fl Pref. =

12  = SECONDARY VENDOR NTS =

0

57

APPROVED BY: DATE: 11.03.2020
Jim Carrasco
PROCUREMENT AGENT

ITB TABULATION ONLY.  THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.
ATTN:  SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL. ITB NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER & DESCRIPTION MUST BE ENTERED ON REQUISITION(S).

Florida PreferenceVendor(s) Were Notified of ITB

Vendor(s) Submitted Bids

Vendor(s) Returned a No Bid

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes
Yes

Vendor(s) Did Not Respond 

IT IS RECOMMENDED THIS ITB BE AWARDED TO ALL AMERICAN POLY, ALL FLORIDA PAPER, CALICO PACKAGING, LLC, CENTRAL POLY-BAG 
CORPORATION,  IMPERIAL BAG & PAPER COMPANY, LLC, INTERBORO PACKAGING CORPORATION,  PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS AND UNIPACK 

CORPORATION HAVING SUBMITTED THE  LOWEST OVERALL AND BEST RESPONSE MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.
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(507) 454-5374
Bids@centralpoly.com
(908) 562-7570

Yes

No

Yes

Yes

Within expected 30 day delivery timeline 1-10

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

(845) 782-6800
Abraham@interboropackaging.co

Yes Yes

YesYes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Original Only

Yes

Original Only

Yes

Yes  (1) Original and (1) copy of bid

Yes Yes

Yes

Original Only

Yes

Yes

Yes

Attachment I - Emergency/Storm Related Catastrophe Agreement

Attachment J - Principal Place of Business

Yes

YesYes

NOT TO SPEC.

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Required Submittal Checklist

Attachment A - ITB Response Form

Attachment B - Reference Form

Attachment C - Insurance Requirements Form

Attachment D - Addenda Acknowledgement Form

Attachment E - Debarment Form

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes  

Attachment F - Drug Free Workplace Certificate

Attachment G - Public Entity Crimes Form

Electronic copy of bid

Yes

Attachment H - Scrutinized Company Certification

Attachment K - Guarantee/Warranty Form

Attachment L - ITB Mailing Label

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes  

Yes  

APPROVED EQUAL (Samples Required) Samples must meet or exceed the specifications 
of the name brand listed for each line item. EACH SAMPLE SUBMITTED SHALL BE 
CLEARLY MARKED WITH COMPANY NAME, BID NUMBER, SDLC PART NUMBER AND THE 
MANUFACTURES NAME WITH THEIR PART NUMBER.

Yes  

Yes  

Yes

Yes  Yes

(888) 808-5120
customercare@unipakcorp.com

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

Yes  

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
 DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Trash Can Liners for District Warehouse (DWO) (732) 752-3200
zeke@allampoly.com

10-20 days ARO

OPENING DATE:
THURSDAY, October 15, 2020 @ 2:00 PM

REVISED:
January 20, 2022

ITB NO. B207383JC

All American Poly
Attn: Zeke Rosenwasser/Nikki Klein

40 Turner Place
Piscataway, NJ  08854

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

District Warehouse Delivery Tabulation

Yes 

Yes

YesYes

All Florida Paper
Attn: Mario Vale

9150 NW 105th Way
Miami, FL  33178

(866) 835-6060
Mvale@allfloridapaper.com

30 DAYS

bids@calicopackaging.com

Jon.Jaret@calicopackaging.com

Calico Packaging, LLC
Attn: Christopher Hartnett/Jon Jaret

10621 Iron Bridge Road, Suite F
Jessup, MD  20794

NO BID NO BID

Yes 

Yes 

Yes  

Yes

Yes Yes

Yes

(800) 638-0828

5

Yes

Yes 

Fastenal Company
Attn: Terry Owen/Christopher Fornes

2001 Theurer Boulevard
Winona, MN  55987

Central Poly-Bag Corporation
Attn: Andrew Hoffer/Nicole Lawson

2400 Bedle Place
Linden, NJ  07036

cfornes@fastenal.com

narfp@fastenal.com

Yes

Yes

Yes Yes

Yes at 30% off wholesale

Imperial Bag & Paper Company, LLC
Attn: Vickie Scaglione/Lisa Barash

5101 E Hanna Avenue
Tampa, FL  33610

(813) 621-3091
Tampabids@Imperialdade.com

YES

Yes

Yes

Yes

Office Depot, LLC
Attn: Tim LaBrie/Wayne Lajoie

6600 North Military Trail
Boca Raton, FL  33496-2434

Yes

Unipak Corporation
Attn: Brian Marcus
PO Box 300027

Brooklyn, NY  11230

Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes

(800) 634-4809
bid@quill.com

matt.appelhans@quill.com

NO BID

NO BID

Quill, LLC
Attn: Karrie Szalkowski/Matt Appelhans

100 Schelter Road
Lincolnshire, IL  60069

Yes

Yes

Yes

Interboro Packaging Corporation
Attn: Miriam Berger/Abraham Jeremias

114 Bracken Road
Montgomery, NY  12549

5 Days ARO

Yes, 50%

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

(561) 438-4800
tim.labrie@officedepot.com

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

NO BID

Yes

N
O
 
A
W
A
R
D

Pyramid School Products
Attn: Kenneth D. Miller
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL  813-621-6446

(800) 792-2644
biddept@pyramidsp.com

10-14 DAYS A.R.O.

YES (10%)

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Yes

Imperial Bag & Paper Company, LLC
Attn: Vickie Scaglione/Lisa Barash

5101 E Hanna Avenue
Tampa, FL  33610

(813) 621-3091
Tampabids@Imperialdade.com

~ DROP SHIP ~                               
Mininum Truckload Required

Yes

Yes

heritage sent samples direct to purchasing. JR 
Plastics samples delayed for #7/#8. Will forward 

when recvd
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