THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

American Portable Air of Tampa
Attn: Matt Davidson/Greg Melton
6091 Johns Road, Suite 8
Tampa, FL 33634

Country Cooling & Heating, Inc.
Attn: Kenneth Robinson
12920 Palm Beach Boulevard
Fort Myers, FL 33905

RENTAL OF SPOT COOLERS and DEHUMIDIFIERS Phone: (877) 823-2722 Phone: (239) 567-1549
ITB NO. B207373JC Email: info@americanportableair.com Email: CountryCooling@gmail.com
OPENING DATE: Thursday, March 5, 2020 at 2:00 pm Email: areg .com Email:
DAILY S WEEKLY . MONTHLY I DAILY I WEEKLY P MONTHLY -
I"I\"I(EDM DESCRIPTION uoM | RENTAL w/ Mo;y;l;zatlon RENTAL w/ Mo;y;l;zatlon RENTAL w/ Mo;):;zatlon RENTAL w/ Mo;):;zatlon RENTAL w/ Mo;)‘lelzatlon RENTAL w/ Moé)él‘lezatlon
) PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. |Spot Cooler, Classic 10 or approved equal EA $75.00 $375.00 $160.00 $460.00 $475.00 $775.00 $90.00 $165.00 $175.00 $250.00 $650.00 $725.00
2. |Spot Cooler, Classic Plus 14 or approved equal EA $85.00 $385.00 $175.00 $475.00 $485.00 $785.00 $120.00 $195.00 $250.00 $325.00 $720.00 $795.00
3. [Spot Cooler, Classic 18 or approved equal EA $90.00 $390.00 $190.00 $490.00 $500.00 $800.00 $150.00 $225.00 $295.00 $370.00 $800.00 $875.00
4. |Spot Cooler, Classic 60 or approved equal EA $250.00 $550.00 $525.00 $825.00 $1,250.00 $1,550.00 $175.00 $250.00 $350.00 $425.00 $1,050.00 $1,125.00
5. [Spot Cooler, Office Pro 60 or approved equal EA $250.00 $550.00 $525.00 $825.00 $1,250.00 $1,550.00 $175.00 $250.00 $350.00 $425.00 $1,050.00 $1,125.00
6. [Dehumidifier, DrizAir 1200 or approved equal EA $60.00 $360.00 $130.00 $430.00 $360.00 $660.00 $95.00 $95.00 $210.00 $285.00 $605.00 $680.00
7. |Dehumidifier, DrizAir LGR2000 or approved equal EA $65.00 $365.00 $140.00 $440.00 $380.00 $680.00 $120.00 $195.00 $250.00 $325.00 $720.00 $795.00
8. [Dehumidifier, LGR 7000XLi or approved equal EA $70.00 $370.00 $150.00 $450.00 $400.00 $700.00 $150.00 $225.00 $275.00 $350.00 $800.00 $875.00
9. [Bidder's alternate equipment EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10. Discqunt on alternate rental equipment during the contract EA 15% 15% 15% NO BID NO BID NO BID
duration
11. |Mobilization Fee, in any, for 6pm - 6am emergency service. EA $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID
12. |Standard Mobilization Fee EA $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $75.00
Required Submittal Checklist Yes Yes
Equipment List Yes Yes
Attachment A - Bid Response Form Yes Yes
Attachment B - Reference Form Yes Yes
Attachment C - Insurance Requirements Form Yes Yes
Attachment D - Addenda Acknowledgement Form Yes Yes
Attachment E - Debarment Form Yes Yes
Attachment F - Drug Free Workplace Certificate Yes Yes
Attachment G - Public Entity Crimes Form Yes Yes
Attachment H - Scrutinized Company Certification Yes Yes
Attachment | - Emergency/Storm Related Catastrophe Agreement Yes Yes
Attachment J - Sealed Bid Mailing Label Yes Yes
Electronic Copy Yes Yes
Original and two (2) copies of packet Yes Yes

PRIMARY
SECONDARY

14 Vendor(s) Were Notified of Bid
7 Vendor(s) Submitted Bids
7 Vendor(s) Did Not Respond
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Herc Rentals, Inc.

Attn: Jason Oosterbeek/Jordan Kelleher

3251 SW 26th Terrace
Dania Beach, FL 33312

Regional Air Solutions, Inc.
Attn: Richard Duckett
5781 Lee Boulevard, Suite 208-352
Lehigh Acres, FL 33971

RENTAL OF SPOT COOLERS and DEHUMIDIFIERS Phone: (404) 655-5296 Phone: (239) 249-2979
ITB NO. B207373JC Email: hercbids@hercrentals.com Email: Richard.duckett@comcast.net
OPENING DATE: Thursday, March 5, 2020 at 2:00 pm Email: Jordan Kelleher@hercrentals.com Email:
DAILY P WEEKLY P MONTHLY T DAILY T WEEKLY I MONTHLY P
I"I\"I(EDM DESCRIPTION UOM RENTAL w/ Mo;)éllezallon RENTAL w/ Mo;)éllezallon RENTAL w/ Moli)(lellezanon RENTAL w/ Moli)(lellezanon RENTAL w/ Mo;)(lelzauon RENTAL w/ Mo;)‘lelzauon
) PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. |[Spot Cooler, Classic 10 or approved equal EA NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.00 $31.00 $145.00 $145.00 $435.00 $435.00
2. |Spot Cooler, Classic Plus 14 or approved equal EA $105.00 $805.00 $285.00 $985.00 $585.00 $1,285.00 $37.00 $37.00 $195.00 $195.00 $585.00 $585.00
3. [Spot Cooler, Classic 18 or approved equal EA $105.00 $805.00 $285.00 $985.00 $585.00 $1,285.00 $39.00 $39.00 $215.00 $215.00 $635.00 $635.00
4. |Spot Cooler, Classic 60 or approved equal EA NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.00 $50.00 $295.00 $295.00 $885.00 $885.00
5. [Spot Cooler, Office Pro 60 or approved equal EA $250.00 | $950.00 $700.00 | $1,400.00 $1,675.00 I $2,375.00 $60.00 $60.00 $295.00 $295.00 $885.00 $885.00
6. |Dehumidifier, DrizAir 1200 or approved equal EA NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.00 $30.00 $135.00 $135.00 $385.00 $385.00
7. |Dehumidifier, DrizAir LGR2000 or approved equal EA NO BID NO BID NO BID $37.00 $37.00 $195.00 $195.00 $585.00 $585.00
8. [Dehumidifier, LGR 7000XLi or approved equal EA $75.00 | $775.00 $265.00 | $965.00 $570.00 | $1,270.00 $39.00 $39.00 $215.00 $215.00 $635.00 $635.00
9. [Bidder's alternate equipment EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10. Discqunt on alternate rental equipment during the contract EA NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
duration
11. |Mobilization Fee, in any, for 6pm - 6am emergency service. EA $1200: delivery+setup+pickup $1,200.00 $1,200.00 Included Included Included
12. |Standard Mobilization Fee EA $700:delivery+setup+pickup $700.00 $700.00 Included Included Included
Required Submittal Checklist Yes Yes
Equipment List Yes Yes
Attachment A - Bid Response Form Yes Yes
Attachment B - Reference Form Yes Yes
Attachment C - Insurance Requirements Form Yes Yes
Attachment D - Addenda Acknowledgement Form Yes Yes
Attachment E - Debarment Form Yes Yes
Attachment F - Drug Free Workplace Certificate Yes Yes
Attachment G - Public Entity Crimes Form Yes Yes
Attachment H - Scrutinized Company Certification Yes Yes
Attachment | - Emergency/Storm Related Catastrophe Agreement Yes Yes
Attachment J - Sealed Bid Mailing Label Yes Yes
Electronic Copy Yes Yes
Original and two (2) copies of packet Yes Yes

14

7

-

PRIMARY
SECONDARY

Vendor(s) Were Notified of Bid
Vendor(s) Submitted Bids
Vendor(s) Did Not Respond
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
2855 COLONIAL BLVD.

FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Sunbelt Rentals, Inc.
Attn: Kimberly Quirk/Nathan Walters
2341 Deerfield Drive
Fort Mill, SC 29715

Tampa Bay Trane
Attn: Greg Ortiz
902 N Himes Avenue
Tampa, FL 33609

RENTAL OF SPOT COOLERS and DEHUMIDIFIERS Phone: (800) 508-4762 Phone: (813) 545-9948
ITB NO. B207373JC Email: nathan.walters@sunbeltrentals.com Emai: Gregory.Ortiz@Trane.com
OPENING DATE: Thursday, March 5, 2020 at 2:00 pm Email: Email:
DAILY S WEEKLY . MONTHLY I DAILY I WEEKLY P MONTHLY -
I"I\"I(EDM DESCRIPTION uoM | RENTAL w/ Mo;y;l;zatlon RENTAL w/ Mo;y;l;zatlon RENTAL w/ Mo'glelzatlon RENTAL w/ Mo'glelzatlon RENTAL w/ Mo':lel‘lezatlon RENTAL w/ MO;)I“ZaIIOn
: PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE ee
1. |Spot Cooler, Classic 10 or approved equal EA $95.00 $210.00 $200.00 $315.00 $485.00 $600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. |Spot Cooler, Classic Plus 14 or approved equal EA $95.00 $210.00 $200.00 $315.00 $485.00 $600.00 $110.00 $260.00 $300.00 $450.00 $600.00 $750.00
3. [Spot Cooler, Classic 18 or approved equal EA $95.00 $210.00 $200.00 $315.00 $485.00 $600.00 $110.00 $260.00 $300.00 $450.00 $600.00 $750.00
4. |Spot Cooler, Classic 60 or approved equal EA $200.00 $315.00 $400.00 $515.00 $750.00 $865.00 $290.00 $440.00 $600.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $1,650.00
5. [Spot Cooler, Office Pro 60 or approved equal EA $200.00 $315.00 $400.00 $515.00 $750.00 $865.00 $290.00 $440.00 $600.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $1,650.00
6. [Dehumidifier, DrizAir 1200 or approved equal EA $75.00 $190.00 $185.00 $300.00 $450.00 $565.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
7. |Dehumidifier, DrizAir LGR2000 or approved equal EA $75.00 $190.00 $185.00 $300.00 $450.00 $565.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8. |Dehumidifier, LGR 7000XLi or approved equal EA $75.00 $190.00 $185.00 $300.00 $450.00 $565.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
f . owcCi811l OwC1811 OwC1811
R ! NO BID NO BID NO BID 4 Y .
9. |Bidder's alternate equipment EA $100 $250.00 $300 $450.00 $900 $1,050.00
10. Dlscqunt on alternate rental equipment during the contract EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
duration
11. [Mobilization Fee, in any, for 6pm - 6am emergency service. EA $250.00 $250.00 $250.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00
12. |Standard Mobilization Fee EA $115.00 $115.00 $115.00 $150.00 $150.00 $150.00
Required Submittal Checklist Yes Yes
Equipment List Yes Yes
Attachment A - Bid Response Form Yes Yes
Attachment B - Reference Form Yes Yes
Attachment C - Insurance Requirements Form Yes Yes
Attachment D - Addenda Acknowledgement Form Yes Yes
Attachment E - Debarment Form Yes Yes
Attachment F - Drug Free Workplace Certificate Yes Yes
Attachment G - Public Entity Crimes Form Yes Yes
Attachment H - Scrutinized Company Certification Yes Yes
Attachment | - Emergency/Storm Related Catastrophe Agreement Yes Yes
Attachment J - Sealed Bid Mailing Label Yes Yes
Electronic Copy Yes Yes
Original and two (2) copies of packet Yes Yes

14

7

-

PRIMARY
SECONDARY

Vendor(s) Were Notified of Bid
Vendor(s) Submitted Bids
Vendor(s) Did Not Respond
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY United Rentals (North America), Inc.
DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES Attn: Francis Gross/Robert Carlson
2855 COLONIAL BLVD. 3400 NW 15th Street
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966 Lauderhill, FL. 33311
RENTAL OF SPOT COOLERS and DEHUMIDIFIERS Phone: (877) 874-4468
ITB NO. B207373JC Email: gowrents@ur.com
OPENING DATE: Thursday, March 5, 2020 at 2:00 pm Email: govrents@ur.com
DAILY S WEEKLY . MONTHLY o
'L'(EDM DESCRIPTION uom | RentaL | M‘g'eza“o" RENTAL | W/ M‘g'&za“o” rentaL | W/ MO'fé“eza“O”
) PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. |[Spot Cooler, Classic 10 or approved equal EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. |spot Cooler, Classic Plus 14 or approved equal EA | se000 [ $340.00 $225.00 | $475.00 $550.00 |  $800.00
3. |Spot Cooler, Classic 18 or approved equal EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. |Spot Cooler, Classic 60 or approved equal EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
5. [Spot Cooler, Office Pro 60 or approved equal EA $250.00 I $500.00 $550.00 I $800.00 $1,250.00 I $1,500.00
6. |Dehumidifier, DrizAir 1200 or approved equal EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
7. |Dehumidifier, DrizAir LGR2000 or approved equal EA NO BID NO BID NO BID
8. |Dehumidifier, LGR 7000XLi or approved equal EA $80.00 $330.00 $165.00 $415.00 $355.00 $605.00
. . . OowcCi1811 OowcCi1811 owcisil
9. |Bidder's alternate equipment EA $100 $350.00 $250 $500.00 $575 $825.00
10. Dlscqunt on alternate rental equipment during the contract EA 20% 20% 20%
duration
11. |Mobilization Fee, in any, for 6pm - 6am emergency service. EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
12. |Standard Mobilization Fee EA $250.00 $250.00 $250.00
Required Submittal Checklist Yes
Equipment List Yes
Attachment A - Bid Response Form Yes
Attachment B - Reference Form Yes
Attachment C - Insurance Requirements Form Yes
Attachment D - Addenda Acknowledgement Form Yes
Attachment E - Debarment Form Yes
Attachment F - Drug Free Workplace Certificate Yes
Attachment G - Public Entity Crimes Form Yes
Attachment H - Scrutinized Company Certification Yes
Attachment | - Emergency/Storm Related Catastrophe Agreement Yes
Attachment J - Sealed Bid Mailing Label Yes
Electronic Copy Yes
Original and two (2) copies of packet Yes

14

7

-

PRIMARY
SECONDARY

Vendor(s) Were Notified of Bid
Vendor(s) Submitted Bids
Vendor(s) Did Not Respond

IT IS RECOMMENDED THIS ITB BE AWARDED TO REGIONAL AIR SOLUTIONS, INC., SUNBELT RENTALS, INC., TAMPA BAY TRANE AND UNITED
RENTALS(NORTH AMERICA), INC. AS PRIMARY VENDORS AND COUNTRY COOLING & HEATING INC., REGIONAL AIR SOLUTIONS, INC., SUNBELT
RENTALS, INC., TAMPA BAY TRANE AND UNITED RENTALS (NORTH AMERICA), INC. AS SECONDARY VENDORS HAVING SUBMITTED THE
LOWEST OVERALL AND BEST PRICE MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.

BID TABULATION ONLY. THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.

44;” Cozpan ae?
Date 04.16.20

Jim Carrasco - Procurement Agent

ATTN: SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL. ITB NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER & DESCRIPTION
MUST BE ENTERED ON REQUISITION(S).

Approved by:
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