
Apple Specialties, Inc.

Attn: Gerard Tilton

6 Old Dock Road

Yaphank, NY  11980

Bob Dean Supply, Inc.

Attn: Ashley E. Dean / Randy Proulx

2624 Hanson Street

Fort Myers, FL  33901

Ferguson Enterprises

Attn: PJ Anzalone / Dan Pickard

9350 Laredo Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33918

Global Equipment Company, Inc.

Attn: Christopher Solomon / 

Brittany Garrett

2505 Mill Center Parkway

Buford, GA  30518

Phone:  (631) 886-2160                                                    

Fax:                                               

Email:  CSorny5231@aol.com

Phone:  (239) 332-1131                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  adean@bobdeansupply.com

Phone:  (239) 332-4242                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  wes.mathis@ferguson.com

             

daniel.pickard@ferguson.com

Phone:  (678) 969-6731                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  

bgarrett@globalindustrial.com

ITEM

NO.
MANUFACTURER PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT

1 ACORN 5% NO BID QUOTE TO ORDER
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

2 ACCORN MURDOCK WATER COOLER NO BID NO BID QUOTE TO ORDER
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

3 ALTO-SHAAM NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

4 AMERICAN BRANBY NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 AMERICAN PLUMBER NO BID NO BID 40% NO BID

6 AMERICAN SAW NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL PC-5.11 STEEL PIPE 

COUPLINGS 
NO BID 6.20% QUOTE TO ORDER

10% excluding items already on 

promotion

8
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL STPF-5.11 STEEL PIPE 

FITTINGS 
NO BID 11.70% QUOTE TO ORDER

10% excluding items already on 

promotion

9
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL UAN-1.11 UNIVERSAL 

FORGED STEEL ANVILETS 
NO BID 43.30% QUOTE TO ORDER

10% excluding items already on 

promotion

10

ANVIL INTERNATIONAL SPF .XHPNW-5.11 

XTRA HEAVT STEEL PIPE NIPPLES PNW-5.11 

STEEL PIPE NIPPLES (WELDED) 

NO BID 81.00% QUOTE TO ORDER
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

11
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL SPF .CI-5.11 IMPORT 

CAST IRON THREADED FITTINGS
NO BID 81.00% QUOTE TO ORDER

10% excluding items already on 

promotion

12

ANVIL INTERNATIONAL SPF .XHMI-5.11 XTRA 

HEAVY MALLEABLE IRON; PF.CI-5.11 CAST 

IRON FITTINGS; PF.MI-5.11 MALLEABLE IRON 

FITTING

NO BID 62.10% QUOTE TO ORDER
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

13
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL

SPF. PNW-5.11 IMPORT STEEL PIPE NIPPLES
NO BID 75.00% QUOTE TO ORDER

10% excluding items already on 

promotion

14

ANVIL INTERNATIONAL IMFS-4.11 FORGED 

CARBON STEEL FITTING CSF-4.11 FORGED 

CARBON STEEL FITTINGS 

NO BID 74.10% QUOTE TO ORDER
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

15
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL SPF. DI-8.11 IMPORT 

DUCTILE IRON THREADED FITTINGS
NO BID 75.80% QUOTE TO ORDER

10% excluding items already on 

promotion

Opening Date: Thursday, May 3, 2018 @ 2:00 PM
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16
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL PNS-5.11 STEEL PIPE 

NIPPLES 
NO BID 65.00% QUOTE TO ORDER

10% excluding items already on 

promotion

17
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL SPF. MI-5.11 IMPORT 

MALLEABLE IRON FITTINGS 
NO BID 88.00% QUOTE TO ORDER

10% excluding items already on 

promotion

18 A.O. SMITH NO BID NO BID QUOTE TO ORDER
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

19
BEMIS

NO BID NO BID 47%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

20 BLODGETT NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

21 BRADFORD WHITE WATER HEATERS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

22
BRADLEY EMERGENCY FIXTURES 

NO BID NO BID 35%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

23
BRASS CRAFT WATER SUPPLIES

NO BID NO BID 62% NO BID

24
BRASS CRAFT GAS APPLIANCE 

NO BID NO BID 62% NO BID

25
CAMBRIDGE LEE  COPPER TUBES

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

26
CASH ACME

NO BID NO BID 45%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

27
CENTRAL BRASS

37% NO BID NO BID NO BID

28
CHARLOTTE PIPE FOUNDRY CPVC CTS FTG

NO BID NO BID 88% NO BID

29
CHARLOTTE PIPE FOUNDRY PVC SCH40 FTG

NO BID NO BID 78% NO BID

30
CHARLOTTE PIPE FOUNDRY PVC SCH80 FTG

NO BID NO BID 80% NO BID

31
CHICAGO FAUCET

48% NO BID 45% NO BID

32
CHICAGO

NO BID NO BID 45% NO BID

33 CLEVELAND NO BID NO BID 40% NO BID

34 COPELAND NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

35
DELTA FAUCETS

NO BID NO BID 45%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

36
DELTA PARTS

NO BID NO BID 40%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion
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37
DIXON VALVE & COUPLING

NO BID 47.20% QUOTE TO ORDER NO BID

38
DRAIN-NET RESTAURANT PLUMBING 

SUPPLIES
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

39 EDLUND NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

40
EEMAX

NO BID NO BID 35%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

41
ELKHART

NO BID NO BID 82% NO BID

42
ELKHART TECTITE

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

43 ELKAY BUBBLERS 40% NO BID 45%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

44
ELKAY PARTS

45% NO BID 45%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

45
ELKAY (RESIDENTIAL)

NO BID NO BID 55%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

46
ELKAY FAUCETS & SS SINKS

NO BID NO BID 55%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

47
ELKAY WATER COOLERS

46% NO BID 55%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

48
ERICO HANGERS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

49 EVERPURE NO BID NO BID 40%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

50
FERNCO

NO BID NO BID 75%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

51
FNW VALVES

NO BID NO BID 75% NO BID

52 GARLAND NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

53
GRUNDFOS P ACCESSORIES

NO BID NO BID 50%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

54
GRUNDFOS PUMPS

NO BID NO BID 50%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

55
HALSEY TAYLOR

46% NO BID 50%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

56 HATCO CORP. NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

57 HERCULES CHEMICALS NO BID NO BID 35%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion
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58 HOSHIZAKI NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

59 INSINGER NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

60
INSINKERATON COMMERCIAL

NO BID NO BID QUOTE TO ORDER
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

61 INSINKERATOR NO BID NO BID 44%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

62
JONES STEPHENS

NO BID NO BID QUOTE TO ORDER NO BID

63
KBI IND. CPVC FTGS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

64
KOHLER FAUCETS

NO BID NO BID 43% NO BID

65
KOHLER FIXTURES

NO BID NO BID 43% NO BID

66
KOHLER PARTS

NO BID NO BID 40% NO BID

67
LASCO PVC DWV FTG

NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

68
LASCO PVC SCH40

NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

69
LENNOX TOOLS

NO BID NO BID 40% NO BID

70
McDANIEL CONTROLS, INC.

NO BID 20.00% NO BID NO BID

71
LOCHINVAR

NO BID NO BID QUOTE TO ORDER NO BID

72 MANITOWOC NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

73
MCGUIRE

NO BID NO BID 40% NO BID

74
MERIT BRASS

NO BID Nipples 92%  / Fittings 74% NIPPLES-94% FTGS-62%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

75
MILWAUKEE VALVE CO

CAST STEEL CS0112
NO BID 66.20% 65% NO BID

76

MILWAUKEE VALVE CO

BRONZE-GATE & CHECK #IN0112; IRON-USA 

ASSEMBLED, FIRE PROTECT or OFF SHORE 

#IN0112

NO BID 73.00% 65% NO BID
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77

MILWAUKEE VALVE CO 

1/12 BUTTERBALL, BALL - BRONZE DOM, 

BRASS,  CS20 SER, SS20 SER, BRONZE 3PC, 

CS/SS 30 SER & BRONZE 20 SER - ALL# 

BA0112

NO BID 41.60% 65% NO BID

78
MILWAUKEE VALVE CO

ACTUATION-AC0311
NO BID 4.70% QUOTE TO ORDER NO BID

79
MISSION COUPLING

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

80
MOEN - COMMERCIAL

NO BID NO BID 45% NO BID

81
MOEN FULL LINE

NO BID NO BID 45% NO BID

82
MUELLER COPPER FITTINGS

NO BID NO BID 82%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

83
MUELLER PVC-DWV FITTINGS

NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

84
NIBCO 

NO BID NO BID 65%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

85
NIBCO - DWV FTGS

NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

86
OATEY 

NO BID NO BID 64%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

87
RHEEM WATER HEATERS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

88
RIGID TOOLS

NO BID 15.00% 18%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

89 SALVAJOR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

90
SEXAUER

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

91
SHARKBITE

NO BID NO BID 50%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

92
SLOAN FULL CATALOG

43% NO BID 40%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

93
SLOAN PARTS

51% NO BID 45%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

94
SLOAN REGAL SENSOR &VALVES

43% NO BID NON SNR-58% SENSOR 42%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

95
SLOAN VALVES

46% NO BID 45%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

96
SLOAN VALVE PARTS WLP

51% NO BID 45%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion
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97
SLOAN VALVE REPAIR PARTS CLP

51% NO BID 45%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

98
SPEARS MFG. SUPER SOURCE

NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

99

SPEARS MFG.  SUPER SOURCE Discount codes

004, 016, 017, 020,071, 072, 079, 102, 103, 104, 

108 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 158, 159, 160, 161, 

169, 171 201, 202, 203, 204, 208, 209, 210, 211, 

212,213, 214, 215, 216, 217, 218, 219, 220, 222, 

228, 229 230, 232, 238, 239, 240, 250, 252, 256, 

260, 263 264 270, 272, 273, 274, 276,  280, 

281,289, 290, 295, 296, 297, 298, 299, 470, 496, 

498, 500, 502 510, 512, 514, 520, 522, 524, 530, 

532, 540, 542, 544 550, 552, 554, 559, 600, 601, 

603, 604, 604, 605, 606, 607, 608, 609, 610, 611, 

612, 613, 615 617, 620, 621, 622, 624, 625, 626, 

627, 628, 629, 705 706, 707, 708, 709, 710, 745, 

894, 901, 948 

NO BID 31.00% NO BID NO BID

100

SPEARS MFG.  SUPER SOURCE

011, 015, 029, 030, 031, 032, 042, 044, 049, 050, 

051 060, 061, 070, 076, 086, 096, 100, 101, 120, 

121, 190 192, 195, 196, 197, 200, 361

NO BID 44.80%  NO BID

101

SPEARS MFG.  SUPER SOURCE 

019, 024, 025, 026, 034, 035, 041, 047, 055, 084, 

085 091, 097, 140, 143, 300, 301, 310, 319, 320, 

329, 330 339, 340, 350, 360, 370, 380, 390, 400, 

430, 432

NO BID 37.90% NO BID NO BID

102 SPEARS MFG. SUPER SOURCE  040, 043, 046 NO BID 68.70% NO BID NO BID

103 SPEARS MFG. SUPER SOURCE 045 NO BID 24.10% NO BID NO BID

104
SPEARS MFG.  SUPER SOURCE 039, .64, .65, 

066, 623
NO BID 3.90% NO BID NO BID

105 SPEARS MFG.  SUPER SOURCE  052 NO BID 58.60% NO BID NO BID

106 SPEARS MFG. SUPER SOURCE  080, 090 NO BID 75.20% NO BID NO BID

107 SPEARS MFG. SUPER SOURCE  081, 083 NO BID 55.30% NO BID NO BID

108 STATE WATER HEATERS NO BID NO BID 50% NO BID
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109
SYMMONS  FULL LINE

40% NO BID 40% NO BID

110
T & S BRASS FAUCETS

46% NO BID 45%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

111 TRAULSEN NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

112
US FOUNDRY STORM WATER DRAINAGE 

MATERIALS
NO BID NO BID 35% NO BID

113
VIEGA

NO BID NO BID 53% NO BID

114 VULCAN NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

115
WARD GALV. FITTINGS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

116
WARD MAL. FITTINGS

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

117
WARD NIPPLES

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

118
WATTS

NO BID NO BID 40% NO BID

119
WHITLAM

NO BID NO BID 45% NO BID

120
WILKINS

NO BID NO BID 65%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

121 WITTCO NO BID NO BID NO BID
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

122
WOODFORD

NO BID NO BID 40% NO BID

123
ZURN CHINA

NO BID NO BID 40%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

124
ZURN FAUCETS

NO BID NO BID 40%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

125
ZURN PARTS

NO BID NO BID 35%
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

126 BOL - BALANCE OF LINE
10% excluding items already on 

promotion

List Websites to Review Product 

Specifications:
See Exhibit A Page for List www.globalindustrial.com

Referral Submittal Checklist Yes Yes Yes Yes
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Attachment A- BID RESPONSE FORM PROPERLY 

SIGNED
Yes Yes Yes Yes

Attachment B - REFERENCES FORM Yes Yes Yes Yes

Attachment C - INSURANCE FORM SIGNED & 

SUBMITTED
Yes Yes Yes Yes

Attachment D- ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 

FORM SIGNED & SUBMITTED
Yes Yes Yes Yes

Attachment E - DEBARMENT FORM SIGNED Yes Yes Yes Yes

Attachment F - DRUG FREE WORKPLACE 

CERTIFICATE
Yes Yes Yes Yes

Attachment G - PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES FORM 

COMPLETED AND NOTARIZED
Yes Yes Yes Yes

Attachment H - BIDDERS STATEMENT OF 

PRINCIPAL PLACE OF BUSINESS
Yes Yes Yes Yes

Attachment I - WARRANTY FORM Yes Yes Yes Yes

Attachment J - SEALED BID LABEL Yes Yes Yes Yes

ELECTRONIC COPY OF BID SUBMITTAL Yes Yes Yes Yes

ORGINAL AND ONE COPY OF BID Yes Yes Yes Yes

ONE COPY OF EACH CATALOG SUPPORTED No No No No
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ITEM

NO.
MANUFACTURER

1 ACORN

2 ACCORN MURDOCK WATER COOLER

3 ALTO-SHAAM

4 AMERICAN BRANBY

5 AMERICAN PLUMBER

6 AMERICAN SAW

7
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL PC-5.11 STEEL PIPE 

COUPLINGS 

8
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL STPF-5.11 STEEL PIPE 

FITTINGS 

9
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL UAN-1.11 UNIVERSAL 

FORGED STEEL ANVILETS 

10

ANVIL INTERNATIONAL SPF .XHPNW-5.11 

XTRA HEAVT STEEL PIPE NIPPLES PNW-5.11 

STEEL PIPE NIPPLES (WELDED) 

11
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL SPF .CI-5.11 IMPORT 

CAST IRON THREADED FITTINGS

12

ANVIL INTERNATIONAL SPF .XHMI-5.11 XTRA 

HEAVY MALLEABLE IRON; PF.CI-5.11 CAST 

IRON FITTINGS; PF.MI-5.11 MALLEABLE IRON 

FITTING

13
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL

SPF. PNW-5.11 IMPORT STEEL PIPE NIPPLES

14

ANVIL INTERNATIONAL IMFS-4.11 FORGED 

CARBON STEEL FITTING CSF-4.11 FORGED 

CARBON STEEL FITTINGS 

15
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL SPF. DI-8.11 IMPORT 

DUCTILE IRON THREADED FITTINGS

Opening Date: Thursday, May 3, 2018 @ 2:00 PM

The School District of Lee County

 Department of Procurement Services

2855 Colonial Blvd., Fort Myers, Florida  33966-1012

Attachment A                                                                 

Plumbing Parts and Supplies                                  

B187327JC             

Gorman Company

Attn: Rick Westrem / Debbie Turner

2235 Palm Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33916

Heritage Food Service Group, Inc.

Attn: Tari Kovets / Amanda Lewis

5130 Executive Boulevard

Fort Wayne, IN  46808

Palm Beach Plumbing Parts

Attn: Richard Lawrence / Tom Wade

3588 Evans Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33901

Phone:  (239) 334-1375                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  Rwestrem@Hajoca.com

            Debbie-Turner@Hajoca.com

Phone:  (800) 458-5593                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  ContractServices@hfse.com

Phone:  (239) 277-7201                                                                 

Fax:                                                

Email:  

Fmsales@PBPlumbingParts.com

            Sale@PBPlumbingParts.com

PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT

40% NO BID

40% NO BID

NO BID 42%

40% NO BID

40% NO BID

40% NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
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Opening Date: Thursday, May 3, 2018 @ 2:00 PM

The School District of Lee County

 Department of Procurement Services

2855 Colonial Blvd., Fort Myers, Florida  33966-1012

Attachment A                                                                 

Plumbing Parts and Supplies                                  

B187327JC             

16
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL PNS-5.11 STEEL PIPE 

NIPPLES 

17
ANVIL INTERNATIONAL SPF. MI-5.11 IMPORT 

MALLEABLE IRON FITTINGS 

18 A.O. SMITH

19
BEMIS

20 BLODGETT

21 BRADFORD WHITE WATER HEATERS

22
BRADLEY EMERGENCY FIXTURES 

23
BRASS CRAFT WATER SUPPLIES

24
BRASS CRAFT GAS APPLIANCE 

25
CAMBRIDGE LEE  COPPER TUBES

26
CASH ACME

27
CENTRAL BRASS

28
CHARLOTTE PIPE FOUNDRY CPVC CTS FTG

29
CHARLOTTE PIPE FOUNDRY PVC SCH40 FTG

30
CHARLOTTE PIPE FOUNDRY PVC SCH80 FTG

31
CHICAGO FAUCET

32
CHICAGO

33 CLEVELAND

34 COPELAND

35
DELTA FAUCETS

36
DELTA PARTS

Gorman Company

Attn: Rick Westrem / Debbie Turner

2235 Palm Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33916

Heritage Food Service Group, Inc.

Attn: Tari Kovets / Amanda Lewis

5130 Executive Boulevard

Fort Wayne, IN  46808

Palm Beach Plumbing Parts

Attn: Richard Lawrence / Tom Wade

3588 Evans Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33901

Phone:  (239) 334-1375                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  Rwestrem@Hajoca.com

            Debbie-Turner@Hajoca.com

Phone:  (800) 458-5593                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  ContractServices@hfse.com

Phone:  (239) 277-7201                                                                 

Fax:                                                

Email:  

Fmsales@PBPlumbingParts.com

            Sale@PBPlumbingParts.com

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID 24%

40% NO BID

NO BID 42%

NO BID NO BID

30% NO BID

40% NO BID

40% NO BID

50% NO BID

45% NO BID

NO BID NO BID

60% NO BID

10% NO BID

10% NO BID

35% 18%

40% NO BID

40% 42%

NO BID NO BID

40% NO BID

40% NO BID
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Opening Date: Thursday, May 3, 2018 @ 2:00 PM

The School District of Lee County

 Department of Procurement Services

2855 Colonial Blvd., Fort Myers, Florida  33966-1012

Attachment A                                                                 

Plumbing Parts and Supplies                                  

B187327JC             

37
DIXON VALVE & COUPLING

38
DRAIN-NET RESTAURANT PLUMBING 

SUPPLIES

39 EDLUND

40
EEMAX

41
ELKHART

42
ELKHART TECTITE

43 ELKAY BUBBLERS

44
ELKAY PARTS

45
ELKAY (RESIDENTIAL)

46
ELKAY FAUCETS & SS SINKS

47
ELKAY WATER COOLERS

48
ERICO HANGERS

49 EVERPURE

50
FERNCO

51
FNW VALVES

52 GARLAND

53
GRUNDFOS P ACCESSORIES

54
GRUNDFOS PUMPS

55
HALSEY TAYLOR

56 HATCO CORP.

57 HERCULES CHEMICALS

Gorman Company

Attn: Rick Westrem / Debbie Turner

2235 Palm Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33916

Heritage Food Service Group, Inc.

Attn: Tari Kovets / Amanda Lewis

5130 Executive Boulevard

Fort Wayne, IN  46808

Palm Beach Plumbing Parts

Attn: Richard Lawrence / Tom Wade

3588 Evans Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33901

Phone:  (239) 334-1375                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  Rwestrem@Hajoca.com

            Debbie-Turner@Hajoca.com

Phone:  (800) 458-5593                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  ContractServices@hfse.com

Phone:  (239) 277-7201                                                                 

Fax:                                                

Email:  

Fmsales@PBPlumbingParts.com

            Sale@PBPlumbingParts.com

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID 42%

38% NO BID

50% NO BID

50% NO BID

40% NO BID

40% NO BID

40% 22%

40% NO BID

40% NO BID

NO BID NO BID

30% 45%

55% NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID 42%

45% NO BID

45% NO BID

40% 22%

NO BID 42%

40% NO BID
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The School District of Lee County

 Department of Procurement Services

2855 Colonial Blvd., Fort Myers, Florida  33966-1012

Attachment A                                                                 

Plumbing Parts and Supplies                                  

B187327JC             

58 HOSHIZAKI

59 INSINGER

60
INSINKERATON COMMERCIAL

61 INSINKERATOR

62
JONES STEPHENS

63
KBI IND. CPVC FTGS

64
KOHLER FAUCETS

65
KOHLER FIXTURES

66
KOHLER PARTS

67
LASCO PVC DWV FTG

68
LASCO PVC SCH40

69
LENNOX TOOLS

70
McDANIEL CONTROLS, INC.

71
LOCHINVAR

72 MANITOWOC

73
MCGUIRE

74
MERIT BRASS

75
MILWAUKEE VALVE CO

CAST STEEL CS0112

76

MILWAUKEE VALVE CO

BRONZE-GATE & CHECK #IN0112; IRON-USA 

ASSEMBLED, FIRE PROTECT or OFF SHORE 

#IN0112

Gorman Company

Attn: Rick Westrem / Debbie Turner

2235 Palm Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33916

Heritage Food Service Group, Inc.

Attn: Tari Kovets / Amanda Lewis

5130 Executive Boulevard

Fort Wayne, IN  46808

Palm Beach Plumbing Parts

Attn: Richard Lawrence / Tom Wade

3588 Evans Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33901

Phone:  (239) 334-1375                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  Rwestrem@Hajoca.com

            Debbie-Turner@Hajoca.com

Phone:  (800) 458-5593                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  ContractServices@hfse.com

Phone:  (239) 277-7201                                                                 

Fax:                                                

Email:  

Fmsales@PBPlumbingParts.com

            Sale@PBPlumbingParts.com

NO BID 25% PARTS    43% EQUIP

NO BID 42%

40% 39%

40% NO BID

45% NO BID

NO BID NO BID

40% NO BID

40% NO BID

40% NO BID

60% NO BID

55% NO BID

35% NO BID

NO BID NO BID

10% 12%

NO BID 42%

45% NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
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Opening Date: Thursday, May 3, 2018 @ 2:00 PM

The School District of Lee County

 Department of Procurement Services

2855 Colonial Blvd., Fort Myers, Florida  33966-1012

Attachment A                                                                 

Plumbing Parts and Supplies                                  

B187327JC             

77

MILWAUKEE VALVE CO 

1/12 BUTTERBALL, BALL - BRONZE DOM, 

BRASS,  CS20 SER, SS20 SER, BRONZE 3PC, 

CS/SS 30 SER & BRONZE 20 SER - ALL# 

BA0112

78
MILWAUKEE VALVE CO

ACTUATION-AC0311

79
MISSION COUPLING

80
MOEN - COMMERCIAL

81
MOEN FULL LINE

82
MUELLER COPPER FITTINGS

83
MUELLER PVC-DWV FITTINGS

84
NIBCO 

85
NIBCO - DWV FTGS

86
OATEY 

87
RHEEM WATER HEATERS

88
RIGID TOOLS

89 SALVAJOR 

90
SEXAUER

91
SHARKBITE

92
SLOAN FULL CATALOG

93
SLOAN PARTS

94
SLOAN REGAL SENSOR &VALVES

95
SLOAN VALVES

96
SLOAN VALVE PARTS WLP

Gorman Company

Attn: Rick Westrem / Debbie Turner

2235 Palm Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33916

Heritage Food Service Group, Inc.

Attn: Tari Kovets / Amanda Lewis

5130 Executive Boulevard

Fort Wayne, IN  46808

Palm Beach Plumbing Parts

Attn: Richard Lawrence / Tom Wade

3588 Evans Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33901

Phone:  (239) 334-1375                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  Rwestrem@Hajoca.com

            Debbie-Turner@Hajoca.com

Phone:  (800) 458-5593                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  ContractServices@hfse.com

Phone:  (239) 277-7201                                                                 

Fax:                                                

Email:  

Fmsales@PBPlumbingParts.com

            Sale@PBPlumbingParts.com

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

60% NO BID

45% NO BID

45% NO BID

55% NO BID

60% NO BID

40% NO BID

60% NO BID

40% NO BID

30% NO BID

20% NO BID

NO BID 42%

NO BID NO BID

40% NO BID

45% NO BID

45% NO BID

45% NO BID

45% NO BID

45% NO BID
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Opening Date: Thursday, May 3, 2018 @ 2:00 PM

The School District of Lee County

 Department of Procurement Services

2855 Colonial Blvd., Fort Myers, Florida  33966-1012

Attachment A                                                                 

Plumbing Parts and Supplies                                  

B187327JC             

97
SLOAN VALVE REPAIR PARTS CLP

98
SPEARS MFG. SUPER SOURCE

99

SPEARS MFG.  SUPER SOURCE Discount codes

004, 016, 017, 020,071, 072, 079, 102, 103, 104, 

108 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 158, 159, 160, 161, 

169, 171 201, 202, 203, 204, 208, 209, 210, 211, 

212,213, 214, 215, 216, 217, 218, 219, 220, 222, 

228, 229 230, 232, 238, 239, 240, 250, 252, 256, 

260, 263 264 270, 272, 273, 274, 276,  280, 

281,289, 290, 295, 296, 297, 298, 299, 470, 496, 

498, 500, 502 510, 512, 514, 520, 522, 524, 530, 

532, 540, 542, 544 550, 552, 554, 559, 600, 601, 

603, 604, 604, 605, 606, 607, 608, 609, 610, 611, 

612, 613, 615 617, 620, 621, 622, 624, 625, 626, 

627, 628, 629, 705 706, 707, 708, 709, 710, 745, 

894, 901, 948 

100

SPEARS MFG.  SUPER SOURCE

011, 015, 029, 030, 031, 032, 042, 044, 049, 050, 

051 060, 061, 070, 076, 086, 096, 100, 101, 120, 

121, 190 192, 195, 196, 197, 200, 361

101

SPEARS MFG.  SUPER SOURCE 

019, 024, 025, 026, 034, 035, 041, 047, 055, 084, 

085 091, 097, 140, 143, 300, 301, 310, 319, 320, 

329, 330 339, 340, 350, 360, 370, 380, 390, 400, 

430, 432

102 SPEARS MFG. SUPER SOURCE  040, 043, 046

103 SPEARS MFG. SUPER SOURCE 045

104
SPEARS MFG.  SUPER SOURCE 039, .64, .65, 

066, 623

105 SPEARS MFG.  SUPER SOURCE  052

106 SPEARS MFG. SUPER SOURCE  080, 090

107 SPEARS MFG. SUPER SOURCE  081, 083

108 STATE WATER HEATERS

Gorman Company

Attn: Rick Westrem / Debbie Turner

2235 Palm Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33916

Heritage Food Service Group, Inc.

Attn: Tari Kovets / Amanda Lewis

5130 Executive Boulevard

Fort Wayne, IN  46808

Palm Beach Plumbing Parts

Attn: Richard Lawrence / Tom Wade

3588 Evans Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33901

Phone:  (239) 334-1375                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  Rwestrem@Hajoca.com

            Debbie-Turner@Hajoca.com

Phone:  (800) 458-5593                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  ContractServices@hfse.com

Phone:  (239) 277-7201                                                                 

Fax:                                                

Email:  

Fmsales@PBPlumbingParts.com

            Sale@PBPlumbingParts.com

45% NO BID

NO BID NO BID

30% NO BID

30% NO BID

30% NO BID

30% NO BID

30% NO BID

30% NO BID

30% NO BID

30% NO BID

30% NO BID

NO BID NO BID
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The School District of Lee County

 Department of Procurement Services

2855 Colonial Blvd., Fort Myers, Florida  33966-1012

Attachment A                                                                 

Plumbing Parts and Supplies                                  

B187327JC             

109
SYMMONS  FULL LINE

110
T & S BRASS FAUCETS

111 TRAULSEN

112
US FOUNDRY STORM WATER DRAINAGE 

MATERIALS

113
VIEGA

114 VULCAN

115
WARD GALV. FITTINGS

116
WARD MAL. FITTINGS

117
WARD NIPPLES

118
WATTS

119
WHITLAM

120
WILKINS

121 WITTCO

122
WOODFORD

123
ZURN CHINA

124
ZURN FAUCETS

125
ZURN PARTS

126 BOL - BALANCE OF LINE

List Websites to Review Product 

Specifications:

Referral Submittal Checklist

Gorman Company

Attn: Rick Westrem / Debbie Turner

2235 Palm Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33916

Heritage Food Service Group, Inc.

Attn: Tari Kovets / Amanda Lewis

5130 Executive Boulevard

Fort Wayne, IN  46808

Palm Beach Plumbing Parts

Attn: Richard Lawrence / Tom Wade

3588 Evans Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33901

Phone:  (239) 334-1375                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  Rwestrem@Hajoca.com

            Debbie-Turner@Hajoca.com

Phone:  (800) 458-5593                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  ContractServices@hfse.com

Phone:  (239) 277-7201                                                                 

Fax:                                                

Email:  

Fmsales@PBPlumbingParts.com

            Sale@PBPlumbingParts.com

40% NO BID

42% 45%

NO BID 42%

NO BID NO BID

45% NO BID

NO BID 29%

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

40% NO BID

40% NO BID

40% NO BID

NO BID 18%

38% NO BID

40% NO BID

40% NO BID

40% NO BID

0-45%

www.heritageparts.com

Yes Yes
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Opening Date: Thursday, May 3, 2018 @ 2:00 PM

The School District of Lee County

 Department of Procurement Services

2855 Colonial Blvd., Fort Myers, Florida  33966-1012
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Plumbing Parts and Supplies                                  

B187327JC             

Attachment A- BID RESPONSE FORM PROPERLY 

SIGNED

Attachment B - REFERENCES FORM

Attachment C - INSURANCE FORM SIGNED & 

SUBMITTED

Attachment D- ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 

FORM SIGNED & SUBMITTED

Attachment E - DEBARMENT FORM SIGNED

Attachment F - DRUG FREE WORKPLACE 

CERTIFICATE

Attachment G - PUBLIC ENTITY CRIMES FORM 

COMPLETED AND NOTARIZED

Attachment H - BIDDERS STATEMENT OF 

PRINCIPAL PLACE OF BUSINESS

Attachment I - WARRANTY FORM

Attachment J - SEALED BID LABEL

ELECTRONIC COPY OF BID SUBMITTAL

ORGINAL AND ONE COPY OF BID

ONE COPY OF EACH CATALOG SUPPORTED

Gorman Company

Attn: Rick Westrem / Debbie Turner

2235 Palm Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33916

Heritage Food Service Group, Inc.

Attn: Tari Kovets / Amanda Lewis

5130 Executive Boulevard

Fort Wayne, IN  46808

Palm Beach Plumbing Parts

Attn: Richard Lawrence / Tom Wade

3588 Evans Avenue

Fort Myers, FL  33901

Phone:  (239) 334-1375                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  Rwestrem@Hajoca.com

            Debbie-Turner@Hajoca.com

Phone:  (800) 458-5593                                                                

Fax:                                                

Email:  ContractServices@hfse.com

Phone:  (239) 277-7201                                                                 

Fax:                                                

Email:  

Fmsales@PBPlumbingParts.com

            Sale@PBPlumbingParts.com

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

Yes Yes 

Yes Yes  

Yes Yes  

No Yes  

Original Only Yes  

No No

44 Vendor(s) Were Notified of Bid

7 Vendor(s) Submitted Bids

37 Vendor(s) Did Not Respond 

APPROVED BY: Date: 05.21.18

Jim Carrasco - Procurement Agent

BID TABULATION ONLY.  THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.

ATTN:  SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL. BID NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER & DESCRIPTION MUST BE ENTERED ON REQUISITION(S).

IT IS RECOMMENDED THIS BID BE AWARDED TO APPLE SPECIALTIES, INC., BOB DEAN SUPPLY, INC., FERGUSON 

ENTERPRISES, GLOBAL EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC., GORMAN COMPANY, HERTIAGE FOOD SERVICES GROUP, INC. 

AND PALM BEACH PLUMBING PARTS HAVING SUBMITTED THE  LOWEST OVERALL AND BEST RESPONSE MEETING 

SPECIFICATIONS.
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