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FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966 Tampa, FL 33605 elle Glade, FL 33430 Orlando, FL 32806 jorth Fort Myers, FL 33918 ort Pierce, FL 34950 Lehigh Acren, FL 330711555 Fort Myers, FL 33916
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS Phone: 813-248-1044 Phone: 561-996-2787 Phone: 800-785-6397 Phone: 800-872-9185 Phone: 772-461-2300 Phone: 877-770-7670 Phone: 239-334-1000
BID NO. B187333RC Fax: Fax: 561-992-9156 Fax: Fax: 239-995-0845 Fax: 772-595-0843 Fax: 877-770-7670 Fax:
UPDATED: November 7, 2021 Email: larry.mcg: om Email: j; om Email: tonyflal@aol.com Email: i i @gmail.com Email: shennin@palmdalec om Email: stevem@prevmaintfl.com Email:
ITEM BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND
NO. DESCRIPTION uom DID NOT RENEW NUMBER PRICE NUMBER PRICE NUMBER PRICE DID NOT RENEW NUMBER PRICE NUMBER PRICE
MOTOR OIL: 15W-40 KAPPA PREMIUM Total Rubia Optima 1100 § Mag1 Synthetic Blend 15w40
1.a |OR APPROVED EQUAL -BULK 250 GAL. giﬁ%f" 15W40 $5.85 | Lubriguard HD 15WAOCK4 | $5.88 ""'::v';::’c:;"’"e s::o NO BID CK-4 HDDEO / MAG-SB- $5.55 NO BID NO BID
MINIMUM-TANK LOTS . 202150 - 15W40-000
1 :
. Mag1 Synthetic Blend 15w40
Total Rubia Optima 1100 I
MOTOR OIL: 15W-40 KAPPAPREMIUM |PRICE PER ) 1 UltraGuard Amalie 55 CK-4 HDDEO / MAG-SB-
$6:30 g 6.19 NO BID $6:33 NO BID NO BID
1-b | OR APPROVED EQUAL - 55 GAL. DRUM |GALLON: 21:2“1:2 Lubriguard HD 1SW40 Cic4 | 15W40CK4D $7.20 15W40-055
: *quoted 55 gal barrel $348.00
MOTOR OIL: 15W-40 KAPPA PREMIUM Total Rubia Optima 1100 § Mag1 Synthetic Blend 15w40
1.c |OR APPROVED EQUAL - 1 GALLON giﬁ%’;ﬁk 15W40 $1223 | Lubriguard HD 15W40 CK-4 | $10.40 u.‘,::wu::::;ane s::o NO BID CK-4 HDDEO / MAG-SB- $8.86 NO BID NO BID
CONTAINER . 202152 - 15W40-003
Total Rubia Optima 1100 1 1 1 Mag1 Synthetic Blend 15w40
MOTOR OIL: 15W-40 KAPPA PREMIUM  |PRICE PER UltraGuard Am;
1.d 15W40 $3.08 Lubriguard HD 15W40 CK-4 $294 | I $2.50 I NO BID CK-4 HDDEO / MAG-SB- $235 NO BID NO BID
OR APPROVED EQUAL QUART: 202153 : 15wa0ckQ : : oWa0.006
MOTOR OIL: 5W-40 FULL SYNTHETIC Total Rubia Optima 1100
OIL FORD SPEC WSS-M2C171-F1 CJ-4 |PRICE PER ) UltraGuard Petro Canada 842 Magl Full Synthetic 5w40
K $14.50 10.75 NO BID $9.65 NO BID NO BID
1-€ | OR APPROVED EQUAL BULK 250 GAL. |GALLON: 21:2“1:2 Lubriguard HD FS 5W40 | §: SWA4OFSHDB $15.50 HDDEO / MAG-SYN-5W40-000
MINIMUM-TANK LOTS
MOTOR OIL: 5W-40 FULL SYNTHETIC Total Rubia Optima 1100 !
1.f |OIL FORD SPEC WSS-M2C171-F1 CJ-4 ZRAREOZFR 15W40 $14.50 |  Lubriguard HD FS 5W40 $11.15 ”'"’5::;:0:::::“"’3 si'::o NO BID HD’:I)zgllF:I:IK\SGV';‘V.‘:';;VS;ASSS $10.65 NO BID NO BID
OR APPROVED EQUAL 55 GAL. DRUM : 202155 § ST
MOTOR OIL: 5W-40 FULL SYNTHETIC -
OIL FORD SPEC WSS-M2C171-F1 CJ-4 |PRICE PER Total Rubla Optima 1100 UltraGuard Petro Canada 842 Mag1 Full Synthetic 5w40
- b $15.35 i 19.2: NO BID $16.83 NO BID NO BID
1-9 | or APPROVED EQUAL 1 GALLON GALLON: 21:2“;:2 Lubriguard HD FS 5W40 s1923 5WA4OFSHDG $15.50 HDDEO / MAG-SYN-5W40-003
CONTAINER
MOTOR OIL: 5W-40 FULL SYNTHETIC 1 1 1 _
1.h |OIL FORD SPEC WSS-M2C171-F1 CJ4 gﬁ'::T'_’ER NO BID NO BID 1 ”"'35:‘;':;‘;:;;3“"3 I ss00 | NO BID HD";ig‘/‘,‘:':G"';‘V";';N‘;‘g“ 8475 NO BID NO BID
OR APPROVED EQUAL : ! ! | -SYN-SWa0-
Total Transmission MDL NA 1 UltraGuard Santex el
2.a |GEAR LUBRICANT: GL 5 35 # PAIL PRICE PER 85W140 $1.48 Lubriguard 85W140GL-5 |  $1.26 85W140P L2 NO BID Total Transmission MDL $1.34 NO BID NO BID
POUND: H $2.75 85w140 / 181992-154
181992 MIL-1-2105C
t
Total Transmission MDL NA UltraGuard Santex
GEAR LUBRICANT: GL 5120 #DRUM  |PRICE PER [ 134 Total Transmission MDL
2.b |, 85W140 $1.63 Lubriguard 85W140 GL-5 | $1.41 85W140D120 NO BID $1.65 NO BID NO BID
‘Supersedes MIL-1-2105C POUND: 185382 1 MIL-1-2105C $2.84 85w140 / 185382-120
Total Transmission MDL NA
PRICE PER UltraGuard Santex Total Transmission MDL
. B . i -t 1.04 1.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2.c |GEAR LUBRICANT: GL5400#DRUM |0 slsa\f;:;) $1.08 | Lubriguard 85W1406L5 | § ‘S 1400400 $ S5w140/ 181993055 RES
PRICE PER Total Multis Complex ET Moly . X 1 UltraGuard Pure Guard 143 Total Multis Complex ET 2
3 x 2.2 NO BID ! NO BID NO BID
3.a |CHASSIS LUBRICANT: TUBE TUBE: Sagen $2.84 | Lubriguard Hi-Temp Grease : $2.20 reMPTOBEGH e Mioly / 184954.265 $2.63
T
PRICE PER Total Multis Complex ET Moly . ) I UltraGuard Pure Guard $1.46 Total Multis Complex ET 2
. B . . 3 2.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.b |CHASSIS LUBRICANT: 250r 35 #PAIL. |50 Ao 185235 $3.04 | Lubriguard Hi-Temp Grease IL $ e e 6296 Moly / 185235.154 $2:65
I
PRICE PER Total Multis Complex ET Moly . X 1 UltraGuard Pure Guard 27 Total Multis Complex ET 2
X H 5 2.28 NO BID N NO BID NO BID
3.c |CHASSIS LUBRICANT: 120 # DRUM POUND: s $3.00 | Lubriguard HiTemp Grease | § PR, oy Moly/ 185234120 $2.68
i
1
PRICE PER Total Multis Complex ET Moly N " 1 UltraGuard Pure Guard 145 Total Multis Complex ET 2
X B X 3 2.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3.d |CHASSIS LUBRICANT: 400 # DRUM POUND: 304206 $283 | Lubriguard Hi-Temp Grease | $ et ooe] 295 Moly / 185236-055 $z48
PRICE PER Total Multis Complex EP NA N N UltraGuard Pure Guard 17 Total Multis Complex ET 2/
: x 2.2 NO BID K NO BID NO BID
4 |WHEEL BEARING GREASE: 120 # DRUM | S\ P $258 | Lubriguard Hi-Temp Grease | $2.28 P, oo pPe $2.25
1
AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID, ; 1 .
5.a |SYNTHETIC, TRANSYND OR APPROVED ZRAREOZFR Shell 5‘;‘;’;::021': A5 | agea Lubriguard HD FS ATF : $26.45 ”'":‘T;:;;: :;:m s:so NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
[EQUAL - 1 GALLON CONTAINER : ! !
I
T
1
AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID 725 Total Fluidmatic MV - Meets
§ hell Spi ATF 2! | i
5.b |SYNTHETIC, TRANSYND OR APPROVED giﬁ%’;ﬁk Shel 5:;:;2268 95 $28.89 Coastal FSMVATF | $8.10 ""':‘Ti::;:é’;‘a"e $8.50 gal NO BID or exceeds Allison TES 205 / |  $15.72 NO BID NO BID
EQUAL - 55 GAL. DRUM : I $467.50/Drum 188346-055
= 1
t
AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID, ! Total Fluidmatic MV - meets
SYNTHETIC, TRANSYND OR APPROVED | PRICE PER Shell Spirax 56 ATF 295 1 UltraGuard Amalie 725 :
S $24.50 7.65. NO BID $15.72. NO BID NO BID
5 |EQUAL - BULK 250 GAL. MIN. TANK GALLON: 550032968 Coastal FSMVATE | § ATF295FSB $8.75 or exceeds Allison TES295/
e 1 188346-000
LoTs
1
ANTIWEAR HYDRAULIC FLUID- ISO
VISCOSITY GRADE 68, FINAHYDRON | PRICE PER Total Azolla Z5 Plus AW6S . ) UltraGuard Amalie 425 Mag 1 AW 68 Hydraulic Oil /
$4.94 .1 NO BID $4.95 NO BID NO BID
6 |OR APPROVED EQUAL -55 GALLON  |GALLON: 182259 Lubriguard Hydraulic AW €8 |~ $5.19 HYDRAW68D $5.75 MAG-AW68-055
DRUM.
Johnsen's Power Steering
POWER STEERING FLUID: ROCKFORD- |PRICE PER " § UltraGuard Amalie Mag1 Power Steering Fluid /
$3.20 X % BID s286 NO BID
7 |npsk (L-4338-A) OR APPROVED EQUAL. | QUART: 4;‘:)':1 § = el Johnsen's 4610 Q sa17 NOBI MAG-PSF-006 o NOBID
ANTIFREEZE: EXTENDED LIFE, 50/50 ! ] . Rudson - Diesel Heavy Duty
hell Rotella ELC Pre-Dils I ‘Amalie Proshiel KOST Defe 1 HD EL(
8.2 |CONCENTRATE e R shellRotella FLCPreDilted | ss.00 |  prestonemoecso/so | 675 |V "a:“::s':lzgi';so’/‘; ield $11.50 NO BID osT bete /":;03694535"/ 0| se0r Antifreeze 50/50 $827 NO BID
1 GALLON CONTAINER : H#AFC0301
1
ANTIFREEZE: EXTENDED LIFE, 50/50 ; 1 ) . 555 Rudson - Diesel Heavy Duty
hell Rotella ELC Pre-Dilt . KOST Defe | HD EL(
8.b |CONCENTRATE e R e s " | 8943 | prestonerpeicso/so | sez0 [ UNERSMATEIHONE | 6705501 Gly-Cool HD Ext.Life sea0 | S A::/":;msos‘:"/ 01 35 Antifreeze 50/50 $8.10 NO BID
55 GALLON DRUM : : $387.75/Drum #AFC0355
L
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PETROLEUM PRODUCTS Phone: 813-248-1044 Phone: 561-996-2787 Phone: 800-785-6397 Phone: 800-872-9185 Phone: 772-461-2300 Phone: 877-770-7670 Phone: 239-334-1000
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ITEM BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND BRAND NAME AND
NO. DESCRIPTION uom DID NOT RENEW NUMBER PRICE NUMBER PRICE NUMBER PRICE DID NOT RENEW NUMBER PRICE NUMBER PRICE
DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF): 32.5% o 116
9.a |UREA, 67.5% DE-IONIZED WATER. giﬁ%’;ﬁk ;’9’:;3;'5 $2.09 Ultrapure DEF 157 ”"“G;:;::::""'“ $1.75 NO BID YARA BULK DEF / DEF-000 $1a7 NO BID NO BID
275 GALLON TANKS ONSITE ¢ $1.82
DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF): 32.5% .
0. |UREA,67.5% DEJONIZED WATER, R Temar 22 | e NO BID Vtracuard mrenniag s7.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 GALLON CONTAINER :
ALTERNATE PRODUCTS. A SAMPLE IS .
10 |REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE | ICE PER Non Chlor Brake Cleaner | $5:00 UttraGuard Amalie as shown
DATE GALLON: 15W40CK4
ALTERNATE PRODUCTS. A SAMPLE IS
11 |REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE | ICE PER UltraGuard Petro Canada as shown
DATE GALLON: 5W40 Full Syn
ALTERNATE PRODUCTS. A SAMPLE IS UltraGuard Amalie
12 |REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE | PRICE PFR Full Syn ATF as shown
GALLON:
DATE 295 type
ALTERNATE PRODUCTS. A SAMPLE IS y
12.a |REQUIRED NO LATER THAN BID DUE UttraGuard Amalie as shown % 0 %
AW68 Hyd
DATE
13 |BALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT % % % % % % NO BID
Required Checklist Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID
A - Proposal Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID
Attachment B - Reference Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID
C- i Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID
D - Addenda Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID
E-D Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID
F - Drug Free Workplace Certificate Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID
G - Public Entity Crimes Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID
H - Bidder's of Principal Place of Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID
I- Warranty Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID
mec‘m"ic copy of the bid Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NOBID
[(1) Original and (3) copies of bid Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes NO BID
Vendor(s) Were Notified of Bid = PRIMARY
T T = seconpary

Vendor(s) Returned a NO BID

18
6 Vendor(s) Submitted Bids
1

u

Vendor(s) Did Not Respond

PER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THIS ITB, IT IS RECOMMENDED THIS BID BE AWARDED TO

BEST LINE OIL COMPANY, INC., HOWELL OIL

CCOMPANY,INC., NEWSOM OIL COMPANY AND PALMDALE OIL COMPANY MEETING SPECIFICATIONS AT THE LOWEST COST AND THE BEST VALUE TO THE

DISTRICT.

APPROVED BY:

/MKQ Cr’(,\)»«.;.

DATE:

3-May-18

RICHARD COWIE
PROCUREMENT AGENT

BID TABULATION ONLY. THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER.

ATTN: SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL. BID NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER &
DESCRIPTION MUST BE ENTERED ON REQUISITION(S).
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