THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY

DEPARTMENT OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2855 COLONIAL BLVD.
FORT MYERS, FLORIDA 33966

Agni Enterprises, LLC
dibla Head to Heels Safety Supplies
Atin: Subbarayan R. Pochi
7950 NW 155th Street, Suite 103
Miami Lakes, FL 33016

Al Florida Paper
Altn: Mario Vale
9150 NW 105th Way
Miami, FL 33178

Imperial Dade
Atin: Vickie Scaglione
9601 NW 112th Avenue
Miami, FL 33178

Pyramid School Products
Atn: Kenneth D. Miller
6510 North 54th Street

Tampa, FL 33610

Sam Tell & Son, Inc.
Attn: Marc Tell/Fred Smilow
300 Smith Street
Farmingdale, NY 11735

Tranzonic d/bla CCP Industries, Inc.
Atin: Pete ChojhackilLaura Dalton
26301 Curtiss Wright Parkway, #200
Richmond Heights, OH 44143

CUSTODIAL TOOLS FOR DISTRICT (DWO) | Phone: (305) 712-6653 Phone: (305) 815-5366 Phone: (305) 805-2600 Phone: (800) 702:2644. Phone: (631)501-9700 Phone: (216) 243-6844
BID NO. B207396JC Fax: (888) 592-3667 Fax (@05) 6646424 Fax: (205) 8639363 Fax: (®13:621-7688 Fax: 6315019708 Fax (800) 4456366
~ WAREHOUSE OPERATIONS - i PR N
: Email: csenice@headoheels.net | Email: Emait: Emait: m | Emai: o Email: e ecpine.com.
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 11, 2021 @ 2:00 PM Idalton@ecpind com
UPDATED: January 20, 2022; June 20, 2022; June 28, 2023
mem| soic DESCRPTION ESTWATED | PRODUCTNAME| GTYPER | DELVERED |PRODUCTNAME| OQTYPER | DELVERED |PpRODUCTNAME| OTYPER | DELVERED |PpRODUCTNAME| QTYPER | DELVERED | pRODUCTNAME| OTYPER PRODUCTNAME|  GTYPER | DELIVERED
NO. | Part No. ANNUALGTY | ANDNUMBER | CASEIPKG PRICE ANDNUMBER |  CASEIPKG PRICE ANDNUMBER | CASEIPKG PRICE ANDNUMBER | CASEIPKG PRICE | ANDNUMBER | CASEIPKG |PELVEREDPRICE| “pypnymper | CASEIPKG PRICE
Waste Baskel, Standard, 28 quart Black, PESTc, CORTINERTAL
ow. | Rectanguir, 14 % x 10 %" x 15" high, BOAROWALK . CONTINENTAL p— . FeBteeK
1| 6o001 | Continental #2818BLK, OR APPROVED 600 Ee et 2 $313 el 2 8396 ‘CONTINENTAL 12 439
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED MINMOM
Waste Basket, Standard, 28 QUar BEiGe, CORTRER A
CW. | Plastc, Rectanguar, 14 % x 10 %' x 15' high, IMPACT . o . pastes:
2| goo0 |Contierial #2818BE, OR APPROVED EQUAL| 120 PRODLCTS, LLG E NoBig Toi 2 s721 ‘CONTINENTAL 2 s430
s IMP77026E ! N
Waste Baske!, Standard, 28 quart Gray, Plastc | CORTRERTAT
ow. | Rectanguir, 14 % x 10 %' x 15" high. Continental . Rubbormaid ey
3. | goo0s | Contineral 2813GY, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 Commercial B foBd 29560068 ” st ‘CONTINENTAL ” 3430
SAVPLE REQUIRED Prodi 28166 o
Scouring Pad, Green, 6" x 9", 10/Packat -
cw. | Scouring Pad, Green, 6" x', 10Package, BOARDWALK o 026 o 23107
4| 73700 |Contnental 23107, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 1000 & (EERCENED ” 18 491CAS tosi UL chses | COFACS sozt
AMPLE REQUIRED Ly
T
Gloves, Nirle, SMALL, Non Latex 15 il e, #8217SMALL
- atotZone 213 Ea
5. | O |14 USDA Approved, reusable, Ansel, OR m SatetyZor 1202Cs i Nosid NoBid TEMPRICED | 12PAR s218
74650 NGS5 E:
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED PER
g
Gloves, Nirle, MEDIUM, Non Latex 15 mil . #5217MEDIUN
6 | oaey |nie, 14" USDA Approved, reusatie, Ansel, £ Sureyzone | 12020 et NoBid NoBid TEMPRIED | 12PAR 5218
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
Gloves, Nirle, LARGE, Non Latex 15 il itie
cw- | 7 SafetyZone 1202Cs Suoota i No Bid 218
7. | ety | 14" USDA Approved. reusable, Ansen OR 576 P ] s NoBig 12PAR
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
TR ACT PO
cw. | Gloves, Nitile X-LARGE, Non Latex 15 mil Sateyzons ssovEn LARGE
8. | yaggy |nirle, 14" USDA Approved, reusae, Anscll OR | 576 comazone | 12040s oty NoBid NoBid “TEMPRICED | 12PAR 5218
APPROVED EQUAL, SAVPLE REQUIRED P
Gloves, Nirle, SMALL Size 7, Non Latex 15 mil
ow- " SafetyZona . | stemmen § .
9. | qoss |1, 19" USDA Approved, reusable, Ansel, 144 onGusazis | 00 saator Nosid NoBid 12PAR. 5217
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
Gloves, Nitle, MEDIUM Size 8, Non Latex 15
10. | Sh | milniie 15° USDA Approved. reusabe, Ansel, 144 devzone | sowes | SUSTORA NoBid No Bid 12PAR 5247
OR APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE REQUIRED
Gloves, Nile, LARGE Size &, Non Latex: 15 mil
cw- v g SafetyZone . | snemmea § o5
11| g5y |, 19° USDA Approved, reusable, Ansell 144 oNGUL22-18 30a0s s431.21 Nosid NoBid 12PAR 247
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
Gloves, Nitle, X LARGE Size 10, Non Latex 15 P
12| W | i, 15 USOA Arove, rumane Avseh | 14 | gomeie | apacs | ST rosis osis ear | s
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
13| OW- |15 mitnitrio 19" USOA Approved reusabler— e SafetyZona abaics NoBid NoBid NoBid
74659 3 :
CONTINERTA
cw. | Tolet Bowt Brush, Must Include Container, LAY o
.| 77189 |Conliental J50600, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 120 Lenioz2cT oo Nos fosd Ll ” s
AMPLE REQUIRED LORDER
‘CONTINENTAL
45| CW- |Bag. Repiacement for Janior Cart, Continental w NoBid CONTINENTAL o 1223) NoBid ey o s1008
77190 | 1884 OR APPROVED EQUAL 188YW FULL CASES
N
oo R =
35" H, Tough Polypropylene with Flagged
| o e T e | | | e Wi | [ ERE] meme | 0| we | miwe | w | oue
NC or Rubbermaid 6374, OR APPROVED e
cw. |Broom, Push Fine SweepMecium Sweep, 24" BETTER BRUSH
17| a0 |Anchor Sty Block. Carlste 41871, ONLY,NO a8 NoBid NoBig NoBid 100124 “FULL 12 5959
SUBSTITUTES CASES ONLY
cw. |Broom.Push, Fine SweepiMedium Sweep, 35" BETTER BRUSH
18. | 7oty |Anchor Syl biock, Carisie 41872, ONLY, No s No Bid NoBid NoBid 00136 “FULL 2 stese
SUBSTITUTES CASES ONLY
Broom, Sianl, Siandard Size, Anged Bistes,
ow. |45 d Poly Briste Tips, ABKO ok $5990ach . S353EACH NoBid 2 598
19, ABCO BR-10054 o 10054
77209 | Commercial Qualy, ABCO, BR-10054, OR w0 BRA0054 53593 siz4tcs ABCO #GR1005
|APPROVED EQUAL. SAMPLE REQUIRED
Broom, Straght Corn 56", Wood Hande,
ow- BOARDWALK 12101 $11.05 cach y o §7.57 each NoBid BETTERBRUSHH| 15 5699
20, | O |Carisi 4135467, OR APPROVED EQUAL 120 BORDNALK e | Ascosr-10036 phpd B
SAMPLE REQUIRED
Broom, Synthetc Corn Broom 57°, Wood
cw. Carlsio 12101 s15.95Ea § Nosid S "
21| % |ando, Cariso 41679, ONLY.NO 00 Sanste R NoBid T 2 .
SUBSTITUTES s
ABCO #00100
Courter Brush, Pre Line, Sef Flagging Brstes, s
22| % | 8CO #00100, OR APPROVED EQUAL s BOARDWALK Ea s408 ABCO 00100 12 e Nosia MINMOM 2 s298
77235 BIK5303 52086CS
SANPLE REQUIRED
CW. | Brush, Tie Foam, Cariske 40423, OF BOARDWALK $5.44 EACH
2 3 € so22 ABCO-00049 6 NoBid 2 s798
77236 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAVPLE REQUIRED ® BWK3310 sa67cs AINMUM
ORDER I 46"
RUBBERMAD "ABCO 00027
Brush, ron Hande, Scrub, Carlise 36289, 5
2. 7‘;23'7 |ABCO 00027, OF 120 COMMERGIAL Ea 5321 ABCO 00027 2 ST NoBid AL 12 s1.40
SANPLE REQUIRED FonspRReoRLT] s
BETIER BRUSH ]
CW. | Brush, Smal Grou, Carlsie 365351, OF BOARDWALK 310208
2. x X £ ABCO 700020 54805 o Bid 2
77238 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAVPLE REQUIRED 0 BWKs008 “MINMUM
ORDER S 240
26.| CW-  [Brush. Pipe, 11°, Curved Screwon, Unger 2 neER e 53606 NoBi NoBid © s16.90
77239 |Pipeo. ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES NGPIPE
Gan Garbage, 20 Gallon, Piast Be Wilhout RUBBERMAD
7. | CW-|id, Minimum 10% R ntinerial w COMMERCIAL e 556,05 Nosid No it 6 51098
77300 #2000-1 Huskee, Bue, OR APPROVED PROD.
EQUAL RCP2620738LY
Gan, Garbage, 32 Gallon, Plastc. Bie Wibout RUBBERNAD
25| CW- |10, Minimum 10% Recycked Pastic, Continental 180 COMVERCIAL e CONTINENTAL 6 P 6 st . s21.00
77303 |#32001BL Huskee, Bue, OR APPROVED. PROD 320018L 2632008LU
ROP2632738E
Gan, Garbage, 44 Gallon, Plastic, Gray Without
20| S¥ |1, Minimum 10% Recycked Pastic, Contiental a8 BWK44GLWRGR Ea Nosid Bl @ s4059 4 52590
77308 26436068
4444GY HUSKEE OR APPROVED EQUAL A
Gan, Garbage, 32 Galo, Plastc. Gray Wiou
BOARDWALK
ow- | id, Minimum 10% Recycied Pastc, Continental e NoBi Rubbernaid B s2502 . s2208
3| 77305 |#3200GY Huskee, Gray, OR APPROVED Teo | BWKeZOLWRGR 2632006R
RUBBERMAD
Doly for Garbage Cans tofit round 20 - 55
ow. COMMERCIAL & CONTINENTAL a ¢Fa| bermaid 2 22 . 1098
31| oage |gaton cans, Rubbermaid 2640, Contnental 120 MR e s Rusbornaid
3255, OR APPROVED EQUAL RoPaH00BK
cw- S E: 236.98 $12098
32| 77325 [Jantor Car, Continental1B48L, OR ‘ﬂ pComersal i # NoBid tosid ! .
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED roduct
cw. | Duster Telescopic Hande, Lambs wools
3. | |Extension 56" it lexibe head, SAMPLE 120 SPECIALITIES e s1400 NoBid NoBid ] 672
REQUIRED 350FLEX
cw. | Treated Dust Ciotn, 12 x 17", Chic 0413, 40 per [r— aon "
34 | 77412 |bag. 10 bags per case CHIC 0413 OR 600 SonrOWALK | so0icar NoBid. MDI78404 | 1050 104isk 53536 1050 ss0.08
|APPROVED EQUAL
Dust Pan, Lobby, 36" Hande, Pastic ony. NTINENT
ow- e 8c0 2 prate 3 s774 2 5799
35| w | Contnentaisra, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 360 COMVERCIAL o St | S
SAMPLE REQUIRED 9128K12
RUBBERNAD
| Dust Pan, Counter Duster, Heavy Duty, Rubber, 1,84 oach
56.| St | Contnania 712, OR APPROVED EGUAL: R o oo » Qe s u s1s0
SANPLE REQUIRED ssnamece
"ABCO 4012068
Hande, Wet Mop Invader, Fiverglass handle %
cw. ’ & 8C0 o $6.73 cach 2 sa1 AINMUM 2 890
37| ot |Quick Change, ABCO 01206NB, OR 20 ABKO 012068 ety Siossca | Aecoonzome v
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED prs
. 8GO 0120318
CW- | Hande, Wing Nut Style, ABCO 1203-NB, OR sscoonosney|  Ea A8CO 6 127 eact NoBid “MINMUM " 5590
3| 77501 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED o 01203.N8 25635 s
120
. ABC0 01104
CW. | Handie for Push Broom, Screw i Metal Ti 202 cach “MNMUM
3. ABCO 01104 € ABCO 01104 12 NoBid 2 5399
77505 | ABCO 01104, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 120 $24.24CS. ORDER IS
120
ORI
cw. | Hande for Push Broom, 60", Wood Anchor UM
4. | Drled, & NoBid NoBid Discontnued - No Bid ROER 15 12 sass
77507 | Garisie #45270, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES 60° (CARLISLE
UNGER #AL140
Handlefor Floor Squeegees, M,
41.| %% | Unger AL140, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 60 UNGER UNGAL Es $36.48 NoBid NoBid i 10 $18.99
77509 140 ORDER IS
SAMPLE REQUIRED =
UNGER #0500
42.| CW- [Bxension Pok. 30" Ungar Opt-Loc Tele Pole, " e s21090 NoBid NoBid MM © s12699
77512 | Ung-Ed00, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES. UNGEDS00 ORDER IS
e
. "ABCO 01406,
CW- [ Handie for Dry Mop, Giip On, Wood, ABCO ’ & 8C0 2 3.99 EACH NoBid MINMUM 2 7
. ABGO 0140618 a
77514 |0146-NB, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES o 01406.N8 54791 C8. ORDER 1S
20
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High Duster Handie, Pipe Duster 54" Wooden

c No Bid Nogid No Bid No Bid
44| 77520 | Hande vith Curved Melal Frame, Wikn E317, @
onLY.
Head Des gne o FilPpe Dustar Hande and
NLY. N
CONTRENTAC
4Oy, Garbage Can, Plastic Whit, for #2000WH
4s.| O | a0, Gatagecan pasic i, 20 2, s oo s Z . w05
77550 . 6Case,
Wi, OR APPROVED EQUAL ORDER IS
CONTIRENTAC
Cw. | Only, Recycle Can, lastc Whie ith hole in conmNeNTAL ) o _saona
ar. center, fis 32 gaton can. Continental 3201-1 “° WG240459WH & s to8d tosd MM ¢ s
77551
OR APPROVED EQUAL ORDER 1S
5
1o, | cW- |8 Ony, Garbago Can, Plastc,whie, s 32 rosi DD . o0t b FG263100WHT . o
Galon Contnental Round Garb 2 a2016Y i
7552
APPROVED EQUAL ORDER 15
Rusee
o, | oW |0 Oy, Garoage Can Psic, Gray, s 32 w coNmENTAL . s0s0 oas Nosie CRGY . -
77853 | Galon Continetal Round Garbage Can, WG2A0481WH MM
Coninenial 3201, OR APPROVED EQUAL ORDER S 60"
ROBBERAD
CW. |LidOnly, Garbage Can, Plastc gay, for 44 NTINENT . ) - RG04S0GY
50. | 77554 |Galon Garbage Can, 6/Case, Contnental # 2 conmenTaL 2 52503 NoBid No Bid i 4 5999
4445, OR APPROVED EQUAL ORDER S
TOLCO #260106
ew. Krife, 17, Flx Metal Blade wih Plastic Noid Nogid NoBid “MINNU 2 s160
51| 77585 |Hande, TOLCO 280106, OR APPROVED %0 ORDERIS :
EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 144 ER
W | Mop, Bow,Cotion 14° Long, 14418 Toolco To0Lc0 . ss2AcH osi SACRYLLC:
52| 77605 |2601 OR APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE 700 ansisPKS & s #BC0 02000 * 55260 Nogid VINNUM I e
jasiraie ORDER IS 144
JBC 1083947
Cw. [ Tralfic Cones, 36" Orange Pastc, it rflciive BOARDWALK o o roa Noid TMNMU | goopaer | sa0se
53| 77610 |stip, JBC #1093047, OR APPROVED EQUAL | 240 BWKOOIB0EA X ROt
SAMPLE REQUIRED 200 A
RECOTFSTOT
ow- & 23 0 8517 cach No Bid P o 5599
54, | S|\t Foor Sign, 37" ABCO WS-001, OR 120 |Ascowcrostat ABCOWS-0001 ss174Cs Ascoummy| 1
| APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE REGUIRED ORDER
ROBEERTTA
cw- RUBBERMAD | 10 sgncs 59700 1 o757 1 s01e | ~runstron ' 56998
55 | S | op Bucket Wiinger Coro, Yelow, 20 o A8coTO007 Rubbermaid 7560 RUBBERMAID
a WINNUM
Rubbermaid 7580, ONLY. NO SUBSTITUTES Ny
et Nops, Medum, =
cw.  |Loopends. 1 114" Headband, Dupont Midew ssco . 800 5296 cach
5. Resistanl. ABCO 203MCS, ONLY, NO 1600 | a7saose veL & 055 oamies * sase3cs [AecoLmomcs| 12 7 2 $a19
77626
SUBSTITUTES MINMUM OROER
o T oo o
Cw. | ends, 1 114" Headband, Duponi Midew o saco 5419 0ach _ aueoiics
ST | 77607 |Resistant, ABCO 203LCS, ONLY, NO 50 g Luzoaes " sozacs | fecPumoacs| 12 s440 [ -pscommmum| 12 5999
SuBSTITUTES 1o Sect
~h6CO
CW- [ Dry Mop Head, 24", ABCO DM26524, OR recoumacs|  Es s1281 800 ® $4.14 cach NoBid » 510
| 77628 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED 150 Owz65245 s1078 M OROE
. “ABCO
CW- | Dry Mop Head, 36", ABCO DM26536, OR BOARDWALK c sus s8cO @ 5569 each Nosia | .
s, 3 2
77629 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED o BWK1124 DM265368 £0CS. MINIMUM ORDER
~h6CO
CW- | Dry Mop Head, 48", ABCO DM26545, OR BOARDWALK & sz aco ® $7.19 each NoBid 1 5070
| 77630 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED * BwK1330 ow265488 ses61 MmUY ORDER
- “ABCO
CW- | Dry Mop Head, 60", ABCO DIM26560, OR BOARDWALK c s s8cO G $8.68 each Nosid b s1000
6 o
77631 | APPROVED EQUAL, SAVIPLE REQUIRED o BWK1 148 DN-265608 52.10CS MINMUM OROER
|01y Mop Frames for Cip End Hande, 24" 196 each heco
62 | O |ABCOBH2ts24 OR APPROVED EQUAL. 1 BORRDALK € sort iy c.coly 12 L NoBid MINMUM ORDER| 12 sa00
SAMPLE REQUIRED s
Dry Mop Frames for Cip End Handie, 367, ABCO
cw- BOARDWALK e s21a A8c0 2 pole Nogid 2 s490
6. | St |ABCO BH24536, OR APPROVED EQUAL. ® OnOMAL i ey BE0 el
SAMPLE REQUIRED i
|01y Mop Frames for Cip End Hane, 45, .26 each heco
o4 | G- | 80O ztian, OR APPROVED EQUAL w | swomax | swos | 0 | p | pEes rosa v oroeR| 12 sss0
SAMPLE REQUIRED s
Dry Mop Frames for Cip End Handie, 60', B245607ABCO
cw- BOARDWALK e ste28 4800 s s No gid 2 s990
65. | St |ABCO BH24560, OR APPROVED EQUAL. ® OnomAL . e Draascoasco
SAMPLE REQUIRED i
ROEEERGAD
. ‘az00
CW- | Finish System, Microfber 18" Mop, Rubbermald BOARDWALK & s22060 Mo Bid o N 51200 | . s1200
| 77637 | 800, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES ™ BWK1460 Rubbermaid 0800 REERIAD
ROBEERITATS
cw. | Fiish System, Microfr 18" Quick Gomnect RUBBERMAID storoEAcH a6
67, | S| Frame, Rushermaid G560, ONLY, NO 2 COMERGIAL o s Nosid Rubbormaid Q560 5 51569 | ~rupaeRaD s si850
SUBSTITUTES RePaB0OWH MINNUM
RBBERIAD ROSEGAD
CW- | Finish System, Microfiber, Rubbermaid Q050. COMMERCIAL & 105 o Bid o 1 s17058 | . st6098
| 77639 |ONLY,NO SUBSTITUTES 2 PROD. Rubbermaid 0050 RBERIAD
RePaseo Py
v ROEER
CW- | Finish System, Microfibe, Bucket, Rubbermaid COMMERCIAL c o1 Mo Bid NoBid ers
6. e o B R . .
77641 |Q930, ONLY. NO SUBSTITUTES 2 PROD. “RuBBERAD
RePO0S0 i)
ROBEERIAD
P ————— Fre
70, | % | ande, 56" waick comnect #0750, ONLY.NO| 12 e & srazzs noBia Repomagarso| 6 097 | “rusBtrwAD s sao
SUBSTITUTES romomo e
RUBBER MAD ToLCO #280157
| o (o mpmsatncimer |y | SR | | s wos wos f ol
77643 [Teet vl Hea
N RepaTSOYW 00~
CONTIRENTAC
CW- NoBid No Bid. NoBid 20 e
72| 77644 |Utlty Pad. 4 %° X 10" Back. 5K, Contiental “° “TEMPRICED oo
20969, ONLY. iR
-, WPACT #2005
73, | CW- | Cioth Head for ity Pad Hoder, 4'x10" impact| 0 NoBid o Bid NoBid e @ $1520
77645 | 2005, ONLY, NO SUBSTITUTES et
RUBBERAD
#2514
cw- rapk | S17.68 eacn Noia No Bid & .99
74| 17720 | Three Gaton Pailwith spout, Confinental 8114, 120 IMPACT 2005 §211.93 A iz =
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED e
To-TEwn
75, | W |Rags, Bue, Approximately 14°x 17", 10LBBox,| 50 NoBid o Bid NoBid PRICEDPER 104 4 53798
77778 |RFT DT-HUCK, OR APPROVED EQUAL, 80X
SAMPLE REQUIRED MINMUM
Rags, Terry Cloth, Approxmately 14" x 17°. RFI
cw. |DT-BAR MOP, 10L8, OR APPROVED EQUAL. A -
- No Bid No Bia No Bid 1 3090
76.| W |SAMPLE REQUIRED o0 s
AN
. |Light Duty Scrubbing Sponge, 3 7116:6 1119, ot § o MMM
77| 77gs0 |Git 20951, OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE &0 Noeid Nos fosd ORDERIS “ o7
REQUI -
cw- BOARDWALK i« 08I g
78| 77g51 |Spray Bottes, 1 Quart, Contnental #932, OR R BWKi6320 e ssoet rose fosd RECTESER * sore
|APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED
INPACT #4902
cw- BOARDWALK am o Bid NoBid MU 84
7. | 7798, | Trioger Sprayers, Cotinental#922 HL, ONLY 1400 BWK3010 e 20 .
OR APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE REQUIRED 1000 EA
ABCO BHIS005
ow- a o8 N
8. | 7860 |Window Saueegee, 12°, ABCO BH-15006, OR 120 | Aecosiisons | E (EDAER ! rescs Noid ORDER 5 2 el
|APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED o0 ER"
BETTER BRUSH
Floor Squeegee, Foam Rubber, Universal weACT
o1.| S0 |t 15 Ungar A50, ONLY. N w roRTS, e s rosa o mste » ss00
SUBSTITUTES LiCwpoz28 Rt
UNGER #HM750
. |Floor Squeegee, Foam Rubber, Uiversal }
82, | S | ande, 50 Ungar AN7S0, Carislo 40083, 0R | 48 e & secomrons| 1 N 0 BT ) 0 s2150
APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED i
PRICED
cw- BOARDWALK s B s1058 No gid 255
8. | 7565 |Padfor Floor Scrubbers, 20" Red, Daily Wash ® Soioanes Acss120 = . s
Pads, SAMPLE REQURED e
CW- s io Bi x
84| 77g6g |Pad or Floor Scrubbers, 20" Bue, Shower » BWKA0208LU o eS80 ° soss fosd ® s2e
Scrub Pacs, SAMPLE REQUIRED
cw. BOAROWAL scs Nogid No gid 250
85| 77g73 |Pad. Burishing, 20" Hevy Hogs Hair, SAVPLE % BWATONE s E
REQUIRED Ch. oSt
Us PuwIcE
cw- us. Puwce . . o op y
8. | r7gra |Pumice Scouring Sick 6", US Pumice, OR 240 2 s435 N8 fosd MO ” s2e
|APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED oro
Resst, A Tog, e IMPACT #7320
cw. | Strap, Condor 1VT70, OR APPROVED EQUAL, MCRSAFETY . o oas s e o2
¥ | 77830 |SAMPLEREQUIRED 20 CRW2230R ORDER S 144 & 9
E
ooV
#Tisior
cw- ENPIRE LEVEL . o B £
8. | 7g0 |Tape, Cauton, Yelow3" x 1000’ IMACT 7328, 100 EnLr7ion A s fose fosd MR ” sz
OR APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED ORDER S 50
PRICED
ow. BOARDWALK ™ s No i 15360176
8. | g1 |Padfor Fioor Scrubbers, 12" Red, Daiy Wash & Siornes s si203 Nogia " fi= . o
Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED
cw- M . o B o
90| 17g07 |Pad or Fioor Scrubbers, 12" Bue, Shower 2 61500044708 oo s rose fosd R
Scrub Pacs, SAMPLE REQUIRED
91| e |PadtorFoorScubers, 13 B, Shover | oy | st b b G| e

Scrub Pads, SAVPLE REQUIRED

cos?

SMVUOId—S=S SMUUOIHd—S SMOXUOIAHdA—-—S =SmMX

SmZmX

SmZmX



PRICED
PER
EACH_COST
0. | oW M OARDWALK st sta3a NoBid NoBid wouo s 1,69 oara 45 |
77894 BWKA4OT3RED BE $7.35/CASE
oF 5+
Pad for Floor Scrubbers, 13 Red, Dally Wash Ty
Pads, SAMPLE REQUIRED o
Floor Squeegee, 18", Unger MW450, OR
93. | cw.7786 APPROVED EQUAL, SAMPLE REQUIRED i Ea 51093 | ABCOBH-14001 1 a09cs Mo Bid UNGER #MW450 0 $8.99
9. | ARO Arrival Time in Days 0Days 15 21-30 10-14 ARO.
5% (CONTACT KENNY MILLER FOR
95.| BOL Percentage discount off balance of line: 0% % 32% QUOTES AT (800) 792-2644 EXT 225 OR BY|

E-MAIL AT BIDDEPT@PYRAMIDSP.COM)

28 Vondort) Wore Notified of 8id PRIMARY VENDOR =
& Vondort) Submiied Bids SECONDARY VENDOR ——
5 Vendors) Retured a No 814
22 Vendor(s) Did Not Respond - Florida State Preference - Minimum Order Required
" T 8D 0 LLC 4 HEAD TO HEALS SAFETY SUPPLIES, ALL FLORIDA PAPER,
APPROVED BY: DATE:  Juiv1a. 2021
TorieNein
PROCUREMENT AGENT
51D TABULATION ONLY. THIS IS NOT A PURGHASE ORDER.
. SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL 810 NUMBER, TN MUST BE ENTERED ON
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