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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: July 29, 2009 Section:  Superintendent’s Recommendation

Subject: Increase Estimated Annual Expenditure - RFP No.
R086646VR Low Voltage Infrastructure and Telephone
System Maintenance

Item No: \/:[:i:) . Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder

Mr. Robert M. George

Strategic Plan:

ITT. Acquisition of Resources: We will acquire the resources
needed to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:

RFP No. R086646VR 1is an annual bid for 1low voltage
infrastructure and telephone system maintenance on an as needed
basis. On  March 25, 2008 this bid was awarded to
Telecommunication Conexxions and was renewed for the period of
March 26, 2009 through March 25, 2010 on March 10, 2009 at an
estimated annual expenditure of $3,000,000. Due to additional
wiring infrastructure upgrades and installation of additional
technology equipment, it is recommended that the estimated annual
expenditure be increased by $2,000,000 making a total estimated
annual expenditure of $5,000,000 pursuant to the same terms and
conditions.

Fiscal Impact:

The estimated annual expenditure of $5,000,000 will be
funded from budgeted schools/departments funds.

This agenda item 1is specifically for the approval of the
bid. Funds will only be expended within the existing resources of

the applicable location(s).
The action requested is within the current gzi%et allocated
L N/A

to the department or area: Yes No

Lo 411

{\ a
Approved: Budget: \I Attorney: \Vdéz{v\
____j%li{% o



Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend Board approval to increase the estimated annual
expenditure for RFP No. R086646VR for low voltage infrastructure
and telephone system maintenance on an as needed basis to
Telecommunication Conexxions , for the period of March 26, 2009
through March 25, 2010 by $2,000,000 making a total estimated
annual expenditure of $5,000,000 pursuant to the same terms and
conditions as previously approved by the Board and authorization
for the Superintendent to execute all documents.

414



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: July 29, 2009 Section: Superintendent’s Recommendation

Subject: Award Bid No. B096803SW Annual Contractual Unleaded and
Diesel Transport Lots

Item No: \/jszL . Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder
‘ Mr. Robert M. George
Mr. Michael P. McNerney

Strategic Plan:

ITI. Acquisition of Resources: We will acquire the resources
needed to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:

Bid No. B096803SW is an annual contractual bid for unleaded
and diesel transport lots.

It is recommended that the award be made to:

e Petroleum Traders Corporation as primary vendor and
to Evans O0Oil Company LLC as secondary vendor for
item number 2, Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel.

e Evans 0il Company LLC as primary vendor and to
Petroleum Traders Corporation as secondary vendor
for item number 3, unleaded gasoline,

having the lowest overall responses meeting School District of
Lee County. This bid will be in effect for one-year beginning
July 29, 2009 with renewal options for two additional one-year
periods upon the written agreement of the vendor and the Board at
an estimated annual expenditure of $14,000,000. Thirteen vendors
were invited; three submitted a bid; one returned a no bid and
nine did not respond.

Fiscal Impact:

The estimated annual expenditure of $14,000,000 will be
funded from budgeted Transportation Services Department funds.

413
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Approved: Budget: &§&> Attorney: Eﬁlglleq
\ \
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This agenda item 1is specifically for the approval of the
bid. Funds will only be expended within the existing resources of
the applicable location.

The action requested is within the curr budget allocated
to the department or area: Yes No N/A

Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend Board approval to award Bid No. B096803SW for annual
contractual bid for unleaded and diesel transport lots.

It is recommended that the award be made to:
e Petroleum Traders Corporation as primary vendor and
to Evans O0il Company LLC as secondary vendor for
item number 2, Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel.

e Evans O0Oil Company LLC as primary vendor and to
Petroleum Traders Corporation as secondary vendor
for item number 3, unleaded gasoline,

at an estimated annual expenditure of $14,000,000 beginning
July 29, 2009 through July 28, 2010, with renewal options for two
additional one-year periods upon the written agreement of the
vendor and the Board and authorization for the Superintendent to
execute all documents.

[T



EVANS OIL COMPANY LLC
Attn: Peter Johnson
PO Box 856.
Naples, FL 34106

The School District of Lee County, Florida
Department of Procurement Services
2855 Colonial Blvd. Fort Myers, Florida 33966

PALMDALE OIL CO.
Attn: Lach Cheatham

911 N 2nd St.
Ft. Pierce, FL 34950

PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION
Attn: Linda Stephens
7110 Pointe Inverness Way
Fort Wayne, IN 46804-7928

ANNUAL CONTRACTUAL UNLEADED & DIESEL TRANSPORT LOTS Phone: (239)262-4124 Phone: 239-226-4080 Phone: (800)348-3705 X 1002
BID NO. B096803SW OPENING DATE: Tuesday, June 16, 2009 @ 2:00 PM Fax: (239)262-7861 Fax: 239-226-4081 Fax: 260-207-6347
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION
TWELVE MONTH TWELVE MONTH TWELVE MONTH
FIRM PRICE FIRM PRICE FIRM PRICE

NO.2 LOW SULFUR DIESEL FUEL - TRANSPORT LOTS - DELIVERED

A. POSTED OPIS PRICE PER GALLON ON JUNE 2, 2009 BASE PRICE PER GALLON

B. TAX AMOUNT PER GALLON

NO BID

C. FIRM DIFFERENTIAL FROM OPIS

D. NET DELIVERED PRICE PER GALLON : A+B+C

NO.2 ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL FUEL - TRANSPORT LOTS - DELIVERED

A. POSTED OPIS PRICE PER GALLON ON JUNE 2, 2009 BASE PRICE PER GALLON

$1.8198

0.320615

0.0474

2.187815

NO BID

$1.8283

B. TAX AMOUNT PER GALLON

C. FIRM DIFFERENTIAL FROM OPIS

D. NET DELIVERED PRICE PER GALLON : A+B+C

0.320615

0.0439

2.192815

UNLEADED REGULAR GASOLINE - TRANSPORT LOTS - DELIVERED

$2.024

A. POSTED OPIS PRICE PER GALLON ON JUNE 2, 2009 BASE PRICE PER GALLON

B. TAX AMOUNT PER GALLON

0.371865

C. FIRM DIFFERENTIAL FROM OPIS

0.0379

D. NET DELIVERED PRICE PER GALLON

2.433765

TWELVE MONTH
FIRM PRICE

TWELVE MONTH
FIRM PRICE

TWELVE MONTH
FIRM PRICE

NO.2 LOW SULFUR DIESEL FUEL - TRANSPORT LOTS - DELIVERED

A. BASE PRICE PER GALLON

NOBID
B. TAX AMOUNT PER GALLON

C. NET DELIVERED PRICE PER GALLON: A+B

NOBID

NO BID

NO.2 ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL FUEL - TRANSPORT LOTS - DELIVERED

A. BASE PRICE PER GALLON

NO BID
B. TAX AMOUNT PER GALLON

C. NET DELIVERED PRICE PER GALLON: A+B

22474

0.320615

2.5680

NO BID

UNLEADED REGULAR GASOLINE - TRANSPORT LOTS - DELIVERED

A. BASE PRICE PER GALLON

NO BID NO BID NO BID
B. TAX AMOUNT PER GALLON
C. NET DELIVERED PRICE PER GALLON: A+B
MAILED TO (13) VENDORS
RESPONDED (3)
RETURNED IT IS RECOMMENDED THAT THIS BID BE AWARDED AS FOLLOWS: [T TIPRIMARY

DID NOT RESPOND (9) ITEM # 2 (ULTRA LOW DIESEL)PETROLEUM TRADERS CORPORATION AS PRIMARY
VENDOR AND TO EVANS OIL COMPANY LLC AS SECONDARY VENDOR.

ITEM # 3 (UNLEADED GASOLINE) EVANS OIL COMPANY LLC AS PRIMARY VENDOR

oA

ROBERT M. GEORGE CPPO, CPB
DIRECTOR OF PROCUREMENT/A/ERVICES

APPROVED BY:

DATE: J’/ﬂ' &7

R

SECONDARY
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: July 29, 2009 Section: Superintendent’s Recommendation

Subject: Ranking of Construction Managers for Public Service
Annex at Michigan Elementary School - Conversion

) 4 -
Item No: VT .- Presenter(s): Mr. William G. Moore, Jr.tA
Mr. Reginald H. Snell R®S

~ ScmoorL BoaRD ACTION

Strategic Plan:

V. Growth Management: We will develop a plan that
capitalizes on the challenges of the growth of our community.

Background Information:

The Qualification Review Committee met on June 8, 2009 to
evaluate and score each Construction Manager’s submittal for
Public Service Annex at Michigan Elementary School Conversion and
the Interview Committee met June 15, 2009 to interview, score,
and rank Construction Management firms. Review of the individual
scoring sheets lead to the recommended ranking of the following
firms and to begin negotiations:

W.G. Mills, Inc. of Fort Myers

Wright Construction Group, Inc.

Kraft Construction Company, Inc.

Lodge Construction, Inc.

Gates Butz Institutional Construction, LLC
J.L. Wallace, Inc.

oY Ul WN

Fiscal Impact:
None.

The action requested dis within the current budget allocated
to the department or area: Yes No /A

417

Approved: Budget:

——

Attorney: \&:ﬁ;{\q
=



Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend Board approval of the following ranking of
Construction Management firms to provide services for the Public
Service Annex at Michigan Elementary School Conversion.

1. W.G. Mills, Inc. of Fort Myers
2. Wright Construction Group, Inc.
3. Kraft Construction Company, Inc.
4. Lodge Construction, Inc.

5. Gates Butz Institutional Construction, LLC
6. J.L. Wallace, Inc.

and authorization for the Superintendent to execute all
necessary documents. In the event negotiations with the top
ranked firm are not successful, I recommend authorization to
proceed with negotiation and execution of a contract according to
the final ranking.

£18






THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: July 29, 2009 Section: Public Hearing

Subject: Adoption of the 2009/10 Parent Guide and Code of
Conduct for Students, Grades PreK-5

Item Noﬁ[IIE-l& . Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder

Strategic Plan:

VIII. Organizational Design: We will create an
organizational design to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:

As part of an on-going process, staff reviews and updates
School Board Rules to determine if changes need to be recommended
to the School Board for approval or if new rules need to be
considered for adoption.

The Parent Guide and Code of Conduct for Students, Grades
PreK-5, 1is  reviewed and updated annually, if necessary, and
presented to the Board for adoption. The complete document is
available in the Superintendent’s Office for review.

The proposed Rule was reviewed with the Board at its
Briefing meeting on Tuesday, June 16, 2009. The Notice of Public
Hearing was advertised in the Friday, May 29, 2009 edition of the
News-Press.

Fiscal Impact:

None. The action requested is within the current dget
allocated to the department or area: Yes No \ Al N/A

Superintendent’ s Recommendation:

I recommend that the Board approve adoption of the 2009/10
Parent Guide and Code of Conduct for Students, Grades PreK-5, as
presented.

AN 41

Approved: Budget: ijf ‘ Attorney:
I.J/

9
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: July 29, 2009 Section: Public Hearing

Subject: Adoption of the 2009/10 Parent Guide and Code of
Conduct for Students, Grades 6-12

Item N°=béﬁf-15» Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder

Strategic Plan:

VIII. Organizational Design: We will create an-
organizational design to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:

As part of an on-going process, staff reviews and updates
School Board Rules to determine if changes need to be recommended
to the School Board for approval or if new rules need to be
considered for adoption.

The Parent Guide and Code of Conduct for Students, Grades
6-12, is reviewed and wupdated annually, 1f necessary, and
presented to the Board for adoption. The complete document is
available in the Superintendent’s Office for review.

The proposed Rule was reviewed with the Board at its
Briefing meeting on Tuesday, June 16, 2009. The Notice of Public
Hearing was advertised in the Friday, May 29, 2009 edition of the
News-Press.

Fiscal Impact:

None. The action requested 1s within the current et
allocated to the department or area: Yes No /A

Superintendent’ s Recommendation:

I recommend that the Board approve adoption of the 2009/10
Parent Guide and Code of Conduct for Students, Grades 6-12, as
presented.

7
Approved: Budget: ng{) Attorney:
1

421
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: July 29, 2009 Section: Public Hearing
Subject: Revisions to Policy 4.31, Homeless Students

Item No:[/]zznd,‘ Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder

Strategic Plan:

VIII. Organizational Design: We will create an
organizational design to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:

As part of an on-going process, staff reviews and updates
School Board Rules to determine if changes need to be recommended
to the School' Board for approval or if new rules need to be
considered for adoption.

Revisions to Policy 4.31, Homeless Students, are
being recommended to include the Federal definition of
homeless children and youth and to delete programs that no longer
exist.

The proposed Rule was reviewed with the Board at its
Briefing meeting on Tuesday, June 16, 2009. The Notice of Public
Hearing was advertised in the Friday, May 29, 2009 edition of the
News-Press. ‘

Fiscal Impact:

allocated to the department or area: Yes - No N/A

None. The action requested is within the curren;4 i§dget

Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend that the Board approve revisions to Policy
4.31, Homeless Students, to include the Federal definition of
homeless children and youth and to delete programs that no longer
exist.

- 423

Approved: Budget: 'SQL/ Attorney:















