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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: February 9, 2010 Section: Consent Action Item

Subject: Award Bid No. B096849SW - Purchase and Installation of
Bi-Directional Amplifier Systems for Ida Baker, Island
Coast and South Ft. Myers High School

Item No:ifj; t)aj3 Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder
Ms. Linda S. Owen
Mr. Dwayne C. Alton

Strategic Plan:

ITITI. Acquisition of Resources: We will acquire the
resources needed to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:

Bid No. B096849SW is a bid for purchase and installation of
bi-directional amplifier systems for Ida Baker, Island Coast and
South Ft. Myers high schools. It is recommended that the award be
made to Industrial Communications and Electronics, Inc. having
submitted the lowest response meeting specifications at a total
price of $47,745. Eleven vendors were invited to a mandatory pre-
bid; six attended pre-bid, two submitted a bid, two submitted a
no bid and two did not respond.

Fiscal Impact:

The total price will be funded from budgeted Information
Technology Support funds. The action requested is withims
current budget allocated to the department or area: Qgﬁ,

No N/A L

9105 00 79200 8006 42400 564100 80062010 2010
Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend Board approval to award Bid No. B096849SW for
purchase and installation of bi-directional amplifier systems for
Ida Baker, Island Coast and South Ft. Myers high schools to
Industrial Communications and Electronics, Inc. having the lowest
response and meeting specifications for a total price of $47,745
and authorization for the Superintendent to execute all necessary

documents.
HVA

:§“~ )
Approved: Budget: &L/; Attorney: Eﬁklyffw
i w v \

[



The School District of Lee County
Department of Procurement Services
2855 Colonial Blvd., Fort Myers, FL 33966-1012

Bid No. B096849SW
Purchase to Install Bi-Directional Amplifier
Systems For Ida Baker H.S., Island Coast
H. S. and S. Ft. Myers H.S.
Opens: Tuesday, January 12, 2010
@ 2:00pm

Qualicom
Attn:John Meyer
2100 Electronics Lane
Fort Myers, FLL 33912

(239) 481-8700
(239) 481-0394

o 239) 696-853;
Purchase & Install Bi-Directional Amplifier Systems /
for ida Baker, island Coast, and S. Ft. Myers High
Schools. Total Turn key. /

1. |TOTAL COST: $49,723.00
. 45 DAYS (PENDING CABLE
2. |COMPLETION TIME (ARO): INSTALL)
3 COPY OF LICENSE(S), CERTIFICATION(S) YES
" |AND INSURANCE ENCLOSED: (Y/N)

4. |REFERENCES ENCLOSED: YES
COPY OF LICENSE(S),

3 |CERTIFICATION(S) AND INSURANCE YES
ENCLOSED:

4 |REFERENCES ENCLOSED (Y/N): YES

5. |BID BOND ENCLOSED (Y/N): YES

(11) VENDORS INFORMED OF PREBID
(6) VENDORS ATTENDED PREBID:
(2) VENDORS RETURNED A BID:

(2) VENDORS RETURNED A NO BID
(2) VENDOR DID NOT RESPOND:

RECOMMEND THIS BID BE AWARDED TO Industrial Communications & Electronics, Inc. HAVING
SUBMITTED THE OVERALL LOWEST AND BEST RESPONSE MEETING SPECIFICATIONS.

las Gyt oare.| ]a: [0

Lmdé S. Owen, CPPB
Asst. Director of Procurement Services

Approved by:

BID TABULATION ONLY. THIS IS NOT A PURCHASE ORDER

ATTN: SCHOOL DISTRICT PERSONNEL
BID NUMBER, ITEM NUMBER AND DESCRIPTION MUST BE ENTERED ON REQUISITION



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: February 9, 2010 Section: Consent Action Item

Subject: Award ITN No. N096840SW - Uniform Rental, Laundry &
Delivery Services

Item NOZEXLI)J4g Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder
Ms. Linda S. Owen
Mr. Reginald H. Snell
Mr. Robert K. Morgan
Mr. Sonny A. Stelmacki

 ScHooL BOARD ACTION

Strategic Plan:

IIT. Acquisition of Resources: We will acquire the
resources needed to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:

ITN No. N096840SW is an invitation to negotiate for uniform
rental, laundry and delivery service. Submittals were solicited
from qualified firms and the District Evaluation Committee rated
Unifirst Corporation as the highest ranked, best value firm.
Based on the evaluation and ranking, it is recommended that the
award be made to Unifirst Corporation at an estimated annual
expenditure of $32,000. The ITN will be effective for one year
beginning February 9, 2010 through February 8, 2011 with renewal
options for two additional one year periods upon the written
agreement of the vendor and the School Board. Sixteen vendors
were invited to submit an ITN; two submitted an ITN and fourteen
did not respond.

Fiscal Impact:

The estimated annual expenditure of $32,000 will be funded
from budgeted department funds. This agenda item is specifically
for the approval of the ITN. Funds will only be expended within
the existing resources of the applicable location.

At allocated
N/A

The action requested is within the current bud

to the department or area: Yes No Stk
f

Y
Attorney:gxgziﬁ\P\

A) Al

Approved: Budget:




Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend Board approval to award ITN No. N096840SW for
uniform rental, laundry & delivery service to Unifirst
Corporation based on evaluation and ranking at an estimated
annual expenditure of $32,000 beginning February 9, 2010 through
February 8, 2011 with renewal options for two additional one-year
periods upon the written agreement of the vendor and the School
Board and authorization for the Superintendent to execute all
necessary documents.

£



The School District of Lee County, Florida ARAX?TR{\I]( ‘l)Jg}IQZOYRxESLECleCE
of Pi i 3
2855 Colonial Blvdt, Fort Myers, Florida 33966-1012 5421 DIVISION DRIVE
UNIFORM RENTAL, LAUNDRY & DELIVERY SERVICE FORT MYERS, FL 33905
ITN NO.: N096840SW Tuesday, December 8, 2009 @ 2:00PM PHONE: (813) 247-2116 | FAX: (239) 694-3399
DELIVERY DATE AFTER RECIEPT OF ORDER 35 DAYS
UNUSUAL SIZE OR GARMENT
mEMNO. | UM DESCRIPTION NA?A':_:“:‘?‘ o ‘a’s:ﬁ: CUSTOMIZATION | REPLACEMENT
PRICE RENTAL COST COST
MEN'S SHIRTS - Standard weight, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton with ‘wrinked | $1.85 FOR
free" feature, 2 pockets, short sleeve. o
! A IWHITE, LT. GRAY, SPRUCE, BURGANDY, POSTMAN BLUE Curre OR SolLaRs) 1 NO BURGANDY $10.00
WICONTRASTING COLLAR & CUFFS
MEN'S SHIRTS - Same Specifications as item #1 except with long sleeves. | ARasorT-0019 o | §1.85 FOR
2. EA.  |WHITE, LT. GRAY, SPRUCE, BURGANDY, POSTMAN BLUE CONTRASTING : NO BURGANDY $10.00
WICONTRASTING COLLAR & CUFFS CUFFS OR COLLARS) "
MEN'S SHIRTS - 100% Cotton shirts conforming to OSHA specifications for -
. €A |woiders atire. | ARASOFT- | §2.05 FOR NIA $12.00
WHITE AND GREY 0449 1
MEN'S SHIRTS - Same Specifications as item #3 except with long sleeves. [ ARASOFT- | $2.05 FOR
4 EA \WHITE & GREY 0448 1 N/A $12.00
POLO SHIRT - Standard weight, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton with "wrinkie 3998 1 ;’g_ $2.05 FOR
5. EA.  |free" feature, with front 3 button placket at neck. Shirt shall have short a0, . N/A $12.00
sleeves and collar. 1084, (100% 11
POLYESTER)
MEN'S TROUSERS - Standard weight, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton with
6. EA.  |"wrinkle-free" feature. With button back pockets and belt loops. No cuffs or ARASOFT GP| §2.25 FOR N/A $9.00
plastic zipper. NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY & BLACK 002 "
7 EA.  |MEN'S TROUSERS - Same Specifications as item #7 except with Adjust-A- NO BID
" |Band waistband. NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY & BLACK
MEN'S TROUSERS - Standard weight, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton. Jean | ARASOFT -007
s EA|cut with "wrinkle-free" feature. With button back pockets and belt loops. No (NAVY, $2.25 FOR | NO BUTTONS ON $9.00
cuffs or plastic zipper.(JEAN-CUT)NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY & CHARCOAL 11 BACK POCKETS .
BLACK ONLY)
9 EA.  |MEN'S TROUSERS - 100% Cotton trousers conforming to OSHA ARASOFT- | $2.50 FOR N/A $13.00
specifications for welders' attire. NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY 0171 11 :
MEN'S TROUSERS - Same Specifications as item #9 except with Adjust-A
10. EA- | Band waistband. NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY NOBID
MEN'S BERMUDA SHORTS - Same specifications as item #7 except ARA(SNTJ;OWG $2.25 FOR
" EA. [shorts to be worn no more than four inches above the middie of the CHARCOAL i N/A $9.00
knee.NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY & BLACK "
ONLY)
MEN'S BERMUDA SHORTS - Same specifications as item #11 except with
12 EA- | Adjust-A-Band waistband.NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY & BLACK NOBID
MEN'S BERMUDA SHORTS - 100% Cotton bermuda shorts with button
13. EA. back pockets and belt loops. No cuffs or plastic zipper. Shorts to be worn no| NO BID
more than four inches above the middle of the knes.NAVY, CHARCOAL,
WHITE, GREY & BLACK
WOMEN'S BLOUSE - Standard weight, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton with
1 EA. | 'Wrinkle-free" featurs, 2 pookets, short sieeve WHITE, LT. GRAY, ARASOFT- | $1.85 FOR N/A $10.00
g SPRUCE, BURGANDY, POSTMAN BLUE W/CONTRASTING COLLAR & 0174 11 :
CUFFS
WOMEN'S BLOUSE - Same Specifications as item #15 except with long
15, EA.  [sleeves. WHITE, LT. GRAY, SPRUCE, BURGANDY, POSTMAN BLUE NO BID
WICONTRASTING COLLAR & CUFFS
|WOMEN'S BLOUSE - 100% Cotton blouse, 2 pockets, short
16 EA.  [sleeve. WHITE, LT. GRAY, SPRUCE, BURGANDY, POSTMAN BLUE NOBID
WICONTRASTING COLLAR & CUFFS .




The School District of Lee County, Florida ARAMARK UNIFORM SERVICE
Department of Procurement Services ATTN: JERRY WELCH
2855 Colonial Blvdt, Fort Myers, Florida 33966-1012 5421 DIVISION DRIVE

UNIFORM RENTAL, LAUNDRY & DELIVERY SERVICE FORT MYERS, FL 33905

ITN NO.: N096840SW Tuesday, December 8, 2009 @ 2:00PM PHONE: (813) 247-2116 | FAX: (239) 694-3389
DELIVERY DATE AFTER RECIEPT OF ORDER 35 DAYS
UNUSUAL SIZE OR GARMENT ol e UNUSUALSIZEOR | GARMENT.
ITEM NO, um DESCRIPTION BRAND WEEKLY CUSTOMIZATION REPLACEMENT . A ; ; IZATION ; REPLACEMENT.

NAME & NO. RENTAL

2 ! ST, i COST
PRICE RENTAL COST cosT : o e

WOMEN'S BLOUSE - Same Specifications as item #17 except with long
17 EA.  |slseves.WHITE, LT. GRAY, SPRUCE, BURGANDY, POSTMAN BLUE NO BID
WI/CONTRASTING COLLAR & CUFFS

ADDITIONAL |1/ o
W[ | 1R

SMOCK - Standard waigh, 65% Polyestar35% Cotton with 'wrinkle-ree” | ARASOFT- | o) o Lo

18. EA.  |feature, 3/4 length, short sleavs, button down front, front pockats, for menor] 1536 (LT N/A $10.00
'women. BLUE ONLY)
19 A, |SMOCK - 100% Cotton smack, 3/4 length, short sleeve, button down front, NO BID

frant pockets, for men or women.

WOMEN'S SPLIT SKIRTS - Standard weight, 65% Polyester/35% Cotton
20 EA.  |with "wrinkle-free” feature, metal side zipper and button, pleated or flared NO BID
skirt, belt loaps. Skirts should be worn at knes length.

WOMEN'S SPLIT SKIRTS - 100% Cotton skirts with metal side zipper and

. button, pleated or fiared skirt, beit loops. Skitts should be worn at knee
21 EA. i NO BID
length.
WOMEN'S PANTS - Standard weight, 5% Polyester/35% Cotton with :
22. EA.  |"wrinkle-free” feature. Button down back pockets and belt loops. No cuffs or ARASOFT- | §2.25 FOR N/A $9.00
plastic zipper.NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY 0207 "
.
23 EA.  |WOMEN'S PANTS - Same Specifications as item #23 except with Adjust-A ARASOFT- | $2.25 FOR NA $9.00
" [Band waistband. NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY 0010 11 .
2. Ean. |WOMEN'S PANTS - 100% Cotton pants with button back pockets and belt NO BID

loops. No cuffs or plastic zipper. NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY

|WWOMEN'S PANTS - Same specifications as item #25 except with Adjust-A-
. EA. Band waistband.NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY NOBID

|WOMEN'S BERMUDA SHORTS-WOMEN'S BERMUDA SHORTS-
STANDARD WEIGHT, 63/35 POLYESTER-COTTON, WRINKLE-FREE
26 EA. |FEATURE, BUTTON BACK POCKETS AND BELT LOOPS, NO CUFFS NO BID
OR PLASTIC ZIPPER - TO BE WORN 4" ABOVE THE MIDDLE OF THE
KNEE. COLORS, NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY

27 EA. WOMEN'S BERMUDA SHORTS - Same Specifications as item #27 except NO BID
) with Adjust-A-Band waistband.NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY

(WOMEN'S BERMUDA SHORTS - 100% Catton bermuda shorts. With
2. A, |bution back pockets and beltloops. No cuffs or plastic zipper. Shorts to be NO BID

worn no more than four inches above the middle of the knee. NAVY,
CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY

29 EA. WOMEN'S BERMUDA SHORTS - Same Spacifications as item #29 except NO BID
) with Adjust-A-Band waistband. NAVY, CHARCOAL, WHITE, GREY

MAILED TO (16) VENDORS UNIFORM SAMPLE PROVIDED: YES
RESPONDED (2) 3 PART DELIVERY, P/ FORM: YES : 3 R
NO RESPONSE (14) REPAIR TAG SAMPLE: YES 7. REPARTAG SAMPLE:
MEASUREMENT/ORDER FORM: YES o MEAsUREMENTIQRDER:EQR YES

RECOMMEND THAT THIS ITN BE AWARDED TO UNIFIRST CORPORATION BEING THE BEST VALUE AND HIGHEST RANKED FIRM OF
THE DISTRICT EVALUATION COMMITTEE

:4[ Yy \S\%\,

LINDA S. OWEN, CPPB
ASST. DIRECTOR OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES

APPROVED BY:




ITN No. N096840SW
Invitation to Negotiate for
UNIFORM RENTAL, LAUNDRY, & DELIVERY SERVICE
Opens: TUE, DEC 8, 2009 @ 2:00 P.M.

Written Submittals RANKING/SCORE
UNIFIRST CORPORATION 80.00
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: February 9, 2010 Section: Consent Action Item

Subject: Approve Piggy-back of State Contract No.450-000-09-ACS,
Maintenance, Repair and Operation (MRO) WSCA Industrial
Supplies

M
Item No;_LVﬂX)-ES" Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder
Ms. Linda S. Owen

SCHOOL BOARD ACTION

Strategic Plan:

ITTI. Acquisition of Resources: We will acquire the
resources needed to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:
The State Contract No. 450-000-09-ACS for Maintenance,

Repair and Operation (MRO) WSCA Industrial Supplies was awarded
to Grainger on November 11, 2008 through November 13, 2010. It is

recommended that this bid be piggy-backed through
November 13, 2010 for an estimated annual expenditure of
$150,000.

Fiscal Impact:

The estimated annual expenditure of $150,000 will be funded
from budgeted Schools/Departments funds. This agenda item is
specifically for the approval of the bid. Funds will only be
expended within the existing resources of the applicable
location(s) .

The action requested is within the current by t allocated
to the department or area: Yes No : N/A

Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend Board approval to piggy-back State Contract No.
450-000-09-ACS for Maintenance, Repair and Operation (MRO) WSCA
Industrial Supplies awarded to Grainger through
November 13, 2010, at an estimated annual expenditure of $150,000
and authorization for the Superintendent to execute all necessary
documents.

Approved: Budget: E@@) Attorney: \KﬁQEQ/qﬂ
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: February 9, 2010 Section: Consent Action Item

Subject: Approve Piggy-back of State Contract No.485-060-07-1,
Liners: Can, Plastic, Disposable

Item No{j:VaID-(g@ Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder
Ms. Linda S. Owen

.~ ScHoOL BOARD ACTION

Strategic Plan:

III. Acquisition of Resources: We will acquire the
resources needed to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:

The State Contract No. 485-060-07-1 for liners: can,
plastic, disposable was awarded to All American Poly, Calico
Industries, Inc., Central Poly Corporation and PRIDE Enterprises
on January 1, 2007 and was renewed for the ©period of
January 1, 2010 through December 31, 2012. It is recommended that
this bid be piggy-backed through February 10, 2011 for an
estimated annual expenditure of $50,000.

Fiscal Impact:

The estimated annual expenditure of $50,000 will be funded
from budgeted Schools/Departments funds. This agenda item is
specifically for the approval of the bid. Funds will only be
expended within the existing resources of the applicable
location(s) .

The action requested is within the current b allocated
to the department or area: Yes No N/A

Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend Board approval to piggy-back State Contract No.
485-060-07-1 for liners: can, plastic, disposable awarded to All
American Poly, Calico Industries, Inc., Central Poly Corporation
and PRIDE Enterprises through February 10, 2011, at an estimated
annual expenditure of 550,000 and authorization for the
Superintendent to execute all necessary documents.

Approved: Budget: >>Q Attorney: \(:ééQWW
\
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: February 9, 2010 Section: Consent Action Item

Subject: Purchase Requisitions (4)

Item No: T\/.]D).7]. Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder
Ms. Linda S. Owen

 ScrooL BOARD ACTION

Strategic Plan:

ITT. Acquisition of Resources: We will acquire the resources
needed to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:

The Department of Procurement Services is submitting four (4)
purchase requisitions for approval in the total amount of $67,174.50.

Fiscal Impact:

Upon approval, a purchase order will be issued in the total
amount of $67,174.50.
A e

The action requested/is/ within the current budget allocated to
the department or area: "¢ A  Yes No N/A

Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend Board approval of the purchase requisitions in the
total amount of $67,174.50; and authorization for the issuance of
the four (4) purchase orders as described.
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Approved: Budget:

e

Attorney:




The School Board of Lee County
Purchase Requisition Agenda Items

(1)

Purchase Requisition No.: 31902

e Requisitioning School/Dept.: Transportation Services

e (Contact Person: Robert Morgan

e Vendor: Trapeze Software Group, Inc.

e Purchase Description: Payment for the maintenance agreement for
the period from January 1, 2010 through December 31, 2010 for
Mapnet Redistricting software, and additional workstation fees.

e Board approval is recommended

e Total PO Amount: $25,420.00

(2)

e Purchase Requisition No.: 32607

e Requisitioning School/Dept.: Information Systems Department

e Contact Person: Dolores Shelhorse

e Vendor: Parlant Technology

e Purchase Description: Payment for customer care program renewal -
Parentlink software maintenance agreement for the period of
January 31, 2010 through January 31, 2011.

e Board approval is recommended

e Total PO Amount: $36,825.00

(3)

e Purchase Requisition No.: 32221

¢ Requisitioning School/Dept.: Maintenance Services

e Contact Person: Reggie Snell

e Vendor: Sackett Plumbing

e DPurchase Description: Payment to replace old fixtures such as
faucets; flow valves; toilet flappers, etc. at Lehigh Elementary.

e Board approval is recommended

e Total PO Amount: $4,817.50

(4)

Purchase Requisition No.: 33175

Requisitioning School/Dept.: River Hall Elementary
Contact Person: Roger Lloyd

Vendor: Industrial Communications

Purchase Description: For the purchase of rapid charger plus
freight.

Board approval is recommended
Total PO Amount: $112.00
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: February 9, 2010 Section: Consent Action Item

Subject: Renew Bid No. B086641SW Mowing Services

Item No::I]Al),g Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder
Ms. Linda S. Owen
Mr. William G. Moore, Jr.
Mr. Reginald H. Snell

Strategic Plan:

IIT. Acquisition of Resources: We will acquire the resources
needed to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:

Bid No. B086641SW is an annual bid for mowing services. On
March 11, 2008 this bid was awarded to multiple vendors as
indicated below:

e Gulf Lawn Services, Inc. at an estimated annual
expenditure of $25,536.00.

e Scarnato Lawn Service & Landscaping at an estimated annual
expenditure of $21,440.00.

It is recommended that this bid be renewed with Gulf Lawn
Services, Inc. and Scarnato Lawn Service & Landscaping for the
final period of March 10, 2010 through March 9, 2011 at a total
estimated annual expenditure of $46,976 pursuant to the same
terms and conditions.

Fiscal Impact:

The estimated annual expenditure of $46,976 will be funded
from Maintenance Services Department budgeted funds. This agenda
item is specifically for the approval of the bid.

Funds will only be expended within the existing resources of

the applicable location(s).

to the department or area: Yes No N/A

Approved: Budget: CﬁKL> Attorney: jX%g;&lk)__
]

b
i

The action requested is within the current(iﬁ??et allocated

C.
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Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend Board approval to renew Bid No.B086641SW for
mowing services to:

e Gulf Lawn Services, Inc.
e Scarnato Lawn Service & Landscaping

pursuant to the same terms and conditions as previously approved
by the Board at a total annual estimated expenditure of $46,976
for the final period of March 10, 2010 through March 9, 2011 and
authorization for the Superintendent to execute all documents.



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: February 9, 2010 Section: Consent Action Item

Subject: Personnel Recommendations - General %Amk/

Item N°f_L.U»Ezs;L.~ Presenter(s): Gregory K. Adkins, Ed.D.fmwmmﬂL

Georgianna W. McDanielGV(

ScHOOL BOARD ACTION

Strategic Plan:

IT. Staff: We will ensure that we have effective teachers
and staff throughout the system.

Background Information:

General Personnel Recommendations including Administrative,
Certificated, Support, and substitute staff.
Fiscal Impact:

Funding is included in the 2009-10 budget.

The action requested is
to the department or area:

Yhin the current budget allocated
Yes No N/A

Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend Board approval of the general personnel
recommendations including administrative, certificated, support
and substitute staff, out-of-field appointments, and annual
reappolintments.

39
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Approved: Budget: Clk) Attorney:
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February 9, 2010

Page 1
ADMINISTRATIVE PERSONNEL
Effective
RETIREMENT Location Position Date
Charlotte Rafferty Title I Principal-on- 01/29/10

Assignment

-
.
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Certificated Personnel- continued
February 9, 2010

Page 2
CERTIFICATED PERSONNEL
ADDITIONAL EMPLOYMENT
BEFORE/AFTER SCHOOL Effective
PROGRAM Location Date
Rebecca Pavel G. Weaver Hipps Elementary 12/18/09
Cheryl Darbyshire Lexington Middle 01/12/10
Lisa Pockrus Three Oaks Elementary 12/10/09
Effective
EXTENDED DAY PROGRAM Location Date
Lauren Fox Edison Park Creative & Expressive 11/18/09
Arts
Samantha Richardson Edison Park Creative & Expressive 11/18/09
Arts
Maria Rose Edison Park Creative & Expressive 11/18/09
Arts
Kristine Scanza Edison Park Creative & Expressive 01/04/10
Arts
Sarah Pollman Tropic Isles Elementary 12/14/09
Alexander Caldwell Varsity Lakes Middle 12/10/09
APPOINTMENTS
Contract Effective
FULL-TIME Location Type Date
Charles Flory Alva Middle Annual 01/04/10
Heidi Malesa Bayshore Annual 12/14/09
Flementary
Christina Broadhead Bonita Elementary Annual 01/04/10
Laurie Mastro Bonita Elementary Annual 01/04/10
Brettney Painter Bonita Elementary Open-End 11/13/09
Nancy Vinces Cape Coral High Open-End 01/04/10
Jennifer Kaestner Colonial Open-End 01/08/10
Elementary
Sharon Nowling Cypress Lake High Annual 12/10/09
William Rothenberg Cypress Lake High Annual 12/18/09
Gail Rieckhoff Cypress Lake Annual 01/04/10
Middle
Nina Sanders Cypress Lake Annual 01/04/10
Middle
Parker Fruehan Diplomat Middle Annual 01/04/10
Barbara Vadas Dunbar High Open-End 12/11/09
Karon Finch Early Childhood Annual 01/04/10

Learning Services
o

A I
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Certificated Personnel- continued

Tiffany
Mina
Elsa
Jennifer
Deborah
April
Brenda
Michelle

Diane

Katherine

Sherry

Ted
Ivette
Roy

Jan

Diane
Candace
Xinia
Heather

Lance
Carol

Shawna
Rachel
Elaine

Mandy
Patricia

Franklin
D’ Akbraccio
Marte-
Mendoza
Black
Curtis
Rolph
Baker
Palladino
Petrik

Norris

Stauffer

Ferreira
Garvalosa
La Barbera

Maxwell

Burkle
Derringer
Carvajal
Karnes

Riccio
Romme 1

Champoux
Knauer
Adler

Ryan
Gorrell

Farly Childhood
Learning Services
East Lee County
High

East Lee County
High

Exceptional
Student Education
Franklin Park
Magnet

Gateway Elementary
Gulf Elementary
Harns Marsh
Elementary

Harns Marsh
Elementary

Hector A.
Cafferata, Jr.
Elementary

Hector A.
Cafferata, Jr.
Elementary

Ida S. Baker High
Island Coast High
Lehigh Acres
Middle

North Fort Myers
Academy of the
Arts

Orange River
Elementary

Paul Laurence
Dunbar Middle
Pinewoods
Elementary

Rayma C. Page
Elementary
Riverdale High
South Fort Myers
High

Spring Creek
Elementary

Spring Creek
Elementary

The Sanibel School
The Sanibel School
Treeline
Elementary

Annual
Annual
Annual
Annual
Annual
Annual
Annual
Open-End

Open-End

Annual

Open-End

Open-End
Annual
Open-End

Annual

Annual
Annual
Annual
Annual

Annual
Annual

Cpen-End
Annual
Annual

Open-End
Cpen-End

February 9, 2010

Page 3
01/04/10
12/18/09
12/18/09
08/17/09
01/04/10
01/04/10
01/04/10
12/11/09
01/04/10

01/04/10

12/18/09

12/14/09
01/04/10
01/08/10

01/04/10

01/08/10
01/04/10
01/08/10
12/11/09

01/04/10
08/17/09

01/04/10
01/04/10
08/17/09

12/14/09
12/11/09



Certificated Personnel- continued
February 9, 2010

Page 4
Effective
HOURLY Location Date
Deborah Alexander Adult Education 11/01/09
Amy DeVerteuil Adult Education 01/05/10
Lori Demeter Business and Industry Services 01/12/10
Theodore Drake Business and Industry Services 01/04/10
Aaron Quaintance Business and Industry Services 01/04/10
Heath Roody Business & Industries 01/04/10
Teresa Bukaweski High Tech Center North 12/10/09
Anita Tokie High Tech Center North 01/04/10
Albert Sibert Southwest Florida Public Service 01/15/10
Academy
PROFESSIONAL Previous Effective
SERVICE CONTRACT Location County Date
Virginia Ramos Cypress Lake High Lee 08/17/09
Michael Thornton Cypress Lake High Hillsborough 08/17/09
Beth Zalewski Franklin Park Lee 08/14/09
Magnet
Lori Bollman Ida S. Baker High Lee 08/17/09
Gretchen Kmetz Lehigh Elementary Lee 08/17/09
Pedro Fominaya Lehigh Senior High Collier 08/17/09
Jennifer Rakos Manatee Elementary Lee 08/17/09
Carey Sawyer Three Oaks Lee 08/14/09
Elementary
Julie Keating Treeline Lee 08/17/09
Elementary
Marjan Scheettelkotte Treeline Hillsborough 08/17/09
Elementary
Kimberly Stone Treeline Collier 08/17/09
Elementary
Effective
SUBSTITUTE Date
Victoria Butland 12/11/09
Kathleen D’ Amico 01/14/10
Chansi Driggers 12/17/09
Sarah Evans 12/16/09
Angel Felix 01/14/10
Nancy Goodmonson 12/17/09
Jennifer Herrick 01/05/10
Carol Jastremsky 01/05/10
Charlotte Johanson 01/14/10
Linda McCoy 01/15/10
Vicki Shawgo 01/15/10
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Certificated Personnel- continued

LONG-TERM SUBSTITUTE

February 9,

Location

Cape Coral High

Fort Myers Middle
Gulf Middle

High Tech North

Ida S. Baker High
Island Coast High
Manatee Elementary
Ray V. Pottorf
Sunshine Elementary
Tanglewood Elementary
Tanglewood Elementary

Robert Perron
William Jennings
Russell Greene
Teresa Bukaweski
Gary Neubauer
Derrick Morse
Jacqueline Jarman
Diane Hamstra
Tracy Barroso
Sarah Evans
Jennifer Herrick
SUPPLEMENTAL
CONTRACT

Richard Vandepels
Terrell Harbin
Harrison Samson

EXTENDED LEAVE

DeAdra

Tamika

Anne

Sandra

Kristina

Hall

Woods

Nowicki

Solano

Bota

LEAVE OF ABSENCE

Jamie
Noelle
Kelly

Heidi

Berendes
Coggins
Slover

Kucharek

Location

Cypress Lake High
Lehigh Senior High
Lehigh Senior High

Position

Athletic Coach
Athletic Coach
Athletic Coach

Location Reason

Cape Coral High Family
Obligation

Fast Lee County Medical

High

Hector A. Family

Cafferata, Jr. Obligation

Elementary

James Stephens Family

International Obligation

Academy

Orange River Family

Elementary Obligation

Location Reason

Bonita Springs Personal

Elementary

Colonial Medical

Elementary

Gulf Middle Maternity

Harns Marsh Maternity

Elementary

2010
Page 5

Effective
Date
12/18/09
12/14/09
01/08/10
12/18/09
01/06/10
01/04/10
12/14/09
01/07/10
01/05/10
01/07/10
01/04/10

Effective
Date
12/07/09
01/13/10
12/18/09

Effective

Dates

01/18/10~-
04/12/10
12/18/09-
01/20/10
01/04/10-
06/16/10

11/16/09-
01/04/10

01/18/10-
06/16/10

Effective
Dates
01/26/10-
06/16/10
01/29/10-
02/09/10
01/21/10-
03/18/10
12/18/09-
02/15/10




Certificated Personnel- continued

Kimberly

Erika

Boni

Terry
Nicole
Kristy
Mary
Monica

Jodi

Maloney

Shavulsky

Raitt

Collver
White
Jones
Hunter
Petersen

Frogge

OUT-OF-FIELD

Tamika
Noreen

Lisa
Flsa

Becky

Frances
Amy

Michelle
Diane
Susan

Tiffany
Greg

Amy
Mable

Roberts
Patton
Taylor
Marte-
Mendoza

Evans

Koconis
Anfinson

Palladino
Petrik
Rodocker

Bailey
Hattemer

Bray
Streets

Hector A.

Cafferata,
FElementary
Heights Elementary

Jr.

James Stephens
International
Academy
Lehigh Acres
Middle

Ray V. Pottorf
Elementary
Spring Creek
Elementary
Sunshine
Elementary
Sunshine
Elementary
Treeline
Elementary

Location

Allen Park
Elementary
Diplomat
Elementary
Diplomat Middle
East Lee County
High

Franklin Park
Magnet

Gulf Middle
Harns Marsh
FElementary
Harns Marsh
Elementary
Harns Marsh
Elementary
Harns Marsh
Elementary
Island Coast High
Lehigh Acres
Middle

Mariner High
Ray V. Pottortf
Elementary

Medical

Maternity

Medical

Medical

Maternity
Maternity
Maternity
Maternity

Maternity

Subject
Area

ESOL

ESOL

Gifted
Reading

ESOL

ESOL
ESOL

ESOL
ESOL
ESOL

ESOL
ESOL

ESOL
ESOL

February 9, 2010
Page 6

11/23/09-
01/22/10

12/07/09-
01/18/10
01/13/10-
06/16/10

01/05/10-
02/26/10
12/16/09-
02/01/10
01/25/10-
02/15/10
01/19/10-
03/01/10
01/15/10-
03/01/10
01/29/10-
04/12/10

Effective
Date

11/10/09

01/04/10

10/23/09
12/18/09

01/04/10

10/27/09
11/16/09

12/11/09
01/14/10
01/15/10

12/18/09
10/23/09

08/24/09
11/20/09

&4



Certificated Personnel- continued

RESIGNATION
Donald Collier
Lisa Peck
Emily Sturino
Patrick Flahive
RETIREMENT

Horace Barrett
Richard Riberdy
Barbara Peters
Diane Levy
Avanah Jent
Flizabeth Burke

RETURN FROM LEAVE

Jenifer McClendon
Rita Effing
Jeannine Amodeo
Sandra Solano
Lisa Williams
Leah Hall
Kimberly Gordon
Jennifer Smith

o

Location

East Lee County
High

Gateway Elementary

Paul Laurence
Dunbar Middle
Southwest Florida
Criminal Justice
Academy

Location

Alternative
Learning Center
Middle

Cypress Lake High
East Lee County
High

Exceptional
Student Education
Hector A.
Cafferata, Jr.
FElementary

North Fort Myers
Academy for the
Arts

Location

Cypress Lake High
Dunbar High
Island Coast High
James Stephens
International
Academy

Mirror Lakes
FElementary

Spring Creek
Elementary
Treeline
Elementary
Varsity Lakes
Middle

February 9, 2010

Reason
Personal

Accepted other
Employment
Educational
Enrollment
Personal

Position
Teacher

Teacher
Teacher

Speech-Language
Pathologist
Reading
Specialist

Speech~Language
Pathologist

Position
Teacher
Teacher
Teacher
Teacher
Teacher
Teacher

Teacher

Teacher

Page 7

Effective
Date

01/06/10

12/18/09
01/06/10

01/01/10

Effective
Date

01/22/10
01/26/10
01/04/10
01/29/10

12/18/09

12/18/09

Effective
Date

01/15/10
01/04/10
12/18/09
01/04/10
01/11/10
01/04/10
12/07/09

01/26/10



Certificated Personnel- continued

Kristy

TRANSFER
Anita

Catherine
Karen

Kathleen

Virginia

Sewell

Reynolds
Hile
Snyder

Bean

Pontarelli

TRANSFER AND CHANGE

OF ASSIGNMENT

Haydee

Morales

Veterans Park
Academy for the
Arts

From

Franklin Park
Magnet

Gulf Elementary

Health Services

James Stephens
International
Academy
Mirror Lakes
Elementary

From

Exceptional
Student Education
Department,
Professional
Development
Resource Teacher

February 9,

Teacher

To
Early Childhood
Learning Services
Student
Assignment

Early Childhood
Learning Services
Pinewoods
Elementary

G. Weaver Hipps
Elementary

To

E§press Lake
High, ESE Teacher

2010
Page 8

01/04/10

Effective
Date
01/04/10

12/14/09
01/04/10

01/27/10

01/11/10

Effective
Date

12/09/09




Technical/Support Personnel- continued

February 9,

TECHNICAL/SUPPORT PERSONNEL

ADDITIONAL EMPLOYMENT

BEFORE/AFTER SCHOOL

PROGRAM

Linda Vega
Josephine Barry
Summer Kilgore
Yvonne Martin
Candy McClintock
Stacey Littlejohn
APPOINTMENTS

FULL-TIME

David Hall
Barbara Mateo
Keith Herman
Marie Detournel
Dempsey Vick

Carol Acitelli
Julie Archambault
John Belmonte
April Tom

Albert Hernandez
Renee D’ Angelo

Location

Orangewood Elementary
Pelican Elementary
The Sanibel School
Three Oaks Elementary
Three Oaks Elementary
Trafalgar Elementary

Location
Alternative
Learning Center
West

Alva Elementary

Central Service
Operations
Colonial
Elementary

Diplomat
Elementary
Farly Childhood
Learning
Services

Early Childhood
Learning
Services

Gulf Elementary
Gulf Elementary
Harns Marsh
Elementary

Island Coast
High

Position
Custodian

Educational
Paraprofessional,
ESOL

Custodian

Educational
Paraprofessional,
Instructional
Support
Custodian

Educational
Paraprofessional,
Instructional
support
Educational
Paraprofessional,
Instructional
Support

Helping Teacher,
ESE

Helping Teacher,
ESE

Custodian

Helping Teacher,
ESE

2010
Page 9

Effective
Date
11/30/09
01/04/10
12/01/09
01/07/10
12/14/09
12/15/09

Effective
Date
12/10/09

01/15/10

01/07/10

01/04/10

01/04/10

01/04/10

01/04/10

01/04/09
01/04/09
12/18/09

12/14/09



Technical/Support Personnel- continued

*Monica
Soledad
Jennifer
Toni
Veronica
Brandon
Karyn
Tanna
Joann
Doralba

Randy
Shari

Laurie

Erika

Silvia

*Damarius

*Full-time -

HOURLY
Carina
Tracy

PART-TIME

Cathryn

Caron

McGuire

Hernandez

Beagle
Larocque
Cole
Gott
Walker
Marrero
Vilardi
Gonzalez

Blake
Crocker

Fiechter

Elmore

Monzo

Munoz

working less than 30 hours.

Coello
Riordan

Boarts

Midgett

Island Coast
High

James Stephens
International
Academy
Mariner High
Mariner Middle

Oak Hammock
Middle

Oak Hammock
Middle
Orangewood
Elementary
Paul Laurence
Dunbar Middle
Pelican
Elementary
Rayma C. Page
Elementary
Riverdale High
Skyline
Elementary
Skyline
Elementary
Three Oaks
Elementary

Transportation
Department

Varsity Lakes
Middle

Location
Dunbar High

February 9, 2010

Food Service
Worker
Educational
Paraprofessional

Helping Teacher
Educational
Paraprofessional,
Cafeteria
Educational
Paraprofessional
Custodian

Educational
Paraprofessional
Helping Teacher,
ESE

Helping Teacher,
ESE

Custodian

Custodian
Helping Teacher,
ESE

Helping Teacher,
ESE

Educational
Paraprofessional,
ESE

Supervisor,
Safety and
Training
Helping Teacher,
ESE

Tropic Isles Elementary

Location
Alva Middle

Bayshore
Elementary

Position

Food Service
Worker
Educational
Paraprofessional

Page 10
12/14/09
01/08/10
12/14/09
12/14/09
01/04/10
01/11/10
01/04/10
12/11/09
01/04/09
12/17/09

12/07/09
01/04/10

01/04/10

01/15/10

12/14/09

01/05/10

Effective
Date

12/15/09
01/04/10

Effective

12/18/09

49



Technical/Support Personnel- continued

Arthur
Joe
Maria
Joann
Kathryn
Norma

Carrie

Manuel
Theresa
Yvonne
Racquel

Yvonne

SUBSTITUTE

Patti
Vicki
Delvia
Jose
Nancy

TEMPORARY
Stephanie

Mary

Michael

PO
(]

Scott
Tucker
Hernandez
Madieros
McDonnell
Ramirez

Pitt

Prince
Ficarro
Figueroa
Gilmore

Martin

Tice
Shawgo
Rodriguez
Maestre
Moorman

Jones

James

Heavener

Fort Myers High
Fort Myers High

G. Weaver Hipps
Elementary

G. Weaver Hipps
Elementary

G. Weaver Hipps
Elementary
Hancock Creek
Elementary
Hector A.
Cafferata,
Elementary
Mariner High

Jr.

Pinewoods
Elementary
Pinewoods
Elementary
Trafalgar Middle

Three Oaks
Elementary

Position

Helping Teacher,

February 9,

Food Service

Worker

Food Service

Worker

Educational
Paraprofessional
Educational
Paraprofessional
Food Service
Worker

Food Service
Worker

Food Service
Worker

Food Service
Worker
Food Service
Worker
Food Service

Worker

Food Service
Worker
Educational
Paraprofessional

ESE

Educational Paraprofessional
Food Service Worker

Custodian

Educational Paraprofessional,
Instructional Support

Location
Buckingham
Exceptional
Center
Franklin Park
Magnet

Lehigh Senior
High

Position
Helping Teacher,
ESE

Educational
Paraprofessional,
Instructional
Support
Custodian

2010
Page 11

01/15/10
01/15/10
12/11/09
12/18/09
01/04/10
01/04/10

12/18/09

01/15/10
12/11/09
12/18/09
12/18/09

01/04/10

Effective
Date

11/09/09
01/11/10
01/07/10
01/14/10
01/11/10

Effective
Date
12/11/09

01/14/10

01/07/10



Technical/Support Personnel- continued

CHANGE OF ASSIGNMENT

Dary

Sarah

Marilyn

Christine

Mack

Brandon

Tarrita

Randall

Catris

Victoria

Brian

Soloman

O’ Meara

Cox

Zadlo

Dueease

Cook

Sullivan

Brown

Hart

Mays

Moore

Pentiuk

Russ

EXTENDED LEAVE

Joanna

Harriet

Aceves

Hogue

February 9, 2010

Location and Position

Early Childhood Learning Services,
from Educational Paraprofessional,
Instructional Support, to
Paraprofessional Headstart
Instructor II

Financial Accounting, from
Secretary to Director to Secretary
to Executive Director

Fort Myers Beach Elementary, from
FEducational Paraprofessional to
Educational
Paraprofessional/Clinic Assistant
Fort Myers High, from Clinic
Assistant to School Secretary
James Stephens International
Academy, from Security Specialist
to Head Custodian II

Orangewood Elementary/Edgewood
Academy, from Educational
Paraprofessional to Educational
Paraprofessional/Helping Teacher
Transportation Department, from
Substitute Bus Operator to Regular
Bus Operator

Transportation Department, from
Substitute Bus Operator to Regular
Bus Operator

Transportation Department, from
Substitute Bus Operator to Regular
Bus Operator

Transportation Department, from
Substitute Bus Operator to Regular
Bus Operator

Transportation Department, from
Substitute Bus Operator to Regular
Bus Operator

Transportation Department, from
Substitute Bus Operator to Regular
Bus Operator

Location Reason

East Lee County Family Obligation
High

Ida S. Baker Medical

High

Page 12

Effective
Date
01/04/10

09/09/09

01/01/10

01/11/10

12/14/09

12/14/09

12/10/09
12/10/09
12/10/09
12/10/09
12/10/09
12/10/09
FEffective
Dates
01/04/10-
04/06/10

01/05/10-
01/29/10

&



Technical/Support Personnel- continued

Sandra
Dailany

Cassandra

Olson
Aguilar

Scott

LEAVE OF ABSENCE

Ileana Rojas
Tamika Corbett
Natasha Hodge
Patricia Davis
Stephanie Cobb
Thomas McGrath
REAPPOINTMENTS

Rosa Sagastume
RESIGNATION

Adriana Palma
Linda Kaczmarz
Michelle Mattox
Doreen Coronato
Jose Ramirez
Jacinta ITrwin
Stephanie Westendorf
Mandy Ryan
Wellington Almanzar

ol
1%

Ida S. Baker
High

Manatee
Elementary
Southwest
Florida Juvenile

Detention Center

Location
East Lee
High
Franklin
Magnet
Franklin
Manget
Skyline
Elementary
Transportation
Department
Transportation
Department

County
Park

Park

Location
FDLRS

Location

Alva Elementary
Exceptional
Student
Education
Lehigh Senior
High

Mariner High
Orange River
Elementary
Rayma c¢. Page
San Carlos Park
Elementary

The Sanibel
School
Transportation
Department

February 9,

Medical

Family Obligation

Medical

Reason
Maternity

Educational
Educational
Medical
Medical

Medical

Position
Secretary

Reason

Return to School
Accepted other
Fmployment

Accepted other
Employment
Health
Personal

Personal
Accepted other
Fmployment

Job Change
within system
Personal

2010
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01/05/10-
06/30/10
01/04/10-
06/30/10
01/25/10-
06/30/10

Effective
Dates
01/14/10-
02/25/10
01/07/10-
04/19/10
01/07/10-
04/19/10
12/11/09-
01/25/10
11/05/09-
06/15/10
11/08/09-
06/15/10

Effective
Date

07/01/09

Effective
Date
12/17/09
12/18/09

01/15/10

12/11/09
01/07/10

12/18/09
01/15/10

12/11/09

01/09/10



Technical/Support Personnel- continued

Mirelys Alfonso
Eric Gerstner
RETIREMENT

Betty Collins
Amanda Targquino
RETURN FROM LEAVE
Debra Valentino
Kimberly Winzenread
Teresa Sparks
Reba Brant
Noelia Lichter
Laurie Theil
Amanda Ashley
Deborah Curtis

SALARY EXPERIENCE

CREDIT
Carol

Randall

Tammy

Acitelli

Hart

Traurig

Treeline
FElementary
Veterans Park
Academy for the
Arts

Location
Fort Myers High

Fort Myers
Middle Academy

Location
Caloosa Middle

Diplomat Middle
Fort Myers High

Gulf Middle

J. Colin English
Elementary

Lehigh
Elementary
Patriot
Elementary
Tropic Isles
Elementary

Location

Farly Childhood
Learning
Services
Transportation
Department

Alva Middle

February 9, 2010
Page 14
Personal 01/14/10
Personal 01/12/10
Effective
Position Date
Food Service 12/18/09
Worker
Educational 12/18/09
Paraprofessional,
Instructional
Support
Effective
Position Date
Food Service 01/05/10
Worker
Clerk Typist 01/04/10
Educaticnal 01/11/10
Paraprofessional
Educational 01/04/10
Paraprofessional
Educational 01/04/10
Paraprofessional,
Instructional
Support
Information 01/04/10
Specialist
Alternate Duty in 01/04/10
Training
Educational 01/04/10
Paraprofessional,
Instructional
Support
Effective
Number of Years Date
3 01/04/10
3 12/10/09
1 12/07/09

by

o



Technical/Support Personnel- continued

Silvia

Chevone

Katherine

Brian
Kelmie
Linda
Niyia

Daniella
Joann

Brad
Tomika

Shronda

TERMINATION

Nilsa

TRANSFER
Debbie

Marlene

TRANSFER AND CHANGE OF

Monzo
Peterson
Clowser
Pentiuk
Bigelow
Barton
Anderson

Merzier
Madieros

Rice
Harris

Matthews

Izquierdo

Reynolds

McDaniel

ASSIGNMENT

Susan

O’ Brien

Transportation
Department
Transportation
Department
Tropic Isles
Elementary
Transportation
Department
Transportation
Department
Transportation
Department
Transportation
Department
Cape Coral High
G. Weaver Hipps
Elementary
Payroll
Department
Transportation
Department
Transportation
Department

Location

Varsity Lakes
Middle

From
Pinewoods
Elementary
River Hall
Elementary

From

Bonita Springs
FElementary,
Educational
Paraprofessional,
Instructional
Support, Part-
Time

February 9, 2010

w W

Reason
Job Abandonment

To
Estero High

Bonita Springs
Middle

To
Farly Childhood
Learning
Services,
Educational

Paraprofessional,

Instructional
Support, Full-
time

Page 15

12/14/09
12/04/09
11/02/09
12/10/09
10/26/09
10/26/09
10/26/09

12/04/09
12/18/09

12/08/09
10/26/09

10/26/09

Effective
Date

01/22/10

Effective
Date

01/04/10

01/11/10

Effective
Date

01/04/10




Technical/Support Personnel- continued

Maria

Deborah

Sandra

Shirmaine

Debra

Jennifer

Figueroca

Singh

Magnante

DelLeon

Cody-Reed

Irizarry

G. Weaver Hipps
Elementary,
Clinic Assistant

Lee Adolescent
Mothers Program,
Childcare
Attendant

Orangewood
Elementary,
Teacher

Rayma C. Page
Elementary,
Educational
Paraprofessional

Trade Extension,
Educational
Paraprofessional

Varsity Lakes
Middle, Clerk-
Typist

February 9, 2010
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Rayma C. Page 12/15/09
Elementary,
Helping Teacher,
ESE
Early Childhood
Learning
Services,
Educational
Paraprofessional,
Instructional
Support
FEarly Childhood
Learning
Services,
Educational
Paraprofessional,
Instructional
Support
Farly Childhood
Learning
Services, Early
Childhood Family
Services
Specialist
Early Childhood
Learning
Services, Early
Childhood Family
Services
Specialist
East Lee County
High, Information
Specialist

01/04/10

01/04/10

01/11/10

01/04/10

01/11/10
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEW COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: February 9, 2010 Section: Superintendent’s Recommendation
Subject: Audited Comprehensive Annual Financial Report

Item No:&/&[ef3« Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder

Mrs. Greta S. Campbell /iﬁ&;_

Strategic Plan:

IIT. Acquisition of Resources: We will acquire the resources
needed to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:

Section 11.45, Florida Statutes, requires an annual audit by
independent certified accountants. Cherry, Bekaert & Holland,
L.L.P., has completed the financial and operational audit of the
School Board for the fiscal year 2008-2009.

The scope of this audit included an examination of the
District’s general purpose financial statements for the fiscal
year ended June 30, 2009. The audit also included examinations
of wvarious transactions to determine if the transactions were
executed, both in manner and substance, 1in accordance with
governing provisions of laws, rules and regulations and
restrictions imposed by grantors of resources to the District.
To properly administer public resources, District management 1is
required to establish and maintain an internal control structure
that will reasonably assure the effective and efficient conduct
of their duties and responsibilities. Consequently, the auditors
identified and assessed cohtrol risk, as well as evaluated
selected control environment factors, and accounting system

methods and records. There were no material weaknesses noted by
the auditors.

District Staff has prepared a Comprehensive Annual Financial
Report (CAFR) for the fiscal year ended June 30, 2009. The CAFR
is presented in four sections: Introductory Section, Financial

Section, Statistical Section, and Single Audit Report. In
addition, the report has been submitted to the Government Finance
Officers Association (GFOA) and the Association of School

Business Officials International (ASBO) for recognition. A copy

N

Approved: Budget: Attorney: é§££;t£]l—
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of the CAFR is on file in the office of the Supeiiﬁgéhdént.
Fiscal Impact:

The cost for the audit was Board approved on April 21, 20009.

The action requested is ft#thin the current budget allocated
to the department or area: Yes No N/A

Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend Board acceptance of the audited Comprehensive
Annual Financial Report for The School District of Lee County
for the fiscal year ended June 30, 2009.

Lo
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THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA

Date: February 9, 2010 Section: Superintendent’s Recommendation

Subject: Annual Expenditure for RFP No. R086715SW - Consumable
Office Supplies and Related Items

Item No:\/ﬁfuéé. Presenter(s): Dr. James W. Browder
Ms. Linda S. Owen

- ScHooL BoaRD ACTION

Strategic Plan:

ITTI. Acquisition of Resources: We will acquire the
resources needed to achieve our mission and objectives.

Background Information:

RFP No. R086715SW is an annual bid for consumable office
supplies and related items for the entire District. It is
recommended to approve the anticipated annual expenditure of
$1,700,000 for the second year period through January 26, 2011.

Fiscal Impact:

The estimated annual expenditure of $1,700,000 will be
funded from Schools/Departments budgeted funds.

The action requested is within the current budget allocated
to the department or area: Yes No N/A

Superintendent’s Recommendation:

I recommend Board approval of the anticipated annual
expenditure of $1,700,000 for RFP No. R086715SW for consumable
office supplies and related items for the entire District for the
second year period through January 26, 2011 and authorization for
the Superintendent to execute all necessary documents.

SN

g
Approved: Budget: ‘7ﬁz;<f Attorney: ~C F\A\
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